S2648

or the Foreign Intelligence Surveillance

Court of Review issues an opinion relating to

a directive issued to a covered electronic

communication service provider under para-

graph (1), the Attorney General shall submit

to the appropriate committees of Congress a

copy of the opinion.”.

SEC. 15. ACCESS TO INFORMATION AND MATE-
RIAL REQUESTED BY OVERSIGHT
COMMITTEES.

Section 707 of the Foreign Intelligence Sur-
veillance Act of 1978 (50 U.S.C. 1881f) is
amended by adding at the end the following:

‘‘(c) SUBMITTAL OF INFORMATION AND MATE-
RIAL TO OVERSIGHT COMMITTEES.—Consistent
with the need to protect sensitive intel-
ligence sources and methods or other excep-
tionally sensitive matters, the Director of
National Intelligence, the Attorney General,
and each head of a Federal department,
agency, or other entity involved in the ad-
ministration of this title shall submit to the
congressional intelligence committees, the
Committee on the Judiciary of the Senate,
and the Committee on the Judiciary of the
House of Representatives any information or
material concerning the implementation of
this subchapter which is within their cus-
tody or control, and which is requested by ei-
ther of the congressional intelligence com-
mittees, the Committee on the Judiciary of
the Senate, or the Committee on the Judici-
ary of the House of Representatives in order
to carry out its authorized responsibilities.”.
SEC. 16. CERTIFICATION REQUIREMENT RELAT-

ING TO COMPLIANCE OF FEDERAL
BUREAU OF INVESTIGATION PER-
SONNEL WITH PROCEDURES.

Section 702(f)(3)(D)(i) of the Foreign Intel-
ligence Surveillance Act of 1978 (50 U.S.C.
1881a(f)(3)(D)(1)) is amended—

(1) in the heading, by inserting ‘‘AND CER-
TIFICATION" after ‘‘TRAINING’ ; and

(2) by inserting ‘‘and certify in writing
that they will comply with the requirements
of this section and the query procedures’ be-
fore ‘“on an annual basis’’.

SEC. 17. ENSURING COURT ACCESS TO REPORTS
PROVIDED TO CONGRESS.

Title VII of the Foreign Intelligence Sur-
veillance Act of 1978 (50 U.S.C. 1881 et seq.) is
amended by inserting after section 707 the
following:
“SEC. 707A. ENSURING COURT ACCESS TO RE-
PORTS PROVIDED TO CONGRESS.

“Any report submitted to a committee of
Congress pursuant to titles VI or VII that
concerns the implementation of title VII
shall also be submitted to the Foreign Intel-
ligence Surveillance Court and the Foreign
Intelligence Surveillance Court of Review.”.
SEC. 18. ANNUAL REPORTING ON NUMBER OF

SENSITIVE QUERIES.

Section 603(f)(1) of the Foreign Intelligence
Surveillance Act of 1978 (50 U.S.C. 1873(f)(1))
is amended—

(1) in subparagraph (E), by striking *‘; and”’
and inserting a semicolon;

(2) in subparagraph (F), by striking the pe-
riod at the ending and inserting ‘‘; and”’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(G) the number of approvals pursuant to
subclauses (@8] and IDn of section
702(£)(3)(D)(ii) of the use of a query term rea-
sonably believed to identify—

‘(i) a United States elected official;

‘(ii) an appointee of the President or a
State governor;

‘‘(iii) a United States political candidate;

‘(iv) a United States political organization
or a United States person prominent in such
organization;

‘(v) a United States media organization or
a United States person who is a member of
such organization; or

‘“(vi) a United States religious organiza-
tion or a United States person who is promi-
nent in such organization.”.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

SEC. 19. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITIES OF TITLE
VII OF THE FOREIGN INTELLIGENCE
SURVEILLANCE ACT OF 1978.

(a) EXTENSION OF REPEAL DATE OF TITLE
VII.—Section 403(b) of the FISA Amend-
ments Act of 2008 (Public Law 110-261), as
most recently amended by Public Law 119-87,
is further amended—

(1) in paragraph (1) (50 U.S.C. 1881 note), by
striking ‘“‘June 12, 2026”’ and inserting ‘‘June
12, 2029”’; and

(2) in paragraph (2) (18 U.S.C. 2511 note), in
the matter preceding subparagraph (A), by
striking ‘““‘June 12, 2026’ and inserting ‘‘June
12, 2029°.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments
made by this section shall take effect on the
earlier of the date of the enactment of this
Act or June 11, 2026.

SEC. 20. CENTRAL BANK DIGITAL CURRENCY.

The Federal Reserve Act (12 U.S.C. 221 et
seq.) is amended by inserting after section 16
(12 U.S.C. 411 et seq.) the following:

“SEC. 16A. CENTRAL BANK DIGITAL CURRENCY.

‘‘(a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

‘(1) CENTRAL BANK DIGITAL CURRENCY.—The
term ‘central bank digital currency’ means a
digital asset that—

‘“(A) is denominated in United States dol-
lars;

‘“(B) is a United States currency;

‘“(C) is a direct liability of the Federal Re-
serve System; and

‘(D) is widely available to the general pub-
lic.

‘“(2) DIGITAL ASSET.—The term ‘digital
asset’ has the meaning given the term in sec-
tion 2 of the GENIUS Act (12 U.S.C. 5901).

‘“(b) PROHIBITION.—Except as provided in
subsection (c), the Board of Governors of the
Federal Reserve System or a Federal reserve
bank may not issue or create a central bank
digital currency or any digital asset that is
substantially similar to a central bank dig-
ital currency directly or indirectly through a
financial institution or other intermediary.

‘‘(c) EXCEPTION.—Subsection (b) shall not
prohibit any dollar-denominated currency
that is open, permissionless, and private, and
fully preserves the privacy protections of
United States coins and physical currency.

‘(d) SUNSET.—The provisions of this sec-
tion shall cease to be effective on June 12,
2031.

‘“(e) RULE OF CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in
this section shall be construed to allow the
Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve to
issue a central bank digital currency or any
digital asset that is substantially similar to
a central bank digital currency directly or
indirectly absent authorization by an Act of
Congress.”’.

SA 5815. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 5814 submitted by Mr.
COTTON (for himself and Mr. GRASSLEY)
and intended to be proposed to the bill
S. 1318, to direct the American Battle
Monuments Commission to establish a
program to identify American-Jewish
servicemembers buried in United
States military cemeteries overseas
under markers that incorrectly rep-
resent their religion and heritage, and
for other purposes; which was ordered
to lie on the table; as follows:

At the end add the following:

“This Act shall take effect 1 day after the
date of enactment.”

SA 5816. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 1318, to direct the
American Battle Monuments Commis-

June 4, 2026

sion to establish a program to identify
American-Jewish servicemembers bur-
ied in United States military ceme-
teries overseas under markers that in-
correctly represent their religion and
heritage, and for other purposes; which
was ordered to lie on the table; as fol-
lows:

At the end add the following:
““This Act shall take effect 3 day after the
date of enactment.”

SA 5817. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 5816 submitted by Mr.
THUNE and intended to be proposed to
the bill S. 1318, to direct the American
Battle Monuments Commission to es-
tablish a program to identify Amer-
ican-Jewish servicemembers buried in
United States military cemeteries
overseas under markers that incor-
rectly represent their religion and her-
itage, and for other purposes; which
was ordered to lie on the table; as fol-
lows:

Strike ‘3 days’ and insert ‘2 days”’

SA 5818. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 5817 submitted by Mr.
THUNE and intended to be proposed to
the amendment SA 5816 proposed by
Mr. THUNE to the bill S. 1318, to direct
the American Battle Monuments Com-
mission to establish a program to iden-
tify American-Jewish servicemembers
buried in United States military ceme-
teries overseas under markers that in-
correctly represent their religion and
heritage, and for other purposes; which
was ordered to lie on the table; as fol-
lows:

Strike ‘2 days’ and insert ‘5 days”’

———

AUTHORITY FOR COMMITTEE TO
MEET

Mr. THUNE. Mr. President, I have
one request for a committee to meet
during today’s session of the Senate. It
has the approval of the Majority and
Minority Leaders.

Pursuant to rule XXVI, paragraph
5(a), of the Standing Rules of the Sen-
ate, the following committee is author-
ized to meet during today’s session of
the Senate:

COMMITTEE ON FOREIGN RELATIONS

The Committee on Foreign Relations
is authorized to meet during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Thursday, June 4,
2026, at 10 a.m., to conduct a business
meeting.

PRIVILEGES OF THE FLOOR

Mr. MERKLEY. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent to grant floor privi-
leges to my summer interns for their
shadow days on the following dates:
Gabriela Suescum on June 16, Lily
Middleton on June 17, Carmen Vintro
on June 23, Tali Greenfield on June 24,
Anjali Weerasinghe on July 14, Kainat
Deo on July 15, Miguel Tejeda on July
21, Dario Guadarrama on July 22,
Lucan Pyle on July 28, and Zuha Murad
on July 29.



June 4, 2026

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

Mr. MERKLEY. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that Alisya
Solankhi and Harrison McBride on the
Budget Committee minority staff be
granted floor privileges during consid-
eration of S. 2.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

———

ORDERS FOR MONDAY, JUNE 8,
2026

Mr. THUNE. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that when the Sen-
ate completes its business today, it
stand adjourned until 3 p.m. on Mon-
day, June 8; that following the prayer
and pledge, the Journal of proceedings
be approved to date, the morning hour
be deemed expired, the time for the two
leaders be reserved for their use later
in the day, and the Senate be in a pe-
riod of morning business, with Sen-
ators permitted to speak therein for up
to 10 minutes each; further, that the
cloture motion with respect to Execu-
tive Calendar No. 744 ripen at 5:30 p.m.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

ADJOURNMENT UNTIL MONDAY,
JUNE 8, 2026, AT 3 P.M.

Mr. THUNE. Mr. President, if there is
no further business to come before the
Senate, I ask that it stand adjourned
under the previous order.

There being no objection, the Senate,
at 5:15 a.m., adjourned until Monday,
June 8, 2026, at 3 p.m.

————

NOMINATIONS

Executive nominations received by
the Senate:

IN THE AIR FORCE

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE
AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10 U.S.C., SECTION
601:

To be lieutenant general

MAJ. GEN. DANIEL T. LASICA

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE
AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION
601:

To be lieutenant general

MAJ. GEN. LARRY R. BROADWELL, JR.

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE
AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION
601:

To be lieutenant general

BRIG. GEN. JASON D. VOORHEIS

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE
AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION
601:

To be lieutenant general

MAJ. GEN. DAVID J. SANFORD

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE
AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION
601:

To be lieutenant general
LT. GEN. DAVID R. IVERSON

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
AS CHIEF OF AIR FORCE RESERVE AND APPOINTMENT IN
THE RESERVE OF THE AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE
AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTIONS
601 AND 9038:

To be lieutenant general
MAJ. GEN. PAUL R. FAST
IN THE ARMY

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY TO THE GRADE INDICATED
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601:

To be lieutenant general
MAJ. GEN. CURTIS D. TAYLOR
IN THE NAVY

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY TO THE GRADE INDICATED
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601:

To be vice admiral

VICE ADM. CHRISTOPHER S. GRAY

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY TO THE GRADE INDICATED
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601:

To be vice admiral

REAR ADM. PAUL C. SPEDERO, JR.

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY TO THE GRADE INDICATED
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601:

To be vice admiral

REAR ADM. BRAD J. COLLINS

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY TO THE GRADE INDICATED
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601:

To be vice admiral

REAR ADM. MARC J. MIQUEZ

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICERS FOR APPOINTMENT
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY RESERVE TO THE GRADE
INDICATED UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 12203:

To be rear admiral (lower half)

CAPT. PATRICK W. FINNEY
CAPT. ROBERT C. GERSTEMEIER
CAPT. HAROLD M. KIM

CAPT. ANDREW R. NEEDLES
CAPT. SARA J. TAYLOR

IN THE AIR FORCE

THE FOLLOWING NAMED INDIVIDUAL FOR APPOINT-
MENT TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE REGULAR AIR
FORCE UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 531:

To be lieutenant colonel

ANH T. NGUYEN

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE UNITED STATES AIR
FORCE UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 624:

To be major
JENNA L. STEWART
IN THE ARMY

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY
UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 624:

To be lieutenant colonel

ERIC M. GADDIS

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICERS FOR APPOINTMENT
TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY
MEDICAL CORPS UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTIONS 624
AND 7064:

To be colonel

JONATHAN D. BAILEY
BRAD R. BALLARD
JENNIFER A. BENINCASA
HUSAIN M. BHARMAL
DANTAE L. BOWIE
NATHAN L. BOYER
DANIEL B. BRILLHART
WILLIAM G. CALLIS
ELIZABETH A. CAMPBELL
RONALD J. CARAS
TERRI L. CARLSON
DANIEL G. CASH
BRIAN S. CHEN

STEVE J. CHUN

JOHN P. CODY

SARAH S. COLE
MONICA L. COLOMBO
LUIZ F. CORREA
BRADLEY A. DENGLER
PETER Q. DINH
MICHAEL J. DONOFRIO
KEVIN J. DOWNING
AARON R. FARMER
TOMAS FORAL

S2649

WENDRA J. GALFAND
EDWIN GANDIA

BRIT C. GEISLER
LAUREN M. GIULITTO
BRENDAN C. GRAHAM
LESTER L. GREER
SAMUEL L. GRINDSTAFF
PAUL S. HAHN

DIANE F. HALE

ROBERT D. HALES
SAMUEL J. HAN

EMILY N. HATHAWAY
NATHANAEL E. HATHAWAY
RICHARD M. HAWKINS
KATHERINE M. HETZ
MOLLY D. HOUSE
AARON M. JACKSON
KATHRYN JOHNSON
MATTHEW C. KASPRENSKI
SEAN Q. KERN

KELLY L. LANGAN
GARY L. LEGAULT
THERESA M. LONG

JOHN R. MAGERA
DEREK P. MCVAY
CHRISTOPHER H. MOON
HAPU T. MSONDA

ERICA L. MURRAY
YULIYA A. OGAT
CHRISTINA S. OHARA
WILLIAM A. OMOHUNDRO
JOSEPH R. PARK

ANISH A. PATEL
JOSEPH J. PAVELITES
RACHAEL A. PAZ
KIMBERLEY J. PHILLIPS
ELIZABETH M. POLFER
DANIEL P. RABOIN
CIARA N. RAKESTRAW
NESTOR R. RAMOS
MICHAEL A. REDD
ROBERT D. RICE

IAN M. RIVERA
DOUGLAS S. RUHL

JUAN C. SAAVEDRA
ABRAHAM E. SABERSKY
JENNIFER M. SABINO
ERIC R. SIGMON
GREGORY R. SKERRETT
ASHLEY E. SMITH

RYAN W. SPEIR
GREGORY M. SPROWL
SAMUEL H. TAHK
ASHLEY L. URICK
VANEESHA VALLABHPATEL
SANDRA A. VANHORN
DAVID W. VANWYCK
LUIS X. VELEZCOLON
TIMOTHY J. VREELAND
WENDY S. WARREN
ROBERT E. WATTS

BART D. WILKISON
DAVID J. WILSON
WILLIAM R. WILSON, JR.
CHRISTOPHER G. YHEULON
ALLAN G. YOUNG
PATRICIA YOUNG

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICERS FOR APPOINTMENT
TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY
DENTAL CORPS UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTIONS 624
AND 17064:

To be colonel

IVETTE BLANCO PADILLA
ADAM W. BROCK

TYLER R. BURNINGHAM
EDUARDO A. DECARDONAJULIA
ANDREW A. GUTIERREZ
ZACHARY H. HIGHBERGER
KENNETH M. HUSSEY
HANANE JAMGHILI

JUSTIN JARISCH

MICHAEL L. JOHNSON
SACHIYO KAWAGUCHICHAMBERS
JEREMY J. KOPPENHAVER
MITCHELL P. KREUZE
KOURTNEY R. LOGAN

TROY K. LUNDELL

WILLIAM A. MACNAUGHTON
MINDY M. MCCONNELL
ANDRES M. MENDOZA

RUTH A. NELSON

JESSE B. NORRIS

ADAM R. OCHSNER

SAMUEL PYO

CORY D. RICHARDS
SHETEKA K. ROSSGOODLETT
RYAN D. SWISS

JENNA M. THOMAS

JOHNNY R. VIDIC

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY
UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 624:

To be major

RICHARD T. ATKINS

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT
TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY
UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 624:

To be major

ANNETTE G. GONZALES

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICERS FOR APPOINTMENT
TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY



		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-06-11T17:53:22-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




