June 9, 2025

S. 990
At the request of Mr. SULLIVAN, the
name of the Senator from South Caro-
lina (Mr. ScoTT) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. 990, a bill to prohibit the en-
forcement of a rule with respect to
emissions, to amend the Clean Air Act
to ensure that tailpipe regulations do
not limit the availability of new motor
vehicles, and for other purposes.
S. 1015
At the request of Mr. CASSIDY, the
name of the Senator from Mississippi
(Mr. WICKER) was added as a cosponsor
of S. 1015, a bill to extend the National
Flood Insurance Program through De-
cember 31, 2026.
S. 1101
At the request of Mr. WELCH, the
name of the Senator from Maine (Ms.
CoLLINS) was added as a cosponsor of S.
1101, a bill to authorize the use of Fed-
eral Bureau of Investigation criminal
history record information for adminis-
tration of certain licenses.
S. 1162
At the request of Mr. MARSHALL, the
names of the Senator from Iowa (Ms.
ERNST) and the Senator from Arkansas
(Mr. BOOZMAN) were added as cospon-
sors of S. 1162, a bill to amend the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 to remove
short-barreled rifles, short-barreled
shotguns, and certain other weapons
from the definition of firearms for pur-
poses of the National Firearms Act,
and for other purposes.
S. 1241
At the request of Mr. GRAHAM, the
name of the Senator from Tennessee
(Mrs. BLACKBURN) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 1241, a bill to impose
sanctions and other measures with re-
spect to the Russian Federation if the
Government of the Russian Federation
refuses to negotiate a peace agreement
with Ukraine, violates any such agree-
ment, or initiates another military in-
vasion of Ukraine, and for other pur-
poses.
S. 1314
At the request of Ms. ERNST, the
name of the Senator from Iowa (Mr.
GRASSLEY) was added as a cosponsor of
S. 1314, a bill to amend the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 to provide that
floor plan financing includes the fi-
nancing of certain trailers and camp-
ers.
S. 1316
At the request of Mr. PETERS, the
name of the Senator from New Hamp-
shire (Ms. HASSAN) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 1316, a bill to amend the
Omnibus Crime Control and Safe
Streets Act of 1968 to provide that
COPS grant funds may be used for local
law enforcement recruits to attend
schools or academies if the recruits
agree to serve in precincts of law en-
forcement agencies in their commu-
nities.
S. 1463
At the request of Mr. COONS, the
name of the Senator from Texas (Mr.
CRUZ) was added as a cosponsor of S.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

1463, a bill to allow the Secretary of
the Interior to enter into memoranda
of understanding for the purpose of sci-
entific and technical cooperation in
the mapping of critical minerals and
rare earth elements, and for other pur-
poses.
S. 1677
At the request of Ms. BALDWIN, the
name of the Senator from Arkansas
(Mr. BoOzZMAN) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. 1677, a bill to provide health
insurance benefits for outpatient and
inpatient items and services related to
the diagnosis and treatment of a con-
genital anomaly or birth defect.
S. 1809
At the request of Mrs. MooDY, the
name of the Senator from Texas (Mr.
CRrUZ) was added as a cosponsor of S.
1809, a bill to amend title 18, United
States Code, to prohibit taking or
transmitting video of defense informa-
tion, and for other purposes.
S. 1816
At the request of Mr. MARSHALL, the
name of the Senator from Oklahoma
(Mr. MULLIN) was added as a cosponsor
of S. 1816, a bill to amend title XVIII of
the Social Security Act to establish re-
quirements with respect to the use of
prior authorization under Medicare Ad-
vantage plans.
S. 1844
At the request of Ms. HIRONO, the
name of the Senator from New York
(Mrs. GILLIBRAND) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 1844, a bill to authorize
the Secretary of Education to award
grants to eligible entities to carry out
educational programs that include the
history of peoples of Asian, Native Ha-
waiian, and Pacific Islander descent in
the settling and founding of America,
the social, economic, and political en-
vironments that led to the develop-
ment of discriminatory laws targeting
Asians, Native Hawaiians, and Pacific
Islanders and their relation to current
events, and the impact and contribu-
tions of Asian Americans, Native Ha-
waiians, and Pacific Islanders to the
development and enhancement of
American life, United States history,
literature, the economy, politics, body
of laws, and culture, and for other pur-
poses.
S. 1883
At the request of Mr. COONS, the
names of the Senator from Minnesota
(Ms. KLOBUCHAR), the Senator from
Texas (Mr. CORNYN) and the Senator
from Alaska (Mr. SULLIVAN) were added
as cosponsors of S. 1883, a bill to re-
quire the executive branch to develop a
whole-of-government strategy to dis-
rupt growing cooperation among the
People’s Republic of China, the Russian
Federation, the Islamic Republic of
Iran, and the Democratic People’s Re-
public of Korea, which are the foremost
adversaries of the United States, and
mitigate the risks posed to the United
States.
S. 1887
At the request of Mr. WYDEN, the
name of the Senator from Hawaii (Ms.

S3285

HIRONO) was added as a cosponsor of S.
1887, a bill to amend the Help America
Vote Act of 2002 to allow all eligible
voters to vote by mail in Federal elec-
tions, to amend the National Voter
Registration Act of 1993 to streamline
the procedures under which individuals
may apply to register to vote in such
elections through State motor vehicle
authorities, to permit automatic voter
registration through such authorities
for eligible citizens of the TUnited
States who do not complete voter reg-
istration applications, and for other
purposes.
S. 1916
At the request of Mr. CORNYN, the
name of the Senator from Delaware
(Mr. CooNs) was added as a cosponsor
of S. 1916, a bill to amend title 11,
United States Code, to account for the
protection of genetic information in
bankruptcy.
S. 1938
At the request of Mr. CASSIDY, the
name of the Senator from Kentucky
(Mr. MCCONNELL) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 1938, a bill to amend the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to mod-
ify the cover over of certain distilled
spirits taxes.
S. 1969
At the request of Mr. RICKETTS, the
name of the Senator from Michigan
(Mr. PETERS) was added as a cosponsor
of S. 1969, a bill to amend the Agricul-
tural Foreign Investment Disclosure
Act of 1978 to establish an additional
reporting requirement, and for other
purposes.
S. 1973
At the request of Mr. CASSIDY, the
name of the Senator from North Caro-
lina (Mr. BUDD) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. 1973, a bill to amend title
XVIII of the Social Security Act to
provide for the coordination of pro-
grams to prevent and treat obesity,
and for other purposes.
S. 1983
At the request of Mr. JOHNSON, the
name of the Senator from Wyoming
(Ms. LumMMIS) was added as a cosponsor
of S. 1983, a bill to require any conven-
tion, agreement, or other international
instrument on pandemic prevention,
preparedness, and response reached by
the World Health Assembly to be sub-
ject to Senate ratification.
S. RES. 240
At the request of Ms. HIRONO, the
name of the Senator from New Jersey
(Mr. KiMm) was added as a cosponsor of
S. Res. 240, a resolution affirming that
diversity, equity, inclusion, and acces-
sibility are fundamental values of the
United States and emphasizing the on-
going need to address discrimination
and inequality in the workplace, pre-K
through 12th grade and higher edu-
cation systems, government programs,
the military, and our society.
———
AMENDMENTS SUBMITTED AND
PROPOSED

SA 2308. Mr. THUNE submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed to amendment



S3286

SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE (for Mr.
HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs. GILLIBRAND))
to the bill S. 1582, to provide for the regula-
tion of payment stablecoins, and for other
purposes.

SA 2309. Mr. THUNE proposed an amend-
ment to amendment SA 2308 submitted by
Mr. THUNE to the amendment SA 2307 pro-
posed by Mr. THUNE (for Mr. HAGERTY (for
himself and Mrs. GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S.
1582, supra.

SA 2310. Mr. THUNE proposed an amend-
ment to the bill S. 1582, supra.

SA 2311. Mr. THUNE proposed an amend-
ment to amendment SA 2310 proposed by Mr.
THUNE to the bill S. 1582, supra.

SA 2312. Mr. THUNE proposed an amend-
ment to the bill S. 1582, supra.

SA 2313. Mr. THUNE proposed an amend-
ment to amendment SA 2312 proposed by Mr.
THUNE to the bill S. 1582, supra.

SA 2314. Mr. THUNE proposed an amend-
ment to amendment SA 2313 proposed by Mr.
THUNE to the amendment SA 2312 proposed
by Mr. THUNE to the bill S. 1582, supra.

SA 2315, Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2316. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2317. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2318. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2319. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2320. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 15682, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2321. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2322. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2323. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2324. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2325. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2326, Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 15682, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2327. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2328. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2329. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 15682, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2330. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2331. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2332. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2333. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 15682, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2334. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2335. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2336. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2337. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2338. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2339. Ms. WARREN (for herself, Mr.
REED, and Ms. SMITH) submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed by her to the
bill S. 1582, supra; which was ordered to lie
on the table.

SA 2340. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2341. Ms. WARREN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2342. Ms. WARREN (for herself, Mr.
DURBIN, Mr. WARNOCK, and Mr. MERKLEY)
submitted an amendment intended to be pro-
posed by her to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

June 9, 2025

SA 2343. Mr. TUBERVILLE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 2344. Mr. PAUL submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed to amendment
SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE (for Mr.
HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs. GILLIBRAND))
to the bill S. 15682, supra; which was ordered
to lie on the table.

SA 2345. Mr. MARSHALL (for himself and
Mr. DURBIN) submitted an amendment in-
tended to be proposed to amendment SA 2307
proposed by Mr. THUNE (for Mr. HAGERTY (for
himself and Mrs. GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S.
1582, supra; which was ordered to lie on the
table.

SA 2346. Mr. HAWLEY (for himself and Mr.
BLUMENTHAL) submitted an amendment in-
tended to be proposed to amendment SA 2307
proposed by Mr. THUNE (for Mr. HAGERTY (for
himself and Mrs. GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S.
1582, supra; which was ordered to lie on the
table.

SA 2347. Mr. HAWLEY (for himself and Mr.
BLUMENTHAL) submitted an amendment in-
tended to be proposed to amendment SA 2307
proposed by Mr. THUNE (for Mr. HAGERTY (for
himself and Mrs. GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S.
1582, supra; which was ordered to lie on the
table.

————
TEXT OF AMENDMENTS

SA 2308. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 2307 proposed by Mr.
THUNE (for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself
and Mrs. GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S.
15682, to provide for the regulation of
payment stablecoins, and for other pur-
poses; as follows:

At the end add the following.

“This Act shall take effect 1 day after the
date of enactment.”

SA 2309. Mr. THUNE proposed an
amendment to amendment SA 2308 sub-
mitted by Mr. THUNE to the amend-
ment SA 2307 proposed by Mr. THUNE
(for Mr. HAGERTY (for himself and Mrs.
GILLIBRAND)) to the bill S. 1582, to pro-
vide for the regulation of payment
stablecoins, and for other purposes; as
follows:

Strike ‘1 day” and insert ‘2 days”’

SA 2310. Mr. THUNE proposed an
amendment to the bill S. 1582, to pro-
vide for the regulation of payment
stablecoins, and for other purposes; as
follows:

This Act shall take effect 3 days after the
date of enactment

SA 2311. Mr. THUNE proposed an
amendment to amendment SA 2310 pro-
posed by Mr. THUNE to the bill S. 1582,
to provide for the regulation of pay-
ment stablecoins, and for other pur-
poses; as follows:

Strike ‘3 days’ and insert ‘4 days”’

SA 2312. Mr. THUNE proposed an
amendment to the bill S. 1582, to pro-
vide for the regulation of payment
stablecoins, and for other purposes; as
follows:

At the end add the following.

“This Act shall take effect 5 days after the
date of enactment.”




		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-06-11T06:22:49-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




