March 12, 2025

of the Office of National Drug Control Policy
Reauthorization Act of 2006 (Public Law 109-
469; 120 Stat. 3502) is amended by adding at
the end the following:

‘“Sec. 1121. Requirement for life saving
opioid overdose reversal
study.”.

(f) REPORT ON PILL PRESS MACHINES.—Not
later than 120 days after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Director of the Office
of National Drug Control Policy shall make
public a report that includes an analysis of
and a description of strategic ways to regu-
late the shipment of pill press machines and
their critical parts using reports previously
prepared by the Office.

SA 1261. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

At the end add the following.
“This Act shall take effect 1 day after the
date of enactment.”

SA 1262. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

Strike ‘1 day’’ and insert ‘2 days”’

SA 1263. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

This Act shall take effect 3 days after the
date of enactment

SA 1264. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

Strike ‘3 days’ and insert ‘4 days”’

SA 1265. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

Strike ‘4 days’ and insert ‘5 days”’

SA 1266. Mr. PAUL submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill H.R. 1968, making fur-
ther continuing appropriations and
other extensions for the fiscal year
ending September 30, 2025, and for
other purposes; which was ordered to
lie on the table; as follows:

On page 77, between lines 10 and 11, insert
the following:

SEC. 11209. (a) Notwithstanding section
1101, the levels for the following accounts in

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

title II of division F of Public Law 118-47
shall be as follows:

(1) ““Operating Expenses’’, $288,150,000, of
which up to $43,222,5600 may remain available
until September 30, 2026.

(2) “Capital Investment Fund”’, $44,047,000.

3) ““Office of Inspector General”’,
$14,5635,000, of which up to $2,180,250 may re-
main available until September 30, 2026.

(b) Notwithstanding section 1101, the levels
for the following accounts in title III of divi-
sion F of Public Law 118-47 shall be as fol-
lows:

(1) ““Global Health Programs”’, $677,526,500.

(2) “Development Assistance’, $668,270,000.

(3) “International Disaster Assistance’,
$812,430,000, of which $127,500,000 is designated
by Congress as being for an emergency re-
quirement pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)({)
of the Balanced Budget and Emergency Def-
icit Control Act of 1985.

(4) “Transition Initiatives”, $12,750,000, and
up to an additional $2,550,000 of the funds ap-
propriated to carry out the provisions of part
I of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 if the
Secretary of State determines that it is im-
portant to the mnational interest of the
United States to provide transition assist-
ance in excess of such base amount.

(5) ‘“Complex Crises Fund”’, $9,350,000.

(6) “Economic Support Fund”, $661,368,000,
of which $51,000,000 is designated by Congress
as being for an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Bal-
anced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control
Act of 1985.

(7) “Bureau for Democracy, Human Rights,
and Governance’’, $23,800,000.

(8) ‘‘Assistance for Europe, Eurasia, and
Central Asia”’, $130,956,780, of  which
$52,700,000 is designated by Congress as being
for an emergency requirement pursuant to
section 251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the Balanced Budget
and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

SA 1267. Ms. ALSOBROOKS sub-
mitted an amendment intended to be
proposed by her to the bill H.R. 1968,
making further continuing appropria-
tions and other extensions for the fis-
cal year ending September 30, 2025, and
for other purposes; which was ordered
to lie on the table; as follows:

On page 49, between lines 14 and 15, insert
the following:

SEC. 1609. (a) Notwithstanding section 1101,
the District of Columbia may expend local
funds made available under the heading
“District of Columbia—District of Columbia
Funds” for such programs and activities
under the District of Columbia Appropria-
tions Act, 2024 (title IV of division B of Pub-
lic Law 118-47) at the rate set forth in the
Fiscal Year 2025 Local Budget Act of 2024
(D.C. Law 25-218), as modified as of the date
of enactment of this Act.

(b) Section 816 of the Further Consolidated
Appropriations Act, 2024 (Public Law 118-4T7;
138 Stat. 592) is amended by striking ‘‘fiscal
year 2025 each place it appears and insert-
ing ‘“‘fiscal year 2026”’.

———

AUTHORITY FOR COMMITTEES TO
MEET

Mr. THUNE. Mr. President, I have 10
requests for committees to meet during
today’s session of the Senate. They
have the approval of the Majority and
Minority Leaders.

Pursuant to rule XXVI, paragraph
5(a), of the Standing Rules of the Sen-
ate, the following committees are au-
thorized to meet during today’s session
of the Senate:

S1721

COMMITTEE ON BANKING, HOUSING, AND URBAN
AFFAIRS
The Committee on Banking, Housing,
and Urban Affairs is authorized to
meet during the session of the Senate
on Wednesday, March 12, 2025, at 10
a.m., to conduct a hearing.
COMMITTEE ON COMMERCE, SCIENCE, AND
TRANSPORTATION
The Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation is author-
ized to meet during the session of the
Senate on Wednesday, March 12, 2025,
at 9:30 a.m., to conduct an executive
session.
COMMITTEE ON COMMERCE, SCIENCE, AND
TRANSPORTATION
The Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation is author-
ized to meet during the session of the
Senate on Wednesday, March 12, 2025,
at 10 a.m., to conduct an executive ses-
sion.
COMMITTEE ON ENERGY AND NATURAL
RESOURCES
The Committee on Energy and Nat-
ural Resources is authorized to meet
during the session of the Senate on
Wednesday, March 12, 2025, at 10 a.m.,
to conduct a hearing.
COMMITTEE ON FOREIGN RELATIONS
The Committee on Foreign Relations
is authorized to meet during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday,
March 12, 2025, at 10 a.m., to conduct a
business meeting.
COMMITTEE ON SMALL BUSINESS AND
ENTREPRENEURSHIP
The Committee on Small Business
and Entrepreneurship is authorized to
meet during the session of the Senate
on Wednesday, March 12, 2025, at 2:30
p.m., to conduct a hearing on nomina-
tions.
COMMITTEE ON VETERANS’ AFFAIRS
The Committee on Veterans’ Affairs
is authorized to meet during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday,
March 12, 2025, at 2:30 p.m., to conduct
a business meeting.
SPECIAL COMMITTEE ON AGING
The Special Committee on Aging is
authorized to meet during the session
of the Senate on Wednesday, March 12,
2025, at 3:30 p.m., to conduct a hearing.
SELECT COMMITTEE ON INTELLIGENCE
The Select Committee on Intel-
ligence is authorized to meet during
the session of the Senate on Wednes-
day, March 12, 2025, at 2:30 p.m., to con-
duct a closed briefing.
SUBCOMMITTEE ON READINESS AND
MANAGEMENT SUPPORT
The Subcommittee on Readiness and
Management Support of the Com-
mittee on Armed Services is authorized
to meet in open session during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday,
March 12, 2025, at 9:30 a.m., to receive
testimony.

——
PRIVILEGES OF THE FLOOR
Mr. KELLY. Mr. President, I ask

unanimous consent that privileges of
the floor be granted to the following



S1722

members of my staff: Sami Hollinshead
and Julia Wascher.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

————

MEASURES READ THE FIRST
TIME—S. 1008, H.R. 1156

Mr. THUNE. Madam President, I un-
derstand that there are two bills at the
desk and ask for their first reading en
bloc.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will read the bills by title for the
first time.

The senior assistant legislative clerk
read as follows:

A bill (S. 1008) to provide equitable treat-
ment for the people of the Village Corpora-
tion established for the Native Village of
Saxman, Alaska, and for other purposes.

A bill (H.R. 1156) to amend the CARES Act
to extend the statute of limitations for fraud
under certain unemployment programs, and
for other purposes.

Mr. THUNE. Madam President, I now
ask for a second reading, and I object
to my own request en bloc.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The ob-
jection is heard.

The bills will be read for the second
time on the next legislative day.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

ORDERS FOR THURSDAY, MARCH
13, 2025

Mr. THUNE. Madam President, I ask
unanimous consent that when the Sen-
ate completes its business today, it
stand adjourned until 10 a.m., Thurs-
day, March 13; that following the pray-
er and pledge, the morning hour be
deemed expired, the Journal of pro-
ceedings be approved to date, the time
for the two leaders be reserved for their
use later in the day, and morning busi-
ness be closed, and the Senate resume
consideration of Calendar No. 30; fur-
ther, at 10:45 a.m., the Senate vote on
cloture on the Pulte nomination; that
if cloture is invoked on the Pulte nomi-
nation, the postcloture time expire at 1
p.m. and the Senate vote on confirma-
tion of the Pulte nomination; further,
if cloture is invoked on the Kessler
nomination, the postcloture time ex-
pire at 4:30 p.m. and the Senate vote on
confirmation of the nomination; fi-
nally, if any nominations are con-
firmed during Thursday’s session, the
motions to reconsider be considered
made and laid upon the table and the
President be immediately notified of
the Senate’s action.

March 12, 2025

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

Mr. THUNE. For the information of
all Senators, Senators should expect
one vote at 10:45 a.m., two votes at 1
p.m., and two votes at 4:30 p.m.

———————

ADJOURNMENT UNTIL 10 A.M.
TOMORROW

Mr. THUNE. Madam President, if
there is no further business to come be-
fore the Senate, I ask that it stand ad-
journed under the previous order.

There being no objection, the Senate,
at 7:31 p.m., adjourned until Thursday,
March 13, 2025, at 10 a.m.

———

CONFIRMATIONS
Executive nominations confirmed by
the Senate March 12, 2025:
EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE PRESIDENT

STEPHEN MIRAN, OF NEW YORK, TO BE CHAIRMAN OF
THE COUNCIL OF ECONOMIC ADVISERS.

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

KEITH SONDERLING, OF FLORIDA, TO BE DEPUTY SEC-
RETARY OF LABOR.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-05-04T12:01:46-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




