z)
S1718

bill S. 331, supra; which was ordered to lie on
the table.

SA 1266. Mr. PAUL submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed by him to the
bill H.R. 1968, making further continuing ap-
propriations and other extensions for the fis-
cal year ending September 30, 2025, and for
other purposes; which was ordered to lie on
the table.

SA 1267. Ms. ALSOBROOKS submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill H.R. 1968, supra; which was or-
dered to lie on the table.

———

TEXT OF AMENDMENTS

SA 1259. Mr. SULLIVAN submitted
an amendment intended to be proposed
by him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

At the appropriate place, insert the fol-
lowing:

SEC. . LIMITATIONS.

Section 401(b) of the Controlled Substances
Act (21 U.S.C. 841(b)) is amended by adding at
the end the following:

“(8) Notwithstanding section 3282 of title
18, United States Code, no person shall be
prosecuted, tried, or punished for any viola-
tion of subsection (a) described in paragraph
(1) of this subsection if death or serious bod-
ily injury results from the use of such sub-
stance, unless the indictment is found or the
information is instituted within 10 years
next after such violation shall have been
committed.”.

SA 1260. Mr. CORNYN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

At the appropriate place, insert the fol-
lowing:
SEC.

. OFFICE OF NATIONAL DRUG CON-
TROL POLICY REAUTHORIZATION.

(a) AMENDMENTS TO THE OFFICE OF NA-
TIONAL DRUG CONTROL POLICY REAUTHORIZA-
TION ACT OF 1998.—The Office of National
Drug Control Policy Reauthorization Act of
1998 (21 U.S.C. 1701 et seq.) is amended—

(1) in section 702 (21 U.S.C. 1701)—

(A) in paragraph (3)—

(i) in subparagraph (L), by striking *‘; and”’
and inserting a semicolon;

(ii) in subparagraph (M), by striking the
period at the end and inserting ‘‘; and”’; and

(iii) by adding at the end the following:

‘“(N) tertiary prevention support or serv-
ices, including opioid antagonists or over-
dose reversal agents such as naloxone, and
other harm reduction activities such as over-
dose and drug detection testing.”’;

(B) by amending paragraph (7) to read as
follows:

“(7) EMERGING DRUG THREAT.—The term
‘emerging drug threat’ means the occurrence
of a new and growing trend in the illicit use
or misuse of a drug, class of drugs, or non-
controlled substance, or a new or evolving
method of drug consumption or trafficking,
including rapid expansion in the supply of or
demand for such a drug or substance.”.

(C) in paragraph (9), by striking ‘‘drug
laws” and inserting the following: ‘‘drug,
trade, and illicit drug trafficking laws’’;

(D) in paragraph (10), by inserting after
“demand reduction,” the following: ‘‘illicit
drug trafficking,’’;

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

(E) by redesignating paragraphs (15), (16),
and (17) as paragraphs (17), (18), and (19), re-
spectively;

(F) by inserting after paragraph (14) the
following new paragraph:

¢‘(15) PRECURSOR CHEMICAL.—

‘“(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘precursor
chemical’ includes a listed chemical and an
unregulated precursor.

‘(B) LISTED CHEMICAL.—The term ‘listed
chemical’ has the meaning given that term
in section 102 of the Controlled Substances
Act (21 U.S.C. 802).

“(C) UNREGULATED PRECURSOR.—The term
‘unregulated precursor’—

‘(i) means any chemical used in the pro-
duction of illicit drugs that has not been
identified as a listed chemical under the
Controlled Substances Act (21 U.S.C. 801 et
seq.); and

‘“(ii) does not include a solvent or reagent.

‘“(16) STATE.—The term ‘State’ means each
of the several States of the United States,
the District of Columbia, and each territory
or possession of the United States.”’;

(G) in paragraph (19), as so redesignated—

(i) by redesignating subparagraphs (G) and
(H) as subparagraphs (H) and (I), respec-
tively; and

(ii) by inserting after subparagraph (F) the
following:

‘(G) activities to map, track, dismantle,
and disrupt the financial enablers of drug
trafficking organizations, transnational
criminal organizations, and money
launderers involved in the manufacture and
trafficking of drugs in the United States and
in foreign countries;’’; and

(H) by inserting at the end the following:

‘“(20) UNITED STATES.—The term ‘United
States’, when used in a geographical sense,
means all of the States, the District of Co-
lumbia, and the territories and possessions
of the United States, and any waters within
the jurisdiction of the United States.

‘“(21) EVIDENCE.—The term ‘evidence’ has
the meaning given that term in section 3561
of title 44, United States Code.”’;

(2) in section 703(d) (21 U.S.C. 1702(d))—

(A) in paragraph (5)(B), by striking ‘‘ac-
cepted by a contractor to be used in its per-
formance of a contract for the Office.” and
inserting the following: ‘‘accepted—

‘i) by a contractor (or subcontractor
thereof at any tier) for use in its perform-
ance of a contract for the Office; or

‘“(ii) by a grant recipient (or subgrantee
thereof at any tier) for use in carrying out
an award related to a fund administered by
the Office.””; and

(B) in paragraph (6), by inserting after
‘“‘paragraph (5)”’ the following: ‘‘and the reg-
istry shall be sent to the appropriate con-
gressional committees’’;

(3) in section 704 (21 U.S.C. 1703)—

(A) in subsection (a)(1)(C), by striking
‘‘shall” and inserting ‘“may’’;

(B) in subsection (b)—

(i) in paragraph (16), by inserting after ‘‘to
treat addiction” the following: ‘‘, encourage
primary substance use prevention, and in-
crease accessibility and effectiveness of life-
saving opioid antagonists or reversal agents,
such as naloxone’’;

(ii) by striking paragraph (20);

(iii) by redesignating paragraph (21) as
paragraph (20);

(iv) in paragraph (20), as so redesignated,
by striking the period at the end and insert-
ing ‘‘; and”’; and

(v) by adding at the end the following:

‘“(21) shall coordinate with the Secretary of
Homeland Security, the Attorney General,
and the Secretary of State regarding the sta-
tus of the enforcement of clauses (i) and (ii)
of subparagraph (A) and subparagraph (B) of
section 237(a)(2) of the Immigration and Na-
tionality Act (8 U.S.C. 1227(a)(2)) and sub-

March 12, 2025

paragraphs (A) and (C) of section 212(a)(2) of
that Act (8 U.S.C. 1182(a)(2)) for the purposes
of ensuring such drug control and illicit drug
trafficking enforcement activities are ade-
quately resourced.’’;

(C) in subsection (¢c)—

(i) in paragraph (1)(C), by striking ‘‘supply
reduction, and State, local, and tribal af-
fairs, including any drug law enforcement
activities” and inserting the following: ‘‘sup-
ply reduction, accessibility to life-saving
opioid antagonists or reversal agents, such
as naloxone, and State, local, and Tribal af-
fairs, including any drug related law enforce-
ment activities’’;

(ii) in paragraph (3)(C)—

(I) in clause (ii), by inserting after ‘‘United
States’ the following: ‘¢, including at and be-
tween the ports of entry,”’;

(IT) in clause (iii), by striking *‘; and’”’ and
inserting a semicolon;

(IIT) in clause (iv), by striking the period at
the end and inserting ‘‘; and”’; and

(IV) by adding at the end the following:

“(v) requests funding for activities that fa-
cilitate illicit drug use, but not including
overdose reversal medications, drug check-
ing, or testing technology.”’;

(D) in subsection (d)(8)(F)(ii), by striking
“‘and at United States ports of entry by offi-
cers and employees of National Drug Control
Program agencies and domestic and foreign
law enforcement officers’ and inserting the
following: ‘“‘and at and between United
States ports of entry by officers and employ-
ees of National Drug Control Program agen-
cies and domestic and foreign law enforce-
ment officers’;

(E) in subsection (i)—

(i) in paragraph (1)(A), by striking ‘“‘to ad-
dress illicit drug use issues’” and inserting
the following: ‘“‘to address illicit drug use,
prevention and treatment of overdose and
addiction, and law enforcement activities’’;
and

(ii) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘2023’ and
inserting ‘‘2031°’; and

(F) in subsection (k)—

(i) in the heading, by striking ‘‘HARM RE-
DUCTION PROGRAMS’ and inserting ‘‘SUB-
STANCE USE PREVENTION, HARM REDUCTION,
AND LIFE-SAVING TREATMENT PROGRAMS’;
and

(ii) in the first sentence, by inserting after
“drug addiction and use” the following:
“with the primary goal being the prevention
of initial or continued use and the fostering
of life-saving opioid antagonists or reversal
agents, such as naloxone’’;

(4) in section 705 (21 U.S.C. 1704)—

(A) in subsection (a)(3)—

(i) in subparagraph (A), by inserting after
“Federal Government’” the following: ‘‘and
such lands owned by a foreign principal (as
such term in defined in section 1(b) of the
Foreign Agents Registration Act of 1938, as
amended (22 U.S.C. 611(b)))”’;

(ii) in subparagraph (B)—

(I) in the matter preceding clause (i), by in-
serting after ‘‘the preceding year’ the fol-
lowing: ¢, along with historical comparisons
over the prior 20 years,”’;

(IT) in clause (i)—

(aa) by inserting after ‘‘seizing drugs,” the
following: ‘‘including precursor chemicals,”’;
and

(bb) by striking ‘‘; and” and inserting a
semicolon;

(ITI) in clause (ii), by striking the period at
the end and inserting ‘‘; and”’; and

(IV) by adding at the end the following:

‘‘(iii) the effects of trends of encounters of
inadmissible aliens at and between the ports
of entry, and the effect of any increases or
changes in the level of trade and travel, on
the capacity and ability of the Department
of Homeland Security components to inter-
dict and prevent the unlawful entry of illicit



March 12, 2025

drugs into the United States by any means.”’;
and

(iii) in subparagraph (D)—

(I) in the matter preceding clause (i), by in-
serting after ‘‘the preceding year’ the fol-
lowing: ‘‘, along with historical comparisons
over the prior 20 years,”’; and

(IT) in clause (iii), by inserting after ‘‘seiz-
ing drugs,” the following: ‘‘including pre-
cursor chemicals,’’;

(B) in subsection (e)(2), by inserting before
the period at the end the following: ‘‘and
$3,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2025 through
2031"’; and

(C) in subsection (f)—

(i) in paragraph (2), by inserting after
‘“‘agency shall” the following: ‘‘, in accord-
ance with guidelines issued by the Director
for standard definitions, identification, and
review procedures,’’; and

(ii) by striking paragraph (4);

(5) in section 706 (21 U.S.C. 1705)—

(A) in subsection (¢)—

(i) in paragraph (1)—

(I) by striking subparagraph (D);

(IT) in subparagraph (H)—

(aa) by inserting after ‘‘identifying exist-
ing”’ the following: ‘“‘evidence and’’; and

(bb) by striking ‘‘will obtain such data’
and inserting ‘‘will ensure such data is ob-
tained’’;

(ITI) in subparagraph (J)(ii), by inserting
‘‘evidence,’’ before ‘‘data’’;

(IV) in subparagraph (L), by striking ‘‘sta-
tistical data’ and inserting ‘‘evidence, sta-
tistical data,’’; and

(V) in subparagraph (M)(iv), by inserting
‘“‘storing and retrieving,”’ after ‘‘collecting,’’;

(ii) in paragraph (2)—

(I) by redesignating subparagraphs (E) and
(F') as subparagraphs (G) and (H), respec-
tively; and

(IT) by inserting after subparagraph (D) the
following:

‘““(E) The Administrator of the Office of In-
formation and Regulatory Affairs.

‘“(F') The Chief Data Officers Council.”’;

(iii) in paragraph (3)—

(I) in subparagraph (B)(ii)—

(aa) in subclause (I), by striking ‘; and”
and inserting a semicolon;

(bb) in subclause (II), by striking the pe-
riod at the end and inserting ‘‘; and’’; and

(cc) by adding at the end the following:

‘(ITI) an analysis of the effects of trends of
encounters of inadmissible aliens at and be-
tween the ports of entry, and the effect of
any increases or changes in the level of trade
and travel, on the capacity and ability of the
Department of Homeland Security to inter-
dict and prevent the unlawful entry of illicit
drugs into the United States by any means.”’;
and

(IT) by adding at the end the following:

‘(D) REQUIREMENT FOR CARIBBEAN BORDER
COUNTERNARCOTICS STRATEGY.—

‘(i) PURPOSES.—The Caribbean Border
Counternarcotics Strategy shall—

“(I) set forth the strategy of the Federal
Government for preventing the illegal traf-
ficking of drugs through the Caribbean re-
gion into the United States, including
through ports of entry, between ports of
entry, and across air and maritime ap-
proaches;

““(IT) state the specific roles and respon-
sibilities of each relevant National Drug
Control Program agency for implementing
the strategy;

‘“(IIT) identify the specific resources re-
quired to enable the relevant National Drug
Control Program agencies to implement the
strategy, to the extent practicable; and

“(IV) be designed to promote, and not
hinder, legitimate trade and travel.

‘‘(ii) SPECIFIC CONTENT RELATED TO PUERTO
RICO AND THE UNITED STATES VIRGIN IS-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

LANDS.—The Caribbean Border Counter-
narcotics Strategy shall include—

“(I) a strategy to prevent the illegal traf-
ficking of drugs to or through Puerto Rico
and the United States Virgin Islands, includ-
ing measures to substantially reduce drug-
related violent crime on such islands; and

‘“(II) recommendations for additional as-
sistance or authorities, if any, needed by
Federal, State, and local law enforcement
agencies relating to the strategy, including
an evaluation of Federal technical and finan-
cial assistance, infrastructure capacity
building, and interoperability deficiencies.”’;
and

(iv) in paragraph (5), by striking ‘‘data’
each place it appears and inserting ‘‘evi-
dence, data,’’;

(B) in subsection (f)—

(i) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘“‘publicly
available in a machine-readable format’ and
inserting the following: ‘‘publicly available
as an open Government data asset (as such
term is defined in section 3502 of title 44,
United States Code)’’;

(ii) in paragraph (2), by inserting after
‘“‘searchable format’ the following: ‘“‘avail-
able for bulk download to the extent prac-
ticable’’; and

(iii) by amending paragraph (3) to read as
follows:

‘“(3) DATA.—The data included in the Drug
Control Data Dashboard shall be updated an-
nually with final data, and to the extent
practicable, updated quarterly with provi-
sional data, that aligns with the goals of the
performance measurement system required
under subsection (h) and include, at a min-
imum, the following:

‘““(A) For each substance identified by the
Director as having a significant impact on il-
licit drug use in the United States, data suf-
ficient to—

‘(i) assess supply reduction efforts, includ-
ing, to the extent practicable, the total
amount of substances seized;

‘“(ii) assess drug use behaviors;

‘‘(iii) estimate the prevalence of substance
use disorders;

“(iv) show the number of fatal and non-
fatal overdoses; and

‘“(v) assess the provision of substance use
disorder treatment.

‘(B) Any quantifiable measures the Direc-
tor determines to be appropriate to detail
progress toward the achievement of the goals
of the National Drug Control Strategy, in-
cluding, to the extent practicable, data
disaggregated by specific geographic areas or
sub-populations of interest.

“(C) Data sufficient to assess the effective-
ness of such substance use disorder treat-
ments.

‘(D) To the extent practicable, data suffi-
cient to show the extent of prescription drug
diversion, trafficking, and misuse in the cal-
endar year and each of the previous 3 cal-
endar years.

‘“(E) Any quantifiable measures the Direc-
tor determines to be appropriate to detail
progress toward the achievement of the goals
of the National Drug Control Strategy, in-
cluding to the extent practicable, data
disaggregated by specific geographic areas or
sub-populations of interest.”’; and

(C) in subsection (g)(2)—

(i) in subparagraph (D), by striking ‘‘nar-
cotics’ and inserting ‘‘drugs’’;

(ii) in subparagraph (E), by striking ‘“‘drug
use’’ and inserting ‘‘illicit drug use and mis-
use’’; and

(iii) in subparagraph (F), by striking ‘‘drug
use’’ and inserting ‘‘illicit drug use and mis-
use’’;

(6) in section 707 (21 U.S.C. 1706)—

(A) in subsection (1)(2)(F), by inserting
“‘and authorities enforcing illicit drug traf-
ficking laws’’ after ‘‘task forces’’;

S1719

(B) in subsection (m)(2), by inserting ‘‘, and
authorities enforcing illicit drug trafficking
laws,”” after ‘‘agencies’;

(C) in subsection (p)—

(i) in paragraph (5), by striking ‘‘; and’’ and
inserting a semicolon;

(ii) in paragraph (6), by striking the period
at the end and inserting ‘‘; and’’; and

(iii) by adding at the end the following:

“(T) $298,579,000 for each of fiscal years 2025
through 2031.”;

(D) in subsection (r)(3), by striking ‘‘addic-
tion”’;

(E) in subsection (s)—

(i) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),
by striking ‘‘The Director’” and inserting
“Except as provided in subsection (t)(2), the
Director’’;

(ii) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘‘; and”
and inserting a semicolon;

(iii) in paragraph (3), by striking the period
at the end and inserting ‘‘; and’’; and

(iv) by adding at the end the following:

‘‘(4) enhancing fentanyl seizure and inter-
diction activities.”’; and

(F) by adding at the end the following:

“(t) SUPPLEMENTAL GRANTS FOR FENTANYL
INTERDICTION ACTIVITIES.—

‘(1) MINIMUM ALLOCATION OF FUNDS FOR
FENTANYL INTERDICTION ACTIVITIES.—Of the
amounts allocated for grants under sub-
section (s), not less than $5,000,000 shall be
allocated for the purpose of making grants
under subsection (s)(4).

‘(2) ADDITIONAL FUNDS.—In addition to
amounts allocated under subparagraph (A)
for the purpose of making grants under sub-
section (s)(4), the Director may use amounts
otherwise appropriated to carry out this sec-
tion for such purpose.

‘‘(u) ADDITIONAL JUDICIARY PROSECUTORIAL
RESOURCES.—

‘(1) TEMPORARY REASSIGNMENT OF ASSIST-
ANT UNITED STATES ATTORNEYS.—

‘““(A) AUTHORITY.—The Attorney General
may identify assistant United States attor-
neys who may be made available for tem-
porary reassignment under subsection (b)(2)
for a period of time determined by the Attor-
ney General in coordination with the Direc-
tor, during which an assistant United States
attorney shall prioritize the investigation
and prosecution of organizations and individ-
uals trafficking in fentanyl or fentanyl ana-
logues.

‘“(B) EXTENSION OF REASSIGNMENT.—Such
reassignment may be extended by the Attor-
ney General for such time as may be nec-
essary to conclude any ongoing investigation
or prosecution in which the assistant United
States attorney is engaged.

‘(2) PROCESS FOR TEMPORARY REASSIGN-
MENT.—The Attorney General may establish
a process under which the Director, in con-
sultation with the Executive Boards of each
designated high intensity drug trafficking
area, may request such an assistant United
States attorney to be so temporarily reas-
signed.

“(v) USE OF FUNDS TO COMBAT FENTANYL
TRAFFICKING.—

‘(1) REQUIREMENT.—As part of the docu-
mentation that supports the President’s an-
nual budget request for the Office, the Direc-
tor shall submit to Congress a report de-
scribing the use of HIDTA funds for the pur-
poses of enhancing fentanyl seizure and
interdiction activities under subsection (s)(4)
or (t) and to investigate and prosecute orga-
nizations and individuals trafficking in
fentanyl or fentanyl analogues in the prior
calendar year.

‘“(2) CONTENTS.—The report shall include—

““(A) the amounts of fentanyl or fentanyl
analogues seized by HIDTA-funded initia-
tives in the area during the previous year;
and



S1720

‘(B) law enforcement intelligence and pre-
dictive data from the Drug Enforcement Ad-
ministration showing patterns and trends in
abuse, trafficking, and transportation in
fentanyl and fentanyl analogues.

‘“(w) PROTECTION FROM UNREASONABLE
SEARCH AND SEIZURE.—ANy program or activ-
ity that receives funds made available under
this section shall be conducted in a manner
consistent with the requirements of the
Fourth Amendment to the Constitution of
the United States.

“(x) REPORT ON DATA ANALYTICAL SERVICES
PROGRAM.—

‘(1) REPORT.—With respect to the Data An-
alytical Services program (formally known
as Hemisphere), and any successor program,
the Director shall submit to the Committee
on Oversight and Government Reform and
the Committee on the Judiciary of the House
of Representatives, and the Committee on
the Judiciary of the Senate, a report every 2
years on any activities of the program—

‘“(A) funded by the Office; and

‘(B) carried out in 2 years prior to the sub-
mission of the report.

‘“(2) CONTENTS OF REPORT.—The report re-
quired by paragraph (1) shall include the fol-
lowing:

““(A) A documentation of any activities of
the Data Analytical Services program, in-
cluding—

‘(i) the amount of searches conducted for
each HIDTA; and

‘‘(ii) each requesting local law enforcement
jurisdiction.

‘(B) Information on how the program was
funded and how funds were expended under
the program, including information on any—

‘(i) funding sources derived from each
HIDTA’s funding allocation for a HIDTA, or
any other source of funding, for the program;
and

‘(ii) payments made by the program to
any non-governmental entity or external
vendor.

‘“(C) A description of any policies and
guidelines provided to HIDTA personnel and
local law enforcement jurisdictions gov-
erning the operation of the program in order
to ensure that such program does not in-
fringe on rights protected under the Fourth
Amendment to the Constitution of the
United States or violate legally protected
privacy of United States citizens or individ-
uals legally in the United States, along with
any recommendations by the Director to
strengthen such policies and guidelines.”’;

(7) in section 709 (21 U.S.C. 1708)—

(A) in subsection (f)—

(i) in paragraph (1)—

(I) in the matter preceding subparagraph

(A), by striking ‘‘shall” and inserting
“may’’;
(IT) in subparagraph (A), by striking

“‘abuse’ and inserting ‘‘use or misuse’’; and

(ITI) in subparagraph (D)(i), by striking
‘“‘addiction issues’ and inserting ‘‘substance
use disorders’’; and

(ii) in paragraph (2)(B)(iii)(IV), by inserting
after ‘‘professionals’ the following: ‘‘includ-
ing experts in evidence-based media cam-
paigns, education, and evaluation’’; and

(B) in subsection (g), by striking 2023’
and inserting *‘2031"’;

(8) in section 711 (21 U.S.C. 1710), including
the headings, by striking ‘“‘Command and
Control Plan” each place it appears and in-
serting ‘‘Strategic Plan’’; and

(9) in section 714 (21 U.S.C. 1711), by insert-
ing before the period at the end the fol-
lowing: ‘‘and $20,000,000 for each of fiscal
years 2025 through 2031°°.

(b) AMENDMENTS TO THE ANTI-DRUG ABUSE
AcT OF 1988.—Chapter 2 of subtitle A of title
I of the Anti-Drug Abuse Act of 1988 (21
U.S.C. 1521 et seq.) is amended—

(1) in section 1024 (21 U.S.C. 1524)—

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

(A) in subsection (a), by inserting before
the period at the end the following: ‘‘and
$109,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2025
through 2031”’; and

(B) in subsection (b), by striking ‘‘8 per-
cent’” and inserting ‘10 percent’’; and

(2) in section 1032(b) (21 U.S.C. 15632(b))—

(A) by striking ‘$125,000”" each place the
term appears and inserting ¢‘$150,000”’; and

(B) in paragraph (3)—

(i) by striking subparagraph (A) and insert-
ing the following:

‘“(A) IN GENERAL.—Subject to subparagraph
(F), the Administrator may award up to 2 ad-
ditional grants under this paragraph to an
eligible coalition awarded a grant under
paragraph (1) or (2) for any first fiscal year
after the end of the 4-year or 9-year period
following the period of the initial or subse-
quent grant under paragraph (1) or (2), as the
case may be.”’;

(ii) in subparagraph (B), by striking ‘‘a re-
newal grant’” and inserting ‘‘up to 2 renewal
grants’’;

(iii) in subparagraph (C), by striking ‘“‘an
additional grant’” and inserting ‘‘the addi-
tional grants’’; and

(iv) by striking subparagraph (D) and in-
serting the following:

‘(D) RENEWAL GRANTS.—Subject to sub-
paragraph (F), the Administrator may award
a renewal grant to a grant recipient under
this paragraph for each fiscal year of the 4-
fiscal-year period following the first fiscal
year for which an additional grant under this
paragraph is awarded in an amount not to
exceed the amount of non-Federal funds
raised by the coalition, including in-kind
contributions, for that fiscal year.”.

(¢c) REAUTHORIZATION OF THE NATIONAL
COMMUNITY ANTI-DRUG  COALITION INSTI-
TUTE.—Section 4(d) of Public Law 107-82 (21
U.S.C. 1521 note) is amended by striking
paragraph (2) and inserting the following:

‘“(2) DISBURSEMENT.—The Director shall,
using amounts authorized to be appropriated
by section 1024 of the Anti-Drug Abuse Act of
1988 (21 U.S.C. 1524), disburse $2,500,000 made
available under subsection (a) of this sec-
tion, for each of fiscal years 2025 through
2031.”".

(d) REAUTHORIZATION OF COMMUNITY-BASED
COALITION ENHANCEMENT GRANTS TO ADDRESS
LocAL DRUG CRISES.—Section 103 of the Com-
prehensive Addiction and Recovery Act of
2016 (21 U.S.C. 1536) is amended—

(1) in subsection (a)—

(A) in paragraph (1)—

(i) in the heading, by striking ‘‘ADMINIS-
TRATOR and inserting ‘‘ASSISTANT SEC-
RETARY;

(ii) by striking ‘‘Administrator’ each place
it appears and inserting ‘‘Assistant Sec-
retary’’; and

(iii) by striking ‘‘of the Substance Abuse
and Mental Health Services Administration”
and inserting ‘‘for Mental Health and Sub-
stance Use’’;

(B) in paragraph (4)(B), in the matter pre-
ceding clause (i), by striking ‘‘abuse’ and in-
serting ‘‘use or misuse’’; and

(C) in paragraph (5)(A), by striking
‘‘abuse’ and inserting ‘‘use or misuse’’;

(2) in subsection (b), by striking ‘‘Adminis-
trator’” and inserting ‘‘Assistant Secretary’’;

(3) in subsection (h), by striking ‘‘Adminis-
trator’” and inserting ‘‘Assistant Secretary’’;
and

(4) in subsection (i), by inserting before the
period at the end the following: ‘and
$5,200,000 for each of fiscal years 2025 through
2031°.

(e) REPORT REGARDING LIFE-SAVING OPIOID
ANTAGONISTS OR REVERSAL AGENTS.—

(1) AMENDMENT.—The Office of National
Drug Control Policy Reauthorization Act of
2006 (Public Law 109-469; 120 Stat. 3502) is
amended by adding at the end the following:

March 12, 2025

“SEC. 1121. REQUIREMENT FOR LIFE SAVING
OPIOID OVERDOSE REVERSAL
STUDY.

‘“(a) FINDING.—Congress finds that it is
vital to support access to treatment and
emergency intervention tools to address
drug addiction while also pursuing strategies
to ensure communities have readily avail-
able access to life-saving drug overdose re-
versal medications, including opioid antago-
nists or reversal agents, such as naloxone, in
case of an emergency.

‘“(b) REPORT.—Not later than 180 days after
the date of enactment of this section, the Di-
rector of the Office of National Drug Control
Policy shall submit to Congress a report that
contains the following:

‘(1) A summary of the relevant roles, re-
sponsibilities, and authorities of each rel-
evant National Drug Control Program agen-
cy to ensure that life-saving drug overdose
reversal medications are readily available in
case of an emergency, including life-saving
opioid antagonists or reversal agents, such
as naloxone, across the United States.

‘“(2) A strategy for the Federal Govern-
ment to ensure that State, local, and Tribal
governments, and agencies thereof including
law enforcement and public health and safe-
ty entities, have life-saving drug overdose
reversal medications readily available in
case of an emergency, including life-saving
opioid antagonists or reversal agents, such
as naloxone, which at a minimum identi-
fies—

“(A) any Federal and State policies and ac-
tions necessary for the relevant National
Drug Control Program agencies to take to
address—

‘(i) the challenges faced by pharmacists,
prescription drug providers, dispensers (in-
cluding manufacturers, distributors, and re-
tailers), and other health care providers, to
make such medications readily available to
patients over the counter for emergency use;

‘(i) the challenges faced by pharmacists,
health care providers, and State health offi-
cials to educate the public on the risks and
benefits of such medications, including how
to effectively use such medications; and

‘‘(iii) the appropriate training of State and
local health care providers and first respond-
ers on the use of such medications; and

‘(B) identifies any budgetary resources,
personnel resources, licensing requirements,
and legal authorities that relevant National
Drug Control Program agencies need to en-
able the availability of such life-saving
emergency drug overdose medications.

“(3) A summary of policies in effect before
the submission of the report that are admin-
istered by—

‘“(A) the Director of the Office of National
Drug Control Policy;

‘“(B) the Secretary of Health and Human
Services; and

‘(C) each National Drug Control Program
agency, as applicable.

‘“(4) A summary of the specific actions
taken over the previous 10 years before the
submission of the report by the Substance
Abuse and Mental Health Services Adminis-
tration and the Drug Enforcement Adminis-
tration to coordinate with one another and
with State health agencies to ensure that—

““(A) such treatments, including medica-
tions, are accessible to the public; and

‘(B) appropriate public education on the
use of, and the risks and benefits of, such
treatments, including medications, are read-
ily available.

‘“(c) UPDATES.—Any significant update
made to the strategy included in the report
required by subsection (b) after such report
is submitted shall be included in the next
National Drug Control Strategy submitted
to Congress after such update is made.”’.

(2) TECHNICAL AND CONFORMING AMEND-
MENT.—The table of contents in section 1(c)



March 12, 2025

of the Office of National Drug Control Policy
Reauthorization Act of 2006 (Public Law 109-
469; 120 Stat. 3502) is amended by adding at
the end the following:

‘“Sec. 1121. Requirement for life saving
opioid overdose reversal
study.”.

(f) REPORT ON PILL PRESS MACHINES.—Not
later than 120 days after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Director of the Office
of National Drug Control Policy shall make
public a report that includes an analysis of
and a description of strategic ways to regu-
late the shipment of pill press machines and
their critical parts using reports previously
prepared by the Office.

SA 1261. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

At the end add the following.
“This Act shall take effect 1 day after the
date of enactment.”

SA 1262. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

Strike ‘1 day’’ and insert ‘2 days”’

SA 1263. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

This Act shall take effect 3 days after the
date of enactment

SA 1264. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

Strike ‘3 days’ and insert ‘4 days”’

SA 1265. Mr. THUNE submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 331, to amend the
Controlled Substances Act with respect
to the scheduling of fentanyl-related
substances, and for other purposes;
which was ordered to lie on the table;
as follows:

Strike ‘4 days’ and insert ‘5 days”’

SA 1266. Mr. PAUL submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill H.R. 1968, making fur-
ther continuing appropriations and
other extensions for the fiscal year
ending September 30, 2025, and for
other purposes; which was ordered to
lie on the table; as follows:

On page 77, between lines 10 and 11, insert
the following:

SEC. 11209. (a) Notwithstanding section
1101, the levels for the following accounts in

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

title II of division F of Public Law 118-47
shall be as follows:

(1) ““Operating Expenses’’, $288,150,000, of
which up to $43,222,5600 may remain available
until September 30, 2026.

(2) “Capital Investment Fund”’, $44,047,000.

3) ““Office of Inspector General”’,
$14,5635,000, of which up to $2,180,250 may re-
main available until September 30, 2026.

(b) Notwithstanding section 1101, the levels
for the following accounts in title III of divi-
sion F of Public Law 118-47 shall be as fol-
lows:

(1) ““Global Health Programs”’, $677,526,500.

(2) “Development Assistance’, $668,270,000.

(3) “International Disaster Assistance’,
$812,430,000, of which $127,500,000 is designated
by Congress as being for an emergency re-
quirement pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)({)
of the Balanced Budget and Emergency Def-
icit Control Act of 1985.

(4) “Transition Initiatives”, $12,750,000, and
up to an additional $2,550,000 of the funds ap-
propriated to carry out the provisions of part
I of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 if the
Secretary of State determines that it is im-
portant to the mnational interest of the
United States to provide transition assist-
ance in excess of such base amount.

(5) ‘“Complex Crises Fund”’, $9,350,000.

(6) “Economic Support Fund”, $661,368,000,
of which $51,000,000 is designated by Congress
as being for an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Bal-
anced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control
Act of 1985.

(7) “Bureau for Democracy, Human Rights,
and Governance’’, $23,800,000.

(8) ‘‘Assistance for Europe, Eurasia, and
Central Asia”’, $130,956,780, of  which
$52,700,000 is designated by Congress as being
for an emergency requirement pursuant to
section 251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the Balanced Budget
and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

SA 1267. Ms. ALSOBROOKS sub-
mitted an amendment intended to be
proposed by her to the bill H.R. 1968,
making further continuing appropria-
tions and other extensions for the fis-
cal year ending September 30, 2025, and
for other purposes; which was ordered
to lie on the table; as follows:

On page 49, between lines 14 and 15, insert
the following:

SEC. 1609. (a) Notwithstanding section 1101,
the District of Columbia may expend local
funds made available under the heading
“District of Columbia—District of Columbia
Funds” for such programs and activities
under the District of Columbia Appropria-
tions Act, 2024 (title IV of division B of Pub-
lic Law 118-47) at the rate set forth in the
Fiscal Year 2025 Local Budget Act of 2024
(D.C. Law 25-218), as modified as of the date
of enactment of this Act.

(b) Section 816 of the Further Consolidated
Appropriations Act, 2024 (Public Law 118-4T7;
138 Stat. 592) is amended by striking ‘‘fiscal
year 2025 each place it appears and insert-
ing ‘“‘fiscal year 2026”’.

———

AUTHORITY FOR COMMITTEES TO
MEET

Mr. THUNE. Mr. President, I have 10
requests for committees to meet during
today’s session of the Senate. They
have the approval of the Majority and
Minority Leaders.

Pursuant to rule XXVI, paragraph
5(a), of the Standing Rules of the Sen-
ate, the following committees are au-
thorized to meet during today’s session
of the Senate:

S1721

COMMITTEE ON BANKING, HOUSING, AND URBAN
AFFAIRS
The Committee on Banking, Housing,
and Urban Affairs is authorized to
meet during the session of the Senate
on Wednesday, March 12, 2025, at 10
a.m., to conduct a hearing.
COMMITTEE ON COMMERCE, SCIENCE, AND
TRANSPORTATION
The Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation is author-
ized to meet during the session of the
Senate on Wednesday, March 12, 2025,
at 9:30 a.m., to conduct an executive
session.
COMMITTEE ON COMMERCE, SCIENCE, AND
TRANSPORTATION
The Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation is author-
ized to meet during the session of the
Senate on Wednesday, March 12, 2025,
at 10 a.m., to conduct an executive ses-
sion.
COMMITTEE ON ENERGY AND NATURAL
RESOURCES
The Committee on Energy and Nat-
ural Resources is authorized to meet
during the session of the Senate on
Wednesday, March 12, 2025, at 10 a.m.,
to conduct a hearing.
COMMITTEE ON FOREIGN RELATIONS
The Committee on Foreign Relations
is authorized to meet during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday,
March 12, 2025, at 10 a.m., to conduct a
business meeting.
COMMITTEE ON SMALL BUSINESS AND
ENTREPRENEURSHIP
The Committee on Small Business
and Entrepreneurship is authorized to
meet during the session of the Senate
on Wednesday, March 12, 2025, at 2:30
p.m., to conduct a hearing on nomina-
tions.
COMMITTEE ON VETERANS’ AFFAIRS
The Committee on Veterans’ Affairs
is authorized to meet during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday,
March 12, 2025, at 2:30 p.m., to conduct
a business meeting.
SPECIAL COMMITTEE ON AGING
The Special Committee on Aging is
authorized to meet during the session
of the Senate on Wednesday, March 12,
2025, at 3:30 p.m., to conduct a hearing.
SELECT COMMITTEE ON INTELLIGENCE
The Select Committee on Intel-
ligence is authorized to meet during
the session of the Senate on Wednes-
day, March 12, 2025, at 2:30 p.m., to con-
duct a closed briefing.
SUBCOMMITTEE ON READINESS AND
MANAGEMENT SUPPORT
The Subcommittee on Readiness and
Management Support of the Com-
mittee on Armed Services is authorized
to meet in open session during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday,
March 12, 2025, at 9:30 a.m., to receive
testimony.

——
PRIVILEGES OF THE FLOOR
Mr. KELLY. Mr. President, I ask

unanimous consent that privileges of
the floor be granted to the following



		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-05-04T12:01:34-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




