7]
July 18, 2018

(2) the term ‘‘microloan program’ means the
program established under section 7(m) of the
Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)).

SEC. 3. MICROLOAN INTERMEDIARY LENDING
LIMIT INCREASED.

Section 7(m)(3)(C) of the Small Business Act
(15 U.S.C. 636(m)(3)(C)) is amended by striking
“‘$5,000,000”° and inserting ‘‘36,000,000’.

SEC. 4. MICROLOAN TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.

Section 7(m)(4)(E) of the Small Business Act
(15 U.S.C. 636(m)(4)(E)) is amended by striking
‘25 percent’’ each place that term appears and
inserting ‘50 percent’’.

SEC. 5. SBA STUDY OF MICROENTERPRISE PAR-
TICIPATION.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Administrator of the Small
Business Administration shall conduct a study
and submit to the Committee on Small Business
and Entrepreneurship of the Senate and the
Committee on Small Business of the House of
Representatives a report on—

(1) the operations (including services pro-
vided, structure, size, and area of operation) of
a representative sample of—

(4) intermediaries that are eligible to partici-
pate in the microloan program and that do par-
ticipate; and

(B) intermediaries (including those operated
for profit, operated not for profit, and those af-
filiated with a United States institution of high-
er learning) that are eligible to participate in
the microloan program and that do not partici-
pate;

(2) the reasons why intermediaries described
in paragraph (1)(B) choose not to participate in
the microloan program;

(3) recommendations on how to encourage in-
creased participation in the microloan program
by intermediaries described in paragraph (1)(B);
and

(4) recommendations on how to decrease the
costs associated with participation in the
microloan program for eligible intermediaries.
SEC. 6. GAO STUDY ON MICROLOAN INTER-

MEDIARY PRACTICES.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Comptroller General of the
United States shall submit to the Committee on
Small Business and Entrepreneurship of the
Senate and the Committee on Small Business of
the House of Representatives a report evalu-
ating—

(1) oversight of the microloan program by the
Small Business Administration, including over-
sight of intermediaries participating in the
microloan program; and

(2) the specific processes used by the Small
Business Administration to ensure—

(A4) compliance by intermediaries participating
in the microloan program; and

(B) the overall performance of the microloan
program.

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the com-
mittee-reported substitute amendment
be agreed to; that the Risch amend-
ment at the desk be agreed to; that the
bill, as amended, be considered read a
third time.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The committee-reported amendment
in the nature of a substitute was
agreed to.

The amendment (No. 3397) was agreed
to, as follows:

(Purpose: To strike section 4)

Strike section 4.

The bill was ordered to be engrossed
for a third reading and was read the
third time.

Mr. ROUNDS. I know of no further
debate on the bill, as amended.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

The PRESIDING OFFICER. If there
is no further debate, the bill having
been read the third time, the question
is, Shall the bill pass?

The bill (S. 526), as amended, was
passed, as follows:

S. 526

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Microloan
Modernization Act of 2018,

SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act—

(1) the term ‘“‘intermediary’ has the mean-
ing given the term in section 7(m)(11) of the
Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)(11)); and

(2) the term ‘‘microloan program’ means
the program established under section 7(m)
of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)).
SEC. 3. MICROLOAN INTERMEDIARY LENDING

LIMIT INCREASED.

Section 7(m)(3)(C) of the Small Business

Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)(3)(C)) is amended by

striking ‘$5,000,000”’ and inserting

‘$6,000,000°".

SEC. 4. SBA STUDY OF MICROENTERPRISE PAR-
TICIPATION.

Not later than 1 year after the date of en-
actment of this Act, the Administrator of
the Small Business Administration shall
conduct a study and submit to the Com-
mittee on Small Business and Entrepreneur-
ship of the Senate and the Committee on
Small Business of the House of Representa-
tives a report on—

(1) the operations (including services pro-
vided, structure, size, and area of operation)
of a representative sample of—

(A) intermediaries that are eligible to par-
ticipate in the microloan program and that
do participate; and

(B) intermediaries (including those oper-
ated for profit, operated not for profit, and
those affiliated with a United States institu-
tion of higher learning) that are eligible to
participate in the microloan program and
that do not participate;

(2) the reasons why intermediaries de-
scribed in paragraph (1)(B) choose not to par-
ticipate in the microloan program;

(3) recommendations on how to encourage
increased participation in the microloan pro-
gram by intermediaries described in para-
graph (1)(B); and

(4) recommendations on how to decrease
the costs associated with participation in
the microloan program for eligible inter-
mediaries.

SEC. 5. GAO STUDY ON MICROLOAN
MEDIARY PRACTICES.

Not later than 1 year after the date of en-
actment of this Act, the Comptroller General
of the United States shall submit to the
Committee on Small Business and Entrepre-
neurship of the Senate and the Committee
on Small Business of the House of Represent-
atives a report evaluating—

(1) oversight of the microloan program by
the Small Business Administration, includ-
ing oversight of intermediaries participating
in the microloan program; and

(2) the specific processes used by the Small
Business Administration to ensure—

(A) compliance by intermediaries partici-
pating in the microloan program; and

(B) the overall performance of
microloan program.

Mr. ROUNDS. I ask unanimous con-
sent that the motion to reconsider be
considered made and laid upon the
table.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

INTER-

the

S5073

SMALL BUSINESS INNOVATION
PROTECTION ACT OF 2017

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the Senate
proceed to the immediate consider-
ation of Calendar No. 347, S. 791.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will report the bill by title.

The legislative clerk read as follows:

A Dbill (S. 791) to amend the Small Business
Act to expand intellectual property edu-
cation and training for small businesses, and
for other purposes.

There being no objection, the Senate
proceeded to consider the bill.

Mr. ROUNDS. I ask unanimous con-
sent that the bill be considered read a
third time.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The bill was ordered to be engrossed
for a third reading and was read the
third time.

Mr. ROUNDS. I know of no further
debate on the bill.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. If there
is no further debate, the bill having
been read the third time, the question
is, Shall the bill pass?

The bill (S. 791) was passed, as fol-
lows:

S. 791

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Small Busi-
ness Innovation Protection Act of 2017"".

SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act—

(1) the term ‘‘Administrator’” means the
Administrator of the SBA;

(2) the term ‘“‘Director’” means the Under
Secretary of Commerce for Intellectual
Property and Director of the USPTO;

(3) the term ‘“SBA’ means the Small Busi-
ness Administration;

(4) the term ‘‘small business concern’’ has
the meaning given the term in section 3(a) of
the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 632(a));

(5) the term ‘‘small business development
center’” means a center described in section
21 of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 648);
and

(6) the term “USPTO” means the United
States Patent and Trademark Office.

SEC. 3. FINDINGS.

Congress finds that—

(1) the USPTO and the SBA are positioned
to—

(A) build upon several successful intellec-
tual property and training programs aimed
at small business concerns; and

(B) increase the availability of and the par-
ticipation in the programs described in sub-
paragraph (A) across the United States; and

(2) any education and training program ad-
ministered by the USPTO and the SBA
should be scalable so that the program is
able to reach more small business concerns.
SEC. 4. SBA AND USPTO PARTNERSHIPS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Beginning not later than
180 days after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Administrator, in consultation with
the Director, shall develop partnership
agreements that—

(1) provide for the—

(A) development of high-quality training,
including in-person or modular training ses-
sions, for small business concerns relating to
domestic and international protection of in-
tellectual property;



S5074

(B) leveraging of training materials al-
ready developed for the education of inven-
tors and small business concerns; and

(C) participation of a nongovernmental or-
ganization; and

(2) provide training—

(A) through electronic resources, including
Internet-based webinars; and

(B) at physical locations, including—

(i) a small business development center;
and

(ii) the headquarters or a regional office of
the USPTO.

SEC. 5. SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT CEN-
TERS.

Section 21(c)(3) of the Small Business Act
(15 U.S.C. 648(c)(3)) is amended—

(1) in subparagraph (S), by striking ‘‘and”
at the end;

(2) in subparagraph (T), by striking the pe-
riod at the end and inserting ‘‘; and’’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

‘(U) in conjunction with the United States
Patent and Trademark Office, providing
training—

‘(i) to small business concerns relating
to—

““(I) domestic and international intellec-
tual property protections; and

‘“(IT) how the protections described in sub-
clause (I) should be considered in the busi-
ness plans and growth strategies of the small
business concerns; and

‘“(ii) that may be delivered—

‘“(I) in person; or

“(IT) through a website.”.

Mr. ROUNDS. I ask unanimous con-
sent that the motion to reconsider be
considered made and laid upon the
table.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

——————

AMENDING THE WHITE MOUNTAIN
APACHE TRIBE WATER RIGHTS
QUANTIFICATION ACT OF 2010

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the Senate
proceed to the immediate consider-
ation of Calendar No. 416, S. 2850.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will report the bill by title.

The legislative clerk read as follows:

A bill (S. 2850) to amend the White Moun-
tain Apache Tribe Water Rights Quantifica-
tion Act of 2010 to clarify the use of amounts
in the WMAT Settlement Fund.

There being no objection, the Senate
proceeded to consider the bill.

Mr. ROUNDS. I ask unanimous con-
sent that the Flake amendment at the
desk be agreed to, that the bill, as
amended, be considered read a third
time and passed, and that the motion
to reconsider be considered made and
laid upon the table.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The amendment (No. 3398) in the na-
ture of a substitute was agreed to, as
follows:

(Purpose: In the nature of a substitute)

Strike all after the enacting clause and in-
sert the following:

SEC. . USE OF FUNDS IN WMAT SETTLE-
MENT FUND FOR WMAT RURAL
WATER SYSTEM.

(a) AUTHORIZATION OF WMAT RURAL WATER
SYSTEM.—Section 307(a) of the White Moun-
tain Apache Tribe Water Rights Quantifica-
tion Act of 2010 (Public Law 111-291; 124 Stat.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

3080) is amended in the matter preceding
paragraph (1) by inserting , (b)(2),” after
‘‘subsections (a)”’.

(b) FUNDING.—Section 312(b)(2)(C)(1)(III) of
the White Mountain Apache Tribe Water
Rights Quantification Act of 2010 (Public
Law 111-291; 124 Stat. 3093) is amended by
striking the period at the end and inserting
the following: ‘‘, including the planning, de-
sign, and construction of the WMAT rural
water system, in accordance with section

307(a).”.

SEC. . EXPANSION OF PUEBLO OF SANTA
CLARA LAND ELIGIBLE FOR 99-YEAR
LEASE.

Subsection (a) of the first section of the
Act of August 9, 1955 (commonly known as
the ‘“Long-Term Leasing Act’”) (256 U.S.C.
415(a)), is amended—

(1) by striking ‘Indians,,”” and inserting
‘“‘Indians,’’;

(2) by inserting ‘“Ohkay Owingeh pueblo,”
after ““Cochiti,”’;

(3) by inserting ‘‘the pueblo of Santa
Clara,”’ after ‘‘Pojoaque,’’;

(4) by striking ‘‘the the lands’ and insert-
ing ‘“‘the land’’;

(5) by striking ‘‘lands held in trust for the
Pueblo of Santa Clara,’”’; and

(6) by striking ‘lands held in trust for
Ohkay Owingeh Pueblo’.

The bill (S. 2850), as amended, was or-
dered to be engrossed for a third read-

ing, was read the third time, and
passed.
————
ORDERS FOR THURSDAY, JULY 19,
2018

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that when the Sen-
ate completes its business today, it ad-
journ until 10 a.m., Thursday, July 19;
further, that following the prayer and
pledge, the morning hour be deemed
expired, the Journal of proceedings be
approved to date, the time for the two
leaders be reserved for their use later
in the day, and morning business be
closed. I ask that following leader re-
marks, the Senate proceed to executive
session and resume consideration of
the Bounds nomination; further, that
all time in recess, adjournment, morn-
ing business, and leader remarks count
against postcloture time.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

———

ORDER FOR ADJOURNMENT

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, if there
is no further business to come before
the Senate, I ask unanimous consent
that it stand adjourned under the pre-
vious order, following the remarks of
the Senator from Delaware.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I sug-
gest the absence of a quorum.

The PRESIDING OFFICER.
clerk will call the roll.

The bill clerk proceeded to call the
roll.

Mr. COONS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the order for
the quorum call be rescinded.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The

July 18, 2018

HONORING THE LIFE, ACCOM-
PLISHMENTS, AND LEGACY OF
NELSON MANDELA

Mr. COONS. Mr. President on this
date a century ago, an extraordinary
life began that would change the lives
of millions of others. One hundred
years ago today, Nelson Mandela was
born in the village of Mvezo in a coun-
tryside of grass-covered rolling hills in
the Eastern Cape of South Africa. That
day began a 95-year journey of one man
who led the South African people to
liberation and whose legacy continues
to reverberate through time.

Over the course of his life, Nelson
Mandela, known by his nickname
“Madiba,” became venerated as a glob-
al advocate for justice and equality by
millions—arguably, more than any
other political figure of our time.
Through political activism and resist-
ance, Madiba led a revolution by shep-
herding his people from racial division,
hate, and subjugation to freedom, tol-
erance, and democracy.

One of the most striking aspects of
Nelson Mandela’s leadership as the
first President of a truly free, non-
racial, nonsexist South Africa was his
enormous capacity for forgiveness and
his ability to open his heart to those
who were once his brutal oppressors.

Twenty years after he was released
from a lifetime in prison, Nelson
Mandela invited to dinner at his own
home one of his former jailers, a man
with whom he had become close
friends, saying that their friendship re-
inforced his belief in the essential hu-
manity of even those who had kept him
for so long behind bars. How long?
Twenty-six years, 6 months, and 1
week.

Despite all of those years, months,
and days of continuous imprisonment,
Nelson Mandela never himself became
a prisoner to hate. Madiba set the ex-
ample of healing, forgiveness, and rec-
onciliation that ultimately allowed
South Africa’s rainbow nation to
emerge from the ashes of brutal racial
oppression.

His example is particularly timely
and powerful in light of the polariza-
tion, distrust, and division in our world
and even in our own Nation today. His-
tory reminds us, though, that this rec-
onciliation, this openness, is not a new
phenomenon.

Fifty-two years ago this summer, in
June of 1966, then-U.S. Senator Robert
F. Kennedy delivered a memorable
speech at the University of Cape Town
in South Africa. Speaking to a nation
then deep in the throes of the cruel in-
justices of apartheid, Senator Bobby
Kennedy began his speech by describ-
ing ‘“‘a land in which the native inhab-
itants were at first subdued, but rela-
tions with whom remain a problem to
this day; a land which defined itself on
a hostile frontier; a land which was
once the importer of slaves, and must
now struggle to wipe out the last
traces of that former bondage.” Ken-
nedy then paused before famously con-
cluding: ‘I refer, of course, to the
United States of America.”



		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-10-09T18:29:42-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




