cro

7
S5072

AMENDMENTS SUBMITTED AND
PROPOSED

SA 3397. Mr. ROUNDS (for Mr. RISCH) pro-
posed an amendment to the bill S. 526, to
amend the Small Business Act to provide for
expanded participation in the microloan pro-
gram, and for other purposes .

SA 3398. Mr. ROUNDS (for Mr. FLAKE) pro-
posed an amendment to the bill S. 2850, to
amend the White Mountain Apache Tribe
Water Rights Quantification Act of 2010 to
clarify the use of amounts in the WMAT Set-
tlement Fund.

———
TEXT OF AMENDMENTS

SA 3397. Mr. ROUNDS (for Mr. RISCH)
proposed an amendment to the bill S.
526, to amend the Small Business Act
to provide for expanded participation

in the microloan program, and for
other purposes; as follows:

Strike section 4.

SA 3398. Mr. ROUNDS (for Mr.

FLAKE) proposed an amendment to the
bill S. 2850, to amend the White Moun-
tain Apache Tribe Water Rights Quan-
tification Act of 2010 to clarify the use
of amounts in the WMAT Settlement
Fund; as follows:

Strike all after the enacting clause and in-
sert the following:

SEC. . USE OF FUNDS IN WMAT SETTLE-
MENT FUND FOR WMAT RURAL
WATER SYSTEM.

(a) AUTHORIZATION OF WMAT RURAL WATER
SYSTEM.—Section 307(a) of the White Moun-
tain Apache Tribe Water Rights Quantifica-
tion Act of 2010 (Public Law 111-291; 124 Stat.
3080) is amended in the matter preceding
paragraph (1) by inserting ‘, (b)(2),” after
‘“‘subsections (a)’’.

(b) FUNDING.—Section 312(b)(2)(C)(1)(III) of
the White Mountain Apache Tribe Water
Rights Quantification Act of 2010 (Public
Law 111-291; 124 Stat. 3093) is amended by
striking the period at the end and inserting
the following: *‘, including the planning, de-
sign, and construction of the WMAT rural
water system, in accordance with section
307(a).”".

SEC. . EXPANSION OF PUEBLO OF SANTA
CLARA LAND ELIGIBLE FOR 99-YEAR
LEASE.

Subsection (a) of the first section of the
Act of August 9, 1955 (commonly known as
the ‘“Long-Term Leasing Act’”) (256 U.S.C.
415(a)), is amended—

(1) by striking ‘‘Indians,,” and inserting
“Indians,’’;

(2) by inserting ‘“‘Ohkay Owingeh pueblo,”
after ‘“‘Cochiti,”’;

(3) by inserting ‘‘the pueblo of Santa
Clara,” after ‘“‘Pojoaque,’’;

(4) by striking ‘‘the the lands’ and insert-
ing ‘‘the land’’;

(5) by striking ‘‘lands held in trust for the
Pueblo of Santa Clara,’’; and

(6) by striking ‘‘lands held in trust for
Ohkay Owingeh Pueblo’.

———

AUTHORITY FOR COMMITTEES TO
MEET

Mr. BARRASSO. Mr. President, I
have 7 requests for committees to meet
during today’s session of the Senate.
They have the approval of the Majority
and Minority leaders.

Pursuant to rule XXVI, paragraph
5(a), of the Standing Rules of the Sen-
ate, the following committees are au-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

thorized to meet during today’s session
of the Senate:
COMMITTEE ON COMMERCE, SCIENCE, AND
TRANSPORTATION
The Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation is author-
ized to meet during the session of the
Senate on Wednesday, July 18, 2018, at
10:15 a.m., to conduct a hearing enti-
tled ‘“‘Sharks’.
COMMITTEE ON FOREIGN RELATIONS
The Committee on Foreign Relations
is authorized to meet during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday, July
18, 2018, at 10 a.m., to conduct a hearing
on the nominations of Brian J.
Bulatao, of Texas, to be an Under Sec-
retary (Management), and Denise
Natali, of New Jersey, to be an Assist-
ant Secretary (Conflict and Stabiliza-
tion Operations), both of the Depart-
ment of State.
COMMITTEE ON HOMELAND SECURITY AND
GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS
The Committee on Homeland Secu-
rity and Governmental Affairs is au-
thorized to meet during the session of
the Senate on Wednesday, July 18, 2018,
at 10 a.m., to conduct a hearing.
COMMITTEE ON INDIAN AFFAIRS
The Committee on Indian Affairs is
authorized to meet during the session
of the Senate on Wednesday, July 18,
2018, at 2:30 p.m., to conduct a hearing.
COMMITTEE ON THE JUDICIARY
The Committee on the Judiciary is
authorized to meet during the session
of the Senate on Wednesday, July 18,
2018, at 10 a.m., to conduct a hearing.
SPECIAL COMMITTEE ON AGING
The Special Committee on Aging is
authorized to meet during the session
of the Senate on Wednesday, July 18,
2018, at 9:30 a.m., to conduct a hearing.
SUBCOMMITTEE ON INTERNATIONAL TRADE,
CUSTOMS, AND GLOBAL COMPETITIVENESS
The Subcommittee on International
Trade, Customs, and Global Competi-
tiveness of the Committee on Finance
is authorized to meet during the ses-
sion of the Senate on Wednesday, July
18, 2018, at 2:30 p.m., to conduct a hear-
ing.

PRIVILEGES OF THE FLOOR

Mr. BARRASSO. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that Molly Patrick,
Lane Davis, Victoria Barczyk, James
Payne, and Gabe Dabin, interns from
Senator KENNEDY’s office, be granted
floor privileges for the remainder of
the day.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

————

NOTICE: REGISTRATION OF MASS
MAILINGS

The filing date for the 2018 second
quarter Mass Mailing report is Wednes-
day, July 25, 2018.

An electronic option is available on
Webster that will allow forms to be
submitted via a fillable pdf document.
If your office did no mass mailings dur-

July 18, 2018

ing this period, please submit a form
that states ‘‘none.”

Mass mailing registrations or nega-
tive reports can be submitted elec-
tronically or delivered to the Senate
Office of Public Records, 232 Hart
Building, Washington, DC 20510-7116.

The Senate Office of Public Records
is open from 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. For fur-
ther information, please contact the
Senate Office of Public Records at (202)
224-0322.

———

EXECUTIVE SESSION

EXECUTIVE CALENDAR

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the Senate
proceed to executive session for the
consideration of Calendar No. 942; that
the nomination be confirmed; that the
motion to reconsider be considered
made and laid upon the table with no
intervening action or debate; that no
further motions be in order; that any
statements related to the nomination
be printed in the Record; that the
President be immediately notified of
the Senate’s action, and the Senate
then resume legislative session.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The nomination considered and con-
firmed is as follows:

IN THE COAST GUARD

The following named officer for appoint-
ment in the United States Coast Guard Re-
serve to the grade indicated under title 10,
U.S.C., section 12203(a):

To be rear admiral
Rear Adm. (1h) Andrew S. McKinley

——————

LEGISLATIVE SESSION

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ate will now resume legislative session.

————

MICROLOAN MODERNIZATION ACT
OF 2017

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the Senate
proceed to the immediate consider-
ation of Calendar No. 346, S. 526.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will report the bill by title.

The legislative clerk read as follows:

A Dbill (S. 526) to amend the Small Business
Act to provide for expanded participation in
the microloan program, and for other pur-
poses.

There being no objection, the Senate
proceeded to consider the bill, which
had been reported from the Committee
on Small Business and Entrepreneur-
ship, with an amendment to strike all
after the enacting clause and insert in
lieu thereof the following:

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Microloan Mod-
ernization Act of 2018”°.
SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act—

(1) the term ‘‘intermediary’’ has the meaning
given the term in section 7(m)(11) of the Small
Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)(11)); and



July 18, 2018

(2) the term ‘‘microloan program’ means the
program established under section 7(m) of the
Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)).

SEC. 3. MICROLOAN INTERMEDIARY LENDING
LIMIT INCREASED.

Section 7(m)(3)(C) of the Small Business Act
(15 U.S.C. 636(m)(3)(C)) is amended by striking
“‘$5,000,000”° and inserting ‘‘36,000,000’.

SEC. 4. MICROLOAN TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.

Section 7(m)(4)(E) of the Small Business Act
(15 U.S.C. 636(m)(4)(E)) is amended by striking
‘25 percent’’ each place that term appears and
inserting ‘50 percent’’.

SEC. 5. SBA STUDY OF MICROENTERPRISE PAR-
TICIPATION.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Administrator of the Small
Business Administration shall conduct a study
and submit to the Committee on Small Business
and Entrepreneurship of the Senate and the
Committee on Small Business of the House of
Representatives a report on—

(1) the operations (including services pro-
vided, structure, size, and area of operation) of
a representative sample of—

(4) intermediaries that are eligible to partici-
pate in the microloan program and that do par-
ticipate; and

(B) intermediaries (including those operated
for profit, operated not for profit, and those af-
filiated with a United States institution of high-
er learning) that are eligible to participate in
the microloan program and that do not partici-
pate;

(2) the reasons why intermediaries described
in paragraph (1)(B) choose not to participate in
the microloan program;

(3) recommendations on how to encourage in-
creased participation in the microloan program
by intermediaries described in paragraph (1)(B);
and

(4) recommendations on how to decrease the
costs associated with participation in the
microloan program for eligible intermediaries.
SEC. 6. GAO STUDY ON MICROLOAN INTER-

MEDIARY PRACTICES.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Comptroller General of the
United States shall submit to the Committee on
Small Business and Entrepreneurship of the
Senate and the Committee on Small Business of
the House of Representatives a report evalu-
ating—

(1) oversight of the microloan program by the
Small Business Administration, including over-
sight of intermediaries participating in the
microloan program; and

(2) the specific processes used by the Small
Business Administration to ensure—

(A4) compliance by intermediaries participating
in the microloan program; and

(B) the overall performance of the microloan
program.

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the com-
mittee-reported substitute amendment
be agreed to; that the Risch amend-
ment at the desk be agreed to; that the
bill, as amended, be considered read a
third time.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The committee-reported amendment
in the nature of a substitute was
agreed to.

The amendment (No. 3397) was agreed
to, as follows:

(Purpose: To strike section 4)

Strike section 4.

The bill was ordered to be engrossed
for a third reading and was read the
third time.

Mr. ROUNDS. I know of no further
debate on the bill, as amended.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

The PRESIDING OFFICER. If there
is no further debate, the bill having
been read the third time, the question
is, Shall the bill pass?

The bill (S. 526), as amended, was
passed, as follows:

S. 526

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Microloan
Modernization Act of 2018,

SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act—

(1) the term ‘“‘intermediary’ has the mean-
ing given the term in section 7(m)(11) of the
Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)(11)); and

(2) the term ‘‘microloan program’ means
the program established under section 7(m)
of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)).
SEC. 3. MICROLOAN INTERMEDIARY LENDING

LIMIT INCREASED.

Section 7(m)(3)(C) of the Small Business

Act (15 U.S.C. 636(m)(3)(C)) is amended by

striking ‘$5,000,000”’ and inserting

‘$6,000,000°".

SEC. 4. SBA STUDY OF MICROENTERPRISE PAR-
TICIPATION.

Not later than 1 year after the date of en-
actment of this Act, the Administrator of
the Small Business Administration shall
conduct a study and submit to the Com-
mittee on Small Business and Entrepreneur-
ship of the Senate and the Committee on
Small Business of the House of Representa-
tives a report on—

(1) the operations (including services pro-
vided, structure, size, and area of operation)
of a representative sample of—

(A) intermediaries that are eligible to par-
ticipate in the microloan program and that
do participate; and

(B) intermediaries (including those oper-
ated for profit, operated not for profit, and
those affiliated with a United States institu-
tion of higher learning) that are eligible to
participate in the microloan program and
that do not participate;

(2) the reasons why intermediaries de-
scribed in paragraph (1)(B) choose not to par-
ticipate in the microloan program;

(3) recommendations on how to encourage
increased participation in the microloan pro-
gram by intermediaries described in para-
graph (1)(B); and

(4) recommendations on how to decrease
the costs associated with participation in
the microloan program for eligible inter-
mediaries.

SEC. 5. GAO STUDY ON MICROLOAN
MEDIARY PRACTICES.

Not later than 1 year after the date of en-
actment of this Act, the Comptroller General
of the United States shall submit to the
Committee on Small Business and Entrepre-
neurship of the Senate and the Committee
on Small Business of the House of Represent-
atives a report evaluating—

(1) oversight of the microloan program by
the Small Business Administration, includ-
ing oversight of intermediaries participating
in the microloan program; and

(2) the specific processes used by the Small
Business Administration to ensure—

(A) compliance by intermediaries partici-
pating in the microloan program; and

(B) the overall performance of
microloan program.

Mr. ROUNDS. I ask unanimous con-
sent that the motion to reconsider be
considered made and laid upon the
table.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

INTER-

the

S5073

SMALL BUSINESS INNOVATION
PROTECTION ACT OF 2017

Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the Senate
proceed to the immediate consider-
ation of Calendar No. 347, S. 791.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will report the bill by title.

The legislative clerk read as follows:

A Dbill (S. 791) to amend the Small Business
Act to expand intellectual property edu-
cation and training for small businesses, and
for other purposes.

There being no objection, the Senate
proceeded to consider the bill.

Mr. ROUNDS. I ask unanimous con-
sent that the bill be considered read a
third time.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The bill was ordered to be engrossed
for a third reading and was read the
third time.

Mr. ROUNDS. I know of no further
debate on the bill.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. If there
is no further debate, the bill having
been read the third time, the question
is, Shall the bill pass?

The bill (S. 791) was passed, as fol-
lows:

S. 791

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Small Busi-
ness Innovation Protection Act of 2017"".

SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act—

(1) the term ‘‘Administrator’” means the
Administrator of the SBA;

(2) the term ‘“‘Director’” means the Under
Secretary of Commerce for Intellectual
Property and Director of the USPTO;

(3) the term ‘“SBA’ means the Small Busi-
ness Administration;

(4) the term ‘‘small business concern’’ has
the meaning given the term in section 3(a) of
the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 632(a));

(5) the term ‘‘small business development
center’” means a center described in section
21 of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 648);
and

(6) the term “USPTO” means the United
States Patent and Trademark Office.

SEC. 3. FINDINGS.

Congress finds that—

(1) the USPTO and the SBA are positioned
to—

(A) build upon several successful intellec-
tual property and training programs aimed
at small business concerns; and

(B) increase the availability of and the par-
ticipation in the programs described in sub-
paragraph (A) across the United States; and

(2) any education and training program ad-
ministered by the USPTO and the SBA
should be scalable so that the program is
able to reach more small business concerns.
SEC. 4. SBA AND USPTO PARTNERSHIPS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Beginning not later than
180 days after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Administrator, in consultation with
the Director, shall develop partnership
agreements that—

(1) provide for the—

(A) development of high-quality training,
including in-person or modular training ses-
sions, for small business concerns relating to
domestic and international protection of in-
tellectual property;



		Superintendent of Documents
	2022-10-08T05:23:45-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




