August 1, 2002

Senator from Arizona (Mr. KYL), the
Senator from Oklahoma (Mr. INHOFE)
and the Senator from Texas (Mrs.
HUTCHISON) were added as cosponsors of
S. 2794, supra.
S. 2798
At the request of Mr. DURBIN, the
names of the Senator from Massachu-
setts (Mr. KENNEDY), the Senator from
West Virginia (Mr. ROCKEFELLER) and
the Senator from Massachusetts (Mr.
KERRY) were added as cosponsors of S.
2798, a bill to protect employees and re-
tirees from corporate practices that de-
prive them of their earnings and retire-
ment savings when a business files for
bankruptcy under title 11, United
States Code.
S. 2800
At the request of Mr. BAUCUS, the
names of the Senator from New York
(Mrs. CLINTON) and the Senator from
New York (Mr. SCHUMER) were added as
cosponsors of S. 2800, a bill to provide
emergency disaster assistance to agri-
cultural producers.
S. 2814
At the request of Mr. DORGAN, the
name of the Senator from Colorado
(Mr. ALLARD) was added as a cosponsor
of S. 2814, a bill to amend the Farm Se-
curity and Rural Investment Act of
2002 to clarify the rates applicable to
marketing assistance loans and loan
deficiency payments for other oilseeds.
S. 2819
At the request of Mr. JEFFORDS, the
name of the Senator from Louisiana
(Ms. LANDRIEU) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. 2819, a bill to amend title XXI
of the Social Security Act to permit
qualifying States to use a portion of
their unspent allotments under the
State children’s health insurance pro-
gram to expand health coverage under
that program or for expenditures under
the medicaid program, and for other
purposes.
S. 2820
At the request of Mrs. CARNAHAN, the
name of the Senator from Massachu-
setts (Mr. KENNEDY) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 2820, a bill to increase the
priority dollar amount for unsecured
claims, and for other purposes.
S. 2826
At the request of Mr. SCHUMER, the
names of the Senator from Georgia
(Mr. CLELAND), the Senator from South
Dakota (Mr. JOHNSON) and the Senator
from Maine (Ms. COLLINS) were added
as cosponsors of S. 2826, a bill to im-
prove the national instant criminal
background check system, and for
other purposes.
S. 2830
At the request of Mr. ROBERTS, the
names of the Senator from North Caro-
lina (Mr. HELMS) and the Senator from
Idaho (Mr. CrAIG) were added as co-
sponsors of S. 2830, a bill to provide
emergency disaster assistance to agri-
cultural producers.
S. CON. RES. 122
At the request of Ms. SNOWE, the
name of the Senator from Iowa (Mr .

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

HARKIN) was added as a cosponsor of S.
Con. Res. 122, a concurrent resolution
expressing the sense of Congress that
security, reconciliation, and prosperity
for all Cypriots can be best achieved
within the context of membership in
the European Union which will provide
significant rights and obligations for
all Cypriots, and for other purposes.
S. CON. RES. 129

At the request of Mr. CRAPO, the
name of the Senator from Colorado
(Mr. CAMPBELL) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. Con. Res. 129, a concurrent
resolution expressing the sense of Con-
gress regarding the establishment of
the month of November each year as
““Chronic Obstructive Pulmonary Dis-
ease Awareness Month’’.

———————

STATEMENTS ON INTRODUCED
BILLS AND JOINT RESOLUTIONS

By Mr. FEINGOLD (for himself
and Ms. COLLINS):

S. 2835. A bill to promote the develop-
ment of health care cooperatives that
will help businesses to pool the health
care purchasing power of employers,
and for other purposes; to the Com-
mittee on Health, Education, Labor,
and Pensions.

Mr. FEINGOLD. Mr. President, I rise
today with my colleague from Maine to
introduce legislation to help businesses
form group-purchasing cooperatives to
obtain enhanced benefits, to reduce
health care rates, and to improve qual-
ity for their employees’ health care.

High health care costs are burdening
businesses and employees across the
Nation. These costs are digging into
profits and preventing access to afford-
able health care. Too many patients
feel trapped by the system, with deci-
sions about their health dictated by
costs rather than by what they need.

This year has been the third year in
a row of double-digit increases in
health care costs. Companies will like-
ly face average increases of 12 to 15 per-
cent in 2003, on top of the 12.7 percent
increase this year.

For some employers in Wisconsin,
costs will rise much more sharply. A
recent study found health care cost for
businesses in southeastern Wisconsin
were bb percent higher than the Mid-
west average. While nationwide, the
average health care premium for a
family currently costs about $588 per
month, in Wisconsin an average family
pays $812 per month.

We must curb these rapidly-increas-
ing health care premiums. I strongly
support initiatives to ensure that ev-
eryone has access to health care. It is
crucial that we support successful local
initiatives to reduce health care pre-
miums and to improve the quality of
employees; health care.

By using group purchasing to obtain
rate discounts, some employers have
been able to reduce the cost of health
care premiums for their employees. Ac-
cording to the National Business Coali-
tion on Health, there are more than 90
employer-led coalitions across the

S7903

United States that collectively pur-
chase health care. Through these pools,
businesses are able to proactively chal-
lenge high costs and inefficient deliv-
ery of health care and share informa-
tion on quality. These coalitions rep-
resent over 7,000 employers and ap-
proximately 34 million employees na-
tion-wide.

Improving the quality of health care
will also lower the cost of care. By in-
vesting in the delivery of quality
health car, we will be able to lower
long term health care costs. Effective
care, such as quality preventive serv-
ices, can reduce overall health care ex-
penditures. Health purchasing coali-
tions help promote these services and
act as an employer forum for net-
working and education on health care
cost containment strategies. They can
help foster a dialogue with health care
providers, insurers, and local HMOs.

Health care markets are local. Prob-
lems with cost, quality, and access to
healthcare are felt most intensely in
the local markets. Health care coali-
tions can function best when they are
formed and implemented locally.

Local employers of large and small
businesses have formed health care
coalitions to track health care trends,
create a demand for quality and safety,
and encourage group purchasing.

In Wisconsin, there have been various
successful initiatives that have formed
health care purchasing cooperatives to
improve quality of care and to reduce
cost. For example, the Employer
Health Care Alliance Cooperative, an
employer-owned and employer-directed
not-for-profit cooperative, has devel-
oped a network of health care providers
in Dane County and 12 surrounding
counties on behalf of its 170 member
employers. Through this pooling effort,
employers are able to obtain afford-
able, high-quality health care for their
110,000 employees and dependents.

This legislation seeks to build on
successful local initiatives, such as The
Alliance, that help businesses to join
together to increase access to afford-
able and high-quality health care.

The Promoting Health Care Pur-
chasing Cooperatives Act would au-
thorize grants to a group of businesses
so that they could form group-pur-
chasing cooperatives to obtain en-
hanced benefits, reduce health care
rates, and improve quality.

This legislation offers two separate
grant programs to help different types
of businesses pool their resources and
bargaining power. Both programs
would aid businesses to form coopera-
tives. The first program would help
large businesses that sponsor their own
health plans, while the second program
would help small businesses that pur-
chase their health insurance.

My bill would enable larger busi-
nesses to form cost-effective coopera-
tives that could offer quality health
care through several ways. First, they
could obtain health services through
pooled purchasing from physicians,
hospitals, home health agencies, and



S7904

others. By pooling their experience and
interests, employers involved in a coa-
lition could better attack the essential
issues, such as rising health insurance
rates and the lack of comparable
health care quality data. They would
be able to share information regarding
the quality of these services and to
partner with these health care pro-
viders to meet the needs of their em-
ployees.

For smaller businesses that purchase
their health insurance, the formation
of cooperatives would allow them to
buy health insurance at lower prices
through pooled purchasing. Also, the
communication within these coopera-
tives would provide employees of small
businesses with better information
about the health care options that are
available to them. Finally, coalitions
would serve to promote quality im-
provements by facilitating partner-
ships between their group and the
health care providers.

By working together, the group could
develop better quality insurance plans
and negotiate better rates.

Past health purchasing pool initia-
tives have focused only on cost and
have tried to be all things for all peo-
ple. My legislation creates an incentive
to join the pool by giving grants to a
group of similar businesses to form
group-purchasing cooperatives. The
pool are also given flexibility to find
innovative ways to lower costs, such as
enhancing benefits, for example, more
preventive care, and improving quality.
Finally, the cooperative structure is a
proven model, which creates an incen-
tive for businesses to remain in the
pool because they will be invested in
the organization.

We must reform health care in Amer-
ica and give employers and employees
more options. This legislation, by pro-
viding for the formation of cost-effec-
tive coalitions that will also improve
the quality of care, contributes to this
essential reform process. I urge my col-
leagues to join me in cosponsoring this
proposal to improve the quality and
ease the costs of health care.

By Ms. LANDRIEU:

S. 2837. A bill to amend the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 to allow busi-
nesses to qualify as renewal commu-
nity businesses if such businesses em-
ploy residents of certain other renewal
communities; to the Committee on Fi-
nance.

Ms. LANDRIEU. Mr. President, I rise
to introduce legislation to make a
small change to the Renewal Commu-
nity program that will make a big dif-
ference for the people of my State. This
legislation will spur job growth and
economic development in many impov-
erished areas that have been des-
ignated as renewal communities.

Renewal communities were author-
ized under the Community Renewal
Tax Relief Act of 2000. The Department
of Housing and Urban Development has
designated 40 urban and rural areas
around the country as renewal commu-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

nities that are eligible to share in an
estimated $17 billion in tax incentives
to stimulate job growth, promote eco-
nomic development, and create afford-
able housing. The purpose of the Act is
to help bring needed investment to
areas with demonstrated economic dis-
tress. The poverty rate in renewal com-
munities is at least 20 percent, and the
unemployment rate is one-and-a-half
times the national level. The house-
holds in the renewal communities have
incomes that are 80 percent below the
median income of households in their
local jurisdictions.

Businesses in renewal communities
are eligible to receive wage credits, tax
deductions, and capital gains exclu-
sions for hiring workers living in the
renewal communities. In order for busi-
nesses to qualify for participation in
the program they must meet certain
criteria. For example, at least fifty
percent of the total gross income of a
business must come from operations
within the renewal community and a
substantial part of its tangible prop-
erty must lie within the renewal com-
munity. Furthermore, at least thirty-
five percent of its employees must be
residents of the renewal community
and the employees’ services must be
performed in the renewal community.

The Renewal Community program is
targeted to help small businesses in
poor communities. Through the tax
benefits provided, the small and fam-
ily-owned businesses are able to main-
tain their operations and continue sup-
plying goods and services to their
neighborhoods. These businesses are
the true essence of the entrepreneurial
spirit and are the engines of economic
growth and development. The Renewal
Community program also encourages
the start of new businesses. Louisiana
has really benefited from this program.
It has been a catalyst in boosting local
economics and cutting unemployment.

Louisiana has four renewal commu-
nities. Some of them border one an-
other. Under the rules of the program,
however, a business cannot take advan-
tage of the tax incentives if they hire
someone who lives outside the renewal
community, even if that person lives in
the renewal community next door. In
rural areas, this rule poses a problem
for people living in one renewal com-
munity who often find jobs with com-
panies in an adjacent renewal commu-
nity.

A good example of what I am talking
about is in the northern part of Lou-
isiana, home of the North Louisiana
Renewal Community and the Ouachita
Renewal Community. The City of Mon-
roe is located at the heart of the
Ouachita Renewal Community. Monroe
serves as the hub for Northeast Lou-
isiana. All around Monroe and the
Ouachita Renewal Community there
are parishes which all fall in the North
Louisiana Renewal Community, More-
house Parish to the north, Richland
Parish to the east, Caldwell Parish to
the south, and Lincoln Parish to the
west. We know that many companies in

August 1, 2002

the Ouachita Renewal Community
would qualify for the tax benefits if
they could count any employees they
hired from the adjacent North Lou-
isiana Renewal Community toward
meeting the thirty-five percent re-
quirement. My legislation will allow
the employers in one renewal commu-
nity to hire employees from an adja-
cent or nearby renewal community
areas and still receive the tax benefits
granted through the Act.

The goal of the Renewal Community
Program is to provide a vehicle for
change in poverty stricken areas. It
makes sense that we take steps to add
flexibility to the program. Employees
with a particular skill set may be bet-
ter suited to work at companies lo-
cated in an adjacent renewal commu-
nity. My legislation provides employ-
ers and employees with the oppor-
tunity to take full advantage of the
Renewal Community program.

This legislation is an opportunity for
continued assistance to low income
people and economically distressed
areas of our country. I urge my col-
leagues to support this bill.

By Mrs. FEINSTEIN:

S. 2838. A bill to provide for the con-
veyance of Forest Service facilities and
lands comprising the Five Mile Re-
gional Learning Center in the State of
California to the Clovis Unified School
District, to authorize a new special use
permit regarding the continued use of
unconveyed lands comprising the Cen-
ter, and for other purposes; to the Com-
mittee on Energy and Natural Re-
sources.

Mrs. FEINSTEIN. Mr. President, I
am proud to introduce legislation
today to transfer 27 acres of land from
the Stanislaus National Forest to the
Clovis Unified School District.

This bill allows the school district to
continue operating the California Five
Mile Regional Learning Center and,
more importantly, raise the necessary
funds to renovate the facilities.

Since 1989, Clovis Unified School Dis-
trict has leased the Five Mile Regional
Learning Center from the Forest Serv-
ice to offer programs to students living
in the Central Valley. And each year,
thousands of eager children come to
the Center to take classes that empha-
size mnatural resource conservation.
During this past academic year, for in-
stance, more than 14,000 students bene-
fitted from classes ranging from forest
management to aviary studies to team
building.

In addition to classes, students have
the option of attending summer bas-
ketball camps offered in the Center’s
gymnasium and participating in indi-
vidual activities given on the Center’s
adjacent 93 acres. To date, the district
has invested $14 million of local funds
to provide these opportunities.

Unfortunately, in the last few years,
the Regional Learning Center has fall-
en into a state of disrepair. The build-
ings that occupy the 27 acres are over
40 years old, but have never undergone



August 1, 2002

major renovations to modernize and
improve them. As a result, the Center
has a laundry list of items in need of
repair: from cracked asphalt and leaky
roofs to unreliable electrical wiring.
And while Clovis Unified School Dis-
trict officials have done a fine job of
operating the Center and are willing to
invest in renovations, the Forest Serv-
ice can not permit the district to spend
local funds to renovate these federally
owned buildings.

This bill enables the Forest Service
to convey the acreage that the build-
ings occupy to the school district al-
lowing the district to make the nec-
essary repairs. Clovis Unified has al-
ready committed to investing $5 mil-
lion over 5 years to make the renova-
tions, in addition to the district’s $1.2
million of annual contributions spent
on routine maintenance and operating
costs. These investments will be used
to expand and enhance the Center’s en-
vironmental educational curriculum. I
believe that given the budget con-
straints that schools nationwide are
facing that this commitment speaks to
the quality of these programs and to
the need to keep the Center in oper-
ation.

The Forest Service has already ac-
knowledged that this transfer would be
in the best interest of both the Forest
Service and the general public. At the
Forest Service’s request, reversionary
language was added to this bill to en-
sure that the gederal government
would retain ownership of the land
should the school district decide to no
longer operate the facilities.

Without this important legislation,
in a few years time, the California Five
Mile Regional Learning Center will be
uninhabitable and another educational
resource that benefits our children will
close its doors. I believe that this bill
is the perfect example of what can hap-
pen when local, state, and federal gov-
ernments work together to get some-
thing done. It is this type of partner-
ship that Congress should support in
our efforts to diversify and improve
educational opportunities for students
and encourage multi-use activities on
federal land. In this case, I believe ev-
eryone wins and I urge my colleagues
to join me in supporting this bill.

I ask unanimous consent that the
text of the bill be printed in the
RECORD.

There being no objection, the bill was
ordered to be printed in the RECORD, as
follows:

S. 2838

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘California
Five Mile Regional Learning Center Transfer
Act”.

SEC. 2. LAND CONVEYANCE AND SPECIAL USE

AGREEMENT, FIVE MILE REGIONAL
LEARNING CENTER, CALIFORNIA.

(a) CONVEYANCE.—The Secretary of Agri-
culture shall convey to the Clovis Unified
School District of California all right, title,
and interest of the United States in and to a

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

parcel of National Forest System land con-
sisting of 27.10 acres located within the
southwest Y4 of section 2, township 2 north,
range 15 east, Mount Diablo base and merid-
ian, California, which has been utilized as
the Five Mile Regional Learning Center by
the school district since 1989 pursuant to a
special use permit (Holder No. 2010-02) to
provide natural resource conservation edu-
cation to California youth. The conveyance
shall include all structures, improvements,
and personal property shown on original map
#700602 and inventory dated February 1, 1989.

(b) SPECIAL USE AGREEMENT.—AS soon as
practicable after the date of the enactment
of this Act, the Secretary shall enter into
negotiations with the Clovis Unified School
District to enter into a new special use per-
mit for the approximately 100 acres of Na-
tional Forest System land that, as of the
date of the enactment of this Act, is being
used by the school district pursuant to the
permit described in subsection (a), but is not
included in the conveyance under such sub-
section.

(¢c) REVERSION.—In the event that the Clo-
vis Unified School District discontinues its
operation of the Five Mile Regional Learn-
ing Center, title to the real property con-
veyed under subsection (a) shall revert back
to the United States.

(d) CosTs AND MINERAL RIGHTS.—The con-
veyance under subsection (a) shall be for a
nominal cost. Notwithstanding such sub-
section, the conveyance does not include the
transfer of mineral rights.

By Mr. CLELAND:

S. 2839. A Dbill to enhance the protec-
tion of privacy of children who use
school or library computers employing
Internet content management services,
and for other purposes; to the Com-
mittee on commerce, Science, and
Transportation.

Mr. CLELAND. Mr. President, in De-
cember 2000, New York Times reporter,
John Schwartz, wrote ‘“When Congress
passed a new bill last week requiring
virtually every school and library in
the nation to install technology to pro-
tect minors from adult materials on-
line, it created a business opportunity
for companies that sell Internet fil-
tering systems. some of the fil-
tering companies’ business plans in-
clude tracking students’ Web
wanderings and selling the data to
market research firms.”” While I sup-
port the use of filtering technology in
schools and libraries that will be vis-
ited by our children, this statement
alarmed me.

A month later, the Wall Street Jour-
nal reported that the Department of
Defense was buying information about
our school children’s Internet habits
from a filtering company without the
knowledge of their parents or the
school officials. The Defense Depart-
ment contracted directly with the fil-
tering company. As one of our most
vulnerable populations, I believe it is
Congress’s duty to act in a manner to
ensure families knowledge of the infor-
mation that is collected about our chil-
dren and to restrict the collection of
personal information on children. The
fact that this arrangement could occur
without anyone with direct responsi-
bility for the children having knowl-
edge of it is a serious oversight. We

S7905

need a solution, and to that end, I am
introducing the Children’s Electronic
Access Safety Enhancement, or CEASE
Act.

This legislation is a commonsense
approach to dealing with this problem
in order to ensure our children are pro-
tected. The first section of the bill re-
quires an Internet filtering government
contractor to disclose its treatment of
collected information to the school or
library with which it is contracting.
Additionally, if changes to these poli-
cies are made, the filtering company
must inform the school or library of
these changes. If adequate notice is not
provided, the entity has the option to
cancel the contract. Armed with such
information about the company’s prac-
tices, the school or library officials can
make an informed decision of whether
it wishes to contract with a particular
company.

The Children’s Online Privacy Pro-
tection Act, COPPA, which passed Con-
gress and was signed into law in 1998,
prohibits the collection of personal in-
formation about children on commer-
cial websites. In the second section of
my legislation, a similar COPPA prohi-
bition would extend to Internet con-
tent management services at schools
and libraries. If personal information is
collected on a child, the provider is re-
quired to inform the school or library
and the Federal Trade Commission and
to indicate how it will treat this infor-
mation so that it will not be disclosed
or distributed. When children go to
schools and libraries, these environ-
ments are supposed to be safe. Parents
and guardians should not have to worry
about how their children’s personal in-
formation may be compromised, espe-
cially by a company that markets
itself to protect children and in some
cases facilitate learning. I believe my
legislation will help put to rest such
concerns.

Protecting the privacy of children
has been widely supported, as it should
be. When Congress was debating
COPPA in 1998, the bill received broad
support. At a Senate Commerce Com-
mittee hearing in September 1998, Ar-
thur Sackler, representing the Direct
Marketing Association, DMA stated,
““Although DMA usually supports self-
regulation of electronic commerce, we
believe it may be appropriate to con-
sider targeted legislation in this area.”
Kathyrn Montgomery from the Center
for Media Education stated, ‘‘Children
are not little adults. Because
many young children do not fully un-
derstand the concept of privacy, they
can be quite eager and willing to offer
up information about themselves and
their families when asked. Children
also tend to be particularly trusting of
computers, and thus more open to
interacting with them.”

An April 2002 FTC report on the im-
plementation of COPPA draws the con-
clusion that Web sites have generally
been able to comply with COPPA. That
is why I have every hope and expecta-
tion that the CEASE Act can also be
implemented.



S7906

Given the fact that we have evidence
of some Internet content management
companies already sharing information
with outside entities, the CEASE Act
is timely. If an Internet content man-
agement company believes it is a good
business plan to share information,
even in aggregate, with outside parties,
these companies should not be adverse
to disclosing this practice with a po-
tential client. And, I believe that a
number of communities may not wish
to allow these practices at all because
they believe that, as Alex Molnar, a
professor at the University of Wis-
consin at Milwaukee, stated, ‘‘Pro-
viding demographic information about
students to special interests, even in
aggregate form, is a potential violation
of the privacy of children and their
families.”” Communities with such be-
liefs should be able to act upon them in
the best interest of their children, and
my legislation requires the disclosure
that will help make this a reality.

There is no arguing that the Internet
is, and will continue to be, an impor-
tant part of the learning process. Per-
sonally, I support wiring the schools
and libraries in this Nation as rapidly
as possible because I understand the
educational and job opportunities the
Internet can bring. However, especially
for our children, we need to ensure
there are safeguards. Providing more
information and empowering local offi-
cials to make decisions based on this
information are good policies. As the
Nation’s children prepare to return to
school—schools that are more wired
now than ever before—I urge my col-
leagues to support the CEASE bill to
protect our children.

There being no objection, the bill was
ordered to be printed in the RECORD, as
follows:

S. 2839

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Children’s
Electronic Access Safety Enhancement
(CEASE) Act”.

SEC. 2. DISCLOSURE BY INTERNET CONTENT
MANAGEMENT SERVICES OF COL-
LECTION, USE, AND DISCLOSURE OF

INFORMATION UNDER CONTRACTS
FOR SCHOOLS AND LIBRARIES.

(a) INITIAL DISCLOSURE OF POLICIES.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—A provider of Internet
content management services shall, before
entering into a contract or other agreement
to provide such services to or for an elemen-
tary or secondary school or library, notify
the local educational agency or other au-
thority with responsibility for the school, or
library, as the case may be, of the policies of
the provider regarding the collection, use,
and disclosure of information from or about
children whose Internet use will be covered
by such services.

(2) ELEMENTS OF NOTICE.—Notice on poli-
cies regarding the collection, use, disclosure
of information under paragraph (1) shall in-
clude information on the following:

(A) Whether any information will be col-
lected from or about children whose Internet
use will be covered by the services in ques-
tion.

(B) Whether any information so collected
will be stored or otherwise retained by the

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

provider of Internet content management
services, and, if so, under what terms and
conditions, including a description of how
the information will be secured.

(C) Whether any information so collected
will be sold, distributed, or otherwise trans-
ferred, and, if so, under what terms and con-
ditions.

(3) FORM OF NOTICE.—Any notice under this
subsection shall be clear, conspicuous, and
designed to be readily understandable by its
intended audience.

(b) MODIFICATION OF POLICIES.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—A provider of Internet
content management services shall, before
implementing any material modification of
the policies described in subsection (a)(1)
under a contract or other agreement with re-
spect to an elementary or secondary school
or library, notify the local educational agen-
cy or other authority with responsibility for
the school, or library, as the case may be, of
the proposed modification of the policies.

(2) TIMELINESS.—Notice under paragraph
(1) shall be provided in sufficient time in ad-
vance of the modification covered by the no-
tice to permit the local educational agency
or other authority concerned, or library con-
cerned, as the case may be, to evaluate the
effects of the modification.

(¢) REGULATIONS.—The Commission shall
prescribe regulations for purposes of the ad-
ministration of this section. The regulations
shall include provisions regarding the ele-
ments of notice required under subsection
(a)(2) and the timeliness of notice under sub-
section (b)(2).

(d) ADMINISTRATION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—This section shall be en-
forced by the Commission under the Federal
Trade Commission Act (15 U.S.C. 41 et seq.).

(2) EFFECT ON OTHER LAWS.—Nothing in
this section shall be construed to limit the
authority of the Commission under any
other provision of law.

(e) NONCOMPLIANCE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The violation of any pro-
vision of this section, including the regula-
tions prescribed by the Commission under
subsection (c), shall be treated as a violation
of a rule defining an unfair or deceptive act
or practice prescribed under section
18(a)(1)(B) of the Federal Trade Commission
Act (156 U.S.C. 57a(a)(1)(B)).

(2) TERMINATION OF CONTRACT OR AGREE-
MENT.—

(A) AUTHORITY TO TERMINATE.—Notwith-
standing any provision of a contract or
agreement to the contrary, if a provider of
Internet content management services for a
school or library fails to comply with a pol-
icy in a notice under subsection (a), or fails
to submit notice of a modification of a pol-
icy under subsection (b) in a timely manner,
the local educational agency or other au-
thority concerned, or library concerned, may
terminate the contract or other agreement
with the provider to provide Internet con-
tent management services to the school or
library, as the case may be.

(B) RESOLUTION OF DISPUTES.—Any dispute
under subparagraph (A) regarding the failure
of a provider of Internet content manage-
ment services as described in that subpara-
graph shall be resolved by the Commission.

(C) RELATIONSHIP TO OTHER RELIEF.—The
authority under this paragraph with respect
to noncompliance of a provider of Internet
content management services is in addition
to the power of the Commission to treat the
noncompliance as a violation under para-
graph (1).

(f) NOTICE TO PARENTS.—A school or library
shall provide reasonable notice of the poli-
cies of an Internet content management
service provider used by that school or li-
brary to parents of students, or patrons of
the library, as the case may be.

August 1, 2002

SEC. 3. COLLECTION OF PERSONAL INFORMA-
TION ABOUT CERTAIN OLDER CHIL-
DREN BY PROVIDERS OF INTERNET
CONTENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES
TO SCHOOLS AND LIBRARIES.

(a) PROHIBITION.—A provider of Internet
content management services to or for an el-
ementary or secondary school or library may
not collect through such services personal
information from or about a child who is a
student at that school or a user of that 1li-
brary.

(b) RESPONSIBILITIES UPON COLLECTION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—If a provider of Internet
content management services to or for an el-
ementary or secondary school or library col-
lects through such services personal infor-
mation from or about a child who is a stu-
dent at that school or a user of that library,
the provider shall—

(A) provide prompt notice of such collec-
tion—

(i) to either—

(I) the local educational agency or other
authority with responsibility for the school
and appropriate officials of the State in
which the school is located; or

(IT) the library; and

(ii) to the Federal Trade Commission; and

(B) take appropriate actions to treat the
personal information—

(i) in a manner consistent with the provi-
sions of the Children’s Online Privacy Pro-
tection Act of 1998 (15 U.S.C. 6501 et seq.) if
the personal information was collected from
a child as defined in section 1302(1) of that
Act; or

(ii) in a similar manner, under regulations
prescribed by the Commission, if the per-
sonal information was collected from a child
over the age of 12.

(2) ELEMENTS OF NOTICE.—Notice of the col-
lection of personal information by a provider
of Internet content management services
under paragraph (1)(A) shall include the fol-
lowing:

(A) A description of the personal informa-
tion so collected.

(B) A description of the actions taken by
the provider with respect to such personal
information under paragraph (1)(B).

(c) RESPONSE TO NOTICE.—A local edu-
cational agency or other authority, or li-
brary, receiving notice under subsection (b)
with respect to a covered child shall take ap-
propriate actions to notify a parent or
guardian of the child of receipt of such no-
tice.

SEC. 4. APPLICATION OF COPPA.

Section 1302 of the Children’s Online Pri-
vacy Protection Act of 1998 (15 U.S.C. 6501) is
amended by adding at the end the following:

‘/(13) PROVIDER OF INTERNET CONTENT MAN-
AGEMENT SERVICES TREATED AS OPERATOR.—
The term ‘operator’ includes a provider of
Internet content management services (as
defined in section 5(4) of the Children’s Elec-
tronic Access Safety Enhancement Act) who
collects or maintains personal information
from or about the users of those services, or
on whose behalf such information is col-
lected or maintained, if those services are
provided for commercial purposes involving
commerce described in paragraph (2)(A)(@),
(ii), or (iii).”.

SEC. 5. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act:

(1) CoMMISSION.—The term ‘‘Commission’’
means the Federal Trade Commission.

(2) CHILD.—Except as provided in section
3(b)(1)(B), the term ‘‘child” means an indi-
vidual who is less than 19 years of age.

(3) PERSONAL INFORMATION.—The term
“personal information’” has the meaning
given that term in section 1301(8) of the Chil-
dren’s Online Privacy Protection Act of 1998
(15 U.S.C. 6501(8)).

(4) PROVIDER OF INTERNET CONTENT MANAGE-
MENT SERVICES.—The term ‘‘provider of



August 1, 2002

Internet content management services’ in-
cludes a provider of Internet content man-
agement software if such software operates,
in whole or in part, by or through an Inter-
net connection or otherwise provides infor-
mation on users of such software to the pro-
vider by the Internet or other means.

By Mr. CORZINE (for himself,
Mr. CARPER, Mr. ENSIGN, Mr.
SCHUMER, and Mr. ALLARD):

S. 2841. A bill to adjust the indexing
of multifamily mortgage limits, and
for other purposes; to the Committee
on Banking, Housing, and Urban Af-
fairs.

Mr. CORZINE. Mr. President, today I
am introducing legislation, the FHA
Multifamily Housing Loan Limit Im-
provement Act, to expand the supply of
affordable housing by increasing the
Federal Housing Administration’s mul-
tifamily housing loan limit to account
for inflation.

Providing access to decent, safe, af-
fordable housing for individuals and
families remains an enormous chal-
lenge for our Nation. Throughout the
country, rising construction costs have
resulted in shortage of affordably
priced rental units. In fact, the short-
age of affordable housing should be
considered nothing short of a crisis.
After all, housing is among the most
basic of human needs, and it is criti-
cally important for all American com-
munities.

The Federal Housing Administration,
FHA, was established as part of a na-
tional commitment to providing af-
fordable housing, particularly for those
most in need. Overall, the FHA,
through its various initiatives, has
been successful in providing increased
access to housing. But as the crisis of
affordable housing has grown, so has
the need for Congress and the Depart-
ment of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment, HUD, to promote increased pro-
duction of affordable housing.

That is why I am pleased to join with
Senators CARPER, ENSIGN and SCHUMER
in introducing this legislation to in-
crease the production and availability
of affordable housing for American
families. The bill would improve upon
legislation I introduced last year, ‘“The
FHA Multifamily Housing Loan Limit
Adjustment Act,” which Congress ap-
proved last year as part of the VA-HUD
Appropriations bill. That legislation
increased by twenty-five percent the
statutory limits for multifamily
project development loans that are in-
surable by the FHA. The change re-
flected the increased costs associated
with the production of multifamily
units since 1992, the last time those
limits were revised upwards.

In other words, it had taken Congress
ten years to modify the underlying
statute to account for rising prices and
simply maintain the effectiveness of
the program. That is too long. The leg-
islation we are introducing today
would ensure that it does not take an-
other decade or longer to assist those
who need affordable housing.

This bill is simple, it ensures that
the insurable FHA loan limit amounts,

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

as adjusted under ‘“‘The FHA Multi-
family Loan Adjustment Act,” would
keep pace with economic growth by in-
dexing them each year to the Annual
Construction Cost Index, issued annu-
ally by the Census Bureau.

This bill also promotes the produc-
tion of affordable housing in another
important way, by promoting the de-
velopment of affordable housing in
high-cost cities like Newark, NJ, New
York, Philadelphia and San Francisco.
Currently in those communities, the
cost of living is so high that the FHA
insurance program is rendered largely
ineffective.

This bill improves the FHA multi-
family program by adjusting its statu-
tory limits to promote increased hous-
ing production in high-cost, primarily
urban, communities.

There is a very real need for Congress
to address the shortage of affordable
housing. A report released last year by
the Center for Housing Policy, ‘‘Hous-
ing America’s Working Families,”” doc-
umented the severity of this need. The
report found that more than fourteen
million people faced severe housing
needs because of the lack of affordable
housing. That number may well be
higher now.

This bill will provide the proper in-
centive for public/private investment
in affordable housing in communities
throughout America and spur new pro-
duction of cooperative housing
projects, rental housing for the elderly,
new construction or substantial reha-
bilitation of apartments by for- and
non-profit entities, condominium de-
velopments and refinancing of rental
properties.

In short, this bill is good housing pol-
icy. That is why the National Associa-
tion of Home Builders, the National
Association of Realtors and the Mort-
gage Bankers Association endorse the
legislation, along with other housing
and community advocates.

I hope that my colleagues will sup-
port this legislation and I ask unani-
mous consent that the text of the bill
be printed in the RECORD.

There being no objection, the bill was
ordered to be printed the RECORD, as
follows:

S. 2841

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION. 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “FHA Multi-
family Housing Loan Limit Improvement
Act”.

SEC. 2. INDEXING OF MULTIFAMILY MORTGAGE
LIMITS.

(a) SECTION 207 LIMITS.—Section 207(c)(3) of

the National Housing Act (12 TU.S.C.
1713(c)(3)) is amended—
(1) by striking 11,250 and inserting

©‘$17,460°’;

(2) by inserting before ‘‘; and except that”
the following: ¢‘; except that the Secretary
shall adjust each such dollar amount limita-
tion set forth in this paragraph (as such lim-
itation may have been previously adjusted
pursuant to this paragraph) effective Janu-
ary 1 of each year, beginning in 2003, in ac-
cordance with the percentage increase, if

S7907

any, during the 12-month period ending with
the preceding October, in the Annual Con-
struction Cost Index of the Bureau of the
Census of the Department of Commerce’’;
and

(3) by inserting after ‘‘foregoing dollar
amount limitations contained in this para-
graph’ the following: ‘‘(as such limitations
may have been previously adjusted pursuant
to this paragraph)’’.

(b) SECTION 213 LIMITS.—Section 213(b)(2) of

the National Housing Act (12 TU.S.C.
1715e(b)(2)) is amended—
(1) by striking °°$38,025”°,  “‘$42,120",

¢$50,310", <‘$62,010”’, and ¢$70,200”’, and insert-
ing ¢$41,207, ‘“$47,611°, ‘‘$57,300"", ‘‘$73,343"’,
and ‘‘$81,708"’, respectively;

(2) by striking $49,140°, ‘$60,255’,
““$75,465>°, and ‘$85,328’, and inserting
¢‘$49,710, “$60,446°°, ‘‘$78,197”’, and ‘‘$85,836"",
respectively;

(3) by inserting after the colon at the end
of the first proviso the following: ‘‘Provided
further, That the Secretary shall adjust each
such dollar amount limitation set forth in
this paragraph (as such limitation may have
been previously adjusted pursuant to this
paragraph) effective January 1 of each year,
beginning in 2003, in accordance with the
percentage increase, if any, during the 12-
month period ending with the preceding Oc-
tober, in the Annual Construction Cost Index
of the Bureau of the Census of the Depart-
ment of Commerce:”’; and

(4) by inserting after ‘‘foregoing dollar
amount limitations contained in this para-
graph” the following: ‘‘(as such limitations
may have been previously adjusted pursuant
to this paragraph)’.

(c) SECTION 220 LiMITS.—Section
220(d)(3)(B)(iii) of the National Housing Act
(12 U.S.C. 1715k(d)(3)(B)(iii)) is amended—

(1) by inserting after ‘‘foregoing dollar
amount limitations contained in this
clause’”’, the first place such phrase appears,
the following: ‘‘(as such limitations may
have been previously adjusted pursuant to
this clause)’’.

(2) by inserting after ‘‘Provided,” the fol-
lowing: ‘“‘That the Secretary shall adjust
each such dollar amount limitation set forth
in this clause (as such limitation may have
been previously adjusted pursuant to this
clause) effective January 1 of each year, be-
ginning in 2003, in accordance with the per-
centage increase, if any, during the 12-month
period ending with the preceding October, in
the Annual Construction Cost Index of the
Bureau of the Census of the Department of
Commerce: Provided further,”’; and

(3) by striking ‘‘(as determined after the
application of the preceding proviso)”’ and
inserting ‘‘(as such limitations may have
been previously adjusted pursuant to the
preceding proviso and as determined after
application of any percentage increase au-
thorized in this clause relating to units with
2, 3, 4, or more bedrooms)’’.

(d) SECTION 221(d)(3) LIMITS.—Section
221(d)(3)(ii) of the National Housing Act (12
U.S.C. 17151(d)(3)(ii)) is amended—

(1) by inserting before ‘‘; and except that”
the following: ‘‘; except that the Secretary
shall adjust each such dollar amount limita-
tion set forth in this clause (as such limita-
tion may have been previously adjusted pur-
suant to this clause) effective January 1 of
each year, beginning in 2003, in accordance
with the percentage increase, if any, during
the 12-month period ending with the pre-
ceding October, in the Annual Construction
Cost Index of the Bureau of the Census of the
Department of Commerce’’; and

(2) by inserting after ‘‘foregoing dollar
amount limitations contained in this clause”
the following: ‘‘(as such limitations may
have been previously adjusted pursuant to
this clause)’’.



S7908

(e) SECTION 221(d)(4) LiMmIiTs.—Section
221(d)(4)(ii) of the National Housing Act (12
U.S.C. 17151(d)(4)(ii)) is amended—

(1) by inserting before ‘‘; and except that”
the following: ‘‘; except that the Secretary
shall adjust each such dollar amount limita-
tion set forth in this clause (as such limita-
tion may have been previously adjusted pur-
suant to this clause) effective January 1 of
each year, beginning in 2003, in accordance
with the percentage increase, if any, during
the 12-month period ending with the pre-
ceding October, in the Annual Construction
Cost Index of the Bureau of the Census of the
Department of Commerce’’; and

(2) by inserting after ‘‘foregoing dollar
amount limitations contained in this clause”
the following: ‘‘(as such limitations may
have been previously adjusted pursuant to
this clause)’’.

(f) SECTION 231 LIMITS.—Section 231(c)(2) of
the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C.
1715v(c)(2)) is amended—

(1) by inserting before ‘‘; and except that”
the following: ‘‘; except that the Secretary
shall adjust each such dollar amount limita-
tion set forth in this paragraph (as such lim-
itation may have been previously adjusted
pursuant to this paragraph) effective Janu-
ary 1 of each year, beginning in 2003, in ac-
cordance with the percentage increase, if
any, during the 12-month period ending with
the preceding October, in the Annual Con-
struction Cost Index of the Bureau of the
Census of the Department of Commerce’’;
and

(2) by inserting after ‘‘foregoing dollar
amount limitations contained in this para-
graph’ the following: ‘‘(as such limitations
may have been previously adjusted pursuant
to this paragraph)’’.

(g) SECTION 234 LIMITS.—Section 234(e)(3) of
the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C.
1715y(e)(3)) is amended—

(1) by inserting before ‘‘; except that’ the
second place such phrase appears the fol-
lowing: ‘‘; except that the Secretary shall ad-
just each such dollar amount limitation set
forth in this paragraph (as such limitation
may have been previously adjusted pursuant
to this paragraph) effective January 1 of
each year, beginning in 2003, in accordance
with the percentage increase, if any, during
the 12-month period ending with the pre-
ceding October, in the Annual Construction
Cost Index of the Bureau of the Census of the
Department of Commerce’’;

(2) by inserting after ‘‘each of the fore-
going dollar amounts’” the following: ‘‘(as
such amounts may have been previously ad-
justed pursuant to this paragraph)’’; and

(3) by inserting after ‘‘foregoing dollar
amount limitations contained in this para-
graph” the following: ‘‘(as such limitations
may have been previously adjusted pursuant
to this paragraph and increased pursuant to
the preceding clause)”.

SEC. 2. HIGH-COST AREAS.

(a) SECTION 207 LIMITS.—Section 207(c)(3) of
the National Housing Act (12 TU.S.C.
1713(¢)(3)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘‘140 percent’ and inserting
170 percent’’; and

(2) by striking ‘110 percent’’ and inserting
‘140 percent’’.

(b) SECTION 213 LIMITS.—Section 213(b)(2) of
the National Housing Act (12 TU.S.C.
1715e(b)(2)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘140 percent’ and inserting
170 percent’’; and

(2) by striking ‘110 percent’ and inserting
‘140 percent’’.

(c) SECTION 220 LiMITS.—Section
220(d)(3)(B)(iii) of the National Housing Act
(12 U.S.C. 1715k(d)(3)(B)(iii)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘140 percent’’ and inserting
‘170 percent’’; and

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

(2) by striking ‘‘110 percent’’ and inserting
‘140 percent’’.

(d) SECTION 221(d)(3) LIMITS.—Section
221(d)(3)(ii) of the National Housing Act (12
U.S.C. 17151(d)(3)(ii)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘140 percent’ and inserting
‘170 percent’’; and

(2) by striking ‘110 percent’’ and inserting
€140 percent’’.

(e) SECTION 221(d)(4) LiMITs.—Section
221(d)(4)(ii) of the National Housing Act (12
U.S.C. 17151(d)(4)(i1)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘140 percent’’ and inserting
170 percent’’; and

(2) by striking ‘‘110 percent’’ and inserting
‘140 percent’’.

(f) SECTION 231 LIMITS.—Section 231(c)(2) of
the National Housing Act (12 TU.S.C.
1715v(c)(2)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘140 percent’’ and inserting
‘170 percent’’; and

(2) by striking ‘110 percent’’ and inserting
‘140 percent’’.

(g) SECTION 234 LIMITS.—Section 234(e)(3) of
the National Housing Act (12 TU.S.C.
1715y (e)(3)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘140 percent’’ and inserting
‘170 percent’’; and

(2) by striking ‘110 percent’ and inserting
€140 percent’’.

Mr. CARPER. Mr. President, I am
very pleased to join today with my dis-
tinguished colleagues from New Jersey,
Nevada, and New York to introduce
legislation to index the Federal Hous-
ing Administration’s, FHA, multi-
family loan limits.

Last year, Senator CORZINE and I in-
troduced similar legislation that raised
the FHA multifamily loan limits,
which had not been increased since 1992
despite a 23 percent increase in the An-
nual Construction Cost Index. Senators
MIKULSKI and BOND included this in-
crease in last year’s VA-HUD appro-
priations legislation. I am pleased that
these limits were increased last year,
however, an important piece of the
original legislation was left undone.
While the FHA loan limits were in-
creased, they were not indexed. Con-
struction costs will continue to rise,
and the multifamily loan limits should
be indexed, just like the FHA single-
family loan limits.

Affordable housing continues to be a
problem in this country. Over the July
recess, I held a series of housing sum-
mits in Delaware to hear from Dela-
wareans about the lack of affordable
housing. In each county, I heard that
working families in Delaware are hav-
ing difficulty finding affordable hous-
ing. This shortage of affordable hous-
ing also comes at a time of limited fed-
eral resources. Thus, we have to find
the best use of each dollar at our dis-
posal, as well as the most effective use
of existing Federal programs to stimu-
late new housing production and sub-
stantial rehabilitation. This bill modi-
fies a current federal program, FHA
multifamily insurance, to make that
program more effective.

In the next Congress, I hope to be
able to address the affordable housing
problem in a more comprehensive man-
ner. In the meantime, I believe Con-
gress can take some incremental steps
to address the shortage of affordable
housing.

August 1, 2002

I ask my colleagues to join Senators
CORZINE, ENSIGN, and SCHUMER and me
to increase these multifamily loan lim-
its so that more working families will
have access to affordable housing.

Mr. ENSIGN. Mr. President, I rise
today, along with my good friend, the
Senator from New Jersey, to introduce
a bill that will help solve the afford-
able housing crisis that is facing this
Nation.

There is a dramatic shortage of rent-
al housing that is affordable to low and
moderate income working families.
FHA multifamily insurance programs
are designed to stimulate the construc-
tion, rehabilitation and preservation of
properties by insuring lenders against
loss in financing first mortgages. The
programs assist both the private and
the public sectors towards the goal of
providing affordable housing to those
that otherwise may not be able to af-
ford it.

Last year, in a remarkable step, Con-
gress granted a 25 percent increase in
the FHA multifamily loan limits. The
new loan limits are one great remedy
to the affordable housing crisis facing
our nation, but this alone does not do
enough.

Unfortunately, without additional
legislation, the loan limits will again
be outpaced by inflation and today’s
growing construction costs.

The legislation that we are intro-
ducing solves this problem by indexing
the multifamily loan limits to the an-
nual construction costs index of the
Bureau of the Census. This will allow
loan limits to increase automatically,
as costs increase. Without such a fix,
the FHA multifamily loan program
will again be limited in its ability to
stimulate the development of afford-
able housing.

This legislation will help halt the
growing shortage of affordable rental
housing faced by millions of Americans
and give builders and lenders the con-
fidence that they will be able to use
the programs in their communities
every year, even as construction and
land costs rise over time.

Additionally, this legislation raises
the loan limits in high-cost areas. This
will allow several major urban markets
to take advantage of the new FHA mul-
tifamily insurance programs, and to
provide much needed new affordable
housing to low and moderate income
families.

I believe this legislation is an impor-
tant step in our ongoing battle to en-
sure that each American has access to
affordable housing. I would like to once
again thank the Senator from New Jer-
sey, Mr. CORZINE, for his hard work on
this bill, and for recognizing the sig-
nificant effect this legislation will
have for many low and moderate in-
come families by dramatically increas-
ing their access to affordable housing.

By Mrs. CARNAHAN:
S. 2842. A Dbill to amend the Older
Americans Act of 1965 to authorize ap-
propriations for demonstration



August 1, 2002

projects to provide supportive services
to older individuals who reside in natu-
rally occurring retirement commu-
nities; to the Committee on Health,
Education, Labor, and Pensions.

Mrs. CARNAHAN. Mr. President, we
are all familiar with our changing de-
mographics. Those once a part of the
baby boom are now well on their way
to creating a senior boom. By the year
2020, one in six Americans will be age
65 or over. By 2040, the number of sen-
iors aged 85 and older will more than
triple from about 4 million to 14 mil-
lion. This boom will create a dramatic
increase in the demand for services for
seniors especially long-term care.

Long-term care is more than just
health care. It includes any services
that seniors need to maintain their
quality of life, such as transportation,
nutrition, or other supports that help
seniors live independently.

Long-term care can mean help with
buying groceries, paying bills each
month, getting dressed in the morning,
getting a ride to the doctor’s office, or
taking medicine at the appropriate
time. We need to make sure our society
is ready to provide these kinds of serv-
ices for seniors, and we need to make
sure that we give seniors options. We
need to be creative in what we offer.

Last year I learned about an innova-
tive option for providing long-term
care services for seniors. The concept is
based on naturally occurring retire-
ment communities, NORCs. A natu-
rally occurring retirement community
develops in a community or neighbor-
hood where residents remain for years
and age as neighbors. A NORC may be
a large apartment building or a street
of single family homes. According to
AARP, about 27 percent of seniors cur-
rently live in NORCs. NORCs represent
a new model for giving seniors the sup-
port services they need. We can bring
services directly to seniors, and we can
help enhance their quality of life and
allow them to age in place.

This is important because most sen-
iors prefer living in their own homes.
To address the need for long-term care
services, I secured $1.2 million last year
to establish a NORC project in down-
town St. Louis. To get this project un-
derway, first there will be assessment
of residents’ needs. The funds will then
be used to meet these individual needs.
Residents will receive such services as
individual case management, family
education, wellness services, and other
needed supports.

The St. Louis program is only the
first step. This unique model could be
used to deliver support services to sen-
iors in communities across the coun-
try. That is why I am pleased to intro-
duce the Senior Self-Sufficiency Act.
This legislation would lay the founda-
tion for a new way of helping seniors
stay in their own homes and in their
own communities. The Senior Self-Suf-
ficiency Act would create ten dem-
onstration projects in naturally occur-
ring retirement communities across
the country. Each would last 4 years.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

The grant would be used to provide
comprehensive support services to sen-
iors.

The services offered would be created
to meet the individual needs of the
residents and to help them maintain
their independence. Funds would also
be used to make housing improvements
that would allow seniors to live in
their own neighborhoods longer. For
example, they could install safety bars
in bathrooms or replace stairs with
wheelchair ramps. Two of the ten
projects would be located in rural areas
where access to services is often harder
or more distant. We will learn from the
research how best to expand the pro-
gram to all areas of the country.

If given the choice, most people
would prefer to grow older in their own
homes, surrounded by friends and fam-
ily. This is exactly what this legisla-
tion will allow seniors to do. By mak-
ing support services available to sen-
iors in their own homes, we can extend
the time they live independently, and
we can improve their quality of life.
We can provide services at lower cost,
and we can start preparing now for the
future needs of our population.

I am pleased to announce that the
Senior Self-Sufficiency Act has the
support of the Missouri Department of
Health and the Jewish Federation of
St. Louis.

I ask unanimous consent that their
letters of support and the text of the
bill be printed in the RECORD.

Mrs. CARNAHAN. We need to begin
now to plan for the future senior boom.
The Senior Self-Sufficiency Act is a
step in the right direction, making it
possible for seniors to remain in their
home longer and to retain their inde-
pendence. That is a goal worth pur-
suing.

There being no objection, the mate-
rial was ordered to be printed in the
RECORD, as follows:

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

AND SENIOR SERVICES,
Jefferson City, MO, July 31, 2002.
Hon. JEAN CARNAHAN,
U.S. Senate, Hart Senate Office Bldg,
ington, DC.

DEAR SENATOR CARNAHAN: The Missouri
Department of Health and Senior Services is
charged with the mission of enhancing the
quality of life for all Missourians by pro-
tecting and promoting the community’s
health and well-being of citizens of all ages.
In following that mission, we are pleased to
offer our support of your proposed legislation
known as the Senior Self-Sufficiency Act.

This legislation, which would authorize
demonstration projects in naturally occur-
ring retirement communities, would help
show the effectiveness of providing com-
prehensive supportive services to older indi-
viduals who reside in their homes to enhance
their quality of life and reduce the need for
institutionalization. Missouri has long sup-
ported the concept of ‘“‘options in care’ to in-
clude comprehensive home and community
based services and supports. This legislation
would help focus and define the concept and
value of communities, to include the signifi-
cance of retaining seniors within their nat-
ural occurring communities. The comprehen-
sive nature of the services to be offered
under this concept, such as health services,
nutrition services, transportation, home and

Wash-

S7909

personal care, socialization, continuing
adult education, information and referral,
and any other services to enhance quality of
life will greatly increase a person’s ability to
remain in their home and community.

I can assure you the Department of Health
and Senior Services is eager to assist with
the implementation of this concept. Your
proposed legislation is paramount in sup-
porting our mission to protect and promote
our community’s health, and well-being of
citizens of all ages. Please feel free to con-
tact Jerry Simon, Interim Department Dep-
uty Director, at (673) 7561-8535, if we can offer
any additional information or support to
this important concept.

Respectfully,
RONALD W. CATES,
Interim Director.

JEWISH FEDERATION OF ST. LOUIS,
St. Louis, MO, July 29, 2002.

Hon. JEAN CARNAHAN,

U.S. Senate, Hart Senate Office Building,

Washington, DC.

DEAR SENATOR CARNAHAN: I am writing re-
garding the legislation you will be intro-
ducing to amend the Older Americans act of
1965 authorizing appropriations for dem-
onstration projects to provide services to
older individuals residing in NORCs. As you
are aware, the St. Louis community has a
large senior citizen population compared
with other communities of similar size. It is
essential that we find ways to help our older
adults remain health, productive, and inde-
pendent for as long as possible in order to en-
hance their quality of life.

Your bill, the Senior Self-Sufficiency Act,
authorizing ten demonstration projects to
provide comprehensive supportive services to
residents of naturally occurring retirement
communities will ensure that best practices
are developed and/or replicated nationwide.
It is an innovative and exciting opportunity
to study aging-in-place populations and post-
pone or avoid institutionalization for these
populations.

I strongly support this legislation and ap-
preciate your tireless efforts on behalf of
older adults.

Sincerely,
BARRY ROSENBERG,
Executive Vice President.
S. 2842

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘“‘Senior Self-
Sufficiency Act”’.

SEC. 2. AMENDMENTS.

Part A of title IV of the Older Americans
Act of 1965 (42 U.S.C. 3001 et seq) is amended
by adding at the end the following:

“SEC. 422. DEMONSTRATION PROJECTS IN NATU-
RALLY OCCURRING RETIREMENT
COMMUNITIES.

‘‘(a) PROGRAM AUTHORIZED.—The Assistant
Secretary shall award grants to eligible enti-
ties to carry out 10 demonstration projects
to provide comprehensive supportive services
to older individuals who reside in noninstitu-
tional residences in naturally occurring re-
tirement communities to enhance the qual-
ity of life of such individuals and reduce the
need to institutionalize such individuals.
Those residences for which assistance is pro-
vided under section 202 of the National Hous-
ing Act of 1959 (12 U.S.C. 1701q) in naturally
occurring retirement communities shall not
receive services through a demonstration
project under this section if such services
would otherwise be provided as part of the
assistance received by such residences under
such section 202.

“(b) ELIGIBLE ENTITY.—An entity is eligi-
ble to receive a grant under this section if



S7910

such entity is a nonprofit public or private
agency, organization, or institution that
proposes to provide services only in geo-
graphical areas considered to be low- or mid-
dle-income areas.

“(¢c) PRIORITY.—

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—In awarding grants under
this section, the Assistant Secretary shall
give priority to eligible entities that pro-
vided comprehensive supportive services in
fiscal year 2002 to older individuals who re-
sided in noninstitutional residences in natu-
rally occurring retirement communities.

‘“(2) RURAL AREAS.—Two of the 10 grants
awarded under this section shall be awarded
to eligible entities that propose to provide
services to residents in rural areas.

‘(d) GRANT PERIOD.—Each grant awarded
under this section shall be awarded for a pe-
riod of 4 years, with not more than $1,000,000
being awarded annually.

‘‘(e) APPLICATION.—An eligible entity desir-
ing a grant under this section shall submit
an application to the Assistant Secretary in
such form and containing such information
as the Assistant Secretary may require, in-
cluding a plan for continuing services pro-
vided under the grant after the grant ex-
pires.

““(f) LIMITATIONS.—

‘(1) COST-SHARING.—AnN eligible entity re-
ceiving a grant under this section may re-
quire cost-sharing from individuals receiving
services only in a manner consistent with
the requirements of title III.

‘“(2) CONSTRUCTION.—AN entity may not use
funds received under a grant under this sec-
tion to construct or permanently improve
(other than remodeling to make facilities ac-
cessible to older individuals) any building or
other facility.

‘‘(g) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

‘(1) NATURALLY OCCURRING RETIREMENT
COMMUNITY.—The term ‘naturally occurring
retirement community’ means a geo-
graphical area in which not less than 40 per-
cent of the noninstitutional residences are
occupied for not less than 10 years by heads
of households who are older individuals, but
does not include residences for which assist-
ance is provided under section 202 of the Na-
tional Housing Act of 1959 (12 U.S.C. 1701q).
The definition provided for in the previous
sentence may be modified by the Secretary
as such definition relates to grants for rural
areas.

‘‘(2) SUPPORTIVE SERVICES.—The term ‘sup-
portive services’ means services offered to
residents that may include—

‘‘(A) case management;

‘(B) health services and education;

“(C) nutrition services, nutrition edu-
cation, meals, and meal delivery;

‘(D) transportation services;

‘“(E) home and personal care services;

“(F') continuing adult education;

‘(G) information and referral services; and

‘““(H) any other services and resources ap-
propriate to enhance the quality of life of
residents and reduce the need to institu-
tionalize such individuals.

“(h) MATCHING REQUIREMENT.—The Assist-
ant Secretary may not make a grant to an
eligible entity under this section unless that
entity agrees that, with respect to the costs
to be incurred by the entity in carrying out
the program for which the grant was award-
ed, the entity will make available in cash or
in-kind (directly or through donations from
public or private entities) non-Federal con-
tributions equaling 5 percent of Federal
funds provided under the grant for the sec-
ond year that such grant is provided, 10 per-
cent of Federal funds provided under the
grant for the third year that such grant is
provided, and 15 percent of Federal funds
provided under the grant for the fourth year
that such grant is provided.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

‘(i) REPORT.—Not later than the beginning
of the fourth year of distributing grants
under this section, the Assistant Secretary
shall evaluate services provided with funds
under this section and submit a report to
Congress summarizing the results of such
evaluation and recommending what services
should be taken in the future.

“(j) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—
There are authorized to be appropriated to
carry out this section, not more than
$10,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2003
through 2006.”".

By Ms. LANDRIEU:

S. 2843. A Dbill to direct the Consumer
Product Safety Commission to promul-
gate a rule that requires manufactur-
ers of certain consumer products to es-
tablish and maintain a system for pro-
viding notification of recalls of such
products to consumers who first pur-
chase such a product; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and
Transportation.

Ms. LANDRIEU. Mr. President, it is
my pleasure to come to the floor today
and introduce a bill that I believe will
make it easier for parents to learn
about dangerous products that may
harm their children, and remove these
products from their homes.

Every year, more than 1.7 million
children under the age of 5 are harmed
by defective or hazardous products. As
my colleagues know, each year the
Consumer Products Safety Commission
recalls hundreds of products which
have been found to pose a danger to
consumers. Unfortunately, many times
parents do not get the word about
these recalls, because companies often
do not have a way of getting in touch
with their customers. This is particu-
larly significant when you are talking
about children’s products. The manu-
facturers of these products rarely have
records of who their customers are;
often all they can do is publicize the
recall as best they can. It is for this
reason, that I am introducing the Prod-
uct Safety Notification and Recall Ef-
fectiveness Act of 2002.

This legislation would require the
Consumer Products Safety Commission
to establish a rule to require manufac-
turers to establish and maintain a sys-
tem for notifying consumers of the re-
call of certain products that may cause
harm to children. The database could
be assembled through the use of short-
ened product registration cards, Inter-
net registration, or other alternate
means of encouraging consumers to
provide vital contact information.

As an example for my colleagues, 1
just want to touch on one method that
this bill would encourage companies to
use. We’ve all seen the registration
cards that come with many products.
It is these cards that provide compa-
nies with much of the information on
their customers, and could be used to
help spread the word about a recall.
Unfortunately, many consumers just
throw these cards away without even
sending them in. In fact, by some esti-
mates 90 percent of these cards are
thrown away. Why? Well, one reason is
because the cards ask for personal and

August 1, 2002

marketing information that many peo-
ple do not want to give out. So they
throw the card away.

But if you shorten the card, to just
ask for the basic information, name,
address, and phone number, people are
much more likely to return them. This
is particularly true if the card specifies
the information will not be used for
marketing purposes. These cards are an
idea that Ann Brown, former chairman
of the CPSC and now Chairman of the
non-profit group SAFE, a Safer Amer-
ica for Everyone Foundation, has been
advocating for years. And studies done
with companies like Mattel and
BrandStamp have shown that these
methods really do increase the number
of consumers who respond.

So, I come to the floor today to say
that this is something we need to do,
and we need to do it as quickly as pos-
sible. This is a very important bill for
our citizens. I am hopeful that we can
get a hearing on this legislation very
soon.

Before I close, I just want to com-
mend Ann Brown and the folks at
SAFE for all of their hard work on
product recall. I introduced this legis-
lation in the Senate today, but Ann is
the one who has been pushing this issue
for years, since she served on the
CPSC. I am proud to work with her on
this and want to thank her for her
monumental efforts to bring this to the
forefront. I also want to acknowledge
my colleagues, Congressman JIM
MORAN and Congressman JAMES
MCGOVERN, who introduced this bill in
the House of Representatives. And, of
course, I look forward to working with
the CPSC on this bill. I know they had
some problems with this bill initially,
and I am hopeful we have addressed
most of these concerns.

I want to encourage my colleagues to
support this much-needed legislation.
By passing this bill, we can give par-
ents the information they need to pro-
tect their children. When a child is
hurt or killed by a defective product
that has already been recalled, there
simply is no excuse. This legislation
would go a long way towards ensuring
that this kind of tragedy never happens
again.

I ask unanimous consent that the
text of the bill be printed in the
RECORD.

There being no objection, the bill was
ordered to be printed in the RECORD, as
follows:

S. 2843

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Product
Safety Notification and Recall Effectiveness
Act of 2002”°.

SEC. 2. FINDINGS AND PURPOSES.

(a) FINDINGS.—Congress finds
lowing:

(1) The Consumer Product Safety Commis-
sion conducts approximately 300 recalls of
hazardous, dangerous, and defective con-
sumer products each year.

(2) In developing comprehensive corrective
action plans with recalling companies, the

the fol-



August 1, 2002

Consumer Product Safety Commission staff
greatly relies upon the media and retailers
to alert consumers to the dangers of unsafe
consumer products, because the manufactur-
ers do not generally possess contact informa-
tion regarding the purchasing consumers.
Based upon information received from com-
panies maintaining customer registration
lists, such contact information is known for
generally less than 7 percent of the total
consumer products produced and distributed.

(3) The Consumer Product Safety Commis-
sion staff has found that most consumers do
not return purchaser identification cards be-
cause of requests for marketing and personal
information on the cards, and the likelihood
of receiving unsolicited marketing mate-
rials.

(4) The Consumer Product Safety Commis-
sion staff has conducted research dem-
onstrating that direct consumer contact is
one of the most effective ways of motivating
consumer response to a consumer product re-
call.

(56) Companies that maintain consumer
product purchase data, such as product reg-
istration cards, warranty cards, and rebate
cards, are able to effectively notify con-
sumers of a consumer product recall.

(6) The Consumer Product Safety Commis-
sion staff has found that a consumer product
safety owner card, without marketing ques-
tions or requests for personal information,
that accompanied products such as small
household appliances and juvenile products
would increase consumer participation and
information necessary for direct notification
in consumer product recalls.

(7) The National Highway Traffic Safety
Administration has, since March 1993, re-
quired similar simplified, marketing-free
product registration cards on child safety
seats used in motor vehicles.

(b) PURPOSE.—The purpose of this Act is to
reduce the number of deaths and injuries
from defective and hazardous consumer prod-
ucts through improved recall effectiveness,
by—

(1) requiring the Consumer Product Safety
Commission to promulgate a rule to require
manufacturers of juvenile products, small
household appliances, and certain other con-
sumer products, to include a simplified prod-
uct safety owner card with those consumer
products at the time of original purchase by
consumers, or develop effective electronic
registration of the first purchasers of such
products, to develop a customer database for
the purpose of notifying consumers about re-
calls of those products; and

(2) encouraging manufacturers, private la-
belers, retailers, and others to use creativity
and innovation to create and maintain effec-
tive methods of notifying consumers in the
event of a consumer product recall.

SEC. 3. DEFINITIONS.

For purposes of this Act:

(1) TERMS DEFINED IN CONSUMER PRODUCT
SAFETY ACT.—The definitions set forth in
section 3 of the Consumer Product Safety
Act (15 U.S.C. 2052) shall apply to this Act.

(2) COVERED CONSUMER PRODUCT.—The term
‘“‘covered consumer product’ means—

(A) a juvenile product;

(B) a small household appliance; and

(C) such other consumer product as the
Commission considers appropriate for
achieving the purpose of this Act.

(3) JUVENILE PRODUCT.—The term ‘‘juvenile
product’”—

(A) means a consumer product intended for
use, or that may be reasonably expected to
be used, by children under the age of 5 years;
and

(B) includes—

(i) full-size cribs and nonfull-size cribs;

(ii) toddler beds;

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

(iii) high chairs, booster chairs, and hook-
on chairs;

(iv) bath seats;

(v) gates and other enclosures for confining
a child;

(vi) playpens;

(vii) stationary activity centers;

(viii) strollers;

(ix) walkers;

(x) swings;

(xi) child carriers; and

(xii) bassinets and cradles.

(4) PRODUCT SAFETY OWNER CARD.—The
term ‘‘product safety owner card’” means a
standardized product identification card sup-
plied with a consumer product by the manu-
facturer of the product, at the time of origi-
nal purchase by the first purchaser of such
product for purposes other than resale, that
only requests that the consumer of such
product provide to the manufacturer a mini-
mal level of personal information needed to
enable the manufacturer to contact the con-
sumer in the event of a recall of the product.

(6) SMALL HOUSEHOLD APPLIANCE.—The
term ‘‘small household appliance’” means a
consumer product that is a toaster, toaster
oven, blender, food processor, coffee maker,
or other similar small appliance as provided
for in the rule promulgated by the Consumer
Product Safety Commission.

SEC. 4. RULE REQUIRING SYSTEM TO PROVIDE
NOTICE OF RECALLS OF CERTAIN
CONSUMER PRODUCTS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Commission shall
promulgate a rule under section 16(b) of the
Consumer Product Safety Act (15 U.S.C.
2065(b)) that requires that the manufacturer
of a covered consumer product shall estab-
lish and maintain a system for providing no-
tification of recalls of such product to con-
sumers of such product.

(b) REQUIREMENT TO CREATE DATABASE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The rule shall require
that the system include use of product safety
owner cards, Internet registration, or an al-
ternative method, to create a database of in-
formation regarding consumers of covered
consumer products, for the sole purpose of
notifying such consumers of recalls of such
products.

(2) USE OF TECHNOLOGY.—Alternative meth-
ods specified in the rule may include use of
on-line product registration and consumer
notification, consumer information data
bases, electronic tagging and bar codes, em-
bedded computer chips in consumer prod-
ucts, or other electronic and design strate-
gies to notify consumers about product re-
calls, that the Commission determines will
increase the effectiveness of recalls of cov-
ered consumer products.

(¢) USE OF COMMISSION STAFF PROPOSAL.—
In promulgating the rule, the Commission
shall consider the staff draft for an Advanced
Notice of Proposed Rulemaking entitled
“Purchaser Owner Card Program’, dated
June 19, 2001.

(d) EXCLUSION OF LOW-PRICE ITEMS.—The
Commission shall have the authority to ex-
clude certain low-cost items from the rule
for good cause.

(e) DEADLINES.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Commission—

(A) shall issue a proposed rule under this
section by not later than 90 days after the
date of enactment of this Act; and

(B) shall promulgate a final rule under this
section by not later than 270 days after the
date of enactment of this Act.

(2) EXTENSION.—The Commission may ex-
tend the deadline described in paragraph (1)
if the Commission provides timely notice to
the Committee on Energy and Commerce of
the House of Representatives and the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation of the Senate.

By Mr. ROCKEFELLER:

S7911

S. 2844. A bill to amend the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 to provide a tax
incentive to individuals teaching in el-
ementary and secondary schools Ilo-
cated in rural or high unemployment
areas and to individuals who achieve
certification from the National Board
for Professional Teaching Standards,
and for other purposes; to the Com-
mittee on Finance.

Mr. ROCKEFELLER. Mr. President,
perhaps the most effective way to im-
prove the education of America’s chil-
dren is to ensure that they begin their
education in an uncrowded classroom
led by a qualified teacher. This body
recognized that fact when we over-
whelmingly passed the ‘‘No Child Left
Behind Act” last year, mandating the
hiring of qualified teachers by every
school in every district.

Unfortunately, without our help,
America’s poor and rural schools may
not be able to attract the qualified
teachers this legislation mandates and
our children deserve. Isolated and im-
poverished, competing against higher
paying and well-funded school districts
for scarce classroom talent, they are
already facing a desperate shortage of
qualified teachers. As pressure to hire
increases, that shortage will become a
crisis, and children already at a dis-
advantage in relation to their more af-
fluent and less isolated peers will be
the ones who suffer most.

Today, I propose a bill that will help
bring dedicated and qualified teaching
professionals to West Virginia’s and
America’s poor and rural schools, and
help give their students the oppor-
tunity to learn and flourish that every
child deserves. The Incentives To Edu-
cate American Children Act, or “I
Teach” Act, will provide teachers a re-
fundable tax credit every year they
practice their profession in the public
schools where they are needed most.
And it will give every public school
teacher, whichever school they choose,
a refundable tax credit for earning cer-
tification by the National Board for
Professional Teaching Standards. To-
gether, these two tax credits will give
economically depressed areas a better
ability to recruit and retain skilled
teachers.

One-fourth of America’s children at-
tend public schools in rural areas, and
of the 250 poorest counties in the
United States, 244 are rural. West Vir-
ginia has rural schools scattered
through 36 of its 55 counties, and these
schools face real challenges in recruit-
ing and retaining teachers, as well as
dealing with other issues related to
their rural location.

Attracting teachers to these schools
is difficult in large part due to the vast
gap between what rural districts are
able to offer and the salaries paid by
more affluent school districts, as wide
as $20,000 a year, according to omne
study. Poor urban schools must over-
come similar difficulties. It is often a
challenge for these schools to attract
and keep qualified teachers. Yet, ac-
cording to the 2001 No Child Left Be-
hind Act, every school must have



S7912

qualified teachers by the end of the
2005-2006 school year.

My ““I Teach” Act will reward teach-
ers willing to work in rural or high
poverty schools with an annual $1,000
refundable tax credit. If the teacher ob-
tains certification by the National
Board for Professional Teaching Stand-
ards, they will receive an additional
annual $1,000 refundable tax credit.

Every teacher willing to work in un-
derserved schools will earn a tax cred-
it. Every teacher who gets certified
will earn a tax credit. Teachers who
work in rural or poor schools and get
certified will earn both. Schools who
desperately need help attracting teach-
ers will get a boost. And children edu-
cated in poor and rural schools will
benefit most.

In my State of West Virginia, as in
over 30 other States, there is already a
State fiscal incentive for teachers who
earn National Board certification. My
legislation builds upon the West Vir-
ginia program; together, they add up to
a powerful tax incentive for teachers to
remain in the classroom and to use
their skills where they are most need-
ed.

I have spent a great deal of time in
West Virginia classrooms this year,
and it has become obvious to me that
our education agenda suffers greatly
from inadequate funding on a number
of fronts. In response, I have intro-
duced a series of bills attacking dif-
ferent aspects of the problem.

A qualified teacher is a great start,
but children also deserve a safe, mod-
ern classroom. And so, in addition to
the ““I Teach” Act, I have introduced a
measure to encourage investment in
school construction and renovations.

I am promoting legislation to de-
velop Math and Science Partnerships
at the National Science Foundation, to
place needed emphasis on these core
subjects.

And to ensure that every student, in-
cluding those in rural areas, has access
to modern technology and the wealth
of educational resources on the web, 1
remain vigilant in protecting the E-
Rate, which provides $2.25 billion in an-
nual discounts to connect our schools
and libraries to the Internet.

Education is among our top national
priorities, essential for every family
with a child and vital for our economic
and national security. I supported the
bold goals and higher standards of the
2001 No Child Left Behind Act, but they
won’t be met unless our schools have
the teachers and resources they need. I
am committed to working closely with
my Senate colleagues this fall to se-
cure as much funding as possible for
our children’s education.

No amount of construction or tech-
nology can replace a qualified and mo-
tivated teacher, however, and making
it easier for underserved schools to at-
tract the teachers they need remains
one of my most important objectives. I
hope each of my colleagues will join
me in supporting this important legis-
lation which takes a great stride to-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

ward better education for every child
in the United States.

By Mr. FEINGOLD:

S. 2847. A Dbill to assist in the con-
servation of cranes by supporting and
providing, through projects of persons
and organizations with expertise in
crane conservation, financial resources
for the conservation programs of coun-
tries the activities of which directly or
indirectly affect cranes; to the Com-
mittee on Environment and Public
Works.

Mr. FEINGOLD. Mr. President, I rise
today to introduce the Crane Conserva-
tion Act of 2002. I propose this legisla-
tion in the hope that Congress will do
its part to protect the existence of
these birds, whose cultural significance
and popular appeal can be seen world-
wide. This legislation is important to
the people of Wisconsin, as our State
provides habitat and refuge to several
crane species. But this legislation,
which authorizes the United States
Fish and Wildlife Service to distribute
funds and grants to crane conservation
efforts both domestically and in devel-
oping countries, promises to have a
larger environmental and cultural im-
pact that will go far beyond the bound-
aries of my home State.

In October of 1994, Congress passed
and the President signed the Rhinoc-
eros and Tiger Conservation Act. The
passage of this act provided support for
multinational Rhino and Tiger con-
servation through the creation of the
Rhinoceros and Tiger Conservation
Fund, or RTCF. Administered by the
United States Fish and Wildlife Serv-
ice, the RTCF distributes up to $10 mil-
lion in grants every year to conserva-
tion groups to support projects in de-
veloping countries. Since its establish-
ment in 1994, the RTCF has been ex-
panded by Congress to cover other spe-
cies, such as elephants and great apes.

Today, with the legislation I am in-
troducing, I am asking Congress to add
cranes to this list. Cranes are the most
endangered family of birds in the
world, with ten of the world’s fifteen
species at risk of extinction. Specifi-
cally, this legislation would authorize
up to $3 million of funds per year to be
distributed in the form of conservation
project grants to protect cranes and
their habitat. The financial resources
authorized by this bill can be made
available to qualifying conservation
groups operating in Asia, Africa, and
North America. The program is author-
ized from Fiscal Year 2003 through Fis-
cal Year 2007.

In keeping with my belief that we
should maintain fiscal integrity, this
bill proposes that the $15 million in au-
thorized spending over five years for
the Crane Conservation Act established
in this legislation should be offset by
rescinding $18 million in unspent funds
from funds carried over the Depart-
ment of Energy’s Clean Coal Tech-
nology Program in the Fiscal Year 2002
Energy and Water Appropriations Bill.
The Secretary of the Interior would be

August 1, 2002

required to transfer any funds it does
not expend under the Crane Conserva-
tion Act back to the Treasury at the
end of Fiscal Year 2007. I do not intend
my bill to make any particular judg-
ments about the Clean Coal program or
its effectiveness, but I do think, in gen-
eral, that programs should expend re-
sources that we appropriate in a timely
fashion.

I am offering this legislation due to
the serious and significant decline that
can be expected in crane populations
worldwide without conservation ef-
forts. The decline of the North Amer-
ican whooping crane, the rarest crane
on earth, perfectly illustrates the dan-
gers faced by these birds. In 1941, only
21 whooping cranes existed in the en-
tire world. This stands in contrast to
the almost 400 birds in existence today.
The North American whooping crane’s
resurgence is attributed to the birds’
tenacity for survival and to the efforts
of conservationists in the United
States and Canada. Today, the only
wild flock of North American whooping
cranes breeds in northwest Canada, and
spends its winters in coastal Texas.
Two new flocks of cranes are currently
being reintroduced to the wild, one of
which is a migratory flock on the Wis-
consin to Florida flyway.

This flock of five birds illustrates
that any effort by Congress to regulate
crane conservation needs to cross both
national and international lines. As
this flock of birds makes its journey
from Wisconsin to Florida, the birds
rely on the ecosystems of a multitude
of states in this country. In its journey
from the Necedah National Wildlife
Refuge in Wisconsin to the
Chassahowitzka National Wildlife Ref-
uge in Florida in the fall and eventual
return to my home state in the spring,
this flock also faces threats from pollu-
tion of traditional watering grounds,
collision with utility lines, human dis-
turbance, disease, predation, loss of ge-
netic diversity within the population,
and vulnerability to catastrophes, both
natural and man-made. Despite the
conservation efforts taken since 1941,
this symbol of conservation is still
very much in danger of extinction.

While over the course of the last half-
century, North American whooping
cranes have begun to make a slow re-
covery, many species of crane in Africa
and Asia have declined, including the
sarus crane of Asia and the wattled
crane of Africa.

The sarus crane is a symbol of mar-
tial fidelity in many Asian cultures, es-
pecially Laos, Thailand and Indonesia.
Additionally, in northern India, west-
ern Nepal, and Vietnam, these birds are
a symbol of fertility, lending them as
important religious significance.
Standing at four feet tall, these birds
can be found in the wetlands of north-
ern India and south Asia. These birds
require large, open, well watered plains
or marshes to breed and survive.

Due to agricultural expansion, indus-
trial development, river basin develop-
ment, pollution, warfare, and heavy



August 1, 2002

use of pesticides, which is found to be
highly prevalent in India and southeast
Asia, the sarus crane population has
been in decline. Furthermore, in many
areas, a high human population con-
centration compounds these factors.
On the Mekong River, which runs
through Cambodia, Vietnam, Laos,
Thailand, and China, human popu-
lation growth and planned development
projects threaten the sarus crane. Re-
ports from India, Cambodia, and Thai-
land have also cited incidences of the
trading of adult birds and chicks, as
well as hunting and egg stealing in the
drop-in population of the sarus crane.

Only three subspecies of the sarus
crane exist today. One resides in north-
ern India and Nepal, one resides in
southeast Asia, and one resides in
northern Australia. Their population is
about 8,000 in the main Indian popu-
lation, with recent numbers showing a
rapid decline. In Southeast Asia, only
1,000 birds remain.

The situation of the sarus crane in
Asia is mirrored by the situation of the
wattled crane in Africa. In Africa, the
wattled crane is found in the southern
and eastern regions, with an isolated
population in the mountains of Ethi-
opia. Current population estimates
range between 6,000 to 8,000 and are de-
clining rapidly, due to loss and deg-
radation of wetland habitats, as well as
intensified agriculture, dam construc-
tion, and industrialization. In other
parts of the range, the creation of dams
has changed the dynamics of the flood
plains, thus further endangering these
cranes and their habitats. Human dis-
turbance at or near breeding sites also
continues to be a major threat. Lack of
oversight and education over the ac-
tions of humans, industry, and agri-
culture is leading to reduced preserva-
tion for the lands on which cranes live,
thereby threatening the ability of
cranes to survive in these regions.

If we do not act now, not only will
cranes face extinction, but the eco-
systems that depend on their contribu-
tions will suffer. With the decline of
the crane population, the wetlands and
marshes they inhabit can potentially
be thrown off balance. I urge my col-
leagues to join me in supporting legis-
lation that can provide funding to the
local farming, education and enforce-
ment projects that can have the great-
est positive effect on the preservation
of both cranes and fragile habitats.
This small investment can secure the
future of these exemplary birds and the
beautiful areas in which they live.
Therefore, I ask my colleagues to sup-
port the Crane Conservation Act of
2002.

By Ms. COLLINS (for herself, Mr.
CLELAND, Mr. HUTCHINSON, Mr.
KERRY, Ms. SNOWE, and Mr.
MILLER):

S. 2848. A bill to amend title XVIII of
the Social Security Act to provide for
a clarification of the definition of
homebound for purposes of determining
eligibility for home health services

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

under the medicare program; to the
Committee on Finance.

Ms. COLLINS. Mr. President, I am
pleased to join with Senators CLELAND,
HUTCHINSON, KERRY, SNOWE and MILLER
in introducing the David Jayne Medi-
care Homebound Modernization Act of
2002 to modernize Medicare’s outdated
“homebound’” requirement that has
impeded access to needed home health
services for many of our nation’s elder-
ly and disabled Medicare beneficiaries.

Health care in American has gone
full circle. People are spending less
time in institutions, and recovery and
care for patients with chronic diseases
and conditions has increasingly been
taking place in the home. The highly
skilled and often technically complex
care that our home health agencies
provide have enabled millions of our
most vulnerable older and disabled in-
dividuals to avoid hospitals and nurs-
ing homes and stay just where they be-
long, in the comfort and security of
their own homes.

Under current law, a Medicare pa-
tient must be considered ‘“homebound”
if he or she is to be eligible for home
health services. While an individual is
not actually required to be bedridden
to qualify for benefits, his or her condi-
tions must be such that ‘‘there exists a
normal inability to leave home.” The
statute does allow for absences from
the home of ‘‘infrequent” or ‘‘rel-
atively short duration.” TUnfortu-
nately, however, it does not define pre-
cisely what this means. It leaves it to
the fiscal intermediaries to interpret
just how many absences qualify as
“frequent’”’ and just how short those
absences must be. Interpretations of
this definition have therefore varied
widely.

As a consequence, there have been far
too many instances where an over-
zealous or arbitrary interpretation of
the definition has turned elderly or dis-
abled Medicare beneficiaries, who are
dependent upon Medicare home health
services and medical equipment for
survival, into virtual prisoners in their
own home. We have heard disturbing
accounts of individuals on Medicare
who have had their home health bene-
fits terminated for leaving their homes
to visit a hospitalized spouse or to at-
tend a family gathering, including, in
one case, to attend the funeral of their
own child.

Under current law, a Medicare pa-
tient must be considered ‘“homebound”
if he or she is to be eligible for home
health services. While an individual is
not actually required to be bedridden
to quality for benefits, his or her condi-
tion must be such that ‘‘there exists a
normal inability to leave home.”

The statute does allow for absences
from the home that are ‘‘infrequent
and of short duration.” It also gives
specific permission for the individual
to leave home to attend medical ap-
pointments, adult day care or religious
services. Otherwise, it leaves it to the
fiscal intermediaries to interpret just
how many absences qualify as ‘‘fre-

S7913

quent’” and just how short those ab-
sences must be. Interpretations of this
definition have therefore varied widely.

As a consequence, there have been far
too many instances where an over-
zealous or arbitrary interpretation of
the definition has turned elderly or dis-
abled Medicare recipients, who are de-
pendent upon Medicare home health
services and medical equipment for
survival, into virtual prisoners in their
own homes.

The current homebound requirement
is particularly hard on younger, dis-
abled Medicare patients. For example,
I recently met with David Jayne, a 40-
year old man with Lou Gehrig’s dis-
ease, who is confined to a wheelchair
and cannot swallow, speak or even
breathe on his own. Mr. Jayne needs
several skilled nursing visits per week
to enable him to remain independent
and out of an inpatient facility. De-
spite his disability, Mr. Jayne meets
frequently with youth and church
groups. Speaking through a computer-
ized voice synthesizer, he gives inspira-
tional talks about how the human spir-
it can endure and even overcome great
hardship.

The Atlanta Journal Constitution
ran a feature article on Mr. Jayne and
his activities, including a report about
how he had, with the help of family and
friends, attended a football game to
root for the University of Georgia Bull-
dogs. A few days later, at the direction
of the fiscal intermediary, his home
health agency, which had been sending
a health care worker to his home for
two hours, four mornings a week, noti-
fied him that he could no longer be
considered homebound, and that his
benefits were being cut off. While his
benefits were subsequently reinstated
due to the media attention given the
case, this experience motivated him to
launch a crusade to modernize the
homebound definition and led him to
found the National Coalition to Amend
the Medicare Homebound Restriction.

The current homebound requirement
is particularly hard on younger, dis-
abled individuals who are on Medicare.
The fact is that the current require-
ment reflects an outmoded view of life
for persons who live with serious dis-
abilities. The homebound criteria may
have made sense thirty years ago,
when an elderly or disabled person
might expect to live in the confines of
their home, perhaps cared for by an ex-
tended family. The current definition,
however, fails to reflect the techno-
logical and medical advances that have
been made in supporting individuals
with significant disabilities and mobil-
ity challenges. It also fails to reflect
advances in treatment for seriously ill
individuals, like Mr. Jayne, which
allow them brief periods of relative
wellness.

It also fails to recognize that an indi-
vidual’s mental acuity an physical
stamina can only be maintained by
use, and that the use of the body and
mind is encouraged by social inter-
actions outside the four walls of a
home.



S7914

The David Jayne Medicare Home-
bound Modernization Act of 2002 will
amend the homebound definition to
base eligibility for the home health
benefit on the patient’s functional lim-
itations and clinical condition, rather
than on an arbitrary limitation on ab-
sences from the home. It will provide a
specific, limited exception to the
homebound rule for individuals who:

One, have been certified by a physi-
cian has having a permanent and se-
vere condition that will not improve;

Two, who need assistance from an-
other person with 3 or more of the 5 ac-
tivities of daily living and require
technological and/or personal assist-
ance with the act of leaving home;

Three, who have received Medicare
home health services during the pre-
vious 12 month period; and

Four, who are only able to leave
home because the services provided
through the home health benefit makes
it possible for them to do so.

We believe that our legislation is
budget neutral because it is specifi-
cally limited to individuals who are al-
ready eligible for Medicare and whose
conditions require the assistance of a
skilled nurse, therapist or home health
aide to make it functionally possible
for them to leave the home. Our legis-
lation does not expand Medicare eligi-
bility—it simply gives people who are
already eligible for the benefit their
freedom.

This issue was first brought to my at-
tention by former Senator Robert Dole,
who has long been a vigorous advocate
for people with disabilities. Our pro-
posal is also supported by the Consor-
tium of Citizens with Disabilities, the
Visiting Nurse Associations of Amer-
ica, the National Association for Home
Care, Advancing Independence: Mod-
ernizing Medicare and Medicaid,
AIMM, and the National Coalition to
Amend the Medicare Homebound Re-
striction.

Moreover, the David Jayne Medicare
Homebound Modernization Act of 2002
is consistent with President Bush’s
‘“New Freedom Initiative’ which has,
as its goal, the removal of barriers that
impede opportunities for those with
disabilities to integrate more fully into
the community. By allowing reason-
able absences from the home, our
amendment will bring the Medicare
home health benefit into the 21st Cen-
tury, and I look forward to working
with my colleagues to getting it done.

By Ms. COLLINS (for herself and
Mrs. MURRAY):

S. 2849. A bill to increase the supply
of pancreatic islet cells for research, to
provide better coordination of Federal
efforts and information on islet cell
transplantation, and to collect the
data necessary to move islet cell trans-
plantation from an experimental proce-
dure to a standard therapy; to the
Committee on Health, Education,
Labor, and Pensions.

Ms. COLLINS. Mr. President, I am
pleased to join my colleague from

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

Washington, Senator MURRAY, in intro-
ducing the Pancreatic Islet Cell Trans-
plantation Act of 2002 which will help
to advance important research that
holds the promise of a cure for the
more than one million Americans with
Type 1 or juvenile diabetes.

As the founder and Co-Chair of the
Senate Diabetes Caucus, I have learned
a great deal about this serious disease
and the difficulties and heartbreak
that it causes for so many Americans
and their families as they await a cure.
Diabetes is a devastating, life-long con-
dition that affects people of every age,
race and nationality. It is the leading
cause of kidney failure, blindness in
adults, and amputations not related to
injury. Moreover, diabetes costs the
nation more than $105 billion a year,
one out of every ten health care dol-
lars, in health-related expenditures.

The burden of diabetes is particularly
heavy for children and young adults
with juvenile diabetes. Juvenile diabe-
tes is the second most common chronic
disease affecting children. Moreover, it
is one that they never outgrow.

In individuals with juvenile diabetes,
the body’s immune system attacks the
pancreas and destroys the islet cells
that produce insulin. While the dis-
covery of insulin was a landmark
breakthrough in the treatment of peo-
ple with diabetes, it is not a cure, and
people with juvenile diabetes face the
constant threat of developing dev-
astating, life-threatening complica-
tions as well as a drastic reduction in
their quality of life.

Thankfully, there is good news for
people with diabetes. We have seen
some tremendous breakthroughs in di-
abetes research in recent years, and I
am convinced that diabetes is a disease
that can be cured, and will be cured in
the near future.

We were all encouraged by the devel-
opment of the ‘“‘Edmonton Protocol,”
an experimental treatment developed
at the University of Alberta involving
the transplantation of insulin-pro-
ducing pancreatic islet cells, which has
been hailed as the most important ad-
vance in diabetes research since the
discovery of insulin in 1921. Of the ap-
proximately 70 patients who have been
treated using variation of the Edmon-
ton Protocol over the past two years,
all have seen a reversal of their life-
disabling hypoglycemia, and nearly 80
percent have maintained normal glu-
cose levels without insulin shots for
more than two years.

Moreover, the side effects associated
with this treatment—which uses more
islet cells and a less-toxic combination
of immunosuppressive drugs than pre-
vious, less successful protocols—have
been mild, and the therapy has been
generally well-tolerated by most pa-
tients.

Unfortunately, long-term use of toxic
immunosuppressive drugs, has side-ef-
fects that make the current treatment
inappropriate for use in children. Re-
searchers, however, are working hard
to find a way to reduce the transplant

August 1, 2002

recipient’s dependence on these drugs
so that the procedure will be appro-
priate for children in the future, and
the protocol has been hailed around the
world as a remarkable breakthrough
and proof that islet transplantation
can work. It appears to offer the most
immediate chance to achieve a cure for
juvenile diabetes, and the research is
moving forward rapidly.

New sources of islet cells must be
found, however, because, as the science
advances and continues to demonstrate
promise, the number of islet cell trans-
plants that can be performed will be
limited by a serious shortage of
pancreases available for islet cell
transplantation. There currently are
only 2,000 pancreases donated annually,
and, of these, only about 500 are avail-
able each year for islet cell trans-
plants. Moreover, most patients re-
quire islet cells from two pancreases
for the procedure to work effectively.

The legislation we are introducing
today will increase the supply of
pancreases available for these trials
and research. Our legislation will di-
rect the Centers for Medicare and Med-
icaid Services to grant credit to organ
procurement organizations, OPS, for
the purposes of their certification—for
pancreases harvested and used for islet
cell transplantation and research.

Currently, CMS collects performance
data from each OPO based upon the
number of organs procured for trans-
plant relative to the population of the
OPO’s service area. While CMS con-
siders a pancreas to have been procured
for transplantation if it is used for a
whole organ transplant, the OPO re-
ceives no credit towards its certifi-
cation if the pancreas is procured and
used for islet cell transplantation or
research. Our legislation will therefore
give the OPOs an incentive to step up
their efforts to increase the supply of
pancreases donated for this purpose.

In addition, the legislation estab-
lishes an inter-agency committee on
islet cell transplantation comprised of
representatives of all of the federal
agencies with an active role in sup-
porting this research. The many advi-
sory committees on organ transplan-
tation that currently exist are so broad
in scope that the issue of islet cell
transplantation—while of great impor-
tance to the juvenile diabetes commu-
nity—does not rise to the level of con-
sideration when included with broader
issues associated with organ donation,
such as organ allocation policy and fi-
nancial barriers to transplantation. We
believe that a more focused effort in
the area of islet cell transplantation is
clearly warranted since the research is
moving forward at such a rapid pace
and with such remarkable results.

And finally, to help us collect the
data necessary to move islet cell trans-
plantation from an experimental proce-
dure to a standard therapy covered by
insurance, our legislation directs the
Institute of Medicine to conduct a
study on the impact of islet cell trans-
plantation on the health-related qual-
ity of life for individuals with juvenile



August 1, 2002

diabetes as well as the cost-effective-
ness of the treatment.

Islet cell transplantation offers real
hope for people with juvenile diabetes.
Our legislation, which is strongly sup-
ported by the Juvenile Diabetes Re-
search Foundation, addresses some of
the specific obstacles to moving this
research forward as rapidly as possible,
and I urge all of our colleagues to join
us in sponsoring it.

By Mr. JOHNSON (for himself
and Mr. DORGAN):

S. 2853. A Dbill to direct the Secretary
of the Interior to establish the Mis-
souri River Monitoring and Research
Program, to authorize the establish-
ment of the Missouri River Basin
Stakeholder Committee, and for other
purposes; to the Committee on Envi-
ronment and Public Works.

Mr. JOHNSON. Mr. President, today,
I am pleased to join Senator BYRON
DORGAN in introducing legislation that
will establish a world-class, science-
based long-term monitoring program
for the Missouri River. As America’s
longest river, fed by the headwaters of
thousand, year-old glaciers, the Mis-
souri is intertwined into the fabric of
the American experience. Fed by doz-
ens of tributaries crisscrossing Mon-
tana, North and South Dakota, Ne-
braska, Missouri, and Kansas, the Mis-
souri River supports hundreds of river
species and provides crucial wildlife
habitat for migratory birds and other
animals. The Missouri River also sus-
tains trophy walleye fishing on South
Dakota’s main stem reservoirs and is
the hub for the cultural and economic
development of several communities
and Indian Tribes.

The Missouri River faces challenges
on several fronts: The manipulation of
its water levels by the Corps of Engi-
neers, the continued development of
river shoreline, and the invasion of
nonnative fish and plants. The Mis-
souri River Enhancement and Moni-
toring Act of 2002 creates a comprehen-
sive monitoring program to investigate
and examine how the multiple uses of
the Missouri are impacting water qual-
ity and the sustainability of fish and
wildlife.

The legislation authorizes the estab-
lishment of a federal research program
through the Biological Resources Divi-
sion of the USGS, the Department of
the Interior’s research engine. The
strength of the bill, however, stems
from the participation of the states, In-
dian Tribes, and academic institutions
all who have a stake in the health of
the River. To that end, the legislation
authorizes the establishment of moni-
toring field stations throughout the
Missouri River basin. The bill also in-
cludes a competitive funding process to
contract with Indian Tribes and basin
States for the recovery of threatened
species and specific habitat restoration
projects. These focused investigations
will encourage States and Indian
Tribes to study the impact of water

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

flows on fish populations at main stem
reservoirs.

Earlier this year, water releases from
South Dakota reservoirs damaged the
spring fish spawn and the ecology of
the Missouri River. This bill authorizes
funds for State agencies with jurisdic-
tion over fish and wildlife habitat to
initiate projects that will be able to
tell us how low water levels at South
Dakota reservoirs impact fish popu-
lations and recreational opportunities.

I ask unanimous consent that a let-
ter from the South Dakota Department
of Game, Fish, and Parks in support of
the Missouri River Monitoring Act of
2002 be printed in the RECORD.

There being no objection, the letter
was ordered to be printed in the
RECORD, as follows:

DEPARTMENT OF GAME,
FISH AND PARKS,
Pierre, SD, July 23, 2002.
Senator TIM JOHNSON,
Hart Senate Office,
Washington, DC.

DEAR SENATOR JOHNSON: I would like to ex-
press my appreciation for all of your efforts
on behalf of Missouri River fish and wildlife
resources, especially the introduction of the
“Missouri River Monitoring Act of 2002.”
The framework for this legislation. ‘‘The
Missouri River Environmental Assessment
Program (MOREAP), was developed by the
Missouri River Natural Resources Com-
mittee (MRNRC) during 1996 and 1997 in part-
nership with the Biological Resources Divi-
sion of the United States Geological Survey
(USGS) and 79 Missouri River scientists and
fish and wildlife managers. The MRNRC was
established in 1987 by my agency and other
main stem state fish and wildlife agencies
with statutory responsibilities for manage-
ment and stewardship of river fish and wild-
life resources held in trust for the public. We
are accountable to the public for manage-
ment of those resources.

My staff and I have reviewed the proposed
legislation and I want you to know that we
support your bill. The Missouri River lacks a
basin wide biological monitoring program
and environmental assessment is desperately
needed. The need for collecting comprehen-
sive, long-term natural resource data to un-
derstand the effects of future river manage-
ment decisions cannot be over-stated. This
program will generate a system-wide data-
base on Missouri River water quality, habi-
tat, and biota that will provide the scientific
foundation for management decisions.

The Missouri River is 2,341 miles long and
drains one-sixth of the United States. It is
one of the most important resources in our
country. Harnessing the river’s flow and con-
stricting its channel has altered and reduced
native fish and wildlife habitat. Recovering
declining fish and wildlife resources in this
extremely large, diverse and complex river
environment, while maintaining the impor-
tant economic benefits the river and res-
ervoir system provides, will require sound
and ongoing scientific data.

The time has come to make management
changes on the Missouri River and those
changes should be based on a thorough un-
derstanding of how those changes affect the
river’s environment. Scientific data will help
us understand the complex relationships be-
tween river management and fish and wild-
life habitat recovery.

I thank you once again for your help. This
legislation has the strong support of the
South Dakota Department Game Fish and
Parks.

Sincerely,
JOHN L. COOPER,
Department Secretary.

S7915

The time for a monitoring program
for the Missouri River has arrived.
With the Corps of Engineers poised to
revise the Missouri River Master Water
Control Manual, a monitoring program
will establish a baseline for judging the
impact of new water flows. Years of
scientific analysis and research from
the U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service
point toward Corps management of the
river as the reason for diminished ri-
parian habitat and a laundry list of
threatened fish and bird species. Sci-
entific monitoring must be part of a
new Master Manual to examine how
the new water flows impact fish and
wildlife populations. The Corps has
spent nearly 13 years and millions of
dollars to find a consensus and imple-
ment a new, more balanced Master
Manual. The Missouri River Enhance-
ment and Monitoring Act of 2002 estab-
lishes a comprehensive database to
analyze and examine how fish and wild-
life respond to a new management
plan. A long-term monitoring program
will ensure that future decisions over
the Missouri River are based on sound
science and not politics.

As we approach the 200 year anniver-
sary of Lewis and Clark’s journey up
the Missouri River, I call on Congress
to pass the Missouri River Enhance-
ment and Monitoring Act of 2002 to en-
sure the health and vitality of the
River for the enjoyment of future gen-
erations.

I ask unanimous consent that the
text of the bill be printed in the
RECORD.

There being no objection, the bill was
ordered to be printed in the RECORD, as
follows:

S. 2853

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Missouri
River Enhancement and Monitoring Act of
2002,

SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act:

(1) CENTER.—The term ‘‘Center’ means the
River Studies Center of the Biological Re-
sources Division of the United States Geo-
logical Survey, located in Columbia, Mis-
souril.

(2) COMMITTEE.—The term ‘“Committee”’
means the Missouri River Basin Stakeholder
Committee established under section 4(a).

(3) INDIAN TRIBE.—The term ‘‘Indian tribe”’
has the meaning given the term in section 4
of the Indian Self-Determination and Edu-
cation Assistance Act (25 U.S.C. 450b).

(4) PROGRAM.—The term ‘‘program’ means
the Missouri River monitoring and research
program established under section 3(a).

(5) RIVER.—The term ‘‘River’” means the
Missouri River.

(6) SECRETARY.—The term ‘‘Secretary’”’
means the Secretary of the Interior, acting
through the Biological Resources Division of
the United States Geological Survey.

(7) STATE.—The term ‘‘State’ means—

(A) the State of Iowa;

(B) the State of Kansas;

(C) the State of Missouri;

(D) the State of Montana;

(E) the State of Nebraska;

(F') the State of North Dakota;



S7916

(G) the State of South Dakota; and

(H) the State of Wyoming.

(8) STATE AGENCY.—The term ‘‘State agen-
cy’” means an agency of a State that has ju-
risdiction over fish and wildlife of the River.
SEC. 3. MISSOURI RIVER MONITORING AND RE-

SEARCH PROGRAM.

(a) ESTABLISHMENT.—Not later than 1 year
after the date of enactment of this Act, the
Secretary shall establish the Missouri River
monitoring and research Program—

(1)(A) to coordinate the collection of infor-
mation on the biological and water quality
characteristics of the River; and

(B) to evaluate how those characteristics
are affected by hydrology;

(2) to coordinate the monitoring and as-
sessment of biota (including threatened or
endangered species) and habitat of the River;
and

(3) to make recommendations on means to
assist in restoring the ecosystem of the
River.

(b) CONSULTATION.—In establishing the pro-
gram under subsection (a), the Secretary
shall consult with—

(1) the Biological Resources Division of the
United States Geological Survey;

(2) the Director of the United States Fish
and Wildlife Service;

(3) the Chief of Engineers;

(4) the Western Area Power Administra-
tion;

(5) the Administrator of the Environ-
mental Protection Agency;

(6) the Governors of the States,
through—

(A) the Missouri River Natural Resources
Committee; and

(B) the Missouri River Basin Association;
and

(7) the Indian tribes of the Missouri River
Basin.

(c) ADMINISTRATION.—The Center shall ad-
minister the program.

(d) ACTIVITIES.—In administering the pro-
gram, the Center shall—

(1) establish a baseline of conditions for
the River against which future activities
may be measured;

(2) monitor biota (including threatened or
endangered species), habitats, and the water
quality of the River;

(3) if initial monitoring carried out under
paragraph (2) indicates that there is a need
for additional research, carry out any addi-
tional research appropriate to—

(A) advance the understanding of the eco-
system of the River; and

(B) assist in guiding the operation and
management of the River;

(4) use any scientific information obtained
from the monitoring and research to assist
in the recovery of the threatened species and
endangered species of the River; and

(5) establish a scientific database that
shall be—

(A) coordinated among the States and In-
dian tribes of the Missouri River Basin; and

(B) readily available to members of the
public.

(e) CONTRACTS WITH INDIAN TRIBES.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding any
other provision of law, the Secretary shall
enter into contracts in accordance with sec-
tion 102 of the Indian Self-Determination Act
(25 U.S.C. 450f) with Indian tribes that have—

(A) reservations located along the River;
and

(B) an interest in monitoring and assessing
the condition of the River.

(2) REQUIREMENTS.—A contract entered
into under paragraph (1) shall be for activi-
ties that—

(A) carry out the purposes of this Act; and

(B) complement any activities relating to
the River that are carried out by—

(i) the Center; or

acting

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

(ii) the States.

(f) MONITORING AND RECOVERY OF THREAT-
ENED SPECIES AND ENDANGERED SPECIES.—
The Center shall provide financial assistance
to the United States Fish and Wildlife Serv-
ice and State agencies to monitor and re-
cover threatened species and endangered spe-
cies, including monitoring the response of
pallid sturgeon to reservoir operations on
the mainstem of the River.

(g) GRANT PROGRAM.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Center shall carry out
a competitive grant program under which
the Center shall provide grants to States, In-
dian tribes, research institutions, and other
eligible entities and individuals to conduct
research on the impacts of the operation and
maintenance of the mainstem reservoirs on
the River on the health of fish and wildlife of
the River, including an analysis of any ad-
verse social and economic impacts that re-
sult from reoperation measures on the River.

(2) REQUIREMENTS.—On an annual basis,
the Center, the Director of the United States
Fish and Wildlife Service, the Director of the
United States Geological Survey, and the
Missouri River Natural Resources Com-
mittee, shall—

(A) prioritize research needs for the River;

(B) issue a request for grant proposals; and

(C) award grants to the entities and indi-
viduals eligible for assistance under para-
graph (1).

(h) ALLOCATION OF FUNDS.—

(1) CENTER.—Of amounts made available to
carry out this section, the Secretary shall
make the following percentages of funds
available to the Center:

(A) 35 percent for fiscal year 2003.

(B) 40 percent for fiscal year 2004.

(C) 50 percent for each of fiscal years 2005
through 2017.

(2) STATES AND INDIAN TRIBES.—Of amounts
made available to carry out this section, the
Secretary shall use the following percent-
ages of funds to provide assistance to States
or Indian tribes of the Missouri River Basin
to carry out activities under subsection (d):

(A) 65 percent for fiscal year 2003.

(B) 60 percent for fiscal year 2004.

(C) 50 percent for each of fiscal years 2005
through 2017.

(3) USE OF ALLOCATIONS.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Of the amount made
available to the Center for a fiscal year
under paragraph (1)(C), not less than—

(i) 20 percent of the amount shall be made
available to provide financial assistance
under subsection (f); and

(i) 33 percent of the amount shall be made
available to provide grants under subsection
(8).

(B) ADMINISTRATIVE AND OTHER EXPENSES.—
Any amount remaining after application of
subparagraph (A) shall be used to pay the
costs of—

(i) administering the program;

(ii) collecting additional information relat-
ing to the River, as appropriate;

(iii) analyzing and presenting the informa-
tion collected under clause (ii); and

(iv) preparing any appropriate reports, in-
cluding the report required by subsection (i).

(i) REPORT.—Not later than 3 years after
the date on which the program is established
under subsection (a), and not less often than
every 3 years thereafter, the Secretary, in
cooperation with the individuals and agen-
cies referred to in subsection (b), shall—

(1) review the program;

(2) establish and revise the purposes of the
program, as the Secretary determines to be
appropriate; and

(3) submit to the appropriate committees
of Congress a report on the environmental
health of the River, including—

August 1, 2002

(A) recommendations on means to assist in
the comprehensive restoration of the River;
and

(B) an analysis of any adverse social and
economic impacts on the River, in accord-
ance with subsection (g)(1).

SEC. 4. MISSOURI RIVER BASIN STAKEHOLDER
COMMITTEE.

(a) ESTABLISHMENT.—Not later than 1 year
after the date of enactment of this Act, the
Governors of the States and the governing
bodies of the Indian tribes of the Missouri
River Basin shall establish a committee to
be known as the ‘Missouri River Basin
Stakeholder Committee’” to make rec-
ommendations to the Federal agencies with
jurisdiction over the River on means of re-
storing the ecosystem of the River.

(b) MEMBERSHIP.—The Governors of the
States and governing bodies of the Indian
tribes of the Missouri River Basin shall ap-
point to the Committee—

(1) representatives of—

(A) the States; and

(B) Indian tribes of the Missouri River
Basin;

(2) individuals in the States with an inter-
est in or expertise relating to the River; and

(3) such other individuals as the Governors
of the States and governing bodies of the In-
dian tribes of the Missouri River Basin deter-
mine to be appropriate.

SEC. 5. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

There are authorized to be appropriated to
the Secretary—

(1) to carry out section 3—

(A) $6,500,000 for fiscal year 2003;

(B) $8,500,000 for fiscal year 2004; and

(C) $15,100,000 for each of fiscal years 2005
through 2017; and

(2) to carry out section 4, $150,000 for fiscal
year 2003.

Mr. DORGAN. Mr. President, I am
pleased to join my colleague from
South Dakota Senator TIM JOHNSON
today in introducing this Missouri
River Enhancement and Monitoring
Act of 2002 and thank him for his ef-
forts in working with me on this legis-
lation. This bill will establish a pro-
gram to conduct research on, and mon-
itor the health of, the Missouri River
to help recover threatened and endan-
gered species, such as the pallid stur-
geon and piping plover.

This bill will enable those who are
active in the Missouri River Basin to
collect and analyze baseline data, as
river operations change, so that we can
monitor changes in the health of the
river and in species recovery in future
years.

The program would also provide an
analysis of the social and economic im-
pacts along the river. And, it would es-
tablish a stakeholder group to make
recommendations on the recovery of
the Missouri River ecosystem.

The bill establishes a cooperative
working arrangement between state,
regional federal, and tribal entities
that are active in the Missouri River
Basin. I look forward to working with
all of the stakeholders in the Basin to
implement this important legislation.

I am especially pleased that this leg-
islation is supported by a broad range
of stakeholders, including the North
Dakota State Water Commission, the
North Dakota Game and Fish Depart-
ment, the North Dakota Chapter of the
Sierra Club, the Three Affiliated



August 1, 2002

Tribes, the Missouri River Natural Re-
sources Committee, The Missouri River
Basin Association, the South Dakota
Game and Fish Department, American
Rivers, and Environmental Defense.

I am confident that this legislation
will enjoy bipartisan support, because
of its significance in helping to mon-
itor and restore the health of this his-
toric River. Lewis and Clark traveled
on this River. This River also contrib-
utes to $80 million in recreation, fish-
ing, and tourism benefits in the Basin.
I look forward to holding hearings on
this bill and hope that we will be able
to pass it into law in the near future.

By Mr. BINGAMAN (for himself,
Mr. ROBERTS, and Mr. ENZI):

S. 2854. A bill to amend title XVIII of
the Social Security Act to improve dis-
proportionate share medicare pay-
ments to hospitals serving vulnerable
populations; to the Committee on Fi-
nance.

Mr. BINGAMAN. Mr. President, I am
introducing bipartisan legislation
today with Senators ROBERTS and ENZI
that addresses some inequities in the
current Medicare disproportionate
share hospital, or DSH, program. The
bill incorporates the recommendations
by the Medicare Payment Advisory
Commission, or MedPAC, to address
the current inequities in the formula
that harm rural hospitals and to better
target the money to safety net hos-
pitals.

The Medicare DSH program was cre-
ated with the purpose of assisting hos-
pitals that provide a substantial
amount of care to low-income bene-
ficiaries, including seniors and disabled
citizens served by Medicare. To protect
access to low-income Medicare bene-
ficiaries, DSH funds are provided to
hospitals whose viability is threatened
by providing care, including unreim-
bursed care, to low-income patients.

Unfortunately, the current Medicare
DSH formula does not adequately re-
flect or target money appropriately to
these safety net institutions and it also
inappropriately sets limits and inequi-
ties for rural hospitals, which are a
life-line to many of our Nation’s senior
citizens and yet struggle due to such
payment inequities in the Medicare
system.

This legislation adopts the rec-
ommendations of MedPAC to address
these inequities. According to MedPAC
from its March 2000 ‘“Report to the
Congress: Medicare Payment Policy’—

The Commission believes that special pol-
icy changes are needed to ameliorate several
problems inherent in the existing dispropor-
tionate share payment system. The current
low-income share measure does not include
care to all the poor; most notably, it omits
uncompensated care. Instead, the measure
relies on the share of resources devoted to
treating Medicaid recipients to represent the
low-income patient load for the entire non-
elderly poor population.

New Mexico leads the Nation in the
percentage of uninsured in its popu-
lations, according to the Census Bu-
reau. Consequently, as MedPAC has

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

noted repeatedly, the hospitals in my
state lose more money to uncompen-
sated care than similarly situated hos-
pitals in other states. Because the
Medicare DSH formula fails to account
for uncompensated care directly but in-
stead uses Medicaid as a proxy, the
hospitals in New Mexico are not fairly
compensated by the Medicare DSH for-
mula.

To address this problem, MedPAC
recommends the formula ‘‘include the
costs of all poor patients in calculating
low-income shares used to distribute
disproportionate share payments. . . .”
The legislation we are introducing
today would make that important
change on behalf of our Nation’s safety
net hospitals.

In addition, MedPAC notes that the
current Medicare DSH program has 10
different formulas. MedPAC adds, “‘In
particular, current policy favors hos-
pitals located in urban areas; almost
half of urban hospitals receive DSH
payments, compared with only one-
fifth of rural facilities.”

Although BIPA improved the equity
of DSH payments by raising the min-
imum low-income share needed to
qualify for a payment adjustment for
rural hospitals to that of urban hos-
pitals, BIPA capped the DSH add-on
payments a rural hospital can receive
at just 5.25 percent, except for those
rural hospitals already receiving high-
er payments due to the sole commu-
nity hospital or rural referral center
status. While MedPAC estimated the
change made about 840 additional rural
hospitals, or 40 percent of all rural fa-
cilities, eligible to receive DSH pay-
ments, the cap maintains some of the
inequities between urban and rural
hospitals.

Again, according to MedPAC in its
June 2001 ‘“‘Report to Congress: Medi-
care in Rural America’:

Rural hospitals were responsible for 12.8
percent of the care provided to Medicaid and
uncompensated care patients nationally in
1999. With the DSH payment rules in effect
through 2000, only 3.1 percent of payments
went to rural facilities; BIPA rules would in-
crease that proportion to 6.9 percent.

To address this problem, MedPAC
also recommends using the ‘‘same for-
mula to distribute payments to all hos-
pitals covered by prospective pay-
ment.”

In incorporating the recommenda-
tions of MedPAC in this legislation, it
is estimated the bill would increase
rural DSH payments by 5.4 percent
across the country, including an 8.4
percent increase for rural hospitals
with less than 50 beds. Our Nation’s
public hospitals would also benefit
greatly, as urban public hospitals and
rural government facilities are esti-
mated to receive increases of 3.6 per-
cent and 7.7 percent, respectively,
under this legislation.

This legislation I am introducing
with Senators ROBERTS and ENZzZI ad-
dresses some long-standing inequities
in the Medicare DSH formula. I urge
its adoption this year.

S7917

I ask unanimous consent that the
text of the bill be printed in the
RECORD.

There being no objection, the bill was
ordered to be printed in the RECORD, as
follows:

S. 2854

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Medicare
Safety Net Hospital Improvement Act of
2002"".

SEC. 2. COLLECTION OF DATA AND MODIFICA-
TION OF DISPROPORTIONATE
SHARE MEDICARE PAYMENTS TO
HOSPITALS SERVING VULNERABLE
POPULATIONS.

(a) COLLECTION OF DATA.—Section
1886(d)(5)(F') of the Social Security Act (42
U.S.C. 139%5ww(d)(5)(F)) is amended by adding
at the end the following new clause:

‘““(xiv) The Secretary shall collect from
each subsection (d) hospital annual data on
inpatient and outpatient charges, including
all such charges for each of the following
categories:

“(I) All patients.

‘“(IT) Patients who are entitled to benefits
under part A and are entitled to benefits (ex-
cluding any State supplementation) under
the supplemental security income program
under title XVI.

“(IIT) Patients who are entitled to (or, if
they applied, would be eligible for) medical
assistance under title XIX or child health as-
sistance under title XXI.

“(IV) Patients who are beneficiaries of in-
digent care programs sponsored by State or
local governments (including general assist-
ance programs) which are funded solely by
local or State funds or by a combination of
local, State, or Federal funding.

(V) The amount of charity care charges
and bad debt.”.

(b) MODIFICATION.—Section 1886(d)(5)(F) of
the Social Security Act (42 TU.S.C.
1395ww