AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1191H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 9 20

To ensure that Federal contractors comply with child labor laws, and for
other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

MarcH 10, 2025

Mr. HAwLEY (for himself and Mr. BOOKER) introduced the following bill;
which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Health, Edu-
cation, Labor, and Pensions

A BILL

To ensure that Federal contractors comply with child labor

laws, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Act may be cited as the “Preventing Child
5 Labor Exploitation in Federal Contracting Act”.

6 SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

7 In this Act:

8 (1)  APPROPRIATE COMMITTEES OF CON-
9 GRESS.—The term “appropriate committees of Con-
10 oress’” means—



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
L R W NN = DO VO X NN R WD~ O

2

(A) the Committee on Health, Education,

Labor, and Pensions of the Senate; and

(B) the Committee on Education and

Workforce of the IHouse of Representatives.

(2) EXECUTIVE AGENCY.—The term ‘‘executive
agency’’ has the meaning given such term in section
133 of title 41, United States Code.

(3) SECRETARY.—The term ‘‘Secretary’” means

the Secretary of Labor.

SEC. 3. PROMOTION OF WORKPLACE ACCOUNTABILITY.

(a) REQUIRED REPRESENTATIONS AND CERTIFI-

CATIONS.—Not later than 18 months after the date of en-
actment of this Act, the Federal Acquisition Regulatory

Council shall amend the Federal Acquisition Regulation

(1) require any entity that enters into a con-
tract with an executive agency to represent, on an
annual basis and to the best of the knowledge of the
entity, whether, within the preceding 3-year period,
any final administrative merits determination, arbi-
tral award or decision, or civil judgment, as defined
in coordination with the Secretary, has been issued
against the entity for any violation of section 12 of
the Fair Labor Standards Act of 1938 (29 U.S.C.

212), relating to child labor;

oS 920 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

24
25

3

(2) provide (through a revision of the Certifi-
cation Regarding Knowledge of Child Labor for
Listed End Products as deseribed in section 52.222—
18 of the Federal Acquisition Regulation or through,
if necessary, another certification) a requirement
that an offeror—

(A) certify, to the best of the knowledge of

the offeror, whether, within the preceding 3-

yvear period, any final administrative merits de-

termination, arbitral award or decision, or civil
judgment, as defined in coordination with the

Secretary, for a violation desceribed in para-

oraph (1) has been issued against the offeror;

and

(B) require such a certification from each
of the subcontractors or service providers to be
used in performing, or that were considered for
the performance of, the contract for which the
offeror is submitting an offer and provide such
certifications with the certification by the offer-

or under subparagraph (A);

(3) prohibit executive agencies from awarding a
contract to—

(A) an entity that provides an affirmative

response to a representation under paragraph

oS 920 IS



S O 0 N N B W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
AW N = O 0O o0 NN O BB WNY

4

(1) and has failed to implement any corrective

measure negotiated under subsection (b); or

(B) an offeror that—

(1) provides an affirmative response to
a certification under paragraph (2) and
has failed to implement any corrective
measure negotiated under subsection (b);
or

(1) intends to use a subcontractor or
service provider in the performance of the
contract that was identified as having a
violation In such an affirmative response
and has failed to implement any corrective

measure negotiated under such subsection;

(4) require the name and address of each entity

that provides an affirmative response to a represen-

tation under paragraph (1), and the name and ad-

dress of each offeror, subcontractor, or service pro-

vider identified as having a violation in an affirma-

tive response to a certification under paragraph (2),

to be referred to the Secretary for purposes of nego-

tiating with that entity, offeror, subcontractor, or

service provider on corrective measures under sub-

section (b) and preparing the list and conducting

oS 920 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NG B N e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N e = N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO I e

5}

suspension and debarment proceedings under sub-

section (¢);

(5) provide procedures for consultation with the
Secretary by an offeror deseribed in paragraph (2)
to assist the offeror in evaluating the information on
compliance with section 12 of the Fair Labor Stand-
ards Act of 1938, relating to child labor, submitted
to the offeror by a subcontractor or service provider
pursuant to such paragraph; and

(6) make any other changes necessary to imple-
ment the requirements of this Act.

(b) CORRECTIVE MEASURES.—An entity that makes
an affirmative response to a representation under sub-
section (a)(1) or offeror, subcontractor, or service provider
that makes an affirmative response in a certification under
subsection (a)(2)—

(1) shall update the representation or certifi-
cation, respectively, based on any steps taken by the
entity, offeror, subcontractor, or service provider to
correct a violation of or improve compliance with
section 12 of the Fair Liabor Standards Act of 1938,
relating to child labor, including any agreements en-
tered into with the Secretary; and

(2) may negotiate with the Secretary regarding

corrective measures that the entity, offeror, subcon-

oS 920 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VLV 00O N O B BN~ WD == ©

6
tractor, or service provider may take in order to
avoid being placed on the list under subsection (¢)
and referred for suspension and debarment pro-
ceedings under such subsection, in the case the enti-
ty, offeror, subcontractor, or service provider meets
the criteria for such list and proceedings under such

subsection.

(¢) LIST OF INELIGIBLE ENTITIES.

(1) IN GENERAL.—For each calendar year be-
einning with the first calendar year that begins after
the date that is 2 years after the date of enactment
of this Aect, the Secretary, in coordination with other
executive agencies as necessary, shall prepare a list
and conduct suspension and debarment proceedings

for

(A) each entity that provided an affirma-
tive response to a representation under sub-
section (a)(1) and has failed to implement any
corrective measure negotiated under subsection
(b) for the year of the list; and

(B) each offeror, subcontractor, or service
provider that was identified as having a viola-
tion in an affirmative response to a certification

under subsection (a)(2) and has failed to imple-

oS 920 IS



O© o0 3 O WD A W N -

O TN NG T N T NG I NS I NS R N e T e e T e T e e
[ B NG O N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO I e

7

ment any corrective measure negotiated under
subsection (b) for the year of the list.
(2) INELIGIBILITY.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—The head of an execu-
tive agency shall not, during the period of time
desceribed in subparagraph (B), solicit offers
from, award contracts to, or consent to sub-
contracts with any entity, offeror, subcon-
tractor, or service provider that is listed—

(1) under paragraph (1); and
(i1) as an active exclusion in the Sys-
tem for Award Management.

(B) PERIOD OF TIME.—The period of time
described in this subparagraph is a period of
time determined by the suspension and debar-
ment official that is not less than 4 years from
the date on which the entity, offeror, subcon-
tractor, or service provider is listed as an exclu-
sion in the System for Award Management.

(3) ADDITIONAL CONSIDERATIONS.—In deter-

mining the entities to consider for suspension and

debarment proceedings under paragraph (1), the

Secretary shall ensure procedures for such deter-

mination are consistent with the procedures set forth

in subpart 9.4 of the Federal Acquisition Regulation

oS 920 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG O N N = = N R < BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

8
for the suspension and debarment of Federal con-
tractors.
(d) PENALTIES FOR FAILURE TO REPORT.—

(1) OFFENSE.—It shall be unlawful for a per-
son to knowingly fail to make a representation or
certification required under paragraph (1) or (2), re-
spectively, of subsection (a).

(2) PENALTY.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—A violation of para-
oraph (1) shall be referred by any executive
agency with knowledge of such violation for sus-
pension and debarment proceedings, to be con-
ducted by the suspension and debarment official
of the Department of Labor.

(B) LOSS TO GOVERNMENT.—A violation
of paragraph (1) shall be subject to the pen-
alties under sections 3729 through 3733 of title
31, United States Code (commonly known as

the “False Claims Act”).

(e) ANNUAL REPORTS TO CONGRESS.—For each cal-
endar year beginning with the first calendar year that be-
oins after the date that is 2 years after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Secretary shall submit to the appro-

priate committees of Congress, and make publicly avail-

able on a public website, a report that includes—

oS 920 IS



9

[E—

(1) the number of entities, offerors, subcontrac-
tors, or service providers on the list under subsection
(¢) for the year of the report;

(2) the number of entities, offerors, subcontrac-
tors, or service providers that agreed to take correc-
tive measures under subsection (b) for such year;

(3) the amount of the applicable contracts for

the entities, offerors, subcontractors, or service pro-

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

viders described in paragraph (1) or (2); and

[a—
S

(4) an assessment of the effectiveness of the

[—
[—

implementation of this Act for such year.

12 SEC. 4. CIVIL PENALTIES COLLECTED FOR CHILD LABOR

13 LAW VIOLATIONS.

14 (a) AMOUNTS.

15 (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 16(e)(1)(A) of the
16 Fair Labor Standards Act of 1938 (29 U.S.C.
17 216(e)(1)(A)) 1s amended—

18 (A) by aligning the left margins of clauses
19 (1) and (i1) with the left margin of clause (1) of
20 section 16(e)(1)(B) of the Fair Labor Stand-
21 ards Act of 1938 (29 U.S.C. 216(e)(1)(B));

22 (B) in clause (i), by striking “$11,000”
23 and inserting “$100,000”; and

24 (C) in clause (i1), by striking “$50,000”
25 and inserting “$500,000”.

oS 920 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

10

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made
by paragraph (1) shall be applicable to violations oc-
curring on or after the date of enactment of this

Act.

Section 16(e)(5)
of the Fair Labor Standards Act of 1938 (29 U.S.C.

(b) APPLICATION OF PENALTIES.

216(e)(5)) 1s amended—
(1) by striking “Except” and all that follows
through “sums” and inserting “Sums’’; and
(2) by striking the second sentence.
SEC. 5. TRAINING WITH RESPECT TO CHILD LABOR LAW
VIOLATIONS.

The Fair Labor Standards Act of 1938 (29 U.S.C.
201 et seq.) i1s amended by inserting after section 18D
(42 U.S.C. 218d) the following:

“SEC. 18E. TRAINING WITH RESPECT TO CHILD LABOR LAW
VIOLATIONS.

“The Secretary shall establish programs to provide
training for relevant personnel at the Department of
Labor and other executive agencies, including the Depart-
ment of Health and Human Services and the Department
of Homeland Security, on identifying and preventing viola-

tions of section 12.”.

oS 920 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[ w—
— O

11
SEC. 6. GAO STUDY.

Not later than 2 years after the date of enactment
of this Act, the Comptroller General of the United States
shall conduct a study on the prevalence of violations of
section 12 of the Fair Labor Standards Act of 1938 (29
U.S.C. 212), relating to child labor, among Federal con-
tractors and submit to the appropriate committees of Con-
oress a report with the findings of the study.

SEC. 7. NO ADDITIONAL FUNDS.

No additional funds are authorized to be appro-

priated for the purpose of carrying out this Act.

O

oS 920 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-03-26T22:52:34-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




