AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

116TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 3 1 78

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to modify the limitation
on deduction of State and local taxes, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JANUARY 9, 2020
Mr. ScHuMER (for himself, Mr. WYDEN, and Mr. MENENDEZ) introduced the
following bill; which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Finance

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to modify
the limitation on deduction of State and local taxes,

and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Restoring Tax Fair-

(O Y N )

ness for States and Liocalities Act”.



2

1 SEC. 2. ELIMINATION FOR 2019 OF MARRIAGE PENALTY IN
2 LIMITATION ON DEDUCTION OF STATE AND
3 LOCAL TAXES.

4 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 164(b) of the Internal
5 Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding at the end
6 the following new paragraph:

7 “(7) SPECIAL RULE FOR LIMITATION ON INDI-
8 VIDUAL DEDUCTIONS FOR 2019.—In the case of a
9 taxable year beginning after December 31, 2018,
10 and before January 1, 2020, if the adjusted gross
11 income of the taxpayer for such taxable year does
12 not exceed $100,000,000, paragraph (6) shall be ap-
13 plied by substituting ‘($20,000 in the case of a joint
14 return)’ for ‘($5,000 in the case of a married indi-
15 vidual filing a separate return)’.”.

16 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
17 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

18 December 31, 2018.

19 SEC. 3. ELIMINATION FOR 2020 AND 2021 OF LIMITATION ON
20 DEDUCTION OF STATE AND LOCAL TAXES.

21 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 164(b) of the Internal
22 Revenue Code of 1986, as amended by section 2, is further

23 amended by adding at the end the following new para-

24 oraph:
25 “(8) SUSPENSION OF DOLLAR LIMITATION ON
26 STATE AND LOCAL TAXES FOR 2020 AND 2021.—

oS 3178 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

3

“(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any

taxable year beginning in 2020 or 2021, sub-
paragraph (B) of paragraph (6) shall not apply.

“(B) EXCEPTION FOR CERTAIN HIGH-IN-

COME TAXPAYERS.—Subparagraph (A) shall
not apply to any taxpayer for any taxable year
if the adjusted gross income of such taxpayer
for such taxable year exceeds $100,000,000.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 164(b)(6)

of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 1s amended—

(1) by striking “For purposes of subparagraph
(B)” and inserting “For purposes of this section’;

(2) by striking “January 1, 2018” and insert-
ing “January 1, 20227,

(3) by striking “December 31, 2017, shall” and
inserting “‘December 31, 2021, shall”’; and

(4) by adding at the end the following: “For
purposes of this section, in the case of State or local
taxes with respect to any real or personal property
paid during a taxable year beginning in 2020 or
2021, the Secretary shall prescribe rules which treat
all or a portion of such taxes as paid in a taxable
year or years other than the taxable year in which
actually paid as necessary or appropriate to prevent

the avoidance of the limitations of this subsection.”.

oS 3178 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

| \O JEE \© R O R \O I O B N e T e e e e e e e
A W = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

4

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxes paid or accrued in taxable
years beginning after December 31, 2019.

SEC. 4. INCREASE IN DEDUCTION FOR CERTAIN EXPENSES
OF ELEMENTARY AND SECONDARY SCHOOL
TEACHERS.

(a) INCREASE.—Section 62(a)(2)(D) of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking “$250 and
inserting “$1,000”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 62(d)(3)
of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended—

(1) by striking “2015" and inserting “2019”;

(2) by striking “$250” and inserting “$1,000”;
and

(3) in subparagraph (B), by striking “2014”

and inserting “2018”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2018.

SEC. 5. ABOVE-THE-LINE DEDUCTION ALLOWED FOR CER-
TAIN EXPENSES OF FIRST RESPONDERS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 62(a)(2) of the Internal

Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding at the end

the following new subparagraph:

oS 3178 IS



5

1 “(F) CERTAIN EXPENSES OF FIRST RE-
2 SPONDERS.—The deductions allowed by section
3 162 which consist of expenses, not in excess of
4 $1,000, paid or incurred by a first responder—
5 “(1) as tuition or fees for the partici-
6 pation of the first responder in profes-
7 sional development courses related to serv-
8 ice as a first responder; or
9 “(i1) for uniforms used by the first re-
10 sponder in service as a first responder.”.
11 (b) FIRST RESPONDER DEFINED.—Section 62(d) of
12 the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding
13 at the end the following new paragraph:
14 “(4) FIRST RESPONDER.—For purposes of sub-
15 section (a)(2)(F), the term ‘first responder’ means,
16 with respect to any taxable year, any individual who
17 is employed as a law enforcement officer, firefighter,
18 paramedie, or emergency medical technician for at
19 least 1,000 hours during such taxable year.”.
20 (¢) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—Section 62(d)(3) of

21 the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as amended by section
22 4, is further amended by striking “the $1,000 amount in
23 subsection (a)(2)(D)” and inserting “the $1,000 amount
24 in each of subparagraphs (D) and (F) of subsection
25 (a)(2)".

oS 3178 IS



O o0 N N D B W

[\© TN NG I NG T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e T e T
[ T N U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O TR NO I e

6

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

December 31, 2019.

SEC. 6. INCREASE OF TOP MARGINAL INDIVIDUAL INCOME

TAX RATE UNDER TEMPORARY RULES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The tables contained in subpara-

eraphs (A), (B), (C), (D), and (E) of section 1(j)(2) of

the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 are each amended by

striking “37%" and inserting *°39.6%" and—

oS 3178 IS

(1) in subparagraph (A)—

(A) by striking “$600,000” each place
such term appears and inserting “$479,0007;
and

(B) by striking “$161,379” and inserting
“$119,0297;

(2) in subparagraph (B)—

(A) by striking “$500,000” each place
such term appears and inserting “$452,4007;
and

(B) by striking “$149,298” and inserting
“$132,6387;

(3) in subparagraph (C)—

(A) by striking “$500,000” each place

such term appears and inserting “$425,8007;

and



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS N NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N e = N Re < BN B e ) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

7

(B) by striking “$150,689.50” and insert-
ing “$124,719.50”"; and
(4) in subparagraph (D)—

(A) by striking “$300,000” each place
such term appears and inserting “$239,500"’;
and

(B) by striking “$80,689.50” and insert-
ing “$59,514.50”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.

(1) Section 1(j)(4)(B)(ii1) of the Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986 is amended—

(A) in the matter preceding subclause (I),
by striking “37 percent” and inserting “39.6
percent’’;

(B) in subclause (II), by striking ““37-per-
cent bracket” and inserting ‘39.6-percent
bracket”’; and

(C) in the heading, by striking “37-PER-
CENT BRACKET” and inserting ““39.6-PERCENT

BRACKET” .

(2) Section 1(j)(4)(C) of such Code is amend-

(A) in clause (1)(IT), by striking ‘“‘para-
oraph (5)(B)(1)(IV)” and inserting ‘“‘paragraph
(5)(B)(iv)”’; and

oS 3178 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R \O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

8
(B) by amending clause (1) to read as fol-
lows:

“(i1) the amount which would (without
regard to this paragraph) be taxed at a
rate below 39.6 percent shall not be more
than the sum of—

“(I) the earned taxable income of
such child, plus

“(II)  the maximum  dollar
amount for the 35-percent rate brack-
et for estates and trusts.”.

(3) The heading of section 1(j)(5) of such Code
is amended to read as follows: “APPLICATION OF
ZERO PERCENT CAPITAL GAIN RATE BRACKETS” .

(4) Subparagraphs (A) and (B) of section
1(3)(5) of such Code are amended to read as follows:

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Subsection

(h)(1)(B)(1) shall be applied by substituting

‘below the maximum zero rate amount’ for

‘which would (without regard to this paragraph)

be taxed at a rate below 25 percent’.

“(B) MAXIMUM ZERO RATE AMOUNT DE-

FINED.—For purposes of subparagraph (A), the

term ‘maximum zero rate amount’ means—

oS 3178 IS



O o0 N N B W =

[\ I e e e e e T e e
S OV o0 N O B PR~ WD = O

9

“(1) in the case of a joint return or
surviving spouse, $77,200;

“(i1) in the case of an individual who
18 a head of household (as defined in sec-
tion 2(b)), $51,700;

“(i11) in the case of any other indi-
vidual (other than an estate or trust), an
amount equal to 2 of the amount in effect
for the taxable year under clause (i); and

“(iv) in the case of an estate or trust,
$2,600.”.

(5) Section 1(j)(5)(C) of such Code is amended
by striking “clauses (i) and (i1) of”’.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2019.

(d) SECTION 15 NoT TO APPLY.—Section 15 of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 shall not apply to any
change in a rate of tax by reason of any amendment made

by this section.

oS 3178 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2022-12-31T21:11:24-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




