AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

H.R.6414

One Nundred Fifteenth Congress
of the
Mnited States of America

AT THE SECOND SESSION

Begun and held at the City of Washington on Wednesday,
the third day of January, two thousand and eighteen

An Arct

To amend title 23, United States Code, to extend the deadline for promulgation
of regulations under the tribal transportation self-governance program.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. EXTENSION OF DEADLINE FOR PROMULGATION OF REGU-
LATIONS UNDER TRIBAL TRANSPORTATION SELF-
GOVERNANCE PROGRAM.

Section 207(n)(1) of title 23, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in subparagraph (B) by striking “21 months” and

inserting “42 months”; and
(2) in subparagraph (C) by striking “30 months” and

inserting “48 months”.

Speaker of the House of Representatives.

Vice President of the United States and
President of the Senate.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-03-27T20:07:04-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




