AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

II

Calendar No. 162
LN S 834

[Report No. 114-91]

To amend the law relating to sport fish restoration and recreational boating
safety, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

Marcn 23, 2015
Mr. THuNg (for himself, Mr. INHOFE, Mr. NELSON, and Mr. CARDIN) intro-
duced the following bill; which was read twice and referred to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transportation
JuLy 23, 2015
Reported by Mr. THUNE, with an amendment

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

A BILL

To amend the law relating to sport fish restoration and
recreational boating safety, and for other purposes.
1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 tiwes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T N T NG I NG R N S e T e e T e e e
LN A W D= O O NN N Nl WD = O

2

Seetion 3 of the Dinoell-Johnson Sport Fish Restora-
Seetion 4 of the Dinoell-Johnson Sport Fish Restora-

strrettre projects to support faetlities that meet

*S 834 RS



O o0 N N B W

O TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= O O NN NN B, WD = O

*S 834 RS

Q
(3}

¢ “'- o 44292?,7’,

i Hot seithstatditte chtse s o



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NS N NS R N e T e e T e T e e
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

*S 834 RS

4

Cote; and
“Hh $1500,000 shall be made
speetfied i elanse () for a fiseal year may



[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN, WD = O

-

)
ahed
et stthseetion fe s
B} by amending paragraph {23 to read as

*S 834 RS



6

10 st be the st of—

11 Ay the avatable macmum amount for
12 the precedite fisent vents ahd

13 4 the atonnt  detertred by pdt-
14 phttre—

15 “f the avatable massmam ammount
17 “H1) the change; relative to the pre-
18 cedite fiserd veats o the Comster Priee
19 Tdex for Al Erban Consumers prabhshed
20 by the Department of Laber’-

21 SEC. 4. EXTENSION OF EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON

22 TRANSFERS TO FUND.

23 Seetion 9504AHD) of the Internal Reverme Code of
24 1986 is wmended by strikine 920150 and insertine
25 429232

*S 834 RS



7

1 SEC: 5. RECREATIONAL BOATING SAFETY ALLOCATIONS.

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

SEC. 6. RECREATIONAL BOATING SAFETY.
amended—

*S 834 RS



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R e T e T e T e T T W
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

8

mude available by paragraph (D3 amounts made
SEC: 7. NATIONAL BOATING SAFETY ADVISORY COUNCIL:
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Sport Fish Restoration
and Recreational Boating Safety Act”.

SEC. 2. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

Section 3 of the Dingell-Johnson Sport Fish Restora-
tion Act (16 U.S.C. 777D) is amended by striking “57 per-
cent” and inserting “57.42 percent’.

SEC. 3. DIVISION OF ANNUAL APPROPRIATIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 4 of the Dingell-Johnson

Sport Fish Restoration Act (16 U.S.C. 777¢) is amended—
(1) in subsection (a)—
(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),

by striking “2014 and for the period beginning

*S 834 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ IR NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 0O N O W BN~ WD = ©

read

*S 834 RS

9
on October 1, 2014, and ending on May 31,
2015,” and inserting “2023,”;

(B) in paragraph (1), by striking “18.5
percent” and inserting “18.54 percent’”;

(C) in paragraph (2), by striking “18.5 per-
cent” and inserting “18.04 percent”; and

(D) in paragraph (3), by adding at the end
“Not more than 25 percent of such amount may
be used for capital improvement and infrastruc-
ture projects to support facilities that meet State
requirements for minimizing the introduction of
pollutants into the waterways.”;

(2) by amending the heading in subsection (b) to
as follows: “SET-ASIDES.—;
(3) in subsection (b)(1)—

(A4) n  subparagraph (A), by striking
“2014, and for the period beginning on October
1, 2014, and ending on May 31, 2015,” and in-
serting “2023,7;

(B) in  subparagraph (B), by striking
clauses (1), (1), and (1), and inserting the fol-
lowing:

“(1) for each of the fiscal years 2016

through 2023, 1.8468 percent of total an-



O© o0 2 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e T e T
[ N N N N N = = NN < BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO R e

*S 834 RS

10

nual collections under this Act for such fis-
cal year; and
“(1n) not withstanding clause (i), an
amount that s less than or equal to
$12,299,000.”: and
(C) by adding at the end the following:
“(C) SET-ASIDE FOR BOATING SAFETY.—
“(1) IN GENERAL—From the annual
appropriation made in accordance with sec-
tion 3, for each fiscal year through 2023,
the Secretary shall transfer to the Secretary
of the department in which the Coast Guard
18 operating—

“(D(aa) 0.3435 percent of total
annual collections under this Act to
pay the costs of investigations, per-
sonnel, and activities related to admin-
istering those programs under section
d(a)(2) (16 U.S.C. 777c(a)(2)); and

“(bb) notwithstanding item (aa),
an amount that is less than or equal to
$2,.300,000; and

“(II) $1,500,000 shall be made
available for the National Recreational

Boating Survey, that shall be available



O© 00 3 O WD A W N -

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O B BN WD == ©

11

until expended and may be awarded as

a contract or grant by the Secretary.

“(11) LIMITATION.—The amounts speci-
fied in clause (v) for a fiscal year may not
be included in the amount of the annual ap-

propriation distributed under subsection (a)

of this section for the fiscal year.”;
(4) wn subsection (b)(2)—

(A4) in  subparagraph (A), by striking
“under paragraph (1) shall remain available for
obligation for use under that paragraph” and
mserting “under paragraph (1)(B) shall remain
available for obligation for use under paragraph
(1)(A)”; and

(B) in subparagraph (B)—

(1) by striking “under paragraph (1)”

and inserting “under paragraph (1)(B)”;

and

(11) by striking “‘subsection (e)” and
mserting “subsection (¢)”;
(5) in subsection (c), by striking “57 percent”
and inserting “57.42 percent’;
(6) in subsection (d), by striking “So much of

any sum not allocated” and inserting “Kaxcept as oth-

*S 834 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N -

[\© TN NG I N TR NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO I e

12
erwise provided in this section, so much of any sum
not allocated”; and

(7) in subsection (e)—

(A4) wn paragraph (1), by striking “those
subsections” and inserting “those paragraphs’;
(B) by amending paragraph (2) to read as

Jollows:

“(2) MAxXiMuM AMOUNT.—For fiscal year 2016,
the Secretary of the Interior may use not more than
$1,200,000 in accordance with paragraph (1). For
each fiscal year thereafter, the maxvmum amount that
the Secretary of the Interior may use in accordance
with paragraph (1) shall be determined under para-
graph (3).”; and

(C) by adding at the end the following:

“(3) ANNUAL ADJUSTED MAXIMUM AMOUNT.—
The maximum amount referred to wn paragraph (2)
Jor fiscal year 2016 and each fiscal year thereafter
shall be the sum of—

“(A) the available maximum amount for the
preceding fiscal year; and
“(B) the amount determined by multi-
plying—
“(1) the available maximum amount

Jor the preceding fiscal year; and

*S 834 RS



O o0 N N D Bk W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W = O O 0 N RN = O

13
“(11) the change, relative to the pre-
ceding fiscal year, in the Conswmer Price
Index for All Urban Conswmers published
by the Department of Labor.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 9 of the Din-
gell-Johnson Sport Fish Restoration Act (16 U.S.C. 777h)
18 amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking “section 4(b)”
and inserting “section 4(b)(1)(B)”; and
(2) an subsection (b)(1), by striking “section

4(b)” and inserting “section 4(b)(1)(B)”.

SEC. 4. EXTENSION OF EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON
TRANSFERS TO FUND.

Section 9504(d)(2) of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986 1s amended by striking “June 1, 2015,” and inserting
“October 1, 2023,”.

SEC. 5. RECREATIONAL BOATING SAFETY ALLOCATIONS.

Section 13104 of title 46, United States Code, 1is
amended by striking subsection (c).

SEC. 6. RECREATIONAL BOATING SAFETY.

Section 13107 of title 46, United States Code, 1is

amended—

(1) wn subsection (a)—

*S 834 RS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 0 N O W BN~ WD = ©

14

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking “(1) Sub-
ject to paragraph (2) and subsection (c¢),” and
mserting “Subject to subsection (¢),”; and

(B) by striking paragraph (2); and
(2) in subsection (c)(1), by striking “title,” and

all that follows through the end and inserting “title—

“(A) including the funding of the National
Boating Safety Aduvisory Council established
under section 13110 of thas title and the author-
1zed activities of the Council, including travel for
the council; and

“(B) of the funds referred to in paragraph
(1), not less than $2,500,000 shall be available to
the Secretary only to ensure compliance with
chapter 43 of this title.”.

SEC. 7. NATIONAL BOATING SAFETY ADVISORY COUNCIL.

Section 13110(e) of title 46, United States Code, 1s

amended by striking 20207 and inserting “2023”.
SEC. 8. PLAN EVALUATION.

Section 303(b)(7) of the Coastal Wetlands Planning,
Protection and Restoration Act (16 U.S.C. 3952(b)(7)) 1is
amended by inserting “and tmprovements made to the qual-
vty of fish and wildlife habitat conditions™ after “enhancing

coastal wetlands” .

*S 834 RS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR N© T NS R NG T NG I N R NS R S e e T e e e T e T T
AN U A WD = O O XN NN BN WD = O

15
SEC. 9. REPORT TO CONGRESS.

The Director of the United States Fish and Wildlife
Service shall annually evaluate and report on the adminis-
trative services of such Service for the trust fund to the
States and the sportfishing community, including the fol-
lowing categories of information:

(1) The percent of grant actions completed with-
m 45 days of receipt, average number of days to proc-
ess new grants, and average number of days to proc-
ess grant amendments.

(2) Which wildlife and sport fish restoration
policies are currently being updated, the start time
Jor each update, and the anticipated completion time.

(3) The number of Federal assistance workshops
held with States and such Service in efforts to com-
municate fiscal policies and procedures with the State
agencies.

(4) The response time to States based on initial
notification or assistance requests initiated by a
State.

(5) The number of States with unresolved rec-
onciliation of land records and number of corrective
action plans with open actions.

(6) The number of employees of such Service
with grants management training and outstanding
training requirements and the percent of State fish

*S 834 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

—_—
o = O

16
and wildlife staff to have recewed training from
Wildlife and Sport Fish Restoration Fund Program
of such Service.

(7) The number of full-tvme equivalents contrib-
uting to grant processing and related grant manage-
ment in each region.

(8) The number of in-field state project reviews
and site visits by the Wildlife and Sport Fish Res-
toration Fund Program.

(9) The number of audits per year originating

Sfrom such Service and response time to related ac-

trons and correspondence.

*S 834 RS






Calendar No. 162

11410 CONGRESS
1ST SESSION mo mwh

[Report No. 114-91]

A BILL

To amend the law relating to sport fish restoration
and recreational boating safety, and for other
purposes.

JuLny 23, 2015

Reported with an amendment




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-06T02:07:49-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




