AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1141H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 49 1

M.

To provide sensible relief to community financial institutions, to protect

consumers, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JUNE 3, 2015
BrowN (for himself, Mr. REED, Mr. SconuMER, Mr. MENENDEZ, Mr.
TESTER, Mr. WARNER, Mr. MERKLEY, Ms. WARREN, Ms. HEITKAMP,
and Mr. DONNELLY) introduced the following bill; which was read twice
and referred to the Committee on Banking, Housing, and Urban Affairs

A BILL

To provide sensible relief to community financial institutions,

0 N N B~ W

to protect consumers, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TrrLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“Community Lender Regulatory Relief and Consumer
Protection Act of 2015,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

this Act 1s as follows:
Sec. 1. Short title; table of contents.

TITLE I—HELPING COMMUNITY LENDERS



S O 0 N9 N B WD -

[ e S S N T T S
~N N kA WD =

See.
See.

See.
See.

See.
See.

See.
See.
See.

101.
102.

103.
104.

105.
106.

201.
202.
203.

2

Community bank and eredit union portfolio lending.

Exception to annual written privacy notice requirement under the
Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act.

Expansion of threshold for 18-month on-site examination cycle.

Privately insured credit unions authorized to become members of a
Federal home loan bank.

Registration threshold for savings and loan holding companies.

Transitional license authority.

TITLE II—PROTECTING CONSUMERS

Protecting servicemembers.

Restoration of the Protecting Tenants at Foreclosure Act of 2009.

Confidentiality of information shared between State and Federal fi-
nancial services regulators.

TITLE I—HELPING COMMUNITY

LENDERS

SEC. 101. COMMUNITY BANK AND CREDIT UNION PORT-

FOLIO LENDING.

Section 129C(b)(2) of the Truth in Lending Act (15

U.S.C. 1639¢(b)(2)) is amended by adding at the end the

following:

“(F') SAFE HARBOR.—
“(1) IN GENERAL.—In this section—
“(I) the term ‘qualified mort-
cage’, as defined in subparagraph (A),
includes any residential morteage
loan—
“(aa) that is originated by a
covered institution and continu-
ously retained in portfolio by the

covered institution;

oS 1491 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

“(bb) that, except as pro-
vided in subparagraph (E), fully
amortizes over a term of not
longer than 30 years;

“(cc) that complies with—

“(AA) the requirements

of clauses (i), (i1), (iii), (iv),

(v), and (vii) of subpara-

oraph (A); and

“(BB) any require-
ments consistent with the
purposes desceribed in para-

araph (3)(B)(0);

“(dd) for which the covered
institution, at or before con-
summation of the residential
mortegage loan, takes into ac-
count and verifies the monthly
debt and income of the consumer;
and

“(ee) that 1s not considered
a high-cost mortgage; and

“(IT) a residential mortgage loan

that meets the requirements of sub-

clause (I) shall be deemed to meet the



O o0 N N D Bk W=

O TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
L R W NN = DO VO XN R WD~ O

oS 1491 IS

4

requirements of subsection (a) until

the residential mortegage loan no

longer meets the requirements of sub-

clause (I).

“(11) DEFINITION.—In this subpara-
oraph, the term ‘covered institution’
means—

“(I) an insured depository insti-
tution or insured credit union that—
“(aa) at the time of origina-
tion of the residential mortgage
loan, together with its affiliates,
has less than $2,000,000,000 in
total consolidated assets; and
“(bb) during the calendar
year preceding the time of origi-
nation of the residential mort-
cage loan, originated not more
than 2,000 residential mortgage
loans that were—

“(AA) sold, assigned, or
otherwise transferred to an-
other person; or

“(BB) subject to, at

the time of consummation, a



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

oS 1491 IS

()}

commitment to be acquired
by another person; or

“(IT) an insured depository insti-

tution or insured credit union that, at
the time of origination of the residen-

tial mortgage loan—

“(aa) together with its affili-
ates, has more than
$2,000,000,000 and less than
$10,000,000,000 in total consoli-
dated assets;

“(bb) 1s not considered a
specialty bank, such as a bank
that offers only a narrow product
line (including credit card or
motor vehicle loans) to a regional
or broader market;

“(ce) engages in the basic
activities of lending and deposit
taking as a significant percentage
of total assets;

“(dd) has a limited geo-
oraphic scope; and

“(ee) meets any other cri-

teria as determined by the Bu-



O o0 N N W BB W

e e = S T
whnm A~ W D = O

16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

6

reau, including restrictions on
the volume of residential mort-
oage loans—

“(AA) sold, assigned, or
otherwise transferred to an-
other person; or

“(BB) subject to, at
the time of consummation, a
commitment to be acquired
by another person.”.

SEC. 102. EXCEPTION TO ANNUAL WRITTEN PRIVACY NO-
TICE REQUIREMENT UNDER THE GRAMM-
LEACH-BLILEY ACT.

Section 503 of the Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act (15
U.S.C. 6803) is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(f) EXCEPTION TO ANNUAL WRITTEN NOTICE RE-
QUIREMENT.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—A financial institution de-
seribed in paragraph (2) shall not be required to
provide an annual written disclosure under this sec-
tion until such time as the financial institution fails
to comply with subparagraph (A), (B), or (C) of

paragraph (2).

oS 1491 IS



7

“(2) COVERED INSTITUTIONS.—A financial in-

stitution described in this paragraph is a financial

mstitution that—

“(A) provides nonpubli¢ personal informa-
tion only in accordance with the provisions of
subsection (b)(2) or (e) of section 502 or regu-
lations prescribed under section 504(b);

“(B) has not changed its policies and prac-
tices with respect to disclosing nonpublic per-
sonal information from the policies and prac-
tices that were disclosed in the most recent dis-
closure sent to consumers in accordance with
this section; and

“(C) otherwise provides customers access
to such most recent disclosure in electronic or
other form permitted by regulations preseribed

under section 504.”.

SEC. 103. EXPANSION OF THRESHOLD FOR 18-MONTH ON-

SITE EXAMINATION CYCLE.

Section 10(d) of the Federal Deposit Insurance Act

(12 U.S.C. 1820(d)) 1s amended—

(1) in paragraph (4)(A), by striking

“$500,000,000” and inserting “$1,000,000,000";

oS 1491 IS



8

(2) in  paragraph  (10), by striking

“$500,000,000” and inserting “$1,000,000,000".
SEC. 104. PRIVATELY INSURED CREDIT UNIONS AUTHOR-
IZED TO BECOME MEMBERS OF A FEDERAL

HOME LOAN BANK.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 4(a) of the Federal Home
Loan Bank Act (12 U.S.C. 1424(a)) is amended by adding

at the end the following:

“(5) CERTAIN PRIVATELY INSURED CREDIT

UNIONS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Subject to the re-
quirements of subparagraph (B), a credit union
that lacks insurance of its member accounts
under Federal law shall be treated as an in-
sured depository institution for purposes of this
Act.

“(B) CERTIFICATION BY APPROPRIATE
STATE SUPERVISOR.—For purposes of this
paragraph, a credit union that lacks insurance
of its member accounts under Federal law and
that has applied for membership in a Federal
home loan bank shall be treated as an insured
depository institution if the following has oc-

curred:

oS 1491 IS



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R e T e T e T e e T
A W N = O VWV 00O N O W B WD == ©

oS 1491 IS

9

“(1) DETERMINATION BY STATE SU-

PERVISOR OF THE CREDIT UNION.—

“(I) IN GENERAL.—Subject to
subclause (II), the appropriate super-
visor of the State in which the credit
union 1s chartered has determined
that the credit union meets all the eli-
eibility requirements under section
201(a) of the Federal Credit Union
Act (12 U.S.C. 1781(a)) to apply for
insurance of its member accounts as
of the date of the application for
membership.

“(II)  CERTIFICATION DEEMED
VALID.—In the case of any credit
union to which subclause (I) applies,
if the appropriate supervisor of the
State in which such credit union is
chartered fails to make the determina-
tion required pursuant to such sub-
clause by the end of the 12-month pe-
riod beginning on the date on which
the application is submitted to the su-

pervisor, the credit union shall be



O o0 N N BB W =

O TN NG TN N T NG N NG I NG R N e T e e T e T e e
[ T NG O N N e = N R < BN B o) W ) TR~ O TR NO S e

oS 1491 IS

10

deemed to have met the requirements

of subclause (I).

“(i1) DETERMINATION BY STATE SU-
PERVISOR OF TIIE PRIVATE DEPOSIT IN-
SURER.—The licensing entity of the pri-
vate deposit insurer that is insuring the
member accounts of the credit union—

“(I) receives, on an annual basis,
an independent actuarial opinion that
the private insurer has set aside suffi-
cient reserves for losses; and

“(II) obtains, as frequently as
appropriate, but not less frequently
than every 36 months, an independent
actuary’s study of the capital ade-
quacy of the private insurer.

“(i11) SUBMISSION OF FINANCIAL IN-
FORMATION.—The credit union or the ap-
propriate supervisor of the State in which
such credit union is chartered makes avail-
able, and continues to make available for
such time as the credit union is a member
of a Federal home loan bank, to the Fed-
eral Housing Finance Agency or to the

Federal home loan bank all reports,



O© o0 3 O WD B W N -

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A LW N = O VWV o0 N O B BN~ WD = O

11

records, and other information related to

any examinations or inquiries performed

by the supervisor concerning the financial
condition of the credit union, as soon as is
practicable.

“(C) SECURITY INTERESTS OF FEDERAL
HOME LOAN BANK NOT AVOIDABLE.—Notwith-
standing any provision of State law authorizing
a conservator or liquidating agent of a credit
union to repudiate contracts, no such provision
shall apply with respect to—

“(1) any extension of credit from any

Federal home loan bank to any credit

union that is a member of any such bank

pursuant to this paragraph; or

“(11) any security interest in the as-
sets of such a credit union securing any
such extension of credit.

“(D) PROTECTION FOR CERTAIN FEDERAL

HOME LOAN BANK  ADVANCES.—Notwith-
standing any State law to the contrary, if a
Bank makes an advance under section 10 to a

State-chartered credit union that is not feder-

ally insured—

oS 1491 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
L A W NN = DO O X NN R WD = O

12

“(i) the Bank’s interest in any collat-
eral securing the advance has the same
priority and is afforded the same standing
and rights that the security interest would
have had if the advance had been made to
a federally insured credit union; and

“(i1) the Bank has the same right to
access such collateral that the Bank would
have had if the advance had been made to

a federally insured credit union.”.

(b) COPIES OF AUDITS OF PRIVATE INSURERS OF

CERTAIN DEPOSITORY INSTITUTIONS REQUIRED TO BE

PROVIDED

TO  SUPERVISORY  AGENCIES.—Section

43(a)(2)(A) of the Federal Deposit Insurance Act (12
U.S.C. 1831t(a)(2)(A)) 1s amended—

(1) in clause (i), by striking

“;and” and insert-

ing a semicolon;

(2) in clause (ii), by striking the period at the

end and inserting ‘‘; and”; and

oS 1491 IS

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(i11) in the case of depository institu-
tions described in subsection (e)(2)(A), the
member accounts of which are insured by
the private deposit insurer, which are

members of a Federal home loan bank, to



13

| the Federal Housing Finance Agency, not
2 later than 7 days after the audit is com-
3 pleted.”.

4 (¢) GAO REPORT.—Not later than 18 months after
5 the date of enactment of this Act, the Comptroller General
6 of the United States shall conduct a study and submit a
7 report to Congress—

8 (1) on the adequacy of insurance reserves held
9 by a private deposit insurer that insures the member

10 accounts of an entity deseribed 1n section
11 43(e)(2)(A) of the Federal Deposit Insurance Act
12 (12 U.S.C. 1831t(e)(2)(A)); and

13 (2) for an entity described in paragraph (1),
14 the member accounts of which are insured by a pri-
15 vate deposit insurer, information on the level of com-
16 pliance with Federal regulations relating to the dis-
17 closure of a lack of Federal deposit insurance.

18 SEC. 105. REGISTRATION THRESHOLD FOR SAVINGS AND
19 LOAN HOLDING COMPANIES.

20 The Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78a

21 et seq.) is amended—

22 (1) in section 12(g)—

23 (A) in paragraph (1)(B), by inserting after
24 “is a bank” the following: ““, a savings and loan
25 holding company (as such term is defined in

oS 1491 IS



14

1 section 10 of the Home Owners’ Lioan Act (12
2 U.S.C. 1467a(a))),”; and

3 (B) in paragraph (4), by inserting after
4 “case of a bank” the following: ““, a savings and
5 loan holding company (as such term is defined
6 in section 10 of the Home Owners’ Loan Act
7 (12 U.S.C. 1467a(a))),”; and

8 (2) in section 15(d)(1), by striking “case of
9 bank” and inserting the following: “case of a bank,
10 a savings and loan holding company (as such term
11 is defined in section 10 of the Home Owners’ Lioan
12 Act (12 U.S.C. 1467a(a))),”.

13 SEC. 106. TRANSITIONAL LICENSE AUTHORITY.

14 Section 1504 of the S.A.F.E. Mortgage Licensing Act
15 of 2008 (12 U.S.C. 5103) 1s amended—

16 (1) in subsection (a), by inserting after “as the
17 case may be,” the following: “and except as provided
18 in subsection (¢),”; and

19 (2) by adding at the end the following:

20 “(¢) TRANSITIONAL AUTHORITY.—

21 “(1) DEFINITION.—In this subsection, the term
22 ‘covered registered loan originator’ means a reg-
23 istered loan originator who—

24 “(A) submits the information required
25 under section 1505(a); and

oS 1491 IS



15

| “(B) during the 30-day period preceding
2 the date of such submission, met the standard
3 of being qualified under section 129B(b)(1)(A)
4 of the Truth in Lending Act (15 U.S.C.
5 1639b(b)(1)(A)).

6 “(2) Avurnoorrry.—Notwithstanding the re-
7 quirements of subsections (b) through (e) of section
8 1505, a State may permit a covered registered loan
9 originator to act as a loan originator, under the su-
10 pervision of a non-depository firm that engages in
11 loan origination in that State, for the 120-day pe-
12 riod beginning on the date on which the covered reg-
13 istered loan originator submits the information re-
14 quired under section 1505(a).

15 “(3) LIMITATION.—A covered registered loan
16 originator may not act as a loan originator under
17 paragraph (2) after the date on which the 120-day
18 period described in that paragraph expires.”.

19 TITLE II—PROTECTING
20 CONSUMERS
21 SEC. 201. PROTECTING SERVICEMEMBERS.
22 Section 1002(12) of the Consumer Financial Protec-

23 tion Act of 2010 (12 U.S.C. 5481(12)) is amended—
24 (1) in subparagraph (Q), by striking *; and”

25 and inserting a semicolon;

oS 1491 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O T \© R (O R R e e e e e e e T
DN = O 00N N R WD = O

16
(2) in subparagraph (R), by striking the period
at the end and inserting ““; and”’; and
(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(S) sections 101, 107 (except with respect
to bailments), 108 (except with respect to in-
surance), 201 (except with respect to child cus-
tody proceedings), 207, 301, 302, 303, 305,
and 305A of the Servicemembers Civil Relief
Act (50 U.S.C. App. 511, 517, 518, 521, 527,
531, 532, 533, 535, and 535a).”.

SEC. 202. RESTORATION OF THE PROTECTING TENANTS AT
FORECLOSURE ACT OF 2009.

(a) REPEAL OF SUNSET PROVISION.—Section 704 of
the Protecting Tenants at Foreclosure Act of 2009 (12
U.S.C. 5201 note; 12 U.S.C. 5220 note; 42 U.S.C. 1437f
note) is repealed.

(b) RESTORATION.—Sections 701 through 703 of
such Act, the provisions of law amended or repealed by
such sections, and any regulations promulgated pursuant
to such sections, as were in effect on December 31, 2014,
are restored and revived as if the sunset provision in sec-

tion 704 had not taken effect.

oS 1491 IS



17
1 SEC. 203. CONFIDENTIALITY OF INFORMATION SHARED BE-

TWEEN STATE AND FEDERAL FINANCIAL

SERVICES REGULATORS.

2
3
4 Section 1512(a) of the S.A.F.E. Mortgage Licensing
5 Act of 2008 (12 U.S.C. 5111(a)) is amended by inserting
6

“or financial services” before “industry”’.

O

oS 1491 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-06T04:16:49-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




