AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1141H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 340

To amend the Mineral Leasing Act to improve coal leasing, and for other
purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

May 14, 2015
Mr. MARKEY introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Energy and Natural Resources

A BILL

To amend the Mineral Leasing Act to improve coal leasing,
and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the
“Coal Oversight and Leasing Reform Act of 2015” or the
“COAL Reform Act of 2015”.

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents of

o N N e B W

this Act is as follows:

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Short title; table of contents.
Deferred bonus payments.

DN —

Confidentiality requirements for consultants.
Exploration data.

ANl

Fair market value.



O o0 9 N U B WD =

—
N = O

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

Sec. 6. Publie availability data.

See. 7. Lease modifications.

See. 8

See. 9. Size of coal leasing modifications.
See. 10. Coal leasing program.

See. 11. Rental rates.

See. 12. Primary term of lease.

. Findings necessary for coal lease modifications.

See. 13. Minimum value.

See. 14. Inspection and enforcement.

See. 15. Civil penalties.

See. 16. Moratorium on new coal lease sales pending implementation.
SEC. 2. DEFERRED BONUS PAYMENTS.

Section 2(a) of the Mineral Leasing Act (30 U.S.C.
201(a)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking the second
and third sentences; and

(2) by striking paragraphs (4) and (5).

SEC. 3. CONFIDENTIALITY REQUIREMENTS FOR CONSULT-
ANTS.

Section 2(a) of the Mineral Leasing Act (30 U.S.C.
201(a)) (as amended by section 2(2)) is amended by add-
ing at the end the following:—

“(4) CONFIDENTIALITY REQUIREMENTS FOR
CONSULTANTS.—If the Secretary uses an inde-
pendent consultant in evaluating a lease sale, the
independent consultant shall be subject to a non-
disclosure agreement and any other confidentiality
requirements the Secretary determines necessary.”.

SEC. 4. EXPLORATION DATA.

Section 2(b)(3) of the Mineral Leasing Act (30

U.S.C. 202(b)(3)) is amended by adding at the end the

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

| \O JEE \© R \O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

3
following: ““Subject to applicable penalties for submitting
false data, the licensee shall certify the accuracy of the
data submitted under this paragraph. The Secretary shall
consider whether to independently verify the data sub-
mitted under this paragraph. The Secretary shall conduct
and document any inspections of exploration activities
conducted under this section.”.
SEC. 5. FAIR MARKET VALUE.

Section 2 of the Mineral Leasing Act is amended by
inserting after subsection (d) (30 U.S.C. 202a) the fol-
lowing:

“(e) FAIR MARKET VALUE.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—A proposed lease sale shall
not be held under this section until the date on
which the Secretary of the Interior (acting through
the Director of the Bureau of Liand Management)
(referred to in this subsection as the ‘Secretary’), in
consultation with the applicable Bureau of Land
Management field office with jurisdiction over the
leasing tract subject to the proposed lease sale and
the Office of Valuation Services of the Department
of Interior, makes a determination with respect to
the fair market value of the coal to be extracted

under the proposed lease.

*S 1340 IS



O© 00 3 O WD b W N -

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 N O B BN~ WD = O

4

“(2) CONSIDERATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS.—

In making a determination of fair market value

under paragraph (1), the Secretary—

*S 1340 IS

“(A)(1) shall account for the export poten-
tial of the coal to be extracted under the pro-
posed lease, including—

“(I) eonducting an analysis of wheth-
er the coal extracted under the proposed
lease would be exported, the potential ex-
port markets for the coal, and the price at
which the coal could be sold in export mar-
kets; and

“(IT) providing in the appraisal report
under paragraph (4) an assessment of ex-
port activity for coal extracted from other
leases under this section; and
“() for purposes of the analysis under

clause (1)(I) and the assessment under clause
(1)(II), may consult with other agencies with
relevant expertise relating to coal exports, such
as the Energy Information Administration;

“(B) shall use a comparable lease sale ap-
proach and income approach for purposes of

calculating fair market value;



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N N N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

5}

“(C) shall not rely on any information
from lease sales conducted more than 5 years
before the date of the proposed lease sale for
purposes of calculating fair market value; and

“(D) shall consider domestic coal reserve
estimates.

“(3) APPRAISAL REPORT.—The Secretary shall
include a fair market value determination with re-
spect to a lease under paragraph (1) in a formal,
documented  appraisal  report that  provides
verification of the consultation required under that
paragraph by including the signatures of the individ-
uals representing the offices consulted under that
paragraph in the completed appraisal report.

“(4) GAO REPORT.—Not later than 2 years
after the date of enactment of this subsection, the
Jomptroller General of the United States shall sub-
mit to the appropriate committees of Congress a re-
port that describes whether the Secretary has com-
plied with the requirements of paragraph (2)(A) in
making fair market value determinations of leases
under this subsection.

“(5) MINIMUM BIDS.

Notwithstanding any
other provision of this Aect, the Secretary may not

accept a bid for a lease to extract coal under this

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N BB W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NG R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~SU O TR NO R e

6

Act that is less than the fair market value of the
coal to be extracted under the lease, even if a bid
is above the minimum bid requirement.”.

SEC. 6. PUBLIC AVAILABILITY OF DATA.

Section 2 of the Mineral Leasing Act (as amended
by section 5) is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(f) PUBLIC AVAILABILITY OF APPRAISAL RE-
PORTS.—Any appraisal report conducted under this sec-
tion shall be made publicly available on the website of the
Bureau of Liand Management, with appropriate redactions
of or protections for confidential material or information.

“(g) PUBLIC AVAILABILITY OF LEASE SALES, HIGmn
Bips, RoyaALTy PAYMENTS, AND REVENUE.—The Sec-
retary shall track and make publicly available on the
website of the Bureau of Land Management information
on individual and total lease sales, high bids, royalty pay-
ments, and revenue relating to activities conducted under
this section.”.

SEC. 7. LEASE MODIFICATIONS.

Section 3(a)(1) of the Mineral Leasing Act (30
U.S.C. 203(a)(1)) is amended by inserting “and on com-
pletion of a fair market value determination under sub-
section (e)(1) with respect to the modifications” after

“under paragraph (2)”.

*S 1340 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[ S N S = =Y
A W oo = O

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

7
SEC. 8. FINDINGS NECESSARY FOR COAL LEASE MODIFICA-

TIONS.

Section 3(a)(2) of the Mineral Leasing Act (30
U.S.C. 203(a)(2)) 1s amended—

(1) in subparagraph (B), by striking “and”
after the semicolon at the end;

(2) in subparagraph (C), by striking the period
at the end and inserting ““; and”’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(D) would not result in a reduction of rev-
enue.”’.

SEC. 9. SIZE OF COAL LEASING MODIFICATIONS.

Section 3(a)(3)(A) of the Mineral Leasing Act (30
U.S.C. 203(a)(3)(A)) is amended by striking “960 acres”
and inserting ‘160 acres”.

SEC. 10. COAL LEASING PROGRAM.

The Mineral Leasing Act is amended by inserting
after section 3 (30 U.S.C. 203) the following:
“SEC. 4. COAL LEASING PROGRAM.

“(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall prepare, pe-
riodically revise, and maintain a coal leasing program to
implement this Act.

“(b) CONTENT.—The leasing program shall consist
of a schedule of proposed lease sales indicating, as pre-
cisely as practicable, the size, timing, and location of leas-
ing activity that the Secretary determines will best meet

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N e = N Re - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

8

national needs for the 5-year period following the approval

or reapproval of the program.

“(e¢) PrRINCIPLES.—The leasing program shall be pre-

pared and maintained in a manner consistent with the fol-

lowing prineiples:

“(1) Leasing activities for coal subject to this
Act shall be conducted—

“(A) to ensure receipt of fair market value
for the land leased and the rights conveyed by
the Federal Government;

“(B) to maximize competition for Federal
coal leases; and

“(C) to maximize the financial return per
ton of coal leased for taxpayers of the United
States.

“(2) Management of coal subject to this Act
shall be conducted in a manner that considers—

“(A) the economic, social, and environ-
mental values of Federal land and the coal re-
source; and

“(B) the potential impact of coal leasing
on other resource values and the natural and
human environments.

“(3) Timing and location of exploration, devel-

opment, and production of coal among or within the

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

9

coal-bearing physiographic regions shall be based on

a consideration of—

“(A) existing information concerning the
ogeographical, geological, and ecological charac-
eristics of the regions;
teristics of the regions;

“(B) an equitable sharing of developmental
benefits and environmental risks among or
within the various regions;

“(C) the location of the regions with re-
spect to, and the relative needs of, regional and
national energy markets;

“(D) the location of the regions with re-
spect to other anticipated uses of the resources
and space of the regions;

“(E) the interest of potential coal pro-
ducers in the development of coal resources as
indicated by exploration or nomination;

“(F) laws, goals, and policies of affected
States that have been specifically identified by
the Governors of the States as relevant matters
for the consideration of the Secretary;

“(G) the relative environmental sensitivity
and natural productivity of different areas con-

taining the coal; and

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O I \© R NS R \O N O N N e e e e e T e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

10

“(H) relevant environmental and predictive
information for the different areas.

“(4) The Secretary shall select the timing and
location of leasing, to the maximum extent prac-
ticable, so as to obtain a proper balance between—

“(A) the potential for environmental dam-
age;

“(B) the potential for the discovery of coal;
and

“(C) the potential for adverse impact on
areas containing the coal.

“(5) The Secretary shall develop the plan and
manage coal leasing and development in a manner
that considers the impact of coal leasing and devel-
opment on climate change.

“(d) ESTIMATED APPROPRIATIONS AND STAFF.—
The leasing program shall include estimates of the appro-
priations and staff required—

“(1) to obtain resource information and any
other information needed to prepare the leasing pro-
oram required by this section;

“(2) to analyze and interpret the exploratory
data and any other information that may be com-

piled under this Act;

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e T T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O N BN~ WD = O

11

“(3) to conduct environmental studies and pre-
pare any environmental impact statement required
in accordance with this Act and section 102(2)(C) of
the National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 (42
U.S.C. 4332(2)(C)); and

“(4) to supervise operations conducted pursuant
to each lease in the manner necessary to ensure due
diligence in the exploration and development of the
lease area and compliance with the requirement of
applicable laws (including regulations) and with the
terms of the lease.

“(e) PROPOSED LLEASING PROGRAM.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—During the preparation of
any proposed leasing program under this section, the
Secretary—

“(A) shall mvite and consider suggestions
for the program from—

“(1) any interested Federal agency, in-
cluding the Department of Justice, in con-
sultation with the Federal Trade Commis-
sion; and

“(i1) the Governor of any State that
may become an affected State under the

proposed program; and

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N B W

[\© TN NG I N TR NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N e = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO I e

12

“(B) may invite or consider any sugges-
tions from—

“(1) the executive of any affected local
covernment in an affected State, which
have been previously submitted to the Gov-
ernor of the State; and

“(11) any other person.

“(2) REVIEW AND COMMENTS BY AFFECTED
STATES.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—After preparation and
at least 60 days before publication of a pro-
posed leasing program in the Federal Register
pursuant to paragraph (3), the Secretary shall
submit a copy of the proposed program to the
Governor of each affected State for review and

comment.

“(B) LocAL GOVERNMENTS.—The Gov-
ernor of a State may solicit comments from the
executives of local governments in the State
that the Governor, at the discretion of the Gov-
ernor, determines will be affected by the pro-
posed program.

“(C) REPLY BY SECRETARY.—If any com-
ment by a Governor is received by the Secretary

at least 15 days before submission to Congress

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ JEE \© R O R \O B O B N e e e e e e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

13

pursuant to such paragraph (3) and includes a
request for any modification of the proposed
program, the Secretary shall reply in writing—
“(1)(I) granting or denying the re-
quest in whole or in part; or
“(IT) granting the request in such
modified form as the Secretary considers
appropriate; and
“(i1) stating the reasons for the ac-
tions of the Secretary.

“(D) CORRESPONDENCE.—AIl correspond-
ence between the Secretary and Governor of
any affected State under this paragraph, to-
gether with any additional information and data
relating to the correspondence, shall accompany
the proposed program when the proposed pro-
oram is submitted to Congress.

“(3) SUBMISSION AND PUBLICATION.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 270
days after the date of enactment of the COAL
Reform Act of 2015, the Secretary shall—

“(1) submit a proposed leasing pro-
eram to Congress, the Attorney General,

and the Governors of affected States; and

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N B W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG N NS R N e e T e e T e T e e
[ T NG U N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

14
“(11) publish the proposed program in
the Federal Register.

A Governor

“(B) LOCAL GOVERNMENTS.
shall, on request, submit a copy of the proposed
leasing program to the executive of any local
covernment affected by the proposed program.

“(f) ADMINISTRATION.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 90 days
after the date of publication of a proposed leasing
program, the Attorney General may, after consulta-
tion with the Federal Trade Commission, submit
comments on the anticipated effects of the proposed
program on competition.

“(2) OTHER COMMENTS.—Any State, local gov-

ernment, or other person may submit comments and
recommendations as to any aspect of the proposed
program.

“(3) RESPONSE BY SECRETARY.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—At least 60 days be-
fore approving a proposed leasing program, the
Secretary shall submit the proposed program to
the President and Congress, together with any
comments received.

“(B) RECOMMENDATIONS.—The submis-

sion shall indicate why any specific ree-

*S 1340 IS



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

|\ 2N \© R O B \O I N0 R T T e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

15
ommendation of the Attorney General or a

State or local government was not accepted.

“(4) NEW LEASES.
“(A) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in
subparagraph (B), after the leasing program
has been approved by the Secretary or the date
that is 18 months after the date of enactment
of the COAL Reform Act of 2015 (whichever
first occurs), no lease shall be issued under this
Act unless the lease—
“(1) 18 for an area included in the ap-
proved leasing program; and
“(11) contains provisions that are con-
sistent with the approved leasing program.
“(B) CONTINUED LEASING.—lieasing shall
be permitted to continue until the program is
approved and while the program is under judi-
cial or administrative review pursuant to this
Act.
“(2) REVIEW AND REVISION.—
“(1) REVIEW.—The Secretary shall review the
leasing program approved under this section at least
once each year.

“(2) REVISIONS.

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

| \O JE O R O R O IR O I T S S S i e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

“(h) PROCEDURES.

16

“(A) IN GENERAL.

The Secretary may re-
vise and reapprove the leasing program at any
time.

“(B) PROCEDURE.—The Secretary shall
revise and reapprove the leasing program in the
same manner at the original plan unless the re-
vision is not significant, as determined by the

Secretary.

“(1) INn GENERAL.—The Secretary shall, by

regulation, establish procedures for—

“(A) receipt and consideration of nomina-
tions for any area to be offered for lease or to
be excluded from leasing;

“(B) public notice of and participation in
development of the leasing program;

“(C) review by State and local govern-
ments that may be impacted by the proposed
leasing; and

“(D) periodic consultation with State and
local governments, coal lessees and permittees,
and representatives of other individuals or orga-
nizations engaged in activity in areas covered

by leases.

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O 2N \© R O R \O B O R N e e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

17

“(2) REVISIONS.

The procedures shall be ap-
plicable to any significant revision or reapproval of
the leasing program.
“(1) INFORMATION REQUESTED BY SECRETARY.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary may obtain
from public sources, or purchase from private
sources, any survey, data, report, or other informa-
tion (including interpretations of such data, survey,
report, or other information) that may be necessary
to assist the Secretary in preparing any environ-
mental impact statement and in making other eval-
uations required by this Act.

“(2) CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Data of a classified
nature provided to the Secretary under this
subsection shall remain confidential for such pe-
riod of time as agreed to by the head of the de-
partment or agency from whom the information
1s requested.

“(B) PERIOD.—The Secretary shall main-
tain the confidentiality of all privileged or pro-
prietary data or information for such period of
time as 1s provided for in this Act, established

by regulation, or agreed to by the parties.

*S 1340 IS



18

1 “() INFORMATION PROVIDED BY OTHER FEDERAL
2 AGENCIES.

3 “(1) IN GENERAL.—The head of a Federal de-
4 partment or agency

5 “(A) shall provide the Secretary with any
6 nonprivileged or nonproprietary information the
7 Secretary requests to assist the Secretary in
8 preparing the leasing program; and

9 “(B) may provide the Secretary with any
10 privileged or proprietary information the Sec-
11 retary requests to assist the Secretary in pre-
12 paring the leasing program.

13 “(2) CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION.—Privileged
14 or proprietary information provided to the Secretary
15 under this subsection shall remain confidential for
16 such period of time as agreed to by the head of the
17 department or agency from whom the information is
18 requested.

19 “(3) EXISTING RESOURCES.—In carrying out
20 this subsection, the Secretary may use the existing
21 capabilities and resources of a Federal department
22 or agency by appropriate agreement.
23 “(k) REGULATIONS.—Not later than 180 days after

24 the date of enactment of the COAL Reform Act of 2015,

25 the Secretary shall issue such regulations as are necessary

*S 1340 IS



19

I to carry out this section, including regulations that (to the

2 maximum extent practicable)—

3

4
5
6
7

“(1) minimize discretion by State offices of the
Department of the Interior in conducting lease sales;
and

“(2) maximize the financial return for tax-

payers of the United States.”.

8 SEC. 11. RENTAL RATES.

9

Section 7(a) of the Mineral Leasing Act (30 U.S.C.

10 207) is amended in the third sentence by inserting “at

11 a rental rate of not less than $100 per acre (as reviewed

12 and, if appropriate, adjusted by the Secretary every 5

13 years)” before the period at the end.

14 SEC. 12. PRIMARY TERM OF LEASE.

15

Section 7 of the Mineral Leasing Act (30 U.S.C. 207)

16 1s amended—

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

(1) in subsection (a)—

(A) in the first sentence, by striking
“twenty”” and inserting “107;

(B) in the second sentence, by striking
“ten”” and inserting “5”’; and

(C) 1n the sixth sentence—

(1) by striking “twenty” and inserting

“10”; and

*S 1340 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

20
(i) by striking “ten” and inserting
“5”; and
(2) in subsection (b)(5), by striking “20” and

inserting “10”.

SEC. 13. MINIMUM VALUE.

The Mineral Leasing Act (30 U.S.C. 181 et seq.) is

amended—

(1) 1 sections 7(a) and 14 (30 U.S.C. 207(a),
223), by striking “12%2 per centum” each place it
appears and inserting “18.75 percent’’;

(2) in section 17 (30 U.S.C. 226)—

(A) 1n subsection (b)—

(1) in paragraph (1)(A), in the fifth
sentence, by striking “12.5 percent” and
inserting “18.75 percent’”’; and

(11) in paragraph (2)(A)(1)—

(I) by striking “12% per cen-
tum” and inserting “18.75 percent’’;
and

(IT) by striking “(k)(1)(e¢)” and
inserting “(k)(1)(C)";

(B) in subsection (¢)(1), in the second sen-
tence, by striking “12.5 percent” and inserting

“18.75 percent”’; and

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W kA WO =

| \O I \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

21
(C) in subsections (I) and (n)(1)(C), by
striking “12%% per centum’” each place it ap-
pears and inserting “18.75 percent’’;
(3) in section 18 (41 Stat. 443), by striking
“1274 per centum” and inserting “18.75 percent’’;
and
(4) in sections 19, 20, and 31(f)(4) (30 U.S.C.
228, 229, 188(f)(4)), by striking “127% per centum”
each place it appears and inserting “18.75 percent”.
SEC. 14. INSPECTION AND ENFORCEMENT.

Section 41 of the Mineral Leasing Act (30 U.S.C.
195) is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(2) INSPECTION AND ENFORCEMENT.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Director of the Bureau
of Land Management shall promulgate regulations
for inspections and enforcement of coal operations
carried out under this Act to ensure consistent and
effective inspections and enforcement.

“(2) INCLUSIONS.

The regulations promul-
cated pursuant to paragraph (1) shall—

“(A) provide for oversight of State inspec-

tion and enforcement programs for coal oper-

ations by the Washington, District of Columbia

office of the Bureau of Land Management;

*S 1340 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG O N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO R e

22

“(B) standardize inspection and enforce-
ment practices for all State offices of the Bu-
reau of Land Management;

“(C) require documentation of inspection
and enforcement activities and the recordation
of all inspection results in a central database;
and

“(D) require periodic unannounced inspec-

tions.” .

SEC. 15. CIVIL PENALTIES.

Section 41 of the Mineral Leasing Act (30 U.S.C.

195) (as amended by section 14) is amended by adding

at the end the following:

“(h) BLM AvutHority To Assgss CiviL PEN-

ALTIES.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Director of the Bureau
of Land Management may include in a notice of
noncompliance issued to a person subject to the re-
quirements of this Act an assessment of a civil pen-
alty in accordance with paragraph (2).

“(2) MAXIMUM AMOUNT.—Subject to para-
eraph (3), a penalty assessed pursuant to paragraph
(1) shall not exceed $100,000 per incident per day.

“(3) ADJUSTMENT.—The Secretary may in-

crease the maximum amount described in paragraph

*S 1340 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10

23

(2) after notice and opportunity for public com-

ment.”’.

SEC. 16. MORATORIUM ON NEW COAL LEASE SALES PEND-
ING IMPLEMENTATION.

Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the Sec-
retary of the Interior shall not conduct a new lease sale,
or enter into a new lease, for coal subject to the Mineral
Leasing Act (30 U.S.C. 181 et seq.) until the Secretary
certifies to Congress that this Act and the amendments

made by this Act have been implemented.

O

*S 1340 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-06T05:50:34-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




