AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1141H CONGRESS
naeE H, R, 1886

To amend section 1341 of the Patient Protection and Affordable Care Act
to repeal the funding mechanism for the transitional reinsurance program
in the individual market, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

ApPrIL 16, 2015
Mr. TiBERI (for himself, Mr. MCKINLEY, Mrs. BLACKBURN, Mr. JoyCcr, Mr.
Boustany, and Mr. LIpINsKI) introduced the following bill; which was
referred to the Committee on Energy and Commerce

A BILL

To amend section 1341 of the Patient Protection and Afford-
able Care Act to repeal the funding mechanism for the
transitional reinsurance program in the individual mar-
ket, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. FINDINGS; PURPOSE.

(a) FINDINGS.—Congress makes the following find-
ngs:
(1) According to the most recent United States

Census, employer-based health insurance is the larg-

o N N e B W

est source of health insurance coverage in the



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

2
United States. Of those employed, 70 percent receive
employment-based health insurance. Of unemployed
Americans, 30 percent receive employer-sponsored
health insurance.

(2) Despite the large percentages of coverage,
as health care costs climb, the percentage of Ameri-
cans who receive health insurance through employers
has fallen significantly over the last decade—from
70 percent nationwide in 2000 to 60 percent in
2011, according to a report by the Robert Wood
Johnson Foundation.

(3) According to recent surveys done by the Na-
tional Business Group on Health and the Kaiser
Family Foundation, most companies continue to
provide health insurance for employees and wish to
continue doing so into the future.

(4) Employers who offer insurance will not con-
tribute additional risk to the health insurance ex-
changes established in the Patient Protection and
Affordable Care Act (in this Act referred to as
“PPACA”).

(5) The transitional reinsurance program, es-
tablished in section 1341 of PPACA, is intended to

stabilize risk in the individual health insurance mar-

*HR 1886 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O T \© R (O R R e e e e e e e T
N = O 00NN R WD = O

23
24

Q
(3}

ket during the first three years of the health insur-

ance exchanges, as established by that Act.

(6) PPACA also requires that the Treasury col-
lect a fee for each employer-sponsored covered life in
order to pay for the transitional reinsurance pro-
oram.

(7) This fee is a disincentive for employers to
continue offering coverage to all employees, and does
not give employers any benefits of the transitional
reinsurance program.

(b) PURPOSE.—It is the purpose of this Act to re-
move the current funding mechanism for the transitional
reinsurance program. Employer-sponsored insurance
should be supported so that Americans can sustain quality
health coverage.

SEC. 2. CHANGES IN FUNDING FOR TRANSITIONAL REIN-
SURANCE PROGRAM IN THE INDIVIDUAL
MARKET.

Section 1341(b) of the Patient Protection and Af-
fordable Care Act (Public Law 111-148; 42 U.S.C.
18061(b)) 1s amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “3-year pe-
riod” and inserting “1-year period” each place it ap-

pears;

*HR 1886 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

4

(2) in paragraph (3)(A), by striking “36-month
period”” and inserting “12-month period”;

(3) in paragraph (3)(B)(iii), by striking *,
$6,000,000,000 for plan years beginning 2015, and
$4,000,000,000 for plan years beginning in 2016

(4) in paragraph (3)(B)(iv), by striking *, an
additional $2,000,000,000 for 2015, and an addi-
tional $1,000,000,000 for 2016”’;

(5) in paragraph (4)(A), by striking “used in
any of the three calendar years for which amounts
are collected based on the reinsurance needs of a
particular period or to reflect experience in a prior
period” and inserting “only used with respect to the
calendar year for which amounts are collected based
on the reinsurance needs for that year, as deter-
mined by the Secretary’’;

(6) in paragraph (4), by amending subpara-
oraph (B) to read as follows:

“(B) amounts remaining unexpended as of
December, 31, 2015, shall be deposited into the
general fund of the Treasury of the United
States.”; and
(7) by adding at the end the following new

paragraphs:

*HR 1886 IH



FOR

5}
“(5) AVAILABILITY OF FUNDING FOR STATES
2015 AND 2016.—

“(A)  AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIA-
TIONS; PAYMENT FORMULA.—There are hereby
authorized to be appropriated, based on the
best estimates of the NAIC, $6,000,000,000 for
plan  years  beginning in 2015  and
$4,000,000,000 for plan years beginning in
2016 to make reinsurance payments to health
msurance issuers that cover high-risk individ-
uals in the individual market (excluding grand-
fathered health plans) that insure high-risk in-
dividuals consistent with this paragraph.

“(B) FUND AVAILABILITY.—The amounts
appropriated under subparagraph (A) for plans
yvears beginning in a calendar year shall be allo-
cated among States and only used with respect
to the calendar year for which amounts are col-
lected based on the reinsurance needs for that
particular year, as determined by the Secretary
and the amounts remaining unexpended as of
December 31 of the following year shall be de-
posited into the general fund of the Treasury of

the United States.

*HR 1886 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

N N e T e T
whn A~ W D = O

6

“(6) GAO AUDIT OF USE OF 2014 FUNDS.—The

Comptroller General of the United States shall pro-
vide for an audit of expenditures made under this
subsection with respect plans years beginning during
2014. Such audit shall include a determination of
the number of claims submitted by health isurance
issuers, the amount of such claims, a comparison of
the amount of such claims and the amounts collected
to cover such claims, and the amount of reinsurance
payments made under this section to health insur-
ance issuers. The Comptroller General shall submit
a report on such audit to Congress not later than 3
months after the last date that such reinsurance

payments are made, but not later than July 1,

2016.7.

*HR 1886 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-06T11:18:25-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




