AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1131H CONGRESS
94 HLR. 4364

To provide greater transparency, accountability, and safety authority to the
National Highway Traffic Safety Administration, and for other purposes.

M.

To

~N O O B W

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

ArriL 1, 2014
WaxMAN (for himself, Mr. PALLONE, Mr. Rusmo, Ms. DEGETTE, Ms.
SCHAKOWSKY, Ms. MATsvur, Mrs. CHRISTENSEN, Mr. BRALEY of lowa,
and Mr. ToNKO) introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Energy and Commerce

A BILL

provide greater transparency, accountability, and safety
authority to the National Highway Traffic Safety Admin-
istration, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TrrLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“Motor Vehicle Safety Act of 20147,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

this Act 1s as follows:

Sec. 1. Short title; table of contents.
See. 2. Definitions.



15

Sece. 101.
Sece. 102.
Sece. 103.
Sec. 104.
Sec. 105.
Sec. 106.
Sece. 107.
Sec. 108.

See. 201.
See. 202.

See. 301.
See. 302.

See. 401.

2
TITLE I—TRANSPARENCY AND ACCOUNTABILITY

Additional early warning reporting requirements.
Public notice of inspection and investigation activities.
Improved access to NHTSA vehicle safety information.
Jorporate responsibility for NHTSA reports.

Appeal of defect petition rejection.

Deadlines for rulemaking.

Reports to Congress.

Restriction on Covered Vehicle Safety Officials.

TITLE I—FUNDING

Vehicle safety user fee.
Authorization of appropriations.

TITLE IHII—ENHANCED SAFETY AUTHORITIES

Jivil penalties.
Imminent hazard authority.

TITLE IV—ADDITIONAL PROVISIONS

Preemption of State law.

SEC. 2. DEFINITIONS.

In this Act:

(1) PASSENGER MOTOR VEHICLE.—The term

“passenger motor vehicle” means a motor vehicle (as

defined in section 30102(a)(6) of title 49, United

States Code) that is rated at less than 10,000

pounds gross vehicular weight. Such term does not

melude—

(A) a motoreyele;

(B) a trailer; or

(C) a low speed vehicle (as defined in sec-
tion 571.3 of title 49, Code of Federal Regula-
tions).

(2) SECRETARY.—The term ‘“‘Secretary’” means

the Secretary of Transportation, acting through the

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 9 AN U Bk~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

Q
(3}

Administrator of the National Highway Traffic Safe-

ty Administration.

TITLE I—-TRANSPARENCY AND

ACCOUNTABILITY

SEC. 101. ADDITIONAL EARLY WARNING REPORTING RE-

QUIREMENTS.

(a) DATA ON FATALITIES.—Paragraph (3)(C) of sec-

tion 30166(m) of title 49, United States Code 1s amend-

)

(1) by striking “The manufacturer” and insert-
ing the following: “(i) IN GENERAL.—The manufac-
turer”’; and

(2) by adding at the end the following:

If an 1nci-

“(11) FATAL INCIDENTS.
dent described in clause (1) involves fatali-
ties, the Secretary shall require the manu-
facturer to report—

“(I) all mitial claims or notice
documents that notified the manufac-
turer of the incident;

“(IT) any police reports or other
documents  desceribing  or  recon-

structing the incident; and

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N W BB W

[a—
S

11

4
“(IIT) any amendments or sup-
plements to the documents described
in subclause (I), except for—
“(aa) medical documents
and bills;
“(bb) property damage in-
voices or estimates; and
“(¢e) documents related to

damages.”.

(b) PUBLIC AVAILABILITY.—Paragraph (4) of section

30166(m) of title 49, United States Code, is amended by

12 striking subparagraph (C) and inserting the following:

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

“(C) D1scLOSURE.—The information pro-

vided to the Secretary pursuant to this sub-

section shall be disclosed publicly unless exempt

from disclosure under section 552(b) of title

5.

(¢) REGULATIONS.—Not later than 2 years after the

date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall issue

regulations regarding public access to information sub-

mitted pursuant to section 30166(m) of title 49, United

States Code. The Secretary may establish categories of in-

formation provided pursuant to such section that must be

made available to the public and categories that are ex-

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N W BB W =

O TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = N R < BN B o) W ) B ~S O IR NO R e

5}
empt from public disclosure under section 552(b) of title
5, United States Code.

(d) CONSULTATION.—In conducting the rulemaking
required under subsection (¢), the Secretary shall consult
with the Director of the Office of Government Information
Services within the National Archives and the Director of
the Office of Information Policy of the Department of Jus-
tice.

(e) PRESUMPTION AND LIMITATION.—The Secretary
shall issue the regulations with a presumption in favor of
maximum public availability of information. The following
types of information shall not be eligible for protection
under section 552(b)(4) of title 5, United States Code, and
shall not be withheld from public disclosure:

(1) Production information regarding passenger
motor vehicles, information on incidents involving
death or injury, and numbers of property damage
claims.

(2) Aggregated numbers of consumer com-
plaints.

(f) NULLIFICATION OF PRIOR REGULATIONS.—Be-
oinning 2 years after the date of enactment of this Act,
the regulations establishing early warning reporting class
determinations in Appendix C of section 512 of title 49,

Code of Federal Regulations, shall have no force or effect.

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR N© T NS R NG T NG I NS R NS R e e T e e e T e T
A N Bl WD = O 0O 0NN B W N~ O

6
SEC. 102. PUBLIC NOTICE OF INSPECTION AND INVESTIGA-

TION ACTIVITIES.

The Secretary shall provide public notice of all in-
spection and investigation activities conducted by the Sec-
retary under section 30166 of title 49, United States
Code, and make any such notice, and notice of any en-
forcement or other action taken as a result of an inspec-
tion or investigation available on the website of the Na-
tional Highway Traffic Safety Administration immediately
after such notice is issued.

SEC. 103. IMPROVED ACCESS TO NHTSA VEHICLE SAFETY
INFORMATION.

Not later than 2 years after the date of enactment
of this Act, the Secretary shall improve public accessibility
to information on the website of the National Highway
Traffic Safety Administration regarding vehicle safety, in-

cluding Early Warning data, studies, investigations, in-

spections, incident reports, and other materials, by
(1) improving organization and functionality
and allowing for data to be searched, aggregated,
and downloaded;
(2) providing greater consistency in presen-
tation of vehicle safety issues; and
(3) improving searchability about specific vehi-
cles and issues through standardization of commonly
used search terms and the integration of databases

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 9 A U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

7

to enable all to be simultaneously searched using the

same keyword search function.

SEC. 104. CORPORATE RESPONSIBILITY FOR NHTSA RE-
PORTS.

Paragraph (1) of section 30166(0) of title 49, United
States Code, is amended by striking “may’” and inserting
“shall”.

SEC. 105. APPEAL OF DEFECT PETITION REJECTION.

Section 30162 of title 49, United States Code, is
amended by adding at the end the following:

“(e) JUDICIAL REVIEW.—A decision of the Secretary
to deny a petition filed under subsection (a)(2) of this sec-
tion 1s agency action subject to judicial review under chap-
ter 7 of title 5, and such action shall not be considered
committed to agency discretion within the meaning of sec-
tion 701(a)(2) of such title. A person agerieved by the
denial of a petition may obtain judicial review by filing
an action in the court of appeals of the United States for
the circuit in which the person resides or has its principal
place of business or the United States Court of Appeals
for the District of Columbia Circuit not more than 180
days after notice of the denial of the petition is published

in the Federal Register.”.

*HR 4364 TH



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

8
SEC. 106. DEADLINES FOR RULEMAKING.

If the Secretary determines that a deadline for a final
rule under this Act, or an amendment made by this Act,
cannot be met, the Secretary shall—

(1) notify the Committee on Energy and Com-
merce of the House of Representatives and the Sen-
ate Committee on Commerce, Science, and Trans-
portation and explain why that deadline cannot be
met; and

(2) establish a new deadline for that rule.

SEC. 107. REPORTS TO CONGRESS.

(a) STUDY ON EARLY WARNING DATA.—Not later
than 3, 5, 7, and 9 years after the date of enactment of
this Act, the Office of the Inspector General of the Depart-
ment of Transportation shall complete a study of the utili-
zation of Early Warning data by the National Highway
Traffic Safety Administration (NHTSA). Each study shall
evaluate the following:

(1) The number and type of requests for infor-
mation made by NHTSA based on data received in
the Early Warning Reporting system.

(2) The number of safety defect investigations
opened by NHTSA using any information reported
to the agency through the Karly Warning Reporting

system.

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I NS B e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O T NO R e

9

(3) The nature and vehicle defect category of
all such safety defect investigations.

(4) The number of investigations desecribed in
paragraph (2) that are subsequently closed without
further action.

(5) The duration of each investigation described
in paragraph (2).

(6) The percentage of each investication that
result in a finding of a safety defect or recall by the
agency.

(7) Other information the Office of the Inspec-
tor General determines to be appropriate.

(b) REPORT ON OPERATIONS OF THE COUNCIL FOR
VEHICLE ELECTRONICS, VEHICLE SOFTWARE, AND

EMERGING TECHNOLOGIES.—Not later than 6 months

after the date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall
report to Congress regarding the operations of the Council
for Vehicle Electronies, Vehicle Software, and Emerging
Technologies. Such report shall include information about
the accomplishments of the Council, the role the Council
plays in integrating and aggregating expertise across
NHTSA, and priorities of the Council over the next 5
vears.

(¢) SUBMISSION OF REPORTS.—Each study described

in subsection (a) and the report described in subsection

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N Bk W=

| \O 2R \© R \O B \O N O R e e e e e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

10

(b) shall be submitted to the Committee on Energy and

Commerce of the House of Representatives and to the

Committee on Commerce, Science, and Transportation of

the Senate upon completion.

SEC. 108. RESTRICTION ON COVERED VEHICLE SAFETY OF-
FICIALS.

(a) AMENDMENT.—Subchapter I of chapter 301 of
title 49, United States Code, is amended by adding at the
end the following:

“§30107. Restriction on covered vehicle safety offi-
cials

“(a) IN GENERAL.—For a period of 1 year after the
termination of his or her service or employment, a covered
vehicle safety official shall not knowingly make, with the
intent to influence, any communication to or appearance
before any officer or employee of the National Highway
Transportation Safety Administration on behalf of any
manufacturer subject to regulation under this chapter in
connection with any matter involving vehicle safety on
which such person seeks official action by any officer or
employee of the National Highway Transportation Safety
Administration.

“(b) No EFFECT ON SECTION 207.—This section

does not expand, contract, or otherwise affect the applica-

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N W B W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N e = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O T NO R e

11
tion of any waiver or criminal penalties under section 207
of title 18.

“(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—This section shall apply to
covered vehicle safety officials who terminate service or
employment with the National Highway Transportation
Safety Administration after the date of enactment of the
Motor Vehicle Safety Act of 2014.

“(d) DEFINITION.—In this section, the term ‘covered
vehicle safety official’ means any officer or employee of
the National Highway Transportation Safety Administra-
tion who, within the final 12 months of his or her service
or employment with the agency, serves or served in a tech-
nical or legal capacity, and whose job responsibilities in-
clude or included vehicle safety defect investigation, vehi-
cle safety compliance, vehicle safety rulemaking, or vehicle
safety research, and any officer or employee of the Na-
tional Highway Transportation Safety Administration
Serving in a supervisory or management capacity over such
officers or employees.

“(e) SPECIAL RULE FOR DETAILEES.

For purposes
of this section, a person who is detailed from one depart-
ment, agency, or other entity to another department,
agency, or other entity shall, during the period such per-
son 1s detailed, be deemed to be an officer or employee

of both departments, agencies, or such entities.

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N B W =

e S — YN S S
B~ W NN = O

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

12

“(f) EXCEPTION FOR TESTIMONY.—Nothing in this
section shall prevent an individual from giving testimony
under oath, or from making statements required to be
made under penalty of perjury.”.

(b) Crvi. PENALTY.—Section 30165(a) of title 49,
United States Code, is further amended by adding at the
end the following:

“(5) SECTION 30107.—A person who violates
section 30107 shall be subject to a civil penalty of
not more than $55,000.”.

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—The table of sec-
tions for chapter 301 of title 49, United States Code, is
amended by inserting after the item relating to section

30106 the following:

“30107. Restriction on covered vehicle safety officials.”.
TITLE II—FUNDING
SEC. 201. VEHICLE SAFETY USER FEE.

(a) AMENDMENT.—Subchapter I of chapter 301 of
title 49, United States Code, as amended by section
108(a), is further amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“§30108. Vehicle safety user fee

“(a) ESTABLISHMENT OF KFUND.—There is estab-
lished in the Treasury of the United States a separate ac-
count for the deposit of fees under this section to be

known as the Vehicle Safety Fund.

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG TN N TR NG I NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N N N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

13

“(b) ASSESSMENT AND COLLECTION OF VEHICLE

SAFETY FEES.

Beginning 1 year after the date of enact-
ment of the Motor Vehicle Safety Act of 2014, the Sec-
retary shall assess and collect, in accordance with this sec-
tion, a vehicle safety user fee from the manufacturer for
each motor vehicle that is certified as compliant with ap-
plicable motor vehicle safety standards pursuant to section
30115.

“(¢) DEPOSIT.—The Secretary shall deposit any fees
collected pursuant to subsection (b) into the Vehicle Safe-
ty Flund established by subsection (a).

“(d) UsSkE.—Amounts in the Vehicle Safety Fund
shall be available to the Secretary, as provided in sub-
section (i), for making expenditures to meet the oblica-
tions of the United States to carry out vehicle safety pro-
erams of the National IMighway Traffic Safety Adminis-
tration.

“(e) VEHICLE SAFETY USER FEE.—

“(1) FIRST, SECOND, AND THIRD YEAR FEES.

The fee assessed under this section for the first
three years shall be as follows:

“(A) $3 for ecach vehicle certified during

the first year in which such fees are assessed.

“(B) $6 for each vehicle certified during

the second year in which such fees are assessed.

*HR 4364 TH



14

1 “(C) $9 for each vehicle certified during
2 the third year in which such fees are assessed.
3 “(2) SUBSEQUENT YEARS.—The fee assessed
4 under this section for each vehicle certified after the
5 third year in which such fees are assessed shall be
6 adjusted by the Secretary by notice published in the
7 Federal Register to reflect the total percentage
8 change that occurred in the Consumer Price Index
9 for all Urban Consumers for the 12-month period
10 ending June 30 preceding the fiscal year for which
11 fees are being established.

12 “(3) PAYMENT.—The Secretary shall require
13 payment of fees under this section on a quarterly
14 basis and not later than one quarter after the date
15 on which the fee was assessed.

16 “(f) RULEMAKING.—Not later than 9 months after

17 the date of enactment of the Motor Vehicle Safety Act of
18 2014, the Secretary shall promulgate rules governing the

19 collection and payment of fees pursuant to this section.

20 “(2) LIMITATIONS.

21 “(1) IN GENERAL.—Fees under this section
22 shall not be collected for a fiscal year unless appro-
23 priations for vehicle safety programs of the National
24 Highway Traffic Safety Administration for such fis-
25 cal year (excluding the amount of fees appropriated

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\© TN NG T NG T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N s = N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O TR NO S e

15
for such fiscal year) are equal to or greater than the
amount of appropriations for vehicle safety pro-
erams of the National Highway Traffic Safety Ad-
ministration for fiscal year 2014.

“(2) AurtHORITY.—If the Secretary does not
assess fees under this section during any portion of
a fiscal year because of paragraph (1), the Secretary
may assess and collect such fees, without any modi-
fication in the rate, at a later date in such fiscal
year notwithstanding the provisions of subsection

(e)(3) relating to the date fees are to be paid.

“(h) COLLECTION OF UNPAID FEES.—In any case
where the Secretary does not receive payment of a fee as-
sessed under this section within 30 days after it is due,
such fee shall be treated as a claim of the United States
Government subject to subchapter II of chapter 37 of title
31.

“(1) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—In addi-
tion to funds authorized to be appropriated under section
30104, there is authorized to be appropriated from the
Vehicle Safety Fund to the Secretary for the National
Highway Traffic Safety Administration for each fiscal
yvear in which fees are collected under subsection (b) an
amount equal to the total amount collected during the pre-

vious fiscal year from fees assessed pursuant to this sec-

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 N N B W

[a—
S

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

16
tion. Such amounts are authorized to remain available
until expended.

“(j) CREDITING AND AVAILABILITY OF FEES.—Fees
authorized under subsection (b) shall be collected and
available for obligation only to the extent and in the
amount provided in advance in appropriations Acts.”.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections
for chapter 301 of title 49, United States Code, as amend-
ed by section 108(d), is further amended by inserting after

the item relating to section 30107 the following:

“30108. Vehicle safety user fee.”.
SEC. 202. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.
Section 30104 of title 49, United States Code, is
amended—
(1) by striking “$98,313,500”’; and
(2) by striking “in each fiscal year beginning in
fiscal year 1999 and ending in fiscal year 2011.”
and inserting the following: “and to carry out the
Motor Vehicle Safety Act of 2014—
“(1) $200,000,000 for fiscal year 2015;
“(2) $240,000,000 for fiscal year 2016; and
“(3) $280,000,000 for fiscal year 2017.”.

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 9 N N BB WD =

[\O I O R O R e e e e e e e T e T
N o= OO 0 N R WD = O

17

TITLE III—-ENHANCED SAFETY
AUTHORITIES
SEC. 301. CIVIL PENALTIES.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 30165 of title 49, United
States Code, is amended—
(1) in subsection (a)(1)—
(A) in the first sentence by striking
“$5,000” and inserting “$25,000”; and
(B) in the third sentence, by striking
“$35,000,000” and inserting “$200,000,000;
and
(2) n subsection (a)(3)—
(A) in the second sentence by striking
“$5,000” and inserting “$25,000”; and
(B) in the third sentence, by striking
“$35,000,000” and inserting “$200,000,000".
(b) CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in this section shall be
construed as preventing the imposition of penalties under
section 30165 of title 49, United States Code, prior to
the issuance of a final rule pursuant to section 31203(b)
of the Moving Ahead for Progress in the 21st Century Act
(49 U.S.C. 30165 note).

*HR 4364 TH



18

1 SEC. 302. IMMINENT HAZARD AUTHORITY.

NoNe B e Y, e~ L OV R \O)

[\ TN NG T NG T NG I NG I N B e e T e e T e e e
LN A W D= O O NN NN R W DY = O

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 30118(b) of title 49,

United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the

following:

“(3) IMMINENT HAZARD ORDERS.—If the Sec-
retary of Transportation in making a decision under
subsection (a) also initially decides that such defect
or noncompliance presents a substantial likelihood of
death or serious injury to the public, the Secretary
shall notify such manufacturer. The opportunity for
the manufacturer to present information, views, and
arguments in accordance with paragraph (1) shall be
provided as soon as practicable but not later than 10
calendar days after the initial decision. The Sec-
retary shall expedite proceedings for a decision and
order under paragraph (1) and shall, as appropriate,
issue an imminent hazard order.”.

(b) PROCEDURES.—Not later than 2 years after the

date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall issue
procedures for the issuance and enforcement of imminent
hazard orders under section 30118(b)(3) of title 49,
United States Code (as added by subsection (a)), con-
sistent with the provisions of chapter 301 of such title and
chapter 5 of title 5, United States Code (commonly known

as the Administrative Procedure Act).

*HR 4364 TH



O o0 9 N U B WD =

e T e e T T e T = T
O o0 N O »n B~ WD = O

19

TITLE IV—ADDITIONAL
PROVISIONS

SEC. 401. PREEMPTION OF STATE LAW.

(a) CONGRESSIONAL AUTHORIZATION REQUIRED.—
Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the Secretary
shall not publish a rule pursuant to section 30111 of title
49, United States Code, that addresses the issue of pre-
emption of State law seeking damages for personal injury,
death, or property damage unless Congress expressly au-
thorizes the Secretary to address such preemption.

(b) PREEMPTION LANGUAGE.—Any language ad-
dressing the issue of preemption contained within regula-
tions issued by the Secretary pursuant to section 30111
of title 49, United States Code, during the years 2005
through 2008 shall not be considered in determining
whether any such rule preempts any action under State
law seeking damages for personal injury, death, or prop-
erty damage unless Congress expressly authorizes the Sec-
retary to address such preemption.

O

*HR 4364 TH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-06T23:17:18-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




