AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1131H CONGRESS
BN HLR. 421

To amend the Omnibus Crime Control and Safe Streets Act of 1968 to
enhance the COPS ON THE BEAT grant program, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JANUARY 25, 2013
Mr. REICHERT (for himself, Mr. KING of New York, Mr. PASCRELL, and Mr.
CONYERS) introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Com-
mittee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To amend the Omnibus Crime Control and Safe Streets
Act of 1968 to enhance the COPS ON THE BEAT

orant program, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Act may be cited as the “COPS Improvement
5 and Reauthorization Act of 2013"".

6 SEC. 2. COPS GRANT IMPROVEMENTS.

7 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1701 of title I of the Om-
8 mnibus Crime Control and Safe Streets Act of 1968 (42
9 U.S.C. 3796dd) is amended—



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e T e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R WD = O

22
23
24

2

(1) by striking subsection (c);

(2) by redesignating subsection (b) as sub-
section (¢);

(3) by striking subsection (a) and inserting the
following:

“(a) THE OFFICE OF COMMUNITY ORIENTED POLIC-
ING SERVICES.—

“(1) OFFICE.—There 1s within the Department
of Justice, under the general authority of the Attor-
ney General, a separate and distinet office to be
known as the Office of Community Oriented Policing
Services (referred to in this subsection as the ‘COPS
Office’).

“(2) DIRECTOR.—The COPS Office shall be
headed by a Director who shall—

“(A) be appointed by the Attorney Gen-
eral; and

“(B) have final authority over all grants,
cooperative agreements, and contracts awarded

by the COPS Office.
“(b) GRANT AUTHORIZATION.—The Attorney Gen-
eral shall carry out grant programs under which the Attor-
ney General makes grants to States, units of local govern-

ment, Indian tribal governments, other public and private

*HR 421 IH



3

I entities, and multi-jurisdictional or regional consortia for

2 the purposes described in subsections (¢), (d), and (e).”;
3 (4) in subsection (¢), as so redesignated—

4 (A) in the heading, by striking “uses of
5 orant amounts.—"’ and inserting “COMMUNITY
6 PoLICING AND CRIME PREVENTION GRANTS;
7 (B) in paragraph (3), by striking *, to in-
8 crease the number of officers deployed in com-
9 munity-oriented policing”’;

10 (C) in paragraph (4)—

11 (1) by striking “pay for offices” and
12 inserting “pay for or train officers’; and
13 (i1) by inserting ““, and to provide for
14 the initial hiring of such officers” after
15 “duties’’;

16 (D) by striking paragraph (9);

17 (E) by redesignating paragraphs (5)
18 through (8) as paragraphs (6) through (9), re-
19 spectively;

20 (F) by inserting after paragraph (4) the
21 following:

22 “(5) award grants to hire school resource offi-
23 cers and to establish school-based partnerships be-
24 tween local law enforcement agencies and local
25 school systems to enhance school safety and to com-

*HR 421 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I O T O I N0 R S e e e e e T e T e T
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

1

bat c¢rime, gangs, drug activities, and other problems
in and around elementary and secondary schools, in-
cluding assisting schools with emergency prepared-
ness and preventative measures plans for natural
disasters and acts of violence and terrorism.”’;

(G) by striking paragraph (13);

() by redesignating paragraphs (14),

(15), and (16) as paragraphs (13), (14), and

(15), respectively;

(I) in paragraph (15), as so redesignated,
by striking “and’ at the end;
(J) by redesignating paragraph (17) as

paragraph (18);

(K) by inserting after paragraph (15), as
so redesignated, the following:

“(16) establish and implement innovative pro-
orams to reduce and prevent illegal drug manufac-
turing, distribution, and use, including the manufac-
turing, distribution, and use of methamphetamine;
and

“(17) award enhancing community policing and
crime prevention grants that meet emerging law en-

forcement needs, as warranted.”’; and

*HR 421 IH



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e T e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22

5}

(Iu) in paragraph (18), as so redesignated,
by striking ‘“‘through (16)” and inserting
“through (17);

(5) by striking subsections (h) and (1);

(6) by redesignating subsections (d) through (g)
as subsections (f) through (i), respectively;

(7) by inserting after subsection (¢), as so re-
designated, the following:

“(d) TROOPS-TO-COPS PROGRAMS.

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Grants made under sub-
section (b) may be used to hire former members of
the Armed Forces to serve as career law enforce-
ment officers for deployment in community oriented
policing, particularly in communities that are ad-
versely affected by a recent military base closing.

“(2) DEFINITION.—In this subsection, ‘former
member of the Armed Forces’” means a member of
the Armed Forces of the United States who is invol-
untarily separated from the Armed Forces within
the meaning of section 1141 of title 10, United
States Code.

“(e) TECONOLOGY GRANTS.

The Attorney General

23 may make grants under subsection (b) to develop and use

24 new technologies (including interoperable communications

25 technologies, modernized criminal record technology, and

*HR 421 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

6

forensic technology) to assist State and local law enforce-

ment agencies in reorienting the emphasis of their activi-

ties from reacting to crime to preventing crime and to

train law enforcement officers to use such technologies.”;
(8) in subsection (f), as so redesignated—

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘“‘to
States, units of local government, Indian tribal
covernments, and to other public and private
entities,”’;

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking “define
for State and local governments, and other pub-
lic and private entities,” and inserting ‘‘estab-
lish”; and

(C) in the first sentence of paragraph (3),
by inserting ““(including regional community po-
licing institutes)” after “training centers or fa-
cilities”’;

(9) in subsection (h), as so redesignated—

(A) by striking “‘subsection (a)” the first
place that term appears and inserting ‘‘para-
oraphs (1) and (2) of subsection (¢)”’; and

(B) by striking “in each fiscal year pursu-
ant to subsection (a)” and inserting “in each
fiscal year for purposes described in paragraph

(1) and (2) of subsection (¢)”’;

*HR 421 IH



O o0 N N D Bk W =

[\© TN NG N N TR NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N NG Y N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

7

(10) in subsection (1), as so redesignated, by

2

striking “‘subsection (a)” and inserting ‘“‘subsection

(b)”’; and
(11) in subsection (j)(1), by striking ‘sub-

2

section (b)” and inserting “‘subsection (¢)”.

(b) APPLICATIONS.—Section 1702(¢) of title I of the
Omnibus Crime Control and Safe Streets Act of 1968 (42
U.S.C. 3796dd-1(¢)) is amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (8) through
(11) as paragraphs (9) through (12), respectively;
and

(2) by inserting after paragraph (7) the fol-
lowing:

“(8) if the application is for a grant for officers
performing homeland security duties, explain how
the applicant intends to coordinate with Federal law
enforcement in support of the applicant’s homeland
security mission;’’.

(¢) LIMITATION ON USE OF FUNDS.—Section
1704(¢) of title I of the Ommnibus Crime Control and Safe
Streets Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 3796dd-3(¢)) 1s amended

by striking “$75,000” and inserting “$125,000".

(d) DEFINITIONS.—Section 1709(1) of title I of the
Omnibus Crime Control and Safe Streets Act of 1968 (42

U.S.C. 3796dd—8(1)) is amended by striking “who is au-

*HR 421 IH



O o0 N N B W =

[\O T \© R (O R R e e e e e e e T
DN = O 00N N R WD = O

8

thorized” and inserting “who is a sworn law enforcement
officer and is authorized”.

Section

(¢) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.
1001(a)(11) of title I of the Omnibus Crime Control and
Safe Streets Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 3793(a)(11)) is
amended—

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking ‘“fiscal
yvears 2006 through 2009”7 and inserting ‘“fiscal
years 2013 through 2017”; and

(2) in subparagraph (B)—

(A) 1n the first sentence—
(i) by striking “3 percent” and insert-
ing “5 percent”’; and
(i1) by striking “section 1701(d)” and
inserting “section 1701(f)”’; and
(B) by striking the second sentence and in-
serting the following: “Of the funds available
for grants under part Q, not less than
$600,000,000 shall be used for grants for the
purposes specified in section 1701(¢), and not
more than $250,000,000 shall be used for

orants under section 1701(e).”.

O

*HR 421 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-07T11:11:17-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




