AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1121H CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 36 1 3

To promote research, monitoring, and observation of the Arctic and for
other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

SEPTEMBER 21, 2012
Mr. Becrcm (for himself and Ms. MURKOWSKI) introduced the following bill;
which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation

A BILL

To promote research, monitoring, and observation of the

Arctic and for other purposes.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Arctic Research, Moni-
toring, and Observing Act of 20127,

SEC. 2. FINDINGS AND PURPOSE.

(a) FINDINGS.—Congress makes the following find-

ngs:

NolNe I e Y, - VL B \O)

(1) The United States is an Arctic Nation

[S—
)

with—



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

2
(A) an approximately 700-mile border with

the Arctic Ocean;

(B) more than 100,000,000 acres of land
above the Arctic Circle; and

(C) an even broader area defined as Arctie
by temperature, which includes the Bering Sea
and Aleutian Islands.

(2) The Arctic region of the United States is
home to an indigenous population that has subsisted
for millennia on the abundance in marine mammals,
fish, and wildlife, many of which are unique to the
region.

(3) Temperatures in the United States Arctic
region have warmed by 3 to 4 degrees Celsius over
the past half-century, a rate of increase that is twice
the global average.

(4) The Arctic ice pack is rapidly diminishing
and thinning, and the National Oceanic and Atmos-
pheric Administration estimates the Arctic Ocean
may be ice free during summer months in as few as
30 years.

(5) Such changes to the Arctic region are hav-
ing a significant impact on the indigenous people of

the Arctie, their communities and ecosystems, as

*S 3613 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e T T S
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22

3

well as the marine mammals, fish, and wildlife upon
which they depend.

(6) Such changes are opening new portions of
the United States Arctic continental shelf to possible
development for offshore oil and gas, commercial
fishing, marine shipping, and tourism.

(7) Existing Federal research and science advi-
sory programs focused on the environmental and so-
cioeconomic impacts of a changing Arctic lack a co-
hesive, coordinated, and integrated approach and are
not adequately coordinated with State, local, aca-
demie, and private-sector Arctic research programs.

(8) The lack of research integration and syn-
thesis of findings of Arctic research has impeded the
progress of the United States and international com-
munity in understanding climate change impacts
and feedback mechanisms in the Arctic Ocean.

(9) An improved scientific understanding of the
changing Arctic is critical to the development of ap-
propriate and effective regional, national, and global
climate change adaptation strategies.

(b) PURPOSE.—The purpose of this Act is to estab-

23 lish a permanent program to conduct research, moni-

24 toring, and observation activities in the Arctic—

*S 3613 IS



4

| (1) to promote and sustain a productive and re-
2 silient marine, coastal, and estuarine ecosystem in
3 the Arctic and the human uses of its natural re-
4 sources through greater understanding of how the
5 ecosystem works and monitoring and observation of
6 its vital signs; and

7 (2) to track and evaluate the effectiveness of
8 natural resource management in the Arctic in order
9 to facilitate 1mproved performance and adaptive
10 management.

11 SEC. 3. ARCTIC RESEARCH COMMISSION.

12 (a) DUTIES OF THE ARCTIC RESEARCH COMMIS-
13 stoN.—Section 104(a) of the Arctic Research and Policy
14 Act of 1984 (15 U.S.C. 4103(a)) is amended—

15 (1) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘“‘assist in es-
16 tablishing”” and inserting “establish’’;

17 (2) by redesignating paragraphs (3) through
18 (10) as paragraphs (4) through (11), respectively;
19 and

20 (3) by inserting after paragraph (2) the fol-
21 lowing:

22 “(3) provide—

23 “(A) grants to Federal, State, local, or
24 tribal governments and academic and private
25 organizations to conduct research on or related

*S 3613 IS



5}
to the Arctic, including to the marine environ-
ment of the Arctic Ocean, its adjacent seas or
associated lesser bodies of water; and
“(B) such grants on the basis of merit in
accordance with such national Arctic research
program plan;”.
(b) ADMINISTRATION OF THE COMMISSION.—Section
106 of the Arctic Research and Policy Act of 1984 (15
U.S.C. 4105) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (4), by striking “and” at the
end;

(2) in paragraph (5), by striking the period at
the end and inserting a semicolon and “‘and”; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(6) enter into agreements with appropriate
agencies or organizations to administer grants made
pursuant to this title for Arctic research including
reimbursement from funds of the Commission to ad-

minister such grants.”.

(¢) COMPENSATION OF COMMISSION MEMBERS.
Section 103(d)(1) of the Arctic Research and Policy Act
of 1984 (15 U.S.C. 4102(d)(1)) is amended by striking
“for compensation” in the second sentence and inserting
“by the Federal Government or any State or local govern-

ment’”’.

*S 3613 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG I NG R N e T e e T e T e e
[ B N O N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O I NO R e

6

(d) CONFLICTS OF INTEREST.—

(1) ARCTIC RESEARCH COMMISSION.—Section
103 of the Arctic Research and Policy Act of 1984
(15 U.S.C. 4102) is amended by adding at the end
the following:

“(e) The Commission shall adopt conflict of interest
and recusal provisions that apply to any decision by the
Commission and to all members of the Commission as if
each member of the Commission is an ‘affected individual’
within the meaning of section 302(j) of the Magnuson-
Stevens Fishery Conservation and Management Act (16
U.S.C. 1852(j)), except that in addition to the disclosure
requirements of paragraph (2) of such section 302(j), each
Commission member shall disclose any financial interest
or relationship in an organization or with an individual
that is applying for funding from the Commission held by
the Commission member, including an interest as an offi-
cer, director, trustee, partner, employee, contractor, agent,
or other representative.”.

(2) NORTH PACIFIC RESEARCH BOARD.—Sub-
section (e) of section 401 of the Department of the
Interior and Related Agencies Appropriations Act,
1998 (43 U.S.C. 1474d) is amended—

(A) in paragraph (4)(B), by striking “15

percent” and inserting “20 percent”’; and

*S 3613 IS



7

| (B) by striking paragraph (5) and insert-
2 ing the following:

3 “(5) The Board shall adopt conflict of interest
4 and recusal provisions that apply to any decision by
5 the Board and to all members of the Board as if
6 cach member of the Board is an ‘affected individual’
7 within the meaning of section 302(j) of the Magnu-
8 son-Stevens Fishery Conservation and Management
9 Act (16 U.S.C. 1852(j)), except that in addition to
10 the disclosure requirements of paragraph (2) of such
11 section 302(j), each Board member shall disclose
12 any financial interest or relationship in an organiza-
13 tion or with an individual that is applying for fund-
14 ing from the Board, including an interest as an offi-
15 cer, director, trustee, partner, employee, contractor,
16 agent, or other representative.”.

17 SEC. 4. ENVIRONMENTAL IMPROVEMENT AND RESTORA-
18 TION FUND.

19 (a) TRANSFER AND AVAILABILITY OF AMOUNTS

20 EARNED.—Subsection (¢) of section 401 of the Depart-

21 ment of the Interior and Related Agencies Appropriations

22 Act, 1998 (43 U.S.C. 1474d) is amended—

23 (1) in paragraph (1), by striking “To the extent
24 provided in the subsequent appropriations Acts, 80
25 percent of such amounts shall be made available”

*S 3613 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN O T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e T e T
[ T NG U N N = = N R < BN B o) W ) B ~S O B NO R e

8
and inserting “40 percent of such amounts shall be
made available without further appropriations’;

(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “20 percent”
and inserting “25 percent’’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(3) 25 percent of such amounts shall be made
without further appropriation to the United States
Arctic Research Commission for the purposes of car-
rying out research and monitoring in the Arctic as
provided in subsection (f).

“(4) 10 percent of such amounts shall be made
available without further appropriations to the Sec-
retary of Commerce to fund the Alaska Ocean Ob-

b

serving Program as provided in subsection (g).”.

(b) UskE OoF FuNDs.—Section 401 of the Department
of the Interior and Related Agencies Appropriations Act,
1998 (43 U.S.C. 1474d) is amended by adding at the end
the following:

“(f) UNITED STATES ARCTIC RESEARCH COMMIS-
SION.—Funds available under subsection (¢)(3) shall be
used by the Arctic Research Commission established by
section 103 of the Arctic Research and Policy Act of 1984
to provide erants to Federal and State governments and
academic and private organizations to conduct research

and monitoring, including the identification of Important

*S 3613 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

|\ I O T O I N0 R e e e e e e T e T e T
W N = O O 0N N N R WD = O

9

Ecological Areas, on or related to the Arctie, including the
marine environment of the Arctic Ocean, its adjacent seas
or associated lesser bodies of water. Not more than 20
percent of such funds may be used to provide support for
the Arctic Research Commission and administer grants
under this subsection.”.

“(2) ALASKA OCEAN OBSERVING SYSTEM.—Funds
available under subsection (¢)(4) shall be used to support
the Alaska Ocean Observing System in a manner con-
sistent with the Integrated Coastal and Ocean Observation
System Act of 2009 (33 U.S.C. 3601 et seq.), for the pur-
pose of establishing long-term ocean observing systems
and monitoring programs in waters of the United States
in the North Pacific, Bering Sea, and Arctic Ocean. Not
more than 20 percent of the funds made available pursu-
ant to subsection (¢)(4) may be used to provide adminis-
trative support under this subsection.

“(h) DuPLICATION OF EFFORT; REPORT.—Pro-
orams and grants funded pursuant to paragraphs (2), (3),
and (4) of subsection (¢) shall seek to avoid duplicating
other research activities. The North Pacific Research
Board, the Arctic Research Commission, and the Alaska

Ocean Observing System shall—

*S 3613 IS



10

| “(1) meet not less than once annually to pro-
2 mote coordination among research programs and
3 projects; and

4 “(2) submit to Congress and the President an
5 annual report on the status of research conducted
6 pursuant to this title.

7 “(1) Arcric DEFINED.—In this section, the term
8 ‘Arcti¢’ has the meaning given that term in section 112
9 of the Arctic Research and Policy Act of 1984 (15 U.S.C.
10 4111).”.

*S 3613 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-07T12:43:33-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




