AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

111TH CONGRESS
L HLR. 4176

To amend the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2010
to authorize construction of an Aegis Ashore Test Facility at Pacific
Missile Range Facility, Hawaii.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

DECEMBER 2, 2009
Mr. ABERCROMBIE introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Armed Services

A BILL

To amend the Military Construction Authorization Act for
Fiscal Year 2010 to authorize construction of an Aegis
Ashore Test Facility at Pacific Missile Range Facility,
Hawaii.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Aegis Ashore Test Fa-

Y B S S B O]

cility Construction Authorization Act”.



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[S—
)

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

2
SEC. 2. AUTHORIZED MISSILE DEFENSE AGENCY CON-

STRUCTION PROJECT.

(a) PrROJECT AUTHORITY.—The table entitled ‘‘Mis-
sile Defense Agency” in section 2401 of the Military Con-
struction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2010 (division
B of Public Law 111-84) is amended by inserting after
the item relating to Redstone Arsenal, Alabama, the fol-
lowing new item relating to construction of an Aegis
Ashore Test Facility at Pacific Missile Range Facility,

Kauai, Hawaii:

Hawaii ............. Pacifie Missile Range Facility .................. $68,500,000.

(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section

2404(a) of the Military Construction Authorization Act
for Fiscal Year 2010 (division B of Public Law 111-84)
18 amended—

(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by
striking “$3,177,496,000” and inserting
“$3,245,996,000’; and

(2)  1n paragraph (1), by  striking
“$1,048,783,000” and inserting “$1,117,283,000".
(¢) RELATION TO MILITARY CONSTRUCTION KUND-

ING TABLE.—Section 4001 of the National Defense Au-
thorization Act for Fiscal Year 2010 (Public Law 111-
84) shall apply to the military construction project author-

ized by the amendment made by subsection (a) to the

*HR 4176 IH



A~ WL P

3

same extent and in the same manner as if the project had
been included in the table contained in section 4501 of
such Act and listed as the conference agreement the

amount specified for the project in the amendment.

O

*HR 4176 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-09T00:14:39-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




