AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

111TH CONGRESS
L HLR. 3507

To amend title 38, United States Code, to provide for an increase in the
rates of survivors’ and dependents’ educational assistance payable by
the Secretary of Veterans Affairs.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JuLy 31, 2009
Mr. PAULSEN (for himself and Mr. WALZ) introduced the following bill; which
was referred to the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs

A BILL

To amend title 38, United States Code, to provide for an
increase in the rates of survivors’ and dependents’ edu-
cational assistance payable by the Secretary of Veterans
Affairs.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. INCREASE IN RATES OF SURVIVORS’ AND DE-

Section 3532 of title 38, United States Code, is

2
3
4 PENDENTS’ EDUCATIONAL ASSISTANCE.
5
6 amended—

7

(1) 1 subsection (a)(1)—



O o0 N N W BB W

e S N T T Y =N =
N O L B~ WY = O

2
(A) by striking “$788”7 and inserting
“$10987;
(B) by striking “$592” and inserting
“$82377; and
(C) by striking “$394” and inserting
“$5477;
(2) in subsection (a)(2)(B), by striking “$788”
and inserting “$1098”;
(3) in subsection (b), by striking “$788” and
inserting “$1098”; and
(4) in subsection (¢)(2)—
(A) by striking “$636”7 and inserting
“$88477;
(B) by striking “$4477 and inserting
“$663"; and
(C) by striking “$319” and inserting
“$4417.

*HR 3507 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-09T05:39:22-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




