AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

111TH CONGRESS
L9 HLR. 1169

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the amount of assistance
provided by the Secretary of Veterans Affairs to disabled veterans for
specially adapted housing and automobiles and adapted equipment.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

FEBRUARY 25, 2009

Mr. BoozmAN (for himself and Mr. BUYER) introduced the following bill;
which was referred to the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs

A BILL

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the
amount of assistance provided by the Secretary of Vet-
erans Affairs to disabled veterans for specially adapted

housing and automobiles and adapted equipment.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tiwes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

e e L N
<N O L A WD = O

2

SECTION 1. INCREASE IN AMOUNT OF ASSISTANCE PRO-

VIDED BY SECRETARY OF VETERANS AF-
FAIRS TO DISABLED VETERANS FOR SPE-
CIALLY ADAPTED HOUSING AND AUTO-

MOBILES AND ADAPTED EQUIPMENT.

(a) SPECIALLY ADAPTED HOUSING.—Section 2102

of title 38, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in subsection (b)(2), by striking “$12,000”

and inserting “$36,000”; and

(2) in subsection (d)—

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking

“$60,000” and inserting “$180,000”; and

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking

“$12,000” and inserting “$36,000”.

(b) AUTOMOBILES AND ADAPTED KQUIPMENT.—Sec-

tion 3902(a) of such title is amended by striking

“$11,000” and inserting “$33,000".

*HR 1169 IH

O



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-09T14:25:52-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




