AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

110TH CONGRESS
LN S, 3497

To amend the Food and Nutrition Act of 2008 to decrease the period
of benefit ineligibility of certain adults due to unemployment.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

SEPTEMBER 16, 2008

Mrs. CLINTON introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Agriculture, Nutrition, and Forestry

A BILL

To amend the Food and Nutrition Act of 2008 to decrease
the period of benefit ineligibility of certain adults due

to unemployment.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Food Insecurity Re-
duction Act of 2008,

SEC. 2. PERIOD OF INELIGIBILITY FOR SUPPLEMENTAL NU-
TRITION ASSISTANCE DUE TO UNEMPLOY-

MENT.

O o0 9 N U B W

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 6(0) of the Food and Nu-

[S—
e}

trition Act of 2008 (7 U.S.C. 2015(0)) 1s amended—



2
| (1) in paragraph (2), by striking “3 months”
and inserting ‘12 months”,
(2) in paragraph (5)(C), by striking “3-month”

each place it appears and inserting “12-month”, and

2
3
4
5 (3) 1 paragraph (6)(A)(11)(IV), by striking 3
6 months” and inserting 12 months”.
7 (b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
8 16(h)(1)(E)@G1)(I) of the Food and Nutrition Act of 2008
9 (7TU.S.C.2025(h)(1)(E)@i)(I)) is amended by striking ““3-
10 month” and inserting “12-month”.

O

oS 3497 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-09T18:13:59-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




