AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

Calendar No. 187
I S, 1549

To authorize appropriations for fiscal year 2008 for military construction,
and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JUNE 5, 2007

Mr. LEVIN, from the Committee on Armed Services, reported the following
original bill; which was read twice and placed on the calendar

A BILL

To authorize appropriations for fiscal year 2008 for military
construction, and for other purposes.
1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Military Construction
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008,

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.

~N O e AW

The table of contents for this Act i1s as follows:

See. 1. Short title.
See. 2. Table of contents.
Sec. 3. Congressional defense committees.



Seec.
Seec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

2101.
2102.
2103.
2104.
2105.

2106.

2107.
2108.

2109.

2201.
2202.
2203.
2204.
2205.

2301.
2302.
2303.
2304.
2305.

2306.

2307.
2308.

2401.
2402.
2403.
2404.

2405.

2
TITLE XXI—ARMY

Authorized Army construction and land acquisition projects.

Family housing.

Improvements to military family housing units.

Authorization of appropriations, Army.

Termination of authority to carry out fiscal year 2007 Army
projects for which funds were not appropriated.

Modification of authority to carry out certain fiscal year 2006
project.

Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2005 project.

Technical amendments to the Military Construction Authorization
Act for 2007.

Ground lease, SOUTHCOM Headquarters Facility, Miami-Doral,
Florida.

TITLE XXII—NAVY

Authorized Navy construction and land acquisition projects.

Family housing.

Improvements to military family housing units.

Authorization of appropriations, Navy.

Termination of authority to carry out fiscal year 2007 Navy projects
for which funds were not appropriated.

TITLE XXIII—AIR FORCE

Authorized Air Force construction and land acquisition projects.

Family housing.

Improvements to military family housing units.

Authorization of appropriations, Air Force.

Termination of authority to carry out fiseal year 2007 Air Force
projects for which funds were not appropriated.

Modification of authority to carry out certain fiscal year 2006
project.

Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2005 projects.

Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2004 projects.

TITLE XXIV—DEFENSE AGENCIES

Authorized Defense Agencies construction and land acquisition
projects.

Energy conservation projects.

Authorization of appropriations, Defense Agencies.

Termination or modification of authority to carry out certain fiscal
year 2007 Defense Agencies projects.

Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2005 projects.

TITLE XXV—NORTIH ATLANTIC TREATY ORGANIZATION

2
2

501.
502.

SECURITY INVESTMENT PROGRAM

Authorized NATO construction and land acquisition projects.
Authorization of appropriations, NATO.

TITLE XXVI—GUARD AND RESERVE FORCES FACILITIES

2601.

Authorized Army National Guard construction and land acquisition
projects.

*S 1549 PCS



2602.
2603.

2604.

2605.

2606.
2607.

2608.

2609.
2610.

3

Authorized Army Reserve construction and land acquisition projects.

Authorized Navy Reserve and Marine Corps Reserve construction
and land acquisition projects.

Authorized Air National Guard construction and land acquisition
projects.

Authorized Air Force Reserve construction and land acquisition
projects.

Authorization of appropriations, Guard and Reserve.

Termination of authority to carry out fiscal year 2007 Guard and
Reserve projects for which funds were not appropriated.

Modification of authority to carry out fiscal year 2006 Air Force
Reserve construction and acquisition projects.

Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2005 projects.

Extension of authorizations of certain fiscal year 2004 projects.

TITLE XXVII—BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES

2701.

2702.

2703.

2704.

Authorization of appropriations for base closure and realignment ac-
tivities funded through Department of Defense Base Closure
Account 1990.

Authorized base closure and realignment activities funded through
Department of Defense Base Closure Account 2005.

Authorization of appropriations for base closure and realignment ac-
tivities funded through Department of Defense Base Closure
Account 2005.

Authorized cost and scope of work variations.

TITLE XXVIII—MILITARY CONSTRUCTION GENERAL PROVISIONS

See.
See.

Subtitle A—Effective Date and Expiration of Authorizations

2801.
2802.

Effective Date.
Expiration of authorizations and amounts required to be specified
by law.

Subtitle B—Military Construction Program and Military Family Housing

See.

See.

See.

See.

See.

See.

See.

2811.

2812.

2813.

2814.

2815.

2816.

2817.

Changes

General military construction transfer authority.

Modifications of authority to lease military family housing.

Increase in thresholds for unspecified minor military construction
projects.

Modification and extension of temporary, limited authority to use
operation and maintenance funds for construction projects out-
side the United States.

Temporary authority to support revitalization of Department of De-
fense laboratories through unspecified minor military construc-
tion projects.

Two-year extension of temporary program to use minor military con-
struction authority for construction of child development cen-

ters.
Extension of authority to accept equalization payments for facility
exchanges.

Subtitle C—Real Property and Facilities Administration

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N U B WL

See. 2831.
See. 2832.
See. 2833.

See. 2834.
See. 2835.

See. 2841.

See. 2851.
See. 2852,

See. 2853.

4

Requirement to report transactions resulting in annual costs of more
than $750,000.

Modification of authority to lease non-excess property.

Enhanced flexibility to create or expand buffer zones.

Reports on Army and Marine Corps operational ranges.

Consolidation of real property provisions without substantive
change.

Subtitle D—DBase Closure and Realignment
Niagara Air Reserve Base, New York, basing report.
Subtitle E—Land Conveyances

Land conveyance, Liynn Haven Fuel Depot, Lynn Haven, Florida.
Modification to land conveyance authority, Fort Bragg, North Caro-

lina.
Transfer of administrative jurisdiction, GSA property, Springfield,
Virginia.

Subtitle F—Other Matters

. Report on condition of schools under jurisdiction of Department of

Defense Education Activity.

. Repeal of requirement for study and report on impact to military

readiness of proposed land management changes on public
lands in Utah.

3. Additional project in Rhode Island.

TITLE XXIX—WAR-RELATED MILITARY CONSTRUCTION

See. 2901.

See. 2902.

AUTHORIZATIONS

Authorized war-related Army construction and land acquisition

projects.
Authorization of war-related military construction appropriations,
Army.

SEC. 3. CONGRESSIONAL DEFENSE COMMITTEES.

For purposes of this Act, the term “‘congressional de-

fense committees” has the meaning the given that term

in section 101(a)(16) of title 10, United States Code.

TITLE XXI—ARMY

SEC. 2101. AUTHORIZED ARMY CONSTRUCTION AND LAND

ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts

appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-

*S 1549 PCS



()}

I tions in section 2104(a)(1), the Secretary of the Army
may acquire real property and carry out military construc-
tion projects for the installations or locations inside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the fol-

9 B S S B O]

lowing table:
Army: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount
Alabama .......... Anniston Army Depot ... $26,000,000
Redstone Arsenal $20,000,000
Alaska .............. Fort Richardson $92,800,000
Fort Wainwright ... $114,500,000
Arizona ............ Fort Huachuca .........cooooiiiiiie $129,600,000
California ........ Fort Trwin oo $24,000,000
Presidio, Monterey ............ $28,000,000
Colorado ... Fort Carson ........cccceeenee.. $156,200,000
Delaware ... Dover Air Force Base ...... $17,500,000
Florida ............. Eglin Air Force Base $66,000,000
Miami Doral $237,000,000
Georgia ............ Fort Benning $185,800,000
Fort Stewart/Hunter Army Air Field ............... $123,500,000
Hawaii ............. Fort Shafter ......coccovieiiiiiiiiicceecee e $31,000,000
Schofield Barracks ........... $38,000,000
Wheeler Army Air Field ... $51,000,000
Iinois ............. Rock Island Arsenal ......... $3,350,000
Kansas ............ Fort Leavenworth ...........ccooooviiiiiiiiii $90,800,000
Fort Riley ..o $138,300,000
Kentucky ......... Fort Campbell .. $105,000,000
TFOTt KNOX e $6,700,000
Louisiana Fort Polk ..oooviiiiiiiiiciicececeee e $15,900,000
Maryland ... Aberdeen Proving Ground .... $12,200,000
Michigan .......... | Detroit Arsenal ..................... $18,500,000
Missouri ..... ... | Fort Leonard Wood ..........ccoccooeinn. $125,650,000
Nevada ............ Hawthorne Army Ammunition Plant ................. $11,800,000
New Mexico ..... White Sands Missile Range .........cccoovvviennnnne. $71,000,000
New York ........ Fort Drum $291,000,000
North Carolina | Fort Brage $275,600,000
Oklahoma ........ Fort Sill oo $6,200,000
South Carolina Fort Jackson . $35,000,000
Texas ...ocoevveens Camp Bullis ...coooovviiiiiiiice e $1,600,000
FOrt BISS oo $111,900,000
Fort Hood ...cocovveviennnne. $145,400,000
Fort Sam Houston ........... $19,150,000
Red River Army Depot ..... $9,200,000
Virginia ........... Fort Belvoir ... $13,000,000
Fort Eustis ...oooooiiiniic $75,000,000
Fort Liee ........ $16,700,000
Fort Myer ..o $20,800,000
Washington ..... Fort Lewis ..o $164,600,000
Yakima Training Center ........c.coocveviieeinnnennnn. $29,000,000
6 (b) OUuTSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts

7 appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-

*S 1549 PCS



9 B S S B O]

14
15
16
17
18

6
tions in section 2104(a)(2), the Secretary of the Army

may acquire real property and carry out military construc-
tion projects for the installations or locations outside the
United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the fol-

lowing table:

Army: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Bulgaria ..., Nevo Selo FOS i $61,000,000
FETTNAILY c.vveenveeiieeerienieeene Arafenwoelr ........occoevieviiiiie e $62,000,000
Honduras ......ccccoeeeveiiinnnnnn. Soto Cano Air Base ..oooeeeeeeeeeeec. $2,550,000
Ttaly oo Vicenza ......... T $173,000,000
Korea ..oooooovviviiiiiii, Camp Humphreys .......ccccooeveevieniieinens $57,000,000
Romania .....ccoooeevivennnnn. Mihail Kogalniceanu FOS .................... $12,600,000

SEC. 2102. FAMILY HOUSING.

(a)  CONSTRUCTION AND  AcCQUISITION.—Using
amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of ap-
propriations in section 2104 (a)(5)(A), the Secretary of the
Army may construct or acquire family housing units (in-
cluding land acquisition and supporting facilities) at the
installations or locations, in the number of units, and n

the amounts set forth in the following table:

Army: Family Housing

Country Installation or Location Units Amount

Germany .................. AnSbach cooooeeee e, 138 ... $52,000,000

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appro-
priated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in
section 2104(a)(5)(A), the Secretary of the Army may
carry out architectural and engineering services and con-
struction design activities with respect to the construction

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\ I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0N N N RN = O

7

or improvement of family housing units in an amount not

to exceed $2,000,000.

SEC. 2103. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING
UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States
Code, and using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2104(a)(5)(A),
the Secretary of the Army may improve existing military
family housing units in an amount not to exceed
$365,400,000.

SEC. 2104. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, ARMY.

Funds

(a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.
are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal years
beginning after September 30, 2007, for military con-
struction, land acquisition, and military family housing
functions of the Department of the Army in the total
amount of $5,218,067,000 as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the

United States authorized by section 2101(a),

$3,254,250,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside

the United States authorized by section 2101(b),

$295,150,000.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

8

(3) For unspecified minor military construction
projects authorized by section 2805 of title 10,
United States Code, $23,000,000.

(4) For architectural and engineering services
and construction design under section 2807 of title
10, United States Code, $333,947,000.

(5) For military family housing functions:

(A) For construction and acquisition, plan-
ning and design, and improvement of military
family housing and facilities, $419,400,000.

(B) For support of military family housing
(including the functions described in section
2833 of title 10, United States Code),
$742,920,000.

(6) For the construction of increment 3 of a
barracks complex at Fort Bragg, North Carolina,
authorized by section 2101(a) of the Military Con-
struction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006
(division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3485), $47,400,000.

(7) For the construction of increment 2 of a
barracks complex at Fort Lewis, Washington, au-
thorized by section 2101(a) of the Military Construc-
tion Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (divi-
sion B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2445), as

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N B W=

|\ I N© TR NG I NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VLV 00O NN O B BN~ WD = O

9

amended by section 20814 of the Continuing Appro-

priations Resolution, 2007 (division B of Public Law

109-289), as added by section 2 of the Revised Con-

tinuing Appropriations Resolution, 2007 (Public

Law 110-5), $102,000,000.

(b) LIMITATION ON TOTAL COST OF CONSTRUCTION
ProJECTS.—Notwithstanding the cost variations author-
ized by section 2853 of title 10, United States Code, and
any other cost variation authorized by law, the total cost
of all projects carried out under section 2101 of this Act
may not exceed the sum of the following:

(1) The total amount authorized to be appro-
priated under paragraphs (1) and (2) of subsection
(a).

(2) $204,000,000 (the balance of the amount
authorized under section 2101(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007
(Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat 2445), as amended
by section 20814 of the Continuing Appropriations
Resolution, 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-
289) (as added by section 2 of the Revised Con-
tinuing Appropriations Resolution, 2007 (Public
Law 110-5)), for construction of a brigade complex

for Fort Lewis, Washington).

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N B W =

| \O I \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R, WD = O

10
(3) $37,000,000 (the balance of the amount au-

thorized under section 2101(b) for construction of a
bricade complex operations support facility at
Vicenza, Italy).

(4) $36,000,000 (the balance of the amount au-

thorized under section 2101(b) for construction of a

bricade complex barracks and community support

facility at Vicenza, Italy).
SEC. 2105. TERMINATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT
FISCAL YEAR 2007 ARMY PROJECTS FOR
WHICH FUNDS WERE NOT APPROPRIATED.

(a) TERMINATION OF INSIDE THE UNITED STATES
ProJECTS.—The table in section 2101(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (di-
vision B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2445), as
amended by section 20814 of the Continuing Appropria-
tions Resolution, 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-
289), as added by section 2 of the Revised Continuing Ap-
propriations Resolution, 2007 (Public Law 110-5), is fur-
ther amended—

(1) by striking the item relating to Redstone

Arsenal, Alabama;

(2) by striking the item relating to Fort Wain-

wright, Alaska;

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

11

(3) in the item relating to Fort Irwin, Cali-
fornia, by striking “$18,200,000” in the amount col-
umn and inserting “$10,000,000";

(4) in the item relating to Fort Carson, Colo-
rado, by striking “$30,800,000” in the amount col-
umn and inserting “$24,000,000";

(5) 1 the item relating to Fort Leavenworth,
Kansas, by striking “$23,200,000” in the amount
column and inserting “$15,000,000;

(6) 1n the item relating to Fort Riley, Kansas,
by striking “$47,400,000” in the amount column
and inserting “$37,200,000";

(7) in the item relating to Fort Campbell, Ken-
tucky, by striking “$135,300,000” in the amount
column and inserting “$115,400,000;

(8) by striking the item relating to Fort Polk,
Louisiana;

(9) by striking the item relating to Aberdeen
Proving Ground, Maryland;

(10) by striking the item relating to Fort
Detrick, Maryland;

(11) by striking the item relating to Detroit Ar-

senal, Michigan;

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

12

(12) in the item relating to Fort Leonard
Wood, Missouri, by striking “$34,500,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$17,000,000";

(13) by striking the item relating to Picatinny
Arsenal, New Jersey;

(14) in the item relating to Fort Drum, New
York, by striking “$218,600,000” in the amount
column and inserting “$209,200,000”;

(15) in the item relating to Fort Bragg, North
Carolina, by striking “$96,900,000” in the amount
column and inserting “$89,000,000”;

(16) by striking the item relating to
Letterkenny Depot, Pennsylvania;

(17) by striking the item relating to Corpus
Christi Army Depot, Texas;

(18) by striking the item relating to Fort Bliss,
Texas;

(19) in the item relating to Fort Hood, Texas,
by striking “$93,000,000” in the amount column
and inserting “$75,000,000”;

(20) by striking the item relating to Red River
Depot, Texas; and

(21) by striking the item relating to Fort Lee,

Virginia.

*S 1549 PCS



13

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 2104(a)
of such Act (120 Stat. 2447) 1s amended—

(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by
striking “$3,518,450,000” and inserting
“$3,275,700,000”’; and

(2) in  paragraph (1), by  striking
“$1,362,200,000” and inserting “$1,119,450,000”.

SEC. 2106. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT
CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006 PROJECT.

(a) MODIFICATION.—The table in section 2101(a) of
the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3485) 1s amended in the item relating to Fort Bragg,
North Carolina, by striking “$301,250,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$308,250,000”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section
2104(b)(5) of that Act (119 Stat. 3488) is amended by
striking “$77,400,000” and inserting ““$84,400,000”.
SEC. 2107. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN

FISCAL YEAR 2005 PROJECT.

(a) EXTENSION AND RENEWAL.—Notwithstanding
section 2701 of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public Law 108—
375; 118 Stat. 2116), the authorization set forth in the

table in subsection (b), as provided in section 2101 of that

*S 1549 PCS



Y B S S B O]

O o0 3 A

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

14
Act, shall remain in effect until October 1, 2008, or the

date of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for mili-
tary construction for fiscal year 2009, whichever is later.
(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a)

1s as follows:

Army: Extension of 2005 Project Authorization

Installation or Location Project Amount

Schofield Barracks, Hawaii .............. Training facility ........cccocceeeee $35,542,000

SEC. 2108. TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS TO THE MILITARY
CONSTRUCTION AUTHORIZATION ACT FOR
2007.
(a) TECHNICAL AMENDMENT TO SPECIFY LLOCATION
OF PROJECT IN ROMANIA.—The table in section 2101(b)
of the Military Construction Authorization Act for 2007
(division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2446) is
amended by striking “Babadag Range” and inserting
“Mihail Kogalniceanu Air Base’ .
(b) TECHONICAL AMENDMENT TO CORRECT PRINT-
ING ERROR RELATING TO ARMY FaMmiLy HousING.—The
table in section 2102(a) of the Military Construction Au-
thorization Act for 2007 (division B of Public Law 109—
364; 120 Stat. 2446) is amended by striking “Fort

MecCoyine” and inserting “Fort McCoy”.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ JEEN N© T N R NG T NG T NG R NS R e e T e T e T e T T N
A NN A WD = O 0O 00NN B W N —= O

15
SEC. 2109. GROUND LEASE, SOUTHCOM HEADQUARTERS

FACILITY, MIAMI-DORAL, FLORIDA.

(a) GROUND LEASE AUTHORIZED.—The Secretary of
the Army may utilize the State of Florida property as de-
sceribed 1n sublease number 4489-01, entered into between
the State of Florida and the United States (in this section
referred to as the “ground lease), for the purpose of con-
structing a consolidated headquarters facility for the
United States Southern Command (SOUTHCOM).

The

(b) ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
Secretary of the Army may carry out the project to con-
struct a new headquarters on property leased from the
State of Florida when the following conditions have been
met regarding the lease for the property:

(1) The United States Government shall have
the right to use the property without interruption
until at least December 31, 2055.

(2) The United States Government shall have
the right to use the property for general administra-
tive purposes in the event the United States South-
ern Command relocates or vacates the property.

(¢) AUTHORITY TO OBTAIN GROUND LIEASE OF AD-
JACENT PROPERTY.—The Secretary may obtain the
eround lease of additional real property owned by the
State of Florida that is adjacent to the real property
leased under the ground lease for purposes of completing

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\O T \© R (O R S i e e e e e e e T
N = O 00N R WD = O

16
the construction of the SOUTIHCOM headquarters facil-

ity, as long as the additional terms of the ground lease
required by subsection (b) apply to such adjacent prop-
erty.

(d) LiMrtATION.—The Secretary may not obligate or
expend funds appropriated pursuant to the authorization
of appropriations in section 2104(a)(1) for the construc-
tion of the SOUTHCOM headquarters facility authorized
under section 2101(a) until the Secretary transmits to the
congressional defense committees a modification to the
eround lease signed by the United States Government and
the State of Florida in accordance with subsection (b).

TITLE XXII—NAVY
SEC. 2201. AUTHORIZED NAVY CONSTRUCTION AND LAND
ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts
appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-
tions in section 2204(a)(1), the Secretary of the Navy may
acquire real property and carry out military construction
projects for the installations or locations inside the United

States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following

table:
Navy: Inside the United States
State Installation or Location Amount
Alabama .......... Outlying Field Evergreen ...........ccccoevvvvieiniieen. $9,560,000
Arizona ........... Marine Corps Air Station, Yuma ........cccccceeneene $33,720,000
California ........ Marine Corps Base, Camp Pendleton ................ $366,394,000
Marine Corps Air Station, Miramar ................... $26,760,000
Naval Station, San Diego .........ccccceeeviiviiennnnn. $23,630,000

*S 1549 PCS



~N O D kAW

Navy: Inside the United States—Continued

17

State Installation or Location Amount
Marine Corps Base, Twentynine Palms ............. $147,059,000
Connecticut ..... Naval Submarine Base, New London ................ $11,900,000
Florida ............. Marine Corps Logistics Base, Blount Island ..... $7,570,000
Cape Canaveral ..........coccooviiiiiiiiinieiceeeee e $9,900,000
Naval Surface Warfare Center, Panama City .... $13,870,000
Hawaii ............. Marine Corps Air Station, Kaneohe ................... $37,961,000
Naval Base, Pearl Harbor ..o $99,860,000
Naval Shipyard, Pearl Harbor ............cccccceeniee $30,200,000
Naval Station Pearl Harbor, Wahiawa .............. $65,410,000
Ilinois ............. Naval Training Center, Great Lakes ................. $10,221,000
Indiana ............ Naval Support Activity, Crane ..........ccccoeeveeenrne $12,000,000
Maryland ......... Naval Air Warfare Center, Patuxent River ....... 38,360,000
Maine ... Naval Shipyard, Portsmouth ..........c.cccovvienin. $9,700,000
Mississippi ....... Naval Air Station, Meridian ...........cccocceevvieenrn. $6,770,000
Nevada ............ Naval Air Station, Fallon ..........cccooceiiiniinnn. $11,460,000
New Jersey ...... Naval Air Station, Lakehurst ...........ccccoooieins $4,100,000
North Carolina | Marine Corps Air Station, Cherry Point ............ $28,610,000
Marine Corps Air Station, New River ............... $54,430,000
Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune ................... $278,070,000
Rhode Island ... | Naval Station, Newport ........cccccoevcievvieiiieniennnnn $9,990,000
South Carolina | Marine Corps Air Station, Beaufort ................. $6,300,000
Marine Corps Reeruit Depot, Parris Island ....... $55,282,000
Texas ..ooooeveenns Naval Air Station, Corpus Christi ........cccceeeneenne $14,290,000
Virginia ........... Naval Support Activity, Chesapeake .................. $8,450,000
Naval Station, Norfolk .........cccoeeiviiiiiiniiiiens $79,560,000
Marine Corps Base, Quantico .......... $50,519,000
Washington ..... Naval Station, Bremerton .... $119,760,000
Naval Station, Everett .................... $10,940,000
Naval Air Station, Whidbey Island .................... $23,910,000

(b) OUuTSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts
appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-
tions in section 2204(a)(2), the Secretary of the Navy may
acquire real property and carry out military construction
projects for the installations or locations outside the
United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the fol-

lowing table:
Navy: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Bahrain .......ccococoeviiinn.. Naval Support Activity, Bahrain .......... $35,500,000
Diego Garcia ......cccveenee.. Naval Support Facility, Diego Garcia .. $7,150,000
Djibouti ..ocovveviiiiiiee, Camp Lemonier ........ocoevvviiiiiieiiee $22.390,000
GUAML oo Naval Activities, Guam ...........ccocceeeueene $273,518,000

*S 1549 PCS



AN LN B~ W

10
11
12
13
14

15
16
17
18
19

18

(¢) UNSPECIFIED WORLDWIDE.—Using amounts ap-
propriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations
in section 2204(a)(3), the Secretary of the Navy may ac-
quire real property and carry out military construction
projects for unspecified installations or locations in the

amount set forth in the following table:

Navy: Unspecified Worldwide

Location Installation or Location Amount
Worldwide Unspecified Whart Utilities Upgrade ..........ccceenee.. $8,900,000
Host Nation Infrastructure .................. $2,700,000

SEC. 2202. FAMILY HOUSING.

(a) CONSTRUCTION AND  AcCQUISITION.—Using
amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of ap-
propriations in section 2204 (a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the
Navy may construct or acquire family housing units (in-
cluding land acquisition and supporting facilities) at the
installation, in the number of units, and in the amount

set forth in the following table:

Navy: Family Housing

Location Installation Units Amount

Mariana Islands ....... Naval Activities, Guam ................. 73 ... $47,167,000

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appro-
priated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in
section 2204(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Navy may
carry out architectural and engineering services and con-

struction design activities with respect to the construction

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG N NG I NS B S e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N e = N RNe - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

19
or improvement of military family housing units in an
amount not to exceed $3,172,000.
SEC. 2203. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING
UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States
Code, and using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2204(a)(6)(A),
the Secretary of the Navy may improve existing military
family housing units in an amount not to exceed
$237,990,000.

SEC. 2204. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, NAVY.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for mili-
tary construction, land acquisition, and military family
housing functions of the Department of the Navy in the
total amount of $3,032,790,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the

United States authorized by section 2201(a),

$1,717,016,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside

the United States authorized by section 2201(b),

$338,558,000.

(3) For military construction projects at un-
specified worldwide locations authorized by section

2201(c), $11,600,000.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

20

(4) For unspecified minor military construction
projects authorized by section 2805 of title 10,
United States Code, $10,000,000.

(5) For architectural and engineering services
and construction design under section 2807 of title
10, United States Code, $119,658,000.

(6) For military family housing functions:

(A) For construction and acquisition, plan-
ning and design, and improvement of military
family housing and facilities, $300,095,000.

(B) For support of military family housing
(including functions described in section 2833
of title 10, United States Code), $371,404,000.
(7) For the construction of increment 2 of the

construction of an addition to the National Maritime
Intelligence Center, Suitland, Maryland, authorized
by section 2201(a) of the Military Construction Au-
thorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of
Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2448), $52,069,000.

(8) For the construction of increment 3 of re-
cruit training barracks infrastructure upgrade at
Recruit Training Command, Great Liakes, Illinois,
authorized by section 2201(a) of the Military Con-

struction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

21
(division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.

3490), $16,650,000.

(9) For the construction of increment 3 of
wharf upgrades at Yokosuka, Japan, authorized by
section 2201(b) of the Military Construction Author-
ization Act of Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public
Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3490), $8,750,000.

(10) For the construction of increment 2 of the
Bachelor Enlisted Quarters Homeport Ashore Pro-
oram at Bremerton, Washington, authorized by sec-
tion 2201(a) of the Military Construction Authoriza-
tion Act of Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public
Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3490), $47,240,000.

(11) For the construction of increment 4 of the
limited area production and storage complex at
Naval Submarine Base Kitsap, Silverdale, Wash-
ington, authorized by section 2201(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2005
(division B of Public Law 108-375; 118 =Stat.
2105), as amended by section 2206 of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006
(division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3493), $39,750,000.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 O D kA WD =

[\ TR N© I NS B NG T NG I NS R NS R e e e T e e e T e T
A NN Bl WD = O O 0NN B W N —= O

22
SEC. 2205. TERMINATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT

FISCAL YEAR 2007 NAVY PROJECTS FOR
WHICH FUNDS WERE NOT APPROPRIATED.

(a) TERMINATION OF INSIDE THE UNITED STATES
ProJecTs.—The table in section 2201(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (di-
vision B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2449) is
amended—

(1) in the item relating to Marine Corps Base,
Twentynine  Palms,  California, by  striking
“$27,217,000” in the amount column and inserting
“$8,217,0007;

(2) by striking the item relating to Naval Sup-
port Activity, Monterey, California;

(3) by striking the item relating to Naval Sub-
marine Base, New London, Connecticut;

(4) by striking the item relating to Cape Canav-
eral, Florida;

(5) in the item relating to Marine Corps Logis-
tics  Base, Albany, Georgia, by  striking
“$70,540,000” in the amount column and inserting
“$62,000,000;

(6) by striking the item relating to Naval Mag-
azine, Pearl Harbor, Hawaii;

(7) by striking the item relating to Naval Ship-
vard, Pearl Harbor, Hawaii;

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

23

(8) by striking the item relating to Naval Sup-
port Activity, Crane, Indiana;

(9) by striking the item relating to Portsmouth
Naval Shipyard, Maine;

(10) by striking the item relating to Naval Air
Station, Meridian, Mississippi;

(11) by striking the item relating to Naval Air
Station, Fallon, Nevada;

(12) by striking the item relating to Marine
Corps Air Station, Cherry Point, North Carolina;

(13) by striking the item relating to Naval Sta-
tion, Newport, Rhode Island;

(14) in the item relating to Marine Corps Air
Station, Beaufort, South Carolina, by striking
“$25,575,000” in the amount column and inserting
“$22,225,0007;

(15) by striking the item relating to Naval Spe-
cial Weapons Center, Dahlgren, Virginia;

(16) in the item relating to Naval Support Ac-
tivity, Norfolk, Virginia, by striking “$41,712,000
in the amount column and inserting “$28,462,000"’;

(17) in the item relating to Naval Air Station,
Whidbey  Island,  Washington, by  striking
“$67,303,000” in the amount column and inserting

“$57,653,000”; and

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W=

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
LN A W D= OO0 NN N N B, WD = O

24
(18) in the item relating to Naval Base, Kitsap,
Washington, by striking “$17,617,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$13,507,000”.
(b) TERMINATION OF MILITARY FamiLy HOUSING
Section 2204(a)(6)(A) of such Act (120
Stat. 2450) is amended by striking “$308,956,000” and

PROJECTS.

inserting “$305,256,000".

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 2204 (a) of

such Act, as amended by subsection (b), is further amend-
ed—

(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by
striking “$2,109,367,000” and inserting
“$1,946,867,000’; and

(2) in  paragraph (1), by  striking
“$832,982,000” and inserting “$674,182,000”.

TITLE XXIII—AIR FORCE
SEC. 2301. AUTHORIZED AIR FORCE CONSTRUCTION AND
LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

(a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts
appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-
tions in section 2304(a)(1), the Secretary of the Air Force
may acquire real property and carry out military construc-
tion projects for the installations or locations inside the
United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the fol-

lowing table:

*S 1549 PCS



[E—

~N O D AW

25

Air Force: Inside the United States

State Installation or Location Amount
Alaska Elmendorf Air Forece Base ........oooeeveinnnn. $83,180,000
Arizona Davis-Monthan Air Force Base ... $11,200,000
Arkansas .................. Little Rock Air Force Base ......cccccooveen. $9,800,000
California ................. Travis Air Force Base .....cooccooevviiviiiinnn.. $26,600,000
Colorado .....ccceeneenne Fort Carson $13,500,000

Schriever Air Force Base ... $24,500,000
United States Air Force Academy ............. $15,000,000
District of Columbia | Bolling Air Force Base ......cccoooveviieniennn. $2.500,000
Florida .....c..c..ccoevnnns Eelin Air Force Base .....oocccooovviiiiiiiiiiinns $158,300,000
MacDill Air Force Base ....oooooveeiiiiiiinn, $57,000,000
Patrick Air Force Base ......ccccooveviiiinn, $11,854,000
Tyndall Air Force Base ........ccccoovvveiieeninn. $44,114,000
Georgia .....oocveeenennnn Robins Air Force Base $14,700,000
Hawaii ....c..oooeveeennnn. Hickam Air Force Base $31,971,000
Tnois ...ocooeevevveeennnen. Scott Air Force Base ..oooooovvviveiiiiiiiiiennn. $24,900,000
Kansas .. | Fort Riley $12,515,000
Massachusetts .......... Hanscom Air Force Base ... $12,800,000
Montana ................... Malmstrom Air Force Base ..o $7,000,000
Nebraska ......... Offutt Air Force Base .....cccoooviviiiiiieiens $16,952,000
New Mexico Cannon Air Force Base ........cccovvieiiivenine $1,688,000
Kirtland Air Force Base .......ccccoevviiiiiinnns $11,400,000
Nevada ...cococevveenniene Nellis Air Force Base .....cccccoovvvviiniiines $4,950,000
North Dakota Grand Forks Air Force Base ... $13,000,000
Minot Air Force Base ....oooooviiiiiiiiin, $18,200,000
Oklahoma ................. Altus Air Foree Base ..o, $2,000,000
Tinker Air Force Base .....ccccooveiiiiiiiinnnn. $34,600,000
Vance Air Force Base .............. $7,700,000
South Carolina ......... Charleston Air Force Base ..........ccceeene. $11,000,000
South Dakota ........... Ellsworth Air Force Base .....ccccoooeevieneen. $16,600,000
Texas Lackland Air Force Base ......... $14,000,000
Utah Il Air Foree Base ...ooooovviiiiiiiiiiiee $25,999,000
Wyoming ................. Francis E. Warren Air Force Base ........... $14,600,000

(b) OUTSIDE THE UNITED STATES.

Using amounts

appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-

tions in section 2304(a)(2), the Secretary of the Air Force

may acquire real property and carry out military construc-

tion projects for the installations or locations outside the

United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the fol-

lowing table:

Air Force: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
FEIMNANY  vveeivieeeireeenereeanns Ramstein Air Base .....cccccooviviviiiinnnn. $48,209,000
GUAIM e Andersen Air Force Base ... $10,000,000
Qatar ..........cceeeeeviiiieiiienn. Al Udeid Air Base ......ooovvevviieeiieenn. $22,300,000
SPAIN. e Moron Air Base .....coceviiniiiiiiieie $1,800,000
United Kingdom ............... Royal Air Force Liakenheath ............... $17,300,000

*S 1549 PCS




o)

10
11
12
13
14

15
16
17

26

Air Force: Outside the United States—Continued

Country

Installation or Location

Amount

Royal Air Force Menwith Hill Station

$41,000,000

(¢) UNSPECIFIED WORLDWIDE.—Using amounts ap-

propriated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations

in section 2304(a)(3), the Secretary of the Air Force may

acquire real property and carry out military construction

projects for unspecified installations or locations in the

amounts set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Unspecified Worldwide

Location

Installation or Location

Amount

Worldwide Classified ...

..... Classified Project ......ccocoovvviiiiiiiinnnnne
Classified-Special Evaluation Program

$1,500,000
$13,940,000

SEC. 2302. FAMILY HOUSING.

(a) CONSTRUCTION

AND  ACQUISITION.—Using

amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of ap-

propriations in section 2304(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the

Air Force may construct or acquire family housing units

(including land acquisition and supporting facilities) at the

installation or location, in the number of units, and in the

amount set forth in the following table:

Air Force: Family Housing

State or Country

Installation or Location

Units

Amount

Germany ........ccccceeee..

Ramstein Air Base ........................

117 ...

$56,275,000

(b) PLANNING AND DESIGN.—Using amounts appro-

priated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in

section 2304(a)(6)(A), the Secretary of the Air Force may

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG N N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ N N O N N s = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~SU O I NO S e

27

carry out architectural and engineering services and con-

struction design activities with respect to the construction

or improvement of military family housing units in an

amount not to exceed $12,210,000.

SEC. 2303. IMPROVEMENTS TO MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING
UNITS.

Subject to section 2825 of title 10, United States
Code, and using amounts appropriated pursuant to the
authorization of appropriations in section 2304(a)(6)(A),
the Secretary of the Air Force may improve existing mili-
tary family housing units in an amount not to exceed
$294,262,000.

SEC. 2304. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, AIR
FORCE.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for mili-
tary construction, land acquisition, and military family
housing functions of the Department of the Air Force in
the total amount of $2,097,357,000, as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the

United States authorized by section 2301(a),

$754,123,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside

the United States authorized by section 2301(b),

$140,609,000.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

28

(3) For the military construction projects at
unspecified worldwide locations authorized by section
2301(¢), $15,440,000.

(4) For unspecified minor military construction
projects authorized by section 2805 of title 10,
United States Code, $15,000,000.

(5) For architectural and engineering services
and construction design under section 2807 of title
10, United States Code, $61,103,000.

(6) For military family housing functions:

(A) For construction and acquisition, plan-
ning and design, and improvement of military
family housing and facilities, $362,747,000.

(B) For support of military family housing
(including functions described in section 2833
of title 10, United States Code), $688,335,000.
(7) For the construction of increment 3 of the

main base runway at Edwards Air Force Base, Cali-
fornia, authorized by section 2301(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006
(division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3494), $35,000,000.

(8) For the construction of increment 3 of the
CENTCOM Joint Intelligence Center at MacDill Air

Force Base, Florida, authorized by section 2301 (a)

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N Bk W =

O TN NG TN N T NG N NS I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N e = N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

29

of the Military Construction Authorization Act for
Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-
163; 119 Stat. 3494), as amended by section 2305
of the Military Construction Authorization Act for
Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-
364; 120 Stat. 2456), $25,000,000.
SEC. 2305. TERMINATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT
FISCAL YEAR 2007 AIR FORCE PROJECTS FOR
WHICH FUNDS WERE NOT APPROPRIATED.
(a) TERMINATION OF INSIDE THE UNITED STATES

ProJECTS.—The table in section 2301(a) of the Military

Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (di-
vision B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2453) is
amended—

(1) in the item relating to Elmendorf, Alaska,
by striking “$68,100,000” in the amount column
and inserting “$56,100,000”;

(2) in the item relating to Davis-Monthan Air
Force Base, Arizona, by striking “$11,800,000” in
the amount column and inserting “$4,600,000"’;

(3) by striking the item relating to Little Rock
Air Force Base, Arkansas;

(4) in the item relating to Travis Air Force
Base, California, by striking “$85,800,000” in the

amount column and inserting “$73,900,000";

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

30

(5) by striking the item relating to Peterson Air
Force Base, Colorado;

(6) in the item relating to Dover Air Force,
Delaware, by striking “$30,400,000” in the amount
column and inserting “$26,400,000”;

(7) in the item relating to Eglin Air Force
Base, Florida, by striking “$30,350,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$19,350,000”;

(8) in the item relating to Tyndall Air Force
Base, Florida, by striking “$8,200,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$1,800,000”;

(9) in the item relating to Robins Air Force
Base, Georgia, by striking “$59,600,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$38,600,000";

(10) in the item relating to Scott Air Force, Il-
linois, by striking “$28,200,000” in the amount col-
umn and inserting “$20,000,000”’;

(11) by striking the item relating to McConnell
Air Force Base, Kansas;

(12) by striking the item relating to Hanscom
Air Force Base, Massachusetts;

(13) by striking the item relating to Whiteman
Air Force Base, Missouri;

(14) by striking the item relating to Malmstrom

Air Force Base, Montana;

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

31

(15) in the item relating to McGuire Air Force
Base, New Jersey, by striking “$28,500,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$15,500,000";

(16) by striking the item relating to Kirtland
Air Force Base, New Mexico;

(17) by striking the item relating to Minot Air
Force Base, North Dakota;

(18) in the item relating to Altus Air Force
Base, Oklahoma, by striking “$9,500,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$1,500,000"’;

(19) by striking the item relating to Tinker Air
Force Base, Oklahoma;

(20) by striking the item relating to Charleston
Air Force Base, South Carolina;

(21) in the item relating to Shaw Air Force
Base, South Carolina, by striking “$31,500,000” in
the amount column and inserting “$22,200,000";

(22) by striking the item relating to Ellsworth
Air Forece Base, South Dakota;

(23) by striking the item relating to Liaughlin
Air Force Base, Texas;

(24) by striking the item relating to Sheppard

Air Force Base, Texas;

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O T NO I e

32

(25) in the item relating to Iill Air Force
Base, Utah, by striking “$63,400,000” in the
amount column and inserting “$53,400,000”’; and

(26) by striking the item relating to Fairchild
Air Force Base, Washington.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 2304(a)
of such Act (120 Stat. 2455) is amended—

(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by
striking “$3,231,442,000” and inserting
“$3,005,817,000’; and

(2) in  paragraph (1), by  striking
“$962,286,000” and inserting “$736,661,000”".

SEC. 2306. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT
CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR 2006 PROJECT.

(a) MODIFICATION.—The table in section 2301(a) of
the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3494), as amended by section 2305(a) of the Military Con-
struction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division
B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2456), is further
amended in the item relating to MacDill Air Force Base,
Florida, by striking “$101,500,000” in the amount col-
umn and inserting “$126,500,000”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 2304(b)(4)

of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal

*S 1549 PCS



S O 0 N N B W

e T S e e S Y
AN LN B~ WD -

33
Year 2006 (119 Stat. 3496), as amended by section
2305(b) of the Military Construction Authorization Act
for Fiscal Year 2007 (120 Stat. 2456), is further amended
by striking “$23,300,000” and inserting “$48,300,000”.
SEC. 2307. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN
FISCAL YEAR 2005 PROJECTS.

(a) EXTENSION AND RENEWAL.—Notwithstanding
section 2701 of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public Law 108—
375; 118 Stat. 2116), authorizations set forth in the table
in subsection (b), as provided in section 2302 of that Act,
shall remain in effect until October 1, 2008, or the date
of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for military
construction for fiscal year 2009, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a)

1s as follows:

Air Force: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations

Installation or Location Project Amount

Davis-Monthan Air Force Base, Ari- | Family housing (250 units) .. $48,500,000
zZona.

Vandenberg Air Force Base, Cali- | Family housing (120 units) .. $30,906,000
fornia.

MaeDill Air Force Base, Florida ..... Family housing (61 units) .... $21,723,000
MaeDill Air Force Base, Florida Housing maintenance facility $1,250,000

Columbus Air Foree DBase, Mis- | Housing management facility $711,000
Sissippi.

Whiteman Air Force Base, Missouri | Family housing (160 units) .. $37,087,000

Seymour Johnson Air Force Base, | Family housing (167 units) .. $32,693,000
North Carolina.

Goodfellow Air Force Base, Texas ... | Family housing (127 units) .. $20,604,000

Ramstein Air Base, Germany .......... USAFE Theater Aerospace $24,024,000

Operations Support Center.

*S 1549 PCS



34
1 SEC. 2308. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN
FISCAL YEAR 2004 PROJECTS.

(a) EXTENSION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of

the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fisecal

2

3

4

5 Year 2004 (division B of Public Law 108-136; 117 Stat.
6 1716), authorizations set forth in the table in subsection
7 (b), as provided in section 2302 of that Act and extended
8 by section 2702 of the Military Construction Authoriza-
9 tion Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law
10 109-364; 120 Stat. 2464), shall remain in effect until Oc-
11 tober 1, 2008, or the date of the enactment of an Act
12 authorizing funds for military construction for fiscal year
13 2009, whichever is later.

14 (b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a)

15 1s as follows:

Air Force: Extension of 2004 Project Authorizations

Installation or Location Project Amount
Travis Air Force Base, California .... | Family housing (56 units) .... $12,723,000
Eelin Air Force Base, Florida ......... Family housing (279 units) .. $32,166,000

16 TITLE XXIV—DEFENSE
17 AGENCIES

18 SEC. 2401. AUTHORIZED DEFENSE AGENCIES CONSTRUC-

19 TION AND LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.
20 (a) INSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts

21 appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-

22 tions in section 2403(a)(1), the Secretary of Defense may

*S 1549 PCS



35
acquire real property and carry out military construction
projects for the installations or locations inside the United

States, and in the amounts, set forth in the following ta-

A~ WL P

bles:

Defense Education Activity

State Installation or Location Amount
North Carolina | Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune ...........cceeees $2,014,000
Defense Intelligence Agency

State Installation or Location Amount
District of Columbia .. | Bolling Air Force Base ......ccoooveiiiiiinnnn. $1,012,000
Defense Logistics Agency

State Installation or Location Amount
California ......... Port Lloma ANNex ....coooovvviiiieee e $140,000,000
Florida ............. Naval Air Station, Key West .....cccooevvevvenieiiiennnne $1,874,000
Hawaii ............. Iickam Air Force Base ........ccoceviiiiiiiiiiiiiei, $26,000,000
New Mexico ..... Kirtland Air Force Base .....ccccoooiiviviiiiiiiiiies $1,800,000
Ohio ..ooveveenene. Defense Supply Center Columbus .........ccccovvennennee. $4,000,000
Pennsylvania .... | Defense Distribution Depot, New Cumberland ..... $21,000,000
Virginia ............ Fort Belvoir ... $5,000,000

National Security Agency

State Installation or Location Amount

Maryland ......... Fort Meade ....c.ooovvevviieiieiecieeieeece e $11,901,000
Special Operations Command

State Installation or Location Amount
California ......... Marine Corps Base, Camp Pendleton .................... $20,030,000
Naval Amphibious Base, Coronado $12,000,000
Florida ............. Hurlburt Field ... $29,111,000
MaeDill Air Force Base ... $47,700,000
Georgia ............ Fort Benning .........ococooviiiiiiiiioiiecee e $35,000,000
Hunter Army Air Field ......ooocoooiiiiiiiiiiiis $13,800,000
Kentucky ......... Fort Campbell ..o $53,500,000
Mississippi ....... Stennis Space Center .......ooviiiiiieeiiieeeieeeen. $10,200,000
New Mexico ..... Cannon Air Force Base .........coooeviviiiiiiiiiice. $7,500,000
North Carolina | Fort Brage ........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeee $47,250,000
Marine Corps Base, Camp Lejeune .......oooooeveens $28,210,000
Virginia ............ Dam Neck ..o $108,500,000
Naval Amphibious Base, Little Creek .................... $99,000,000
Washington ...... Fort Tewis oo $77,000,000

*S 1549 PCS




36
TRICARE Management Activity

State Installation or Location Amount
Florida ............. MaceDill Air Force Base ....ccccooveeniiiiiininiiice. $5,000,000
Ilinois .............. Naval Hospital, Great Liakes ........ccccoeviveviinennnnn.. $99,000,000
New York ........ Fort Drum $41,000,000
Texas ..ococeeenee.. Camp Bullis ...ooooeiiiie e $7,400,000
Virginia ............ Naval Station, Norfolk ..........cccccvvviiieniiiiiireenn, $6,450,000
Washington ...... FOrt TLeWIS v $21,000,000
1 (b) OUuTSIDE THE UNITED STATES.—Using amounts
2 appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-
3 tions in section 2403(a)(2), the Secretary of Defense may
4 acquire real property and carry out military construction
5 projects for the installations or locations outside the
6 United States, and in the amounts, set forth in the fol-
7 lowing tables:
Defense Education Activity
Country Installation or Location Amount
Belgium ................ Sterrebeek ......ooooeiieennnn.. $5,992,000
FETMANY .o Ramstein Air Base $5,393,000
Wiesbaden Air Base $20,472,000
Special Operations Command
Country Installation or Location Amount
Bahrain ................. SOUthWeSt ASIA .oovvveieiiiiieiiecie e $19,000,000
Qatar .......coeeeene. Al Udeid Air Base ......ooceeviiiiiieniiiiceieeeeeee $52,852,000
TRICARE Management Activity
Country Installation or Location Amount
Germany ............... Spangdahlem Air Base ........cccoovviiiiiinininnens $30,100,000
8 (¢) UNSPECIFIED WORLDWIDE.—Using the amounts

9 appropriated pursuant to the authorization of appropria-

10

tions in section 2403(a)(3), the Secretary of Defense may

I1 acquire real property and carry out military construction

*S 1549 PCS




O o0 9 O W B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

37
projects for unspecified installations or locations in the

amount set forth in the following table:

Defense Agencies: Unspecified Worldwide

Location Installation or Location Amount

Worldwide Classified Classified Project .......ccccoovvviieniiiiinns $1,887,000

SEC. 2402. ENERGY CONSERVATION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-
ization of appropriations in section 2403(a)(7), the Seec-
retary of Defense may carry out energy conservation
projects under chapter 173 of title 10, United States
“ode, in the amount of $70,000,000.

SEC. 2403. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, DE-
FENSE AGENCIES.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for mili-
tary construction, land acquisition, and military family
housing functions of the Department of Defense (other
than the military departments) in the total amount of
$1,944,529,000 as follows:

(1) For military construction projects inside the

United States authorized by section 2401(a),

$969,152,000.

(2) For military construction projects outside

the United States authorized by section 2401(b),

$133,809,000.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

24
25

38

(3) For the military construction projects at
unspecified worldwide locations authorized by section
2301(¢), $1,887,000.

(4) For unspecified minor military construction
projects under section 2805 of title 10, United
States Code, $23,711,000.

(5) For contingency construction projects of the
Secretary of Defense under section 2804 of title 10,
United States Code, $10,000,000.

(6) For architectural and engineering services
and construction design under section 2807 of title
10, United States Code, $154,728,000.

(7) For energy conservation projects authorized
by section 2402 of this Act, $70,000,000.

(8) For military family housing functions:

(A) For support of military family housing
(including funections described in section 2833
of title 10, United States Code), $48,848,000.

(B) For credit to the Department of De-
fense Family Housing Improvement Fund es-
tablished by section 2883(a)(1) of title 10,
United States Code, $500,000.

(9) For the construction of increment 3 of the
regional security operations center at Kunia, Hawaii,

authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Con-

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

39

struction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2006 (di-
vision B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3497),
as amended by section 7017 of the Emergency Sup-
plemental Appropriations Act for Defense, the Glob-
al War on Terror, and Hurricane Recovery, 2006
(Public  Law  109-234; 120  Stat.  485),
$136,318,000.

(10) For the construction of increment 3 of the
regional security operations center at Augusta, Geor-
ola, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military
Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2006
(division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3497), as amended by section 7016 of the Emer-
cency Supplemental Appropriations Act for Defense,
the Global War on Terror, and Hurricane Recovery,
2006 (Public Law 109-234; 120 Stat. 485),
$100,000,000.

(11) For the construction of increment 2 of the
health clinic replacement at MacDill Air Force Base,
Florida, authorized by section 2401(a) of the Mili-
tary Construction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year
2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat.
2457), $41,400,000.

(12) For the construction of increment 2 of the

replacement of the Army Medical Research Institute

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

40
of Infectious Diseases at Fort Detrick, Maryland,
authorized by section 2401(a) of the Military Con-
struction Authorization Act of Fiscal Year 2007 (di-
vision B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2457),
$150,000,000.

(13) For the construction of increment 9 of a
munitions demilitarization facility at Pueblo Chem-
ical  Activity, Colorado, authorized by section
2401(a) of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 1997 (division B of Public Law
104-201; 110 Stat. 2775), as amended by section
2406 of the Military Construction Authorization Act
for Fiscal Year 2000 (division B of Public Law 106—
65; 113 Stat. 839) and section 2407 of the Military
Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003
(division B of Public Law 107-314; 116 Stat.
2698), $35,159,000.

(14) For the construction of increment 8 of a
munitions demilitarization facility at Blue Grass
Army Depot, Kentucky, authorized by section
2401(a) of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2000 (division B of Public Law
106-65; 113 Stat. 835), as amended by section
2405 of the Military Construction Authorization Act
for Fiscal Year 2002 (division B of Public Law 107—

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) L ~S O T NO I e

41
107; 115 Stat. 1298) and section 2405 of the Mili-

tary Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year

2003 (division B of Public Law 107-314; 116 Stat.

2698), $69,017,000.

SEC. 2404. TERMINATION OR MODIFICATION OF AUTHOR-
ITY TO CARRY OUT CERTAIN FISCAL YEAR
2007 DEFENSE AGENCIES PROJECTS.

(a) TERMINATION OF INSIDE THE UNITED STATES
ProJects ror Wiicn FunNdDs WERE NoT APPRO-
PRIATED.—The table relating to Special Operations Com-
mand in section 2401(a) of the Military Construction Au-
thorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public
Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2457) is amended—

(1) by striking the item relating to Stennis

Space Center, Mississippi; and

(2) In the item relating to Fort Brage, North

Jarolina, by striking “$51,768,000” in the amount

column and inserting “$44,868,000”.

(b) MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY ToO CARRY OUT

CERTAIN BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVI-

TIES.—Section 2405(a)(7) of that Act (120 Stat. 2460)
is amended by striking “$191,220,000” and inserting
“$252,279,0007.

(¢) MODIFICATION OF CERTAIN INSIDE THE UNITED

STATES PROJECT.—Section 2405(a)(15) of that Act (120

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\O T \© R (O R S i e e e e e e e T
o= OO0 0 NN AW = O

42
Stat. 2461) is amended by striking “$99,157,000” and
inserting “$89,157,000”.

(d) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 2405(a)
of that Act, as amended by subsections (a) through (c),
is further amended—

(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by
striking “$7,163,431,000” and inserting
“$7,197,390,000”’; and

(2) in  paragraph (1), by  striking
“$533,099,000” and inserting “$515,999,000”.

SEC. 2405. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN
FISCAL YEAR 2005 PROJECTS.

(a) EXTENSION AND RENEWAL.—Notwithstanding
section 2701 of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public Law 108—
375; 118 Stat. 2116), authorizations set forth in the table
in subsection (b), as provided in section 2401 of that Act,
shall remain in effect until October 1, 2008, or the date
of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for military
construction for fiscal year 2009, whichever is later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a)

1s as follows:

Defense Wide: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations

. . Agency and
Installation or Location Project Amount
Naval Air Station, Oceana, Virginia ..... DLA bulk fuel storage $3,589,000
tank.
Naval Air Station, Jacksonville, Florida | TMA hospital project ....... $28,438,000

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N U BB WD

[\O 2 O R O R S e e e e e e e T e T
D = OO 0 N R WD = O

43

TITLE XXV—NORTH ATLANTIC
TREATY ORGANIZATION SE-
CURITY INVESTMENT PRO-
GRAM

SEC. 2501. AUTHORIZED NATO CONSTRUCTION AND LAND
ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

The Secretary of Defense may make contributions for
the North Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Invest-
ment Program as provided in section 2806 of title 10,
United States Code, in an amount not to exceed the sum
of the amount authorized to be appropriated for this pur-
pose in section 2502 and the amount collected from the
North Atlantic Treaty Organization as a result of con-
struction previously financed by the United States.

SEC. 2502. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, NATO.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for con-
tributions by the Secretary of Defense under section 2806
of title 10, United States Code, for the share of the United
States of the cost of projects for the North Atlantic Treaty
Organization Security Investment Program authorized by

section 2501, in the amount of $201,400,000.

*S 1549 PCS



S O 0 N9 N B WD

—
[Em—

44

TITLE XXVI—GUARD AND
RESERVE FORCES FACILITIES

SEC. 2601. AUTHORIZED ARMY NATIONAL GUARD CON-

STRUCTION AND LAND ACQUISITION
PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-
ization of appropriations in section 2606(1)(A), the Sec-
retary of the Army may acquire real property and carry
out military construction projects for the Army National
Guard locations, and in the amounts, set forth in the fol-
lowing table:

Army National Guard

State Location Amount
Alabama Springville ... $3,300,000
Arkansas .. Camp Robinson $23,923.000
Arizona ............... Florence ........cccoovviieeininis $10,870,000
California Sacramento Army Depot ... $21,000,000
Camp Roberts ......c..ccoeeee.. $2,850,000
Connecticut ....c.cccoevveveennene Niantic $13,600,000
Florida ....ccoooveiviiiiiiiieee, Jacksonville ... $12,200,000
Idaho ..o Gowen Field ... $7,615,000
Orchard Training Area $1,700,000
TIHNOIS oo, St. Clair County .........c...... $8,100,000
TOWA toovieeiiiiiecie e Towa City wooveviieiiieiice e $13,186,000
Michigan ......ccooooeviininennn. Camp Grayling .......cccccoeeveeeviieeniiieeiiieens $2,450,000
Lansing ................. $4,239,000
Minnesota .....ccoooeveiviiennn. Camp Ripley $4,850,000
Mississippi .... Camp Shelby $4,000,000
Missouri ............. Whiteman Air Force Base ..... $30,000,000
North Dakota .... Camp Grafton ............ccceeeis $33,416,000
Oregon .....cccoveeeeeeeeeniennnenn ONEATIO weeviiiiieiie et $11,000,000
Pennsylvania ..........cccoeeeeee. Carlisle ......oocvevviiiiiiieeee e $7,800,000
East Fallowfield Township .... $8,300,000
Fort Indiantown Gap ........cccoeevvieeenenne $9,500,000
GettyShurg oooeevieieieceee e $6,300,000
Graterford ....... $7,300,000
Hanover ....... $5,500,000
Hazelton .....ooooevviiviiiiieeiceceee $5,600,000
Holidaysburg ..o $9,400,000
Huntingdon e | $7,500,000
KUtZtoWn oovveiiiiiic $6,300,000
Lebanon ......ccceeiiiiiiii $7,300,000
Philadelphia .......... $13,650,000
Rhode Island ....................... East Greenwich ........ $8,200,000
North Kingstown ..... $33,000,000
TexXas ooviierieiriieiieieeeie e Camp Bowie ....cocooiiiiiiiiiiieiiee $1,500,000

*S 1549 PCS




0 N N D B W

9
10
11
12
13
14

45

Army National Guard—Continued

State Location Amount

Fort Wolters ....ccocooveviviiiiiiiieeece $2,100,000
Utah oo North Salt Liake .....ooooviiiiiiniinie. $12,200,000
Vermont .....ococoeveevevienennn. Ethan Allen Range .......c.ccocooveieniiniine $1,996,000
VIrginia .oooooveveeveenceeneennne Fort Pickett .......ccooconviiiiiniiiiie $26,211,000

Winchester .....ooooovvviiiiiiiiece s $3,113,000
West Virginia ......cccvveeeeneenne Camp Dawson ......cccevvvvieiiiiiiiiiieeiieee $4,500,000
Wyoming ....ccoovvvevviieannnnne Camp GUEINSEY ..oevvvvreeiiieeiiieeeiiee e $2,650,000

SEC. 2602. AUTHORIZED ARMY RESERVE CONSTRUCTION

AND LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-

ization of appropriations in section 2606(1)(B), the Sec-

retary of the Army may acquire real property and carry

out military construction projects for the Army Reserve

locations, and in the amounts, set forth in the following

table:
Army Reserve
State Location Amount
California .......cccccoeeveniennenn Fort Hunter Liggett ... $7,035,000
Garden Grove ... $25,440,000
Montana ........cccoeeivninnnn. Butte oo $7,629,000
New Jersey ..oovevvevneennnen. Fort DIX oo $17,000,000
New York ..oooooovviiiiiiiiniil Fort Drum .........coooovviiiiieee $15,923,000
TexXas oooveiiieeiiieeeeeee Ellington Field ......ccccooooiiiiiiiie $15,000,000
Fort Worth ..ooooeeeeeeeeeeee e, $15,076,000
WiISCOonSIN ..oovveeveeieeeiieeeen, BEUSWOIth ool $9,100,000
Fort MceCoy oovvveeiiieciieieeie e $8,523,000

SEC. 2603. AUTHORIZED

NAVY RESERVE AND MARINE

CORPS RESERVE CONSTRUCTION AND LAND

ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-

ization of appropriations in section 2606(a)(2), the Sec-

retary of the Navy may acquire real property and carry

*S 1549 PCS




46

I out military construction projects for the Navy Reserve
2 and Marine Corps Reserve locations, and in the amounts,

3 set forth in the following table:

Navy Reserve and Marine Corps Reserve

State Location Amount

California .......coocveevveeennnen. Miramar .....ccccooevveiviiiiieeee e $5,580,000
Michigan ........ccoceeveveinennnnn. SElTIde oo $4,030,000
Ohio ... | Wright-Patterson Air Force Base .......... $10,277,000
OTEZON .vvveiiiieeeiieeeieeee Portland .....cccooooiiiiiii $1,900,000
South Dakota ..........ccccou... Sioux Falls ....ooooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiicee $3,730,000
Texas tovveeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee, Austin $6,490,000

Fort Worth ....cooovveviiiiiiiiiiieeeee s $22,514,000
Virginia ....occeeevveeveeveeenennn. QUANTICO .vviiviiiiieiieeieeeee e $2,410,000

SEC. 2604. AUTHORIZED AIR NATIONAL GUARD CONSTRUC-
TION AND LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-

ization of appropriations in section 2606(3)(A), the Sec-

retary of the Air Force may acquire real property and

carry out military construction projects for the Air Na-

S O o0 NN O w»n B

tional Guard locations, and in the amounts, set forth in

11 the following table:

Air National Guard

State Location Amount

Colorado ....cccccevvvveuienicnnne Buckley Air National Guard Base ........ $7,300,000
Delaware .........cccovveeeeennn. New Castle ....ooooovveiiiiiiiiiiiiiiciiieeeeees $10,800,000
Georgia Savannah International Airport ... $9,000,000
Indiana IMulman Regional Airport ...................... $7,700,000
Kansas .ooooovoviviiiiee, Smoky Hill Air National Guard Range $9,000,000
Loouisiana Camp Beauregard .........cccoceviiiiiene $1,800,000
Massachusetts .........c.......... Otis Air National Guard Base ............... $1,800,000
New Hampshire ................. Pease Air National Guard Base ............ $8,900,000
Nebraska LANCoI cvvveiiiiiiiicecc e $8,900,000
Nevada ...ooocvvevvvveiiieeinne Reno-Tahoe International Airport ......... $5,200,000
New YOrk oovevvvveeniiieeninnn Gabreski Airport ....cccoevvveeeiiiiiiiiieeeen $8,400,000
Pennsylvania Fort Indiantown Gap $12,700,000
Rhode Island ........ccccoceeee. Quonset State Airport ..........ccceeeeeiee $5,000,000
South Dakota .......cevvvveeeeii. Joe Foss Field oo $7,900,000
Tennessee .....ccocveeevereennnenn MecGhee-Tyson Airport ................. $3,200,000

Memphis International Airport ............ $11,376,000
Vermont ...coooovvvviiiiiinnn. Burlington ..o $6,600,000

*S 1549 PCS



0 N N B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18

47

Air National Guard—Continued

State Location Amount
West Virginia ......cccceeeeenennne Eastern West Virginia Regional Air- | $50,776,000
port-Shepherd Field.
YCAZET oo $17,300,000
Wiseonsin .....ccoeeeeeeeieveennnnnn. Truax Field ...l $7,300,000

SEC. 2605. AUTHORIZED AIR FORCE RESERVE CONSTRUC-
TION AND LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-

ization of appropriations in section 2606(3)(B), the Sec-

retary of the Air Force may acquire real property and

carry out military construction projects for the Air Force

Reserve locations, and in the amounts, set forth in the

following table:

Air Force Reserve

State Location Amount
Alaska oo Elmendorf Air Force Base ..o $14,950,000
Utah oo Hill Air Force Base ....coccoovvvviviiieiinn. $3,200,000

SEC. 2606. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS, GUARD
AND RESERVE.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for the
costs of acquisition, architectural and engineering services,
and construction of facilities for the Guard and Reserve
Forces, and for contributions therefor, under chapter
1803 of title 10, United States Code (including the cost
of acquisition of land for those facilities), in the following

amounts:

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O 2 O R O R NS IR O R e T o T T S U S S S Y
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

48
(1) For the Department of the Army—

(A) for the Army National Guard of the
United States, $458,515,000; and
(B) for the Army Reserve, $134,684,000.

(2) For the Department of the Navy, for the

Navy and Marine Corps Reserve, $59,150,000.

(3) For the Department of the Air Force—

(A) for the Air National Guard of the
United States, $216,417,000; and

(B) for the Air Force Reserve,
$26,559,000.

SEC. 2607. TERMINATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT

FISCAL YEAR 2007 GUARD AND RESERVE

PROJECTS FOR WHICH FUNDS WERE NOT AP-

PROPRIATED.

Section 2601 of the Military Construction Authoriza-
tion Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law
109-364; 120 Stat. 2463) is amended—

(1) in paragraph(1)—

(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking
“$561,375,000” and inserting “$476,697,000";
and

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“$190,617,000” and inserting “$167,987,000";

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N B W =

| \O JEE \© R \O R \O N N0 R e e e e e T e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

49
(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “49,998,000”
and inserting “$43,498,000”’; and

(3) in paragraph (3)
(A) 1n subparagraph (A), by striking
“$294,283,000” and inserting “$133,983,000"’;
and

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking

“$56,836,000” and inserting “$47,436,000”.
SEC. 2608. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT
FISCAL YEAR 2006 AIR FORCE RESERVE CON-

STRUCTION AND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

Section 2601(3)(B) of the Military Construction Au-
thorization Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Publi¢
Law 109-163; 119 Stat. 3501) is amended by striking
“$105,883,000” and inserting “$102,783,000"".

SEC. 2609. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN
FISCAL YEAR 2005 PROJECTS.

(a) EXTENSION AND RENEWAL.—Notwithstanding
section 2701 of the Military Construction Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public Law 108—
375; 118 Stat. 2116), the authorizations set forth in the
tables in subsection (b), as provided in section 2601 of
that Act, shall remain in effect until October 1, 2008, or

the date of the enactment of an Act authorizing funds for

*S 1549 PCS



A~ WP

O o0 I O W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19

50
military construction for fiscal year 2009, whichever is

later.

(b) TABLES.—The tables referred to in subsection (a)
are as follows:

Army National Guard: Extension of 2005 Project Authorizations

Installation or Location Project Amount
Dublin, California ...........cccccoovviiiniinnn. Readiness center .............. $11,318,000
Gary, Indiana ..........ccocoeevviiiiiiiiiie, Reserve center .................. $9,380,000

Army Reserve: Extension of 2005 Project Authorization

Installation or Location Project Amount

Corpus Christi (Robstown), Texas ........ Storage facility ................. $9,038,000

SEC. 2610. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS OF CERTAIN
FISCAL YEAR 2004 PROJECTS.

(a) EXTENSION.—Notwithstanding section 2701 of
the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2004 (division B of Public Law 108-136; 117 Stat.
1716), the authorizations set forth in the table in sub-
section (b), as provided in section 2601 of that Act and
extended by section 2702 of the Military Construction Au-
thorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Publie
Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2464), shall remain in effect
until October 1, 2008, or the date of the enactment of
an Act authorizing funds for military construction for fis-
cal year 2009, whichever 1s later.

(b) TABLE.—The table referred to in subsection (a)

1s as follows:

*S 1549 PCS



ol

Army National Guard: Extension of 2004 Project Authorizations

Installation or Location Project Amount
Albuquerque, New Mexico ................ Readiness center ...........c....... $2 533,000
Fort Indiantown Gap, Pennsylvania | Multipurpose training range $15,338,000

TITLE XXVII—BASE CLOSURE
AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVITIES

SEC. 2701. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR

[E—

BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVI-

TIES FUNDED THROUGH DEPARTMENT OF

DEFENSE BASE CLOSURE ACCOUNT 1990.
Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for

fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for base

O o0 9 AN U Bk~ W

closure and realignment activities, including real property
10 acquisition and military construction projects, as author-
11 ized by the Defense Base Closure and Realignment Act
12 of 1990 (part A of title XXIX of Public Law 101-510;
13 10 U.S.C. 2687 note) and funded through the Department
14 of Defense Base Closure Account 1990 established by sec-
15 tion 2906 of such Aect, in the total amount of
16 $220,689,000, as follows:

17 (1) For the Department of the Army,
18 $73,716,000.

19 (2) For the Department of the Air Force,
20 $143,260,000.

21 (3) For the Defense Agencies, $3,713,000.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ JEEN N© T N TR NG T NG I NG R NS R S e e T e e e T e . T
A N R~ WD = O 0O 0NN B WND—= O

52
SEC. 2702. AUTHORIZED BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGN-
MENT ACTIVITIES FUNDED THROUGH DE-
PARTMENT OF DEFENSE BASE CLOSURE AC-
COUNT 2005.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-
ization of appropriations in section 2703, the Secretary
of Defense may carry out base closure and realignment
activities, including real property acquisition and military
construction projects, as authorized by the Defense Base
Closure and Realignment Act of 1990 (part A of title
XXIX of Public Law 101-510; 10 U.S.C. 2687 note) and
funded through the Department of Defense Base Closure
Account 2005 established by section 2906A of such Act,
in the amount of $8,718,988,000.

SEC. 2703. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR
BASE CLOSURE AND REALIGNMENT ACTIVI-
TIES FUNDED THROUGH DEPARTMENT OF
DEFENSE BASE CLOSURE ACCOUNT 2005.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for base
closure and realignment activities, including real property
acquisition and military construction projects, as author-
ized by the Defense Base Closure and Realignment Act
of 1990 (part A of title XXIX of Public Law 101-510;
10 U.S.C. 2687 note) and funded through the Department

of Defense Base Closure Account 2005 established by sec-

*S 1549 PCS



[E—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

53
tion 2906A of such Act, in the total amount of
$8,174,315,000, as follows:
(1) For the Department of the Army,
$4,015,746,000.
(2) For the Department of the Navy,
$733,695,000.
(3) For the Department of the Air Forece,
$1,183,812,000.
(4) For the Defense Agencies, $2,241,062,000.
SEC. 2704. AUTHORIZED COST AND SCOPE OF WORK VARI-
ATIONS.

For military construction projects carried out using
amounts appropriated pursuant to the authorization of ap-
propriations in sections 2701 and 2703 of this title and
section 2405(a)(8) of the Military Construction Authoriza-
tion Act for Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law
109-364; 120 Stat. 2460), section 2853 of title 10, United
States Code, shall apply for variations to the cost and
scope of work for each military construction project re-
quested to the congressional defense committees as part
of the budget justification materials submitted to Con-
eress in support of the Department of Defense budget for
fiscal year 2007 and 2008 (as submitted with the budget
of the President under section 1105(a) of title 31, United
States Code).

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N U BB WD

[\ T N R NG R NG R NG R O B e e e e T e e e
LN A W N = O VOV 0 N O B A W DD = O

54
TITLE XXVIII-MILITARY CON-
STRUCTION GENERAL PROVI-
SIONS
Subtitle A—Effective Date and
Expiration of Authorizations
SEC. 2801. EFFECTIVE DATE.
Titles XXI, XXII, XXIII, XXIV, XXV, XXVI,
XXVII, and XXIX shall take effect on the later of—
(1) October 1, 2007; or
(2) the date of the enactment of this Act.
SEC. 2802. EXPIRATION OF AUTHORIZATIONS AND
AMOUNTS REQUIRED TO BE SPECIFIED BY
LAW.
(a) EXPIRATION OF AUTHORIZATIONS AFTER THREE

YEARS.

Except as provided in subsection (b), all author-
izations contained in titles XXI through XXVI and title
XXIX for military construction projects, land acquisition,
family housing projects and facilities, and contributions to
the North Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Invest-
ment Program (and authorizations of appropriations
therefor) shall expire on the later of—
(1) October 1, 2010; or
(2) the date of the enactment of an Act author-
izing funds for military construction for fiscal year

2011.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N B W =

[\ I e e e e e T e e
S OV o0 N O B PR~ WD = O

21
22
23
24
25

55
(b) EXCEPTION.—Subsection (a) shall not apply to
authorizations for military construction projects, land ac-
quisition, family housing projects and facilities, and con-
tributions to the North Atlantic Treaty Organization Se-
curity Investment Program (and authorizations of appro-
priations therefor), for which appropriated funds have
been obligated before the later of—
(1) October 1, 2010; or
(2) the date of the enactment of an Act author-
izing funds for fiscal year 2011 for military con-
struction projects, land acquisition, family housing
projects and facilities, or contributions to the North
Atlantic Treaty Organization Security Investment
Program.

Subtitle B—Military Construction
Program and Military Family
Housing Changes

SEC. 2811. GENERAL MILITARY CONSTRUCTION TRANSFER

AUTHORITY.

(a) AUTHORITY TO TRANSFER AUTHORIZATIONS.

(1) AuTHORITY.—Upon a determination by the
Secretary of a military department, or with respect
to the Defense Agencies, the Secretary of Defense,
that such action is necessary in the national interest,

the Secretary concerned may transfer amounts of

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

|\ I NO TR NG I NS R NS R e T e T e T e e T T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O W BN~ WD = ©

51

authorizations made available to that military de-

partment or Defense Agency in this division for fis-

cal year 2008 between any such authorizations for
that military department or Defense Agency for that
fiscal year. Amounts of authorizations so transferred
shall be merged with and be available for the same
purposes as the authorization to which transferred.

(2) AGGREGATE LIMIT.—The aggregate amount
of authorizations that the Secretaries concerned may
transfer under the authority of this section may not
exceed $200,000,000.

(b) LiMITATION.—The authority provided by this sec-
tion to transfer authorizations may only be used to fund
increases in the cost or scope of military construction
projects that have been authorized by law.

(¢) EFFECT ON AUTHORIZATION AMOUNTS.—A
transfer made from one account to another under the au-
thority of this section shall be deemed to increase the
amount authorized for the account to which the amount
is transferred by an amount equal to the amount trans-
ferred.

(d) Norice 1O CONGRESS.—The Secretary con-
cerned shall promptly notify Congress of cach transfer

made by that Secretary under subsection (a).

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T N T NG I NG I N B e T e e T e e T T
LN A W D= O O NN NN Bl WNDY = O

Y
SEC. 2812. MODIFICATIONS OF AUTHORITY TO LEASE MILI-
TARY FAMILY HOUSING.
(a) INCREASED MAXIMUM LEASE AMOUNT APPLICA-
BLE TO CERTAIN DOMESTIC ARMY FaMmIiLy HOUSING

LEASES.—Subsection (b) of section 2828 of title 10,

United States Code, 1s amended—
(1) in paragraph (2), by striking “paragraphs

(3) and (4)” and inserting “paragraphs (3), (4), and

(1)

(2) in paragraph (5), by striking “‘paragraphs

(2) and (3)” and inserting “paragraphs (2), (3), and

(7)”; and

(3) by adding at the end the following new
paragraph:

“(7)(A) Not more than 600 housing units may be
leased by the Secretary of the Army under subsection (a)
for which the expenditure for the rental of such units (in-
cluding the cost of utilities, maintenance, and operation)
exceeds the maximum amount per unit per year in effect
under paragraph (2) but does not exceed $18,620 per unit
per vear, as adjusted from time to time under paragraph
(5).

“(B) The maximum lease amount provided in sub-
paragraph (A) shall apply only to Army family housing

in areas designated by the Secretary of the Army.

*S 1549 PCS



08

1 “(C) The term of a lease under subparagraph (A)
may not exceed 2 years.”.

(b) INCREASED MAXIMUM LEASE AMOUNT APPLICA-

BLE TO FOREIGN MILITARY FAMILY HOUSING LEASES.—

Subsection (e) of such section 1s amended—

2

3

4

5

6 (1) in paragraph (1)—

7 (A) by striking “(1)” and inserting
8 ()

9 (B) by striking the second sentence; and
10 (C) by adding at the end the following new
11 subparagraph:

12 “(B)(i) Subject to clause (ii), the maximum lease
13 amounts in subparagraph (A) may be waived and in-
14 creased up to a maximum of $100,000 per unit per year.
15 “(i1) The Secretary concerned may not exercise the
16 waiver authority under clause (i) until the Secretary has
17 mnotified the congressional defense committees of such pro-
18 posed waiver and the reasons therefor and a period of 21
19 days has elapsed or, if over sooner, 14 days after such

20 mnotice is provided in an electronic medium pursuant to sec-

21 tion 480 of this title.”;

22 (2) in paragraph (2), by striking “the Secretary
23 of the Navy may lease not more than 2,800 units of
24 family housing in Italy, and the Secretary of the
25 Army may lease not more than 500 units of family

*S 1549 PCS



09

1 housing in Italy” and inserting “the Secretaries of
2 the military departments may lease not more than
3 3,300 units of family housing in Italy”’; and

4 (3) in paragraph (4), by striking “$35,000”
5 and inserting “$35,050”.

6 (¢) INCREASED THRESHOLD FOR CONGRESSIONAL
7 NOTIFICATION FOR FOREIGN MILITARY FaMILY HOUSs-
8 ING LEASES.—Subsection (f) of such section is amended
9 by striking “$500,000” and inserting “$1,000,000".

10 SEC. 2813. INCREASE IN THRESHOLDS FOR UNSPECIFIED
11 MINOR MILITARY CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS.
12 (a) INCREASE.—Section 2805(a)(1) of title 10,
13 United States Code, is amended—

14 (1) by striking “$1,500,000” and inserting
15 “$2,500,000”; and

16 (2) by striking “$3,000,000” and inserting
17 “$4,000,000”.

18 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

19 subsection (a) shall take effect on October 1, 2007.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\O I O R O R e e e e e e e T e
N = OO 0 NN N N R W N = O

60
SEC. 2814. MODIFICATION AND EXTENSION OF TEM-

PORARY, LIMITED AUTHORITY TO USE OPER-
ATION AND MAINTENANCE FUNDS FOR CON-
STRUCTION PROJECTS OUTSIDE THE UNITED
STATES.

Section 2808 of the Military Construction Authoriza-
tion Act for Fiscal Year 2004 (division B of Public Law
108-136; 117 Stat. 1723), as amended by section 2810
of the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2005 (division B of Public Law 108-375; 118 Stat.
2128), section 2809 of the Military Construction Author-
1zation Act for Fiscal Year 2006 (division B of Public Law
109-163; 119 Stat. 3508), and section 2802 of the Mili-
tary Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007
(division B of Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2466), is
further amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking “2007” and
inserting “2008”; and
(2) in subsection (¢)—
(A) in paragraph (1), by striking “(1) The
total” and inserting “The total”’; and

(B) by striking paragraphs (2) and (3).

*S 1549 PCS



1

O o0 9 N W B~ W

[\ JEEN NO T N R NG T NG I N R NS R S e e T e e e T e T
A N R~ WD = O 0O 00NN B W NN~ O

61
SEC. 2815. TEMPORARY AUTHORITY TO SUPPORT REVITAL-

IZATION OF DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE LAB-
ORATORIES THROUGH UNSPECIFIED MINOR
MILITARY CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS.

(a) LABORATORY REVITALIZATION.—For the revital-
ization and recapitalization of laboratories owned by the
United States and under the jurisdiction of the Secretary
concerned, the Secretary concerned may obligate and ex-
pend—

(1) from appropriations available to the Sec-
retary concerned for operation and maintenance,
amounts necessary to carry out an unspecified minor
military construction project costing not more than
$1,000,000; or

(2) from appropriations available to the Sec-
retary concerned for military construction not other-
wise authorized by law, amounts necessary to carry
out an unspecified minor military construction
project costing not more than $2,500,000.

(b) F1scAL YEAR LIMITATION APPLICABLE TO INDI-
VIDUAL LABORATORIES.—For purposes of this section,
the total amount allowed to be applied in any one fiscal
year to projects at any one laboratory shall be limited to
the larger of the amounts applicable under subsection (a).

(¢) LABORATORY DEFINED.—In this section, the
term ‘‘laboratory’” includes—

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG N N T NG I NG N NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

62
(1) a research, engineering, and development
center;
(2) a test and evaluation activity; and
(3) any buildings, structures, or facilities lo-
cated at and supporting such center or activity.

(d) SUNSET.—The authority to carry out a project
under this section expires on September 30, 2012.

SEC. 2816. TWO-YEAR EXTENSION OF TEMPORARY PRO-
GRAM TO USE MINOR MILITARY CONSTRUC-
TION AUTHORITY FOR CONSTRUCTION OF
CHILD DEVELOPMENT CENTERS.

(a) EXTENSION.—Subsection (e) of section 2810 of
the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal
Year 2006 (division B of Public Law 109-163; 119 Stat.
3510) is amended by striking “September 30, 2007 and
inserting “‘September 30, 2009”.

(b) REPORT REQUIRED.—Subsection (d) of such sec-
tion 1s amended to read as follows:

“(d) REPORTS REQUIRED.—Not later than March 1,
2007, and March 1, 2009, the Secretary of Defense shall
submit to the congressional committees reports on the pro-
eram authorized by this section. Each report shall include
a list and description of the construction projects carried
out under the program, including the location and cost

of each project.”.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

N NN N N NN = e e e e e e e e
A N A WD = O 0O 0NN B W N~ O

63
SEC. 2817. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY TO ACCEPT EQUALI-

ZATION PAYMENTS FOR FACILITY EX-
CHANGES.

Section 2809(c)(5) of the Military Construction Au-
thorization Act for Fiscal Year 2005 (division B of Public
Law 108-375; 118 Stat. 2127) is amended by striking
“September 30, 2007” and inserting ‘“‘September 30,
20107,

Subtitle C—Real Property and

Facilities Administration
SEC. 2831. REQUIREMENT TO REPORT TRANSACTIONS RE-
SULTING IN ANNUAL COSTS OF MORE THAN
$750,000.

Section 2662(a)(1) of title 10, United States Code,
1s amended—

(1) by striking “or his designee” and inserting
“or the Secretary’s designee, or with respect to a
Defense Agency, the Secretary of Defense or the
Secretary’s designee”’; and

(2) by adding at the end the following new sub-
paragraph:

“(G) Any transaction or contract action that re-
sults in, or includes, the acquisition or use by, or the
lease or license to, the United States of real prop-
erty, if the estimated annual rental or cost for the
use of the real property is more than $750,000.”.

*S 1549 PCS



64

1 SEC. 2832. MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITY TO LEASE NON-
2 EXCESS PROPERTY.
3 (a) INCREASED USE OF COMPETITIVE PROCEDURES
4 FOR SELECTION OF CERTAIN LESSEES.—Section
5 2667(h)(1) of title 10, United States Code, is amended
6 by striking “exceeds one year, and the fair market value
7 of the lease” and inserting “‘exceeds one year, or the fair
8 market value of the lease”.
9 (b) MODIFICATION OF AUTHORITIES RELATED TO
10 FACILITIES OPERATION SUPPORT.—
11 (1) ELIMINATION OF AUTHORITY TO ACCEPT
12 FACILITIES OPERATION SUPPORT AS IN-KIND CON-
13 SIDERATION.—Section 2667(¢)(1) of title 10, United
14 States Code, is amended—
15 (A) by striking subparagraph (D); and
16 (B) by redesignating subparagraph (E) as
17 subparagraph (D).
18 (2) ELIMINATION OF AUTHORITY TO USE RENT-
19 AL AND CERTAIN OTHER PROCEEDS FOR FACILITIES
20 OPERATION SUPPORT.—Section 2667(e)(1)(C) of
21 title 10, United States Code, is amended by striking
22 clause (1v).
23 (¢) TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS.—Section 2667(e) of

24 title 10, United States Code, is further amended—

*S 1549 PCS



1

2
3
4
5
6
7
8

65
(1) in paragraph (1)(B)(i1), by striking “para-
oraph (4), (5), or (6)” and inserting “‘paragraph (3),
(4), or (5)”; and
(2) by redesignating paragraphs (4), (5), and

(6) as paragraphs (3), (4), and (5).

SEC. 2833. ENHANCED FLEXIBILITY TO CREATE OR EXPAND

BUFFER ZONES.

Section 2684a(d) of title 10, United States Code, is

9 amended—

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (3), (4), (5),
and (6) as paragraphs (4), (5), (6), and (7), respec-
tively;

(2) by inserting after paragraph (2) the fol-
lowing new paragraph:

“(3) Subject to the availability of appropria-
tions for such purpose, an agreement with an eligible
entity under subsection (a)(2) may provide for the
management of natural resources and the contribu-
tion by the United States towards natural resource
management costs on any real property in which a
military department has acquired any right title or
interest in accordance with paragraph (1)(A) where
there is a demonstrated need to preserve or restore

habitat for purposes of subsection (a)(2).”; and

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG I N T NS R NS R NS B N e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O B NO R e

66
(3) in paragraph (4)(C), as redesignated by
paragraph (1), by striking “paragraph (4)” and in-
serting “‘paragraph (5), unless the Secretary con-
cerned certifies in writing to the Committees on

Armed Services of the Senate and the House of Rep-

resentatives that the military value to the United

States as a result of the acquisition of such property

or interest in property justifies the payment of costs

in excess of the fair market value of such property
or interest. Such certification shall include a detailed
deseription of the military value to be obtained in
each such case. The Secretary concerned may not
acquire such property or interest until 14 days after
the date on which the certification is provided to the
Committees or, if earlier, 10 days after the date on
which a copy of such certification is provided in an
electronic medium pursuant to section 480 of this
title”.
SEC. 2834. REPORTS ON ARMY AND MARINE CORPS OPER-
ATIONAL RANGES.

(a) REPORT ON UTILIZATION AND POTENTIAL EX-
PANSION OF ARMY OPERATIONAL RANGES.—Section
2827(¢) of the Military Construction Authorization Act for
Fiscal Year 2007 (division B of Public Law 109-364; 120
Stat. 2479) is amended—

*S 1549 PCS



67
(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “February 1,
2007 and inserting “December 31, 2007"; and
(2) in paragraph (2)—

(A) 1n subparagraph (B), by amending
clauses (1v) and (v) to read as follows:

“(iv) the proposal contained in the
budget justification materials submitted in
support of the Department of Defense
budget for fiscal year 2008 to increase the
size of the active component of the Army
to 547,400 personnel by the end of fiscal
yvear 2012; or

“(v) high operational tempos or surge
requirements.”’; and
(B) by adding at the end the following new

subparagraphs:

“(F) An analysis of the cost of, potential
military value of, and potential legal or prac-
tical impediments to, the expansion of the Joint
Readiness Training Center at Fort Polk, Lou-
isiana, through the acquisition of additional
land adjacent to or in the vicinity of the instal-
lation that is under the control of the United

States Forest Service.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

68

“(G) An analysis of the impact of the pro-
posal described in subparagraph (B)(iv) on the
plan developed prior to such proposal to relo-
cate forces from Germany to the United States
and vacate installations in Germany as part of
the Integrated Global Presence and Basing
Strategy, including a comparative analysis of—

“(1) the projected utilization of the

Army’s three combat training centers if all

of the six light infantry brigades proposed

to be added to the active component of the

Army would be based in the United States;

and

“(i1) the projected utilization of such
ranges 1if at least one of those six brigades
would be based in Germany.

“(H) If the analysis required by subpara-
oraph (G) indicates that the Joint Multi-Na-
tional Readiness Center in Hohenfels, Germany,
or the Army’s training complex at Grafenwoehr,
Germany, would not be fully utilized under the
basing scenarios analyzed, an estimate of the
cost to replicate the training capability at that

center in another location.”.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

69

(b) REPORT ON POTENTIAL EXPANSION OF MARINE

CORPS OPERATIONAL RANGES.

(1) REPORT REQUIRED.—Not later than De-
cember 31, 2007, the Secretary of the Navy shall
submit to the congressional defense committees a re-
port containing an assessment of the operational
ranges used to support training and range activities
of the Marine Corps.

(2) CONTENT.—The report required under
paragraph (1) shall include the following informa-
tion:

(A) The size, description, and mission-es-
sential tasks supported by each major Marine
Corps operational range during fiscal year
2003.

(B) A description of the projected changes
in Marine Corps operational range require-
ments, including the size, characteristics, and
attributes for mission-essential activities at each
range and the extent to which any changes in
requirements are a result of the proposal con-
tained in the fiscal year 2008 budget request to
increase the size of the active component of the
Marine Corps to 202,000 personnel by the end
of fiscal year 2012.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ TN O T N T NG I NS T NG R e T e e T e T e Y W =
LN R W NN = DO VO NN N R WD~ O

70
(C) The projected deficit or surplus of land

at each major Marine Corps operational range,
and a description of the Secretary’s plan to ad-
dress that projected deficit or surplus of land as
well as the upgrade of range attributes at each
existing Marine Corps operational range.

(D) A description of the Secretary’s
prioritization process and investment strategy
to address the potential expansion or upgrade
of Marine Corps operational ranges.

(E) An analysis of alternatives to the ex-
pansion of Marine Corps operational ranges, in-
cluding an assessment of the joint use of oper-
ational ranges under the jurisdiction, custody,
or control of the Secretary of another military
department.

(F) An analysis of the cost of, potential
military value of, and potential legal or prac-
tical impediments to, the expansion of Marine
Corps Base, Twentynine Palms, California,
through the acquisition of additional land adja-
cent to or in the wvicinity of that installation
that is under the control of the Bureau of Land
Management.

(3) DEFINITIONS.—In this subsection:

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O 2NN \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

71

(A) The term “Marine Corps operational
range”’ has the meaning given the term “‘oper-
ational range” in section 101(e)(3) of title 10,
United States Code, except that the term is lim-
ited to operational ranges under the jurisdic-
tion, custody, or control of the Secretary of the
Navy that are used by or available to the
United States Marine Corps.

(B) The term ‘‘range activities” has the
meaning given that term in section 101(e)(2) of
such title.

SEC. 2835. CONSOLIDATION OF REAL PROPERTY PROVI-
SIONS WITHOUT SUBSTANTIVE CHANGE.

(a) CONSOLIDATION.—Section 2663 of title 10,
United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the
following new subsection:

“(h)  OPTIONS FOR MILITARY CONSTRUCTION
PrROJECTS.—

“(1) AuttoriTy.—The Secretary of a military
department may acquire an option on a parcel of
real property before or after its acquisition is au-
thorized by law, if the Secretary considers it suitable
and likely to be needed for a military project of the

department.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N BB W =

e T = O =
W NN = O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

72

“(2) CONSIDERATION.—ASs consideration for an
option acquired under paragraph (1), the Secretary
may pay, from funds available to the department for
real property activities, an amount that is not more
than 12 percent of the appraised fair market value
of the property.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(1) REPEAL OF SUPERSEDED AUTHORITY.—
Section 2677 of such title is repealed.

(2) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sec-
tions at the beginning of chapter 159 of such title
1s amended by striking the item relating to section
2677.

Subtitle D—Base Closure and

Realignment
SEC. 2841. NIAGARA AIR RESERVE BASE, NEW YORK, BAS-
ING REPORT.

Not later than December 1, 2007, the Secretary of
the Air Force shall submit to the congressional defense
committees a report containing a detailed plan of the cur-
rent and future aviation assets that the Secretary expects
will be based at Niagara Air Reserve Base, New York.
The report shall include a deseription of all of the aviation

assets that will be impacted by the series of relocations

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W B W =

I e R = S~ V=
whnm A~ W D = O

16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

73

to be made to or from Niagara Air Reserve Base and the
timeline for such relocations.
Subtitle E—Land Conveyances
SEC. 2851. LAND CONVEYANCE, LYNN HAVEN FUEL DEPOT,
LYNN HAVEN, FLORIDA.

(a) CONVEYANCE AUTHORIZED.—The Secretary of
the Air Forece may convey to Florida State University (in
this section referred to as the “University”’) all right, title,
and interest of the United States in and to a parcel of
real property, including improvements thereon, consisting
of approximately 40 acres located at the Iiynn Haven Fuel
Depot in Liynn Haven, Florida, as a public benefit convey-
ance for the purpose of permitting the University to de-
velop the property as a new satellite campus.

(b) CONSIDERATION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—For the conveyance of the
property under subsection (a), the University shall
provide the United States with consideration in an
amount that is acceptable to the Secretary, whether
in the form of cash payment, in-kind consideration,

or a combination thereof.

(2) REDUCED TUITION RATES.—The Secretary
may accept as in-kind consideration under para-
oraph (1) reduced tuition rates or scholarships for

military personnel at the University.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\O I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

24

74
(¢) PAYMENT OF COSTS OF CONVEYANCES.—

(1) PAYMENT REQUIRED.—The Secretary shall
require the University to cover costs to be icurred
by the Secretary, or to reimburse the Secretary for
costs incurred by the Secretary, to carry out the
conveyance under subsection (a), including survey
costs, related to the conveyance. If amounts are col-
lected from the University in advance of the Sec-
retary incurring the actual costs, and the amount
collected exceeds the costs actually incurred by the
Secretary to carry out the conveyance, the Secretary
shall refund the excess amount to the University.

(2) TREATMENT OF AMOUNTS RECEIVED.—
Amounts received under paragraph (1) as reim-
bursement for costs incurred by the Secretary to
carry out the conveyance under subsection (a) shall
be credited to the fund or account that was used to
cover the costs incurred by the Secretary in carrying
out the conveyance. Amounts so credited shall be
merged with amounts in such fund or account and
shall be available for the same purposes, and subject
to the same conditions and limitations, as amounts
in such fund or account.

(d) REVERSIONARY INTEREST.—If the Secretary de-

25 termines at any time that the real property conveyed

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N B W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

75

under subsection (a) is not being used in accordance with
the purpose of the conveyance specified in such subsection,
all right, title, and interest in and to all or any portion
of the property shall revert, at the option of the Secretary,
to the United States, and the United States shall have
the right of immediate entry onto the property. Any deter-
mination of the Secretary under this subsection shall be
made on the record after an opportunity for a hearing.

(e) DESCRIPTION OF PROPERTY.—The exact acreage
and legal description of the real property to be conveyed
under subsection (a) shall be determined by a survey satis-
factory to the Secretary.

The Sec-

(f) ADDITIONAL TERM AND CONDITIONS.
retary may require such additional terms and conditions
in connection with the conveyance under subsections (a)
as the Secretary considers appropriate to protect the inter-
ests of the United States.

SEC. 2852. MODIFICATION TO LAND CONVEYANCE AUTHOR-
ITY, FORT BRAGG, NORTH CAROLINA.

(a) REQUIREMENT To CONVEY TrACT No. 404-1
PrROPERTY WITHOUT CONSIDERATION.—Section 2836 of
the Military Construction Authorization Act for Fiscal

Year 1998 (111 Stat. 2005) 1s amended—

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NS R NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ B NG O N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O B NO R e

76
(1) in subsection (a)(3), by striking “at fair
market value” and inserting ‘“‘without consider-
ation’’;
(2) by amending subsection (b)(2) to read as
follows:

“(2) The conveyances under paragraphs (2) and (3)
of subsection (a) shall be subject to the condition that the
County develop and use the conveyed properties for edu-
cational purposes and the construction of public school
structures.”’; and

(3) by amending subsection (c¢)(2) to read as
follows:

“(2) If the Secretary determines at any time that the
real property conveyed under paragraph (2) or paragraph
(3) of subsection (a) is not being used in accordance with
subsection (b)(2), all right, title, and interest in and to
the property conveyed under such paragraph, including
any 1mprovements thereon, shall revert to the United
States, and the United States shall have the right of im-
mediate entry thereon.”.

(b) PAYMENT OF COSTS OF CONVEYANCE.—Such
section 1s further amended by inserting at the end the fol-
lowing new subsection:

“(f) PAYMENT OF COSTS OF CONVEYANCE OF TRACT

No. 404-1 PROPERTY.—

*S 1549 PCS



O© o0 3 O WD b W N =

[\O T \© R (O R S e e e e e e e T
D = O 00NN R WY = O

7

“(1) PAYMENT REQUIRED.—The Secretary
shall require the County to cover costs to be in-
curred by the Secretary, or to reimburse the Sec-
retary for costs incurred by the Secretary, to carry
out the conveyance under subsection (a)(3), includ-
ing survey costs, costs related to environmental doc-
umentation, and other administrative costs related
to the conveyance. If amounts are collected from the
County in advance of the Secretary incurring the ac-
tual costs, and the amount collected exceeds the
costs actually incurred by the Secretary to carry out
the conveyance, the Secretary shall refund the excess
amount to the County.

“(2) TREATMENT OF AMOUNTS RECEIVED.—
Amounts received as reimbursement under para-
oraph (1) shall be credited to the fund or account
that was used to cover the costs incurred by the Sec-
retary in carrying out the conveyance. Amounts so
credited shall be merged with amounts in such fund
or account, and shall be available for the same pur-
poses, and subject to the same conditions and limita-

tions, as amounts in such fund or account.”.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 O D kA WD =

|\ TN NG T N T NG I NG R N B e e T e e T e e e
L A W D= O O NN NN R WNDY = o

78
SEC. 2853. TRANSFER OF ADMINISTRATIVE JURISDICTION,

GSA PROPERTY, SPRINGFIELD, VIRGINIA.

(a) TRANSFER AUTHORIZED.—The Administrator of
General Services (in this section referred to as ‘“‘the Ad-
ministrator’”) may transfer to the administrative jurisdic-
tion of the Secretary of the Army a parcel of real property
consisting of approximately 69.5 acres and containing
warehouse facilities in Springfield, Virginia, known as the
“GSA Property” for the purpose of permitting the Sec-
retary to construct facilities on the property to support
administrative functions to be located at Fort Belvoir, Vir-
ginia.

(b) CONSIDERATION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—As consideration for the
property to be transferred by the Administrator, the
Secretary of the Army shall—

(A) pay all reasonable costs to move fur-
nishings, equipment, and other material related
to the relocation of functions identified by the
Administrator;

(B) if deemed necessary by the Adminis-
trator, transfer to the administrative jurisdic-
tion of the Administrator a parcel of property
in the National Capital Region determined to

be suitable to the Administrator;

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NG B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N N N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O T NO S e

79

(C) if deemed necessary by the Adminis-
trator, design and construct storage facilities,

utilities, security measures, and access to a

road infrastructure on the parcel to meet the

requirements of the Administrator; and

(D) if deemed necessary by the Adminis-
trator, enter into a memorandum of agreement
with the Administrator for support services and
security at the new facilities constructed pursu-

ant to subsection (a).

(2) FAIR MARKET VALUE LIMITATION.—The
consideration provided by the Secretary under para-
oraph (1) may not exceed the fair market value of
the property transferred by the Administrator under
subsection (a).

(¢) ADMINISTRATION OF TRANSFERRED PRroP-
ERTY.—Upon completion of the transfer under subsection
(a), the transferred property shall be administered by the
Secretary as a part of Fort Belvoir, Virginia.

(d) DESCRIPTION OF PROPERTY.—The exact acreage
and legal description of the property or properties to be
conveyed under this section shall be determined by surveys
satisfactory to the Administrator and the Secretary.

(e) STATUS REPORT.—Not later than November 30,

2007, the Administrator and the Secretary shall jointly

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e
b A W D= O 0 NN NN R, WD = O

80

submit to the congressional defense committees a report
on the status and estimated costs of the transfer under
subsection (a).
Subtitle F—Other Matters
SEC. 2861. REPORT ON CONDITION OF SCHOOLS UNDER JU-
RISDICTION OF DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE
EDUCATION ACTIVITY.

(a) REPORT REQUIRED.—Not later than March 1,
2008, the Secretary of Defense shall submit to the con-
oressional defense committees a report on the conditions
of schools under the jurisdiction of the Department of De-
fense Education Activity.

(b) CONTENT.—The report required under subsection
(a) shall include the following:

(1) A deseription of each school under the con-
trol of the Secretary, including the location, year
constructed, erades of attending children, maximum
capacity, and current capacity of the school.

(2) A description of the standards and proc-
esses used by the Secretary to assess the adequacy
of the size of school facilities, the ability of facilities
to support school programs, and the current condi-
tion of facilities.

(3) A description of the conditions of the facil-

ity or facilities at each school, including the level of

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I NS R T e T e T e T e D e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

81

compliance with the standards described in para-
eraph (2), any existing or projected facility defi-
clencies or inadequate conditions at each facility,
and whether any of the facilities listed are tem-
porary structures.

(4) An investment strategy planned for each
school to correct deficiencies identified in paragraph
(3), including a description of each project to correct
such deficiencies, cost estimates, and timelines to
complete each project.

(5) A description of requirements for new
schools to be constructed over the next 10 years as
a result of changes to the population of military per-
sonnel.

(¢) USE OF REPORT AS MASTER PLAN FOR REPAIR,

UPGRADE, AND CONSTRUCTION OF SCHOOLS.—The Sec-
retary shall use the report required under subsection (a)
as a master plan for the repair, upgrade, and construction
of schools in the Department of Defense system that sup-

port dependants of members of the Armed Forces and ci-

vilian employees of the Department of Defense.

*S 1549 PCS



O o0 9 N D kA W N =

[\O I O R O N e e e e e e e T e T
N = OO0 0 NN N N R WD = O

82
SEC. 2862. REPEAL OF REQUIREMENT FOR STUDY AND RE-

PORT ON IMPACT TO MILITARY READINESS
OF PROPOSED LAND MANAGEMENT CHANGES
ON PUBLIC LANDS IN UTAH.

Section 2815 of the National Defense Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 2000 (Public Law 106-65; 113 Stat.
852) is repealed.

SEC. 2863. ADDITIONAL PROJECT IN RHODE ISLAND.

In carrying out section 2866 of the John Warner Na-
tional Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2007
(Public Law 109-364; 120 Stat. 2499), the Secretary of
the Army, acting through the Chief of Engineers, shall
assume responsibility for the annual operation and main-
tenance of the Woonsocket local protection project author-
ized by section 10 of the Act of December 22, 1944 (com-
monly known as the “Flood Control Act of 1944”) (58
Stat. 892, chapter 665), including by acquiring any inter-
est of the State of Rhode Island in and to land and struc-
tures required for the continued operation and mainte-
nance, repair, replacement, rehabilitation, and structural
integrity of the project, as identified by the State, in co-

ordination with the Secretary.

*S 1549 PCS



12
13
14
15
16

TITLE

MILITARY

83

XXIX—WAR-RELATED

AUTHORIZATIONS

SEC. 2901. AUTHORIZED WAR-RELATED ARMY CONSTRUC-

CONSTRUCTION

TION AND LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

Using amounts appropriated pursuant to the author-

ization of appropriations in section 2902(1), the Secretary

of the Army may acquire real property and carry out mili-

tary construction projects for the installations or locations

outside the United States, and in the amounts set forth

in the following table:

Army: Outside the United States

Country Installation or Location Amount
Afehanistan ..........ccccooevenn. Bagram Air Base .......cccooeeiiiiiiiiiiineenn. 116,800,000
Iraq oo Camp Adder .....co.ooevviiiiiiiiiieieee, 80,650,000

AL ASAd oo 86,100,000
Camp Anaconda .........cooeeeveviviieninieennnnnn, 88,200,000
Fallugah .o 880,000
Camp Marez .......cooeevvivviiiiiiiieeicee, 880,000
Mosul oo 43,000,000
Q-WESt oiiiiiiiieie e 26,000,000
Camp Ramadi .......oooooeoviiiiiiiiee, 880,000
SCATTA evvviiieeiiiiiiiee e 5,000,000
Camp Speicher ......ooccoovveiiiiiiiciieee, 103,700,00
Camp Taqqadum ........ccooeevviiieieeenn., 880,000
TIRITE e 43,000,000
Camp VICtOry ..oooovvvieiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeen, 34,400,000
Camp Warrior ......cooeceeevveieviieeeiieeeennn, 880,000
Various Locations .........cccccoeeviniiiinnn. 102,000,000
SEC. 2902. AUTHORIZATION OF WAR-RELATED MILITARY

CONSTRUCTION APPROPRIATIONS, ARMY.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for

fiscal years beginning after September 30, 2007, for mili-

tary construction, land acquisition, and military family

*S 1549 PCS



84

I housing functions of the Department of the Army in the

2 total amount of $752,650,000 as follows:

3

O o0 9 N »n A~

10

(1) For military construction projects outside
the United States authorized by section 2901(a),
$733,250,000.

(2) For architectural and engineering services
and construction design under section 2807 of title
10, United States Code, $19,400,000. meaning given
that term in section 101(a)(16) of title 10, United
States Code.

*S 1549 PCS






Calendar No. 187

11070 CONGRESS
1ST SESSION mo ~ mhw

A BILL

To authorize appropriations for fiscal year 2008 for
military construction, and for other purposes.

JUNE 5, 2007

Read twice and placed on the calendar



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-10T14:25:01-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




