AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

H. Con. Res. 442 Agreed to October 3, 2008

One Nundred Tenth Congress
of the
Mnited Dtates of America

AT THE SECOND SESSION

Begun and held at the City of Washington on Thursday,
the third day of January, two thousand and eight

Concurrent Resolution

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That in the enrollment of the bill S. 3001, the Secretary
of the Senate shall make the following corrections:

(1) In section 201(1), strike “$11,045,052,000” and insert

“$10,943,840,000”.

(2) In section 202(a), strike “$11,799,660” and insert

“$11,799,660,000”.

Attest:

Clerk of the House of Representatives.

Attest:

Secretary of the Senate.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2015-07-13T22:30:55-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




