AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1091H CONGRESS
S8 H,R. 1963

To reduce temporarily the duty on Mesotrione Technical.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
APRIL 28, 2005

Mr. BAKER introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee
on Ways and Means

A BILL

To reduce temporarily the duty on Mesotrione Technical.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. MESOTRIONE TECHNICAL.

4 (a) CALENDAR YEAR 2006.—

5 (1) IN GENERAL.—Subchapter II of chapter 99
6 of the Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the United
7 States is amended by inserting in numerical se-
8 quence the following:

9902.07.01 | Mesotrione Technical - 1,3-
cyclohexanedione,2-[4-
(methylsulfonyl)—2-
nitrobenzoyl]-1,3-
eyelohexanedione (CAS No.
104206-82-8) (provided for
in subheading 2930.90.10) .. | 6.04% No change No change On or before
12/31/2006




O o0 N N B W =

[\ 2 \© R \O I O N N i e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N R WD = O

2

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made
by paragraph (1) applies to goods entered, or with-
drawn from warehouse for consumption, on or after
the 15th day after the date of the enactment of this
Act.

(b) CALENDAR YEAR 2007.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—IHeading 9902.07.01, as
added by subsection (a), is amended—

(A) by striking “6.04%” and inserting

“6.08%"; and

(B) by striking “12/31/2006” and insert-

ing “12/31/2007".

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made
by paragraph (1) shall take effect on January 1,
2007.

(¢) CALENDAR YEAR 2008.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Heading 9902.07.01, as
added by subsection (a) and amended by subsection
(b), 1s further amended—

(A) by striking “6.08%” and inserting

“6.11%"; and

(B) by striking “12/31/2007” and insert-

ing “12/31/2008”.

*HR 1963 IH



3

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made
by paragraph (1) shall take effect on January 1,

2008.

*HR 1963 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-12T04:03:10-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




