AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

108TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S 1 O 6 2

To amend section 924 of title 18, United States Code, to increase the
maximum term of imprisonment for offenses involving stolen firearms.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES
MaY 14, 2003

Mr. CAMPBELL introduced the following bill; which was read twice and
referred to the Committee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To amend section 924 of title 18, United States Code, to
increase the maximum term of imprisonment for offenses
mvolving stolen firearms.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Stolen Gun Penalty
Enhancement Act of 20037,

SEC. 2. STOLEN FIREARMS.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 924 of title 18, United

States Code, is amended—

© 00O N O O b~ W N P

(1) in subsection (a)—



2

1 (A) in paragraph (2), by striking “(i),
2 (3),”; and
3 (B) by adding at the end the following:
4 “(8) Whoever knowingly violates subsection (i)
5 or () of section 922 shall be fined under this title,
6 imprisoned not more than 15 years, or both.”;
7 (2) in subsection (i)(1), by striking “10 years”
8 and inserting ‘15 years’; and
9 (3) in subsection (1), by striking “10 years” and
10 inserting ‘15 years” .
11 (b) SENTENCING COMMISSION.—The United States

12 Sentencing Commission shall amend the Federal sen-
13 tencing guidelines to reflect the amendments made under

14 subsection (a).

*S 1062 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-14T19:42:04-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




