AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

108TH CONGRESS
L9 H, R, 4296

To reauthorize and revise the Child Care Access Means Parents in School

O o0 9 N U kA WD =

[Em—
)

Program (CCAMPIS).

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

May 5, 2004

Mr. POMEROY introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Education and the Workforce

A BILL

To reauthorize and revise the Child Care Access Means
Parents in School Program (CCAMPIS).

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “21st Century CAMPIS
Act”.

SEC. 2. REAUTHORIZATION AND REVISION OF CCAMPIS.

(a) MINIMUM GRANT.—Section 419N (b)(2)(B) of the
Higher  Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C.
1070e(b)(2)(B)) is amended by striking “$10,000” and
inserting “$30,000”.



O o0 N N W B W =

e T e S e e =
AN Ln B~ W NN = O

2

(b) ELIGIBLE INSTITUTIONS.—Section 419N(b)(4)
of such Act is amended by striking “$350,000” and in-
serting “$250,000.

(¢) DEFINITION OF LoOW INCOME STUDENT.—Sec-
tion 419N (b)(7) of such Act is amended by striking “a
student who is eligible to receive’” and inserting “a student
whose family income makes the student eligible to re-
ceive’’.

(d) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section
419N(g) of such Act 1s amended—

(1) by striking “$45,000,000” and inserting

“$75,000,0007;

(2) by striking “1999” and inserting “2005;
and
(3) by striking “4 succeeding” and inserting ‘5

succeeding”’.

*HR 4296 TH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-14T05:18:03-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




