AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

107TH CONGRESS
L S, 3052

To increase scholarship assistance under the Police Corps program, and
for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

OCTOBER 3, 2002

Mr. Harco introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To increase scholarship assistance under the Police Corps

program, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. POLICE CORPS.
4 Subtitle A of title XX of the Violent Crime Control
5 and Law Enforcement Act of 1994, the Police Corps Act
6 (42 U.S.C. 14091 et seq.), is amended—

7 (1) in section 200106—
8 (A) in subsection (a)(2)—
9 (1) in subparagraph (A), by striking

10 “$7.500” and inserting “$10,000”;



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

R N e T i L < =
© © 0 N o o~ W N B O

2

(i) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“$10,000” and inserting “$13,333”"; and

(iii) in subparagraph (C), by striking
“$30,000” and inserting “$40,000”; and
(B) in subsection (b)(2)—

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking
“$7,500” and inserting “$10,000";

(i) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“$10,000” and inserting “$13,333"; and

(iii) in subparagraph (C), by striking
“$30,000” and inserting “$40,000”;

(2) in section 200108, by striking “$250” and
inserting “$400"’;

(3) in section 20110(2), by striking ‘“no more
than 10 percent” and inserting “except with permis-
sion of the Director, no more than 25 percent”’;

(4) by striking section 200111; and

(5) in section 200112, by striking “‘fiscal year
2002”7 and inserting ‘“‘each of fiscal years 2002

through 20057,

*S 3052 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-15T02:07:12-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




