AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

107TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 1 47

To amend title X and title XI of the Energy Policy Act of 1992.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JUNE 29, 2001

Mr. NICKLES introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Energy and Natural Resources

A BILL

To amend title X and title XI of the Energy Policy Act
of 1992.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. REAUTHORIZATION OF THORIUM REIMBURSE-

MENT.

(a) Section 1001(b)(2)(C) of the Energy Policy Act
of 1992 (42 U.S.C. 2296a) is amended by striking
“$140,000,000” and inserting “$263,000,000".

(b) Section 1003(a) of such Act (42 U.S.C. 2296a—

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

2) is amended by striking “$490,000,000” and inserting
10 “$613,000,000".



2
1 (¢) Section 1802(a) of the Atomic Energy Act of

2 1954 (42 U.S.C. 2297¢-1) is amended by striking
3 “$488,333,333” and inserting “$508,833,333"".
O

S 1147 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-15T19:26:43-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




