AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

107TH CONGRESS
L9 H,R. 4214

To amend titles 10 and 38, United States Code, to extend the time limitation

M.

To

o A~ W N BB

for use of eligibility and entitlement to educational assistance under
the Montgomery GI Bill.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

ApriL 11, 2002
SMITi of Washington introduced the following bill; which was referred to
the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs, and in addition to the Committee
on Armed Services, for a period to be subsequently determined by the
Speaker, in each case for consideration of such provisions as fall within
the jurisdiction of the committee concerned

A BILL

amend titles 10 and 38, United States Code, to extend
the time limitation for use of eligibility and entitlement
to educational assistance under the Montgomery GI Bill.
Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Military Education Ex-

tension Act of 20027,



13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2
SEC. 2. EXTENSION OF TIME LIMITATION FOR USE OF ELI-

GIBILITY AND ENTITLEMENT.

(a) ALL VOLUNTEER FORCE PROGRAM.—Section
3031 of title 38, United States Code, 1s amended—

(1) by striking “10-year period” each place it
appears (other than subsection (g)) and inserting
“15-year period”; and

(2) in subsection (g), by striking “the last day”’
and all that follows through “Act” and inserting
“November 30, 2014,”.

(b) EDUCATIONAL ASSISTANCE FOR SELECTED RE-
SERVE.—Section 16133 (a) of title 10, United States Code,
is amended by striking “10-year period” and inserting
“15-year period”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall take effect on the date of the enactment
of this Act, and apply with respect to periods of eligibility
and entitlement beginning on or after such date.

(d) APPLICATION TO KELIGIBILITY AND ENTITLE-
MENT FOR WHICH TIME LiMITATION HAS EXPIRED.—(1)
In the case of an individual whose period for use of entitle-
ment to educational assistance under chapter 30 of title
38, United States Code, has expired by reason of section
3031 of such title before the date of the enactment of this

Act, the individual may use any unexpended portion of

*HR 4214 IH



N oo o~ WO N P

3

such entitlement during the 5-year period that begins on
the date of the enactment of this Act.

(2) The Secretary of Veterans Affairs shall provide
for notice to individuals referred to in paragraph (1) of
the opportunity under this subsection to use any unex-
pended portion of entitlement to educational assistance

under such chapter 30 during such 5-year period.

O

*HR 4214 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-15T08:48:15-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




