AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

106TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 6 9

To improve pay, retirement, and educational assistance benefits for members

M.

To

aa A W N B

of the Armed Forces; and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JANUARY 19, 1999
CLELAND (for himself, Mr. RoBB, Mr. LEVIN, Mr. KENNEDY, Mr. BINGA-
MAN, Mr. ByrDp, Mr. LIEBERMAN, Ms. LANDRIEU, Mr. REED, and Mr.
DascirLi) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and re-
ferred to the Committee on Armed Services

A BILL

improve pay, retirement, and educational assistance bene-
fits for members of the Armed Forces; and for other
purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twves of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Military Recruiting

and Retention Improvement Act of 1999,



© 00 N O O B~ W N P

e A <
o 00 M W N B O

2
TITLE I—PAY AND ALLOWANCES

SEC. 101. FISCAL YEAR 2000 INCREASE AND RESTRUCTUR-
ING OF BASIC PAY.

(a) WAIVER OF SECTION 1009 ADJUSTMENT.—Any
adjustment required by section 1009 of title 37, United
States Code, in the rates of monthly basic pay authorized
members of the uniformed services by section 203(a) of
such title to become effective during fiscal year 2000 shall
not be made.

(b) JANUARY 1, 2000, INCREASE IN BASIC PAY.—
Effective on January 1, 2000, the rates of monthly basic
pay for members of the uniformed services shall be in-
creased by 4.8 percent.

(¢) BAsic PAy REFORM.—Effective on July 1, 2000,
the rates of monthly basic pay for members of the uni-

formed services are as follows:

*S 169 IS



0€'8LE'e 0€'8LE'E 06°0L5°¢ 08°€91°¢ 07'8¢0'¢ | 00°616'c | 0€FF8'E | 08°6FL'G | 09°3¢8G | 0F'Cec's | 0L'€ak'e | 08°¢0Ea | 09°3eE'e | 09°6eEs | 0F'€90'c | " M
06°006°¢ 00°08L°€ 0F699°¢ 0r6ec'e 0C8IF'e | 0886&'¢ | 00°LLL'E | OL'ILOE | 0EFL6G | 06FI8E | 0€F69'C | 0F'88¢'G | 0F'¢ec'e | 0F'¢e¢'s | 06¢ce’s | 7 S\
0rLet'y 0L°68¢'F 09°¢C1d 00°610F 00°888°¢ | 09°€6L'e | 08@e9'e | OL'G8F'e | 08'ace'e | 0@°LIa'e | 0F'€80¢ | 0¢°LF6'E | 09°898°C | 0¢'88L'G | 00'@6s'e | =M
0F LE6'TS$ 06'38.L 0L°839‘F$ 0L CLY TS 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% ooo$ | M
SHYADIAAO INVIIVM
00°600°¢ 00°600°€ 00°600°€ 00°600°¢ 00°600°¢ | 00°600°¢ | 00°600°¢ | 09°LL8'G | 0€'I8L'E | 08°€89'G | 0F'88¢'E | OT'€&FE | 000 000 000 P10
0T9¢¢'e 039¢¢'e 039¢¢'e 03'9¢¢'e | 0B9¢e'e | 08°9¢G’e | OF'I9F'E | 06'¢ee’e | 09°891°¢ | OL'ILO'E | 00°600°¢ | 0070 000 000 rHE0
06'91F % 06'9TF 7% 08°163" 0€°003" 0% 070" 0°0e8'e | 09°G0L'E | 06'¢Cac’ 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% ¥ HE0
HADIAAO INVIIVM Y0 YAIIWHIN GALSTINA NV SV HOIAYAS ALNA JALLOV 40 SAVIX ¥ YHAO HLIM SHAOIAA0 AANOISSININOD
01'¢ete 01°¢aha 01°65hG 01'¢ere orecks | oreeks |oreeke |oreeke |oreeke |oreske |oresks |oreske |oreeks | 06F00% | 0€9a6'T | £ 1-0
0L rLoOe 0L 1L0°€ o:S.m 0L 1L0'E OL'ILO'e | OL'TL0'E | OL'TLO'E [ OL'LLOE | OL'LLO'E | OL'TL0'€ | OL'ILO'E | 00°000°¢ | 06'016G | 0&°L@¢'s | 088L&E | £@ 0
0L6ELY 0L 6&1 0L6E1F 0r6el 0r'6eL 0r6er OU6ELY | OFOFOF | 0°0¢8°¢ | 09°30L°E | 06'¢ac’'e | 08F9¢'e | 08°CIL'E | 0a'F88°C | 00FFC'E | £ 60
0L°808F 0L'808F 0L°808F 0L°808F 0L'808F | 06'8CLF [ 00'TI9F | 00FIFF | 0C1¢Et | 0F086'¢ | 0FGIS'E | $0°909°¢ | 0g'9¢c'e | 06'eee'e | o8LeL's | 0
06°1¢LC 06°1CLC 06°1CLC 09°¢8¢'c 0096F¢ | 0098a°¢ | 06'TL6F | 06°6S9F | 08°02FF | 08°16GF | 08'16GF | OL°LGLF | 06°'LL0F | 06°€18°¢ | 0F'8FG'e | 0
0T'670°L 0T'6TL'9 00°6¥¢'9 0671869 0T°980°9 | 0G'T6L'C | 0€°69T°C | 00F00°C | 00F00°C | 0L'9L6'F | OF'GLLF | OFFCLF | OFFCLF | 09°TOFF | OT'TO0F | 9-0
09°¢50°'8 0F'¢86°L 0F'¢86°L 0F'¢86°L 0F'¢86°L | 0CILF'L [ 01'€98°9 [ 006999 | 08°CLF9 | 00@8&'9 | 09FIL'9 | OFF68°C | 0CIERC | 08°1¢8'¢ | 0¢6LF'e | L0
00°8¥0°6 00°8¥0°6 00°8F0°6 030688 08°€0¢'8 | 0L°0CL'S | 08°906°L | 09°F&8L | 08°0FCL | 0CILFL | O8ILL'L | 0€°€66'9 | OL'E€S6'9 | 0€°0189 | 0€F6S9 8-0
09866 0L°LF9°6 09°6¢¥6 09616 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 | 6-0
0F'SIETI$ | 0G0€6°0T$ | 09°L0L°0T$ | 0T°CCH0T$ | 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% z01-0
1 SHIDIAA0 AANOISSININOD
93 I9AQ $3G I9AQ 3G I9AQ 03 I2AQ _ 8T JI2AQ _ 91 J2AQ _ $1 I2A0 _ 31 I2AQ _ 01 I2AQ _ 8 I8AQ _ 9 JBAQ _ ¥ I8AQ _ € I8AQ _ g I9AQ _ SS9[ J0 g opex
Aeq

9po)) sage)g PAIIU() ‘Lg 9111 JO GO UOIII3S I9pun pajnduiod IIIAISS JO SIBDX

SHOIAYHS AAINIOAINN HH.L 40 AVd JISVE A'THINON 40 SHLVY

*S 169 IS



10€°066% St Aed oseq ‘AMP 2A1OR O SYIUOWL § URL[} SSI] PIAIIS JART] 0T ﬁlm OPRIS AT} UL SIDUIDUL JO 988D Y U] ¢

POy SAPRIS PAYUL] ‘LE O JO GOF UOWIDS Lapun popndwion gaLalos Jo sieos oAy jo E:.::: 00 TOLFS ST 3::: sty 10y Led

ISRO[) A} JO IO A1 JON) JIsey 0 ‘sdio)) dULIRIY o1} Jo J0[R\ JURIBING ‘D010, TV A} JO JURISING I0ISRIY JOI) ‘AARN o) JO 1091JJ() A10J JO)) TSRy ‘AuLry _:E JOo Jole]y JuRASIog S® SUIAIDS O[IA ¢

1990 JURLIPAL 10 JD(UIDUL PIISI[UD UR ST 9IIALS AINP 0AIIR JO SIRIA § 10A0 [[JIA PIYIPALD U 9ARI] OUM SI991JO pouolssiumon 0y Aidde jou

“AMPOPS PATINDIXT] 1} JO A [0A9] 10 Krd a1sR(q JO 91RT A1) 0} ?:::: St

SO[OLIDADN "OPO)) SOJRIG PIITU[] ‘L& 9} JO GG UOTAIS Iopun ponduion 99TATdS JO SIRIA JATIR[NWND JO SSO[PIRSDL ‘() [FHGT$ 9 01 paje[mo[e) ST oprid sty oy Avd a1seq ‘preny) Isvo)) ) Jo
L10)) SULIRT\[ AT[} JO JURPURLITIO)) ‘9010,] ATy 91} JO JJRIS JO Jou) ‘suonpeaad(y [earN Jo JOry) ‘AULLy o1} Jo JIRIS JO JOI[)) ‘JJeIS JO SJOI) JUIOF 91} JO URULIIRI) 9917 0 URULIIRI) S® SUIAIS I &
MPINDS PATJIDOXT] O} JO A [0A9] 10§ Avdl DISR( JO ORI ) 0} PIYIWI] ST ST 0801} 10§ Aed drsegy |

810011J0 981} 10§ Aed orseq ¢
JURPURWILO]) 10 ¢

09°¢00°'T

09°600°T 09°¢00°T 09°¢00°T | 09°C00°T | 09°¢00°T | 09°G00°T | 09°C00°T | 09°CO0°T | 09°C00°T | 09°¢00°T | 09°C00°T | 09°C00°T | 09°C00°T ¢ -0
0F'LaT'T 0% LaT'T 0F'LeT'T 0P L2l | OFLGL'T | OFLEL'T | OFLGLT | OF'LEL'l | OFLGL'T | OFLEL'T | OFLEL'L | OFLel'l | oF'Lel'l | oFLer't | famc
06°¢ee'T 06°6eeT 06661 06’ 06°¢eeT 06°¢ee'T 06°¢ee'T 06°¢ee'T 06°¢ee'T 06°¢ee'T 06°¢ee'T 0TFEET 09°092'T ocTLLT | faC
06°66¢°T 06°€6S°T 06°€6S°T 06 06'€6S°T | 06°€6S'T | 06°€6S'T | 06°€6CT | 06°€6ST | 06°€6S'T | 0T°08¢'T | 0ZLFFT | OL'ELET | 06'GFaT | fiC
03966°T 03°966°T 039€6°T 03966°T 03966'T | 089¢6'T | 06°9€6°T | 02966 | 0CTI8T | 0C°68L'T | OSFILT | OFOFO'T | 0099¢T | 00F6F'T | 09Gee'T | ¢
0L°¢8%'G 0L'¢8%'G 0L°¢8%'G 0€°685'C 0€°¢88c | 09FFa'e | 09I6L'E | 09°8IL'G | 0&°LF0'G | OL'€L6'T | 0€°668°T | 0€FET | 098CLT | 08'8L9°T | 06°81¢'T | "~ 901
orrere 03'9%6'G 09°L8L'G 0t°099°G 01'88¢e | 00FICE | 0€66F'E | 0€7L9€°C | 0OL'F68E | 06036 | OL'LFL'E | 00°€L0G | 00'LO0G | 08°L&6'T | 08°¢oL'T | i
09°68F'¢ i 0191 01°920°¢ 0¢°%E6'c | 0T°0F8'G | 09°TCL'E | 047699 | 09109 | 0F'82¢'a | 00°0 000 000 000 000
08°CL6 e 00FFLC$ 0€°609°c$ OFeLt e ozeLe'es | 00TLE'ES | 08°69T'e$ | 0F'E80°e | 0€°¢TO'ES | 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 00°0% 000$ | + 60

SYAIINIIN TALSTINA

06016 06016 06'016'c 06016 00°GE8'E | 08'FEL'E | 00FE9'E | 0Z'CESE | 0C°CEFE | 08°GEEE | 09°GEGE | OL'CEL'E | 00'TL6'T | 00'TL6'T | 00°6GIL'T | -M
9% I9AQ $5 I9A0 3G 19AQ 03 I2AQ 8T I9AQ | 9T IBAQ | FI I9AQ | I IBAQ | (T I2AQ 8 I9AQ 9 J2AQ ¥ I0AQ € A0 G I9AQ | Sso[a0 g )
Leg

apo)) Sae)S PIAITU() ‘L€ I} JO GO UOIP0aS Jopun payndurod IOIAIIS JO SIBIX

ponuuony—SHOTAYHS AHINHOAIN HHL 40 AVd JISVd ATHINON 40 SHLVY

*S 169 IS



© 00 N O U b~ W N PP

N DN N N N DN P PP PP P PP PPk
oo A WO N P O © 0 N O O B WO N B+ O

-

J

SEC. 102. PAY INCREASES FOR FISCAL YEARS 2001
THROUGH 2006 AT ECI PLUS ONE-HALF PER-
CENT.

Notwithstanding subsection (¢) of section 1009 of
title 37, United States Code, the percentage of the in-
crease in the rates of monthly basic pay that takes effect
under that section during each of fiscal years 2001
through 2006 shall be the percentage equal to the sum
of one percent plus the percentage increase calculated as
provided under subsection (a) of section 5303 of title 5,
United States Code, for such fiscal year (without regard
to whether rates of pay under the statutory pay systems
are actually increased by the percentage calculated under
such section 5303 (a) during such fiscal year).

SEC. 103. THREE-YEAR EXTENSION OF AUTHORITIES RE-
LATING TO PAYMENT OF CERTAIN BONUSES
AND SPECIAL PAYS.

(a) AVIATION OFFICER RETENTION BONUS.—Sec-
tion 301b(a) of title 37, United States Code, is amended
by striking “December 31, 1999,” and inserting “Decem-
ber 31, 2002,”.

(b) REENLISTMENT BONUS FOR ACTIVE MEM-

BERS.

Section 308(g) of title 37, United States Code, is
amended by striking “December 31, 1999” and inserting

“December 31, 2002,

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N NN B R R R R R R R R e
W N B O © 0 N ©o© 00 W N B O

6

(¢) ENLISTMENT BONUSES FOR MEMBERS WITH

CRITICAL SKILLS.—Sections 308a(¢) and 308f(¢) of title

37, United States Code, are each amended by striking
“December 31, 1999” and inserting ‘‘December 31,
20027,

(d) SPECIAL PAY FOR NUCLEAR-QUALIFIED OFFI-

CERS EXTENDING PERIOD OF ACTIVE SERVICE.—Section
312(e) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by

striking “December 31, 1999” and inserting “December

31, 20027,
(e) NUCLEAR CAREER ACCESSION BONUS.—Section
312b(c) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by

striking “December 31, 1999”7 and inserting “December
31, 20027,
(f) NUCLEAR CAREER ANNUAL INCENTIVE

BoNus.—Section 312¢(d) of title 37, United States Code,

is amended by striking “any fiscal year beginning before
October 1, 1998, and the 15-month period beginning on
that date and ending on December 31, 1999”7 and insert-
ing “the 15-month period beginning on October 1, 1998,
and ending on December 31, 1999, and any year begin-
ning after December 31, 1999, and ending before January

1,2003".

*S 169 IS



© 00 N O U b~ W N PP

N DN N NN N DN P PP PP,k PP
o A W N P O © 0 N O O b WO N B O

7
SEC. 104. THREE-YEAR EXTENSION OF CERTAIN BONUSES

AND SPECIAL PAY AUTHORITIES FOR RE-
SERVE FORCES.
(a) SPECIAL PAY FOR HEALTH PROFESSIONALS IN

CRITICALLY SHORT WARTIME SPECIALTIES.—Section

302¢g(f) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by
striking “December 31, 1999”7 and inserting “December
31, 20027,

(b) SELECTED RESERVE REENLISTMENT BONUS.—
Section 308b(f) of title 37, United States Code, is amend-
ed by striking “December 31, 1999”7 and inserting “‘De-
cember 31, 20027,

(¢) SELECTED RESERVE ENLISTMENT BONUS.—Sec-
tion 308¢(e) of title 37, United States Code, is amended
by striking “December 31, 1999 and inserting “Decem-
ber 31, 20027,

(d) SPECIAL PAY FOR ENLISTED MEMBERS As-
SIGNED TO CERTAIN IHiGi PRIORITY UNITS.—Section
308d(e) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by
striking “December 31, 1999” and inserting “December
31,2002,

(¢) SELECTED RESERVE AFFILIATION BONUS.—Sec-

tion 308e(e) of title 37, United States Code, is amended
by striking “December 31, 1999 and inserting “Decem-

ber 31, 20027,

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+~ O

8
(f) READY RESERVE ENLISTMENT AND REENLIST-

MENT BONUS.

Section 308h(g) of title 37, United States
Code, is amended by striking “December 31, 1999” and
inserting ‘“‘December 31, 2002”.

Section

(¢) PRIOR SERVICE ENLISTMENT BONUS.
308i(f) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by
striking “December 31, 1999” and inserting “December
31, 20027,

(h) REPAYMENT OF EDUCATION LOANS FOR CER-
TAIN HEALTH PROFESSIONALS WHO SERVE IN THE SE-
LECTED RESERVE.—Section 16302(d) of title 10, United
States Code, is amended by striking “January 1, 2000”
and inserting in lieu thereof “January 1, 2003,

SEC. 105. THREE-YEAR EXTENSION OF CERTAIN BONUSES
AND SPECIAL PAY AUTHORITIES FOR NURSE
OFFICER CANDIDATES, REGISTERED NURSES,
AND NURSE ANESTHETISTS.

(a) NURSE OFFICER CANDIDATE ACCESSION PRro-
GRAM.—Section 2130a(a)(1) of title 10, United States
Code, is amended by striking “December 31, 1999 and
inserting “‘December 31, 20027,

(b) ACCESSION BONUS FOR REGISTERED NURSES.—
Section 302d(a)(1) of title 37, Umited States Code, 1s
amended by striking “December 31, 1999 and inserting

“December 31, 2002,

*S 169 IS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

=
o

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

9
(¢) INCENTIVE SPECIAL PAY FOR NURSE ANES-

THETISTS.—Section 302e(a)(1) of title 37, United States

Code, is amended by striking “December 31, 1999 and
inserting in lieu thereof “December 31, 2002,
TITLE II—RETIRED PAY
SEC. 201. REPEAL OF REDUCTION IN RETIRED PAY MULTI-
PLIER FOR POST-JULY 31, 1986 MEMBERS RE-
TIRING WITH LESS THAN 30 YEARS OF SERV-
ICE.
Section 1409(b) of title 10, United States Code, is
amended by striking paragraph (2).
SEC. 202. MODIFIED “CPI-1” COST-OF-LIVING ADJUSTMENT.
Paragraph (3) of section 1401a(b) of title 10, United
States Code, is amended to read as follows:

“(3) POST-AUGUST 1, 1986 MEMBERS.—The

Secretary shall increase the retired pay of each
member and former member who first became a
member of a uniformed service on or after August
1, 1986, by the percent equal to the difference be-
tween the percent determined under paragraph (2)
and 1 percent, except that, if the percent determined
under paragraph (2) is less than 3 percent, the Sec-
retary shall increase the retired pay by the lesser of

the percent so determined or 2 percent.”.

*S 169 IS



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

10
SEC. 203. CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.

(a) COMPUTATION OF RETIRED PAy.—(1) Chapter
71 of title 10, United States Code, is further amended—
(A) 1n section 1409(b)—

(i) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘“‘para-
oraphs (2) and (3)” and inserting in lieu there-
of “paragraph (2)”; and

(iii) by redesignating paragraph (3) as
paragraph (2); and
(B) in section 1410, by striking “if—" and all

that follows and inserting the following: “if increases
in the retired pay of the member or former member
under section 1401a(b) of this title had been com-
puted as provided in paragraph (2) of that section
(rather than under paragraph (3) of that section).”
(2)(A) The heading for section 1410 of such title is
amended to read as follows:
“§1410. Members entering on or after August 1, 1986:
restoration of COLA increases to full-
COLA amounts at age 62”.
(B) The item relating to such section in the table of
sections at the beginning of chapter 71 of such title is

amended to read as follows:

“1410. Members entering on or after August 1, 1986: restoration of COLA in-
creases to full-COLA amounts at age 62.”.

*S 169 IS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD P PP PPk PR PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B+~ O

11
(b) SURVIVOR BENEFIT PLAN.—Chapter 73 of such
title is amended—

(1) in section 1447(6)(A), by striking ““(deter-
mined without regard to any reduction under section
1409(b)(2) of this title)”’;

(2) in section 1451(h), by striking paragraph
(3); and

(3) in section 1452(c), by striking paragraph
(4).

SEC. 204. EFFECTIVE DATE.
The amendments made by this title shall take effect
on October 1, 1999.
TITLE III—THRIFT SAVINGS
PLAN

SEC. 301. PARTICIPATION IN THRIFT SAVINGS PLAN.

(a) AUTHORITY.—Subchapter III of chapter 84 of
title 5, United States Code, is amended by adding at the
end the following:

“§ 8440e. Members of the uniformed services in active
service

“(a) PARTICIPATION AUTHORIZED.—(1) A member
of the armed forces in active service may participate in
the Thrift Savings Plan in accordance with this section.

“(2) An election to contribute to the Thrift Savings

Fund under paragraph (1) may be made only during a

*S 169 IS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N L O

12

period provided under section 8432(b) for individuals sub-
ject to this chapter.

“(b) APPLICABILITY OF THRIFT SAVINGS PLAN PRO-
VISIONS.—Except as otherwise provided in this section,
the provisions of this subchapter and subchapter VII of
this chapter shall apply with respect to members of the
uniformed services making contributions to the Thrift
Savings Fund as if such members were employees within
the meaning of section 8401(11).

“(¢) Maximum CONTRIBUTION FrROM BASIC PAy.—
The amount contributed by a member of the uniformed
services for any pay period out of basic pay may not

exceed

“(1) for any pay period 5 percent of such mem-
ber’s basic pay for such pay period, plus

“(2) an amount equal to the amount of any en-
listment or reenlistment bonus paid to the member
under section 308, 308a, or 308f of title 37 in con-
nection with an enlistment for active service.

“(d) AGENCY CONTRIBUTIONS PROHIBITED.—No
contribution under section 8432(c) of this title may be
made for the benefit of a member of the uniformed serv-
ices making contributions to the Thrift Savings Fund

under subsection (a).

*S 169 IS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N N NN B B R R R R R R R e
W N P O © 0 N OO 00 »h W N B O

13

“(e) CERTAIN TRANSFERS NOT CONSIDERED SEPA-

RATIONS.—A transfer of a member from one armed force

to another armed force without a break in active service
of more than 30 days shall not be considered to be a sepa-
ration from service for the purposes of establishing an en-
titlement of the member to a withdrawal from the mem-
ber’s account under the Thrift Savings Plan.

“(f) REGULATIONS.

The Executive Director, after
consultation with the Secretary of Defense, may prescribe

regulations to carry out this section.

“(2) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this section—

“(1) the term ‘armed forces’ has the meaning

oiven the term in subsection (a)(4) of section 101 of
title 10;

“(2) the term ‘active service’ has the meaning
oiven the term in subsection (d)(3) of such section;
and

“(3) the term ‘basic pay’ means basic pay that
is payable under section 204 of title 37.”.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections
at the beginning of chapter 84 of title 5, United States

Code, is amended by adding after the item relating to sec-

tion 8440d the following:

“8440e. Members of the uniformed services in active service.”.

*S 169 IS



14
SEC. 302. NONDUPLICATION OF CONTRIBUTIONS.

Section 8432b(b) of title 5, United States Code, is
amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “Each em-

1
2
3
4
5 ployee” and inserting “Except as provided in para-
6 oraph (4), each employee”;

7 (2) by redesignating paragraph (4) as para-
8 oraph (5); and

9 (3) by inserting after paragraph (3) the follow-
10 ing new paragraph (4)

11 “(4) No contribution may be made under this section
12 for a period for which an employee made a contribution
13 under section 8440e¢.”.

14 TITLE IV—MONTGOMERY GI
15 BILL BENEFITS

16 SEC. 401. INCREASE IN RATES OF EDUCATIONAL ASSIST-
17 ANCE FOR FULL-TIME EDUCATION.
18 (a) INCREASE.—Section 3015 of title 38, United

19 States Code, is amended—

20 (1) in subsection (a)(1), by striking “$528” and
21 inserting “$600”"; and
22 (2) in subsection (b)(1), by striking ‘$429”
23 and inserting “$488”.
24 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

25 subsection (a) shall take effect on October 1, 1999, and
26 shall apply with respect to educational assistance allow-

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O U0 A W N R O

15
ances paid for months after September 1999. IHowever,
no adjustment in rates of educational assistance shall be
made under subsection (g) of section 3015 of title 38,
United States Code, for fiscal year 2000.
SEC. 402. TERMINATION OF REDUCTIONS OF BASIC PAY.

(a) REPEALS.—(1) Section 3011 of title 38, United

States Code, is amended by striking subsection (b).

(2) Section 3012 of such title is amended by striking
subsection (¢).

(3) The amendments made by paragraphs (1) and (2)
shall take effect on the date of the enactment of this Act
and shall apply to individuals whose nitial obligated pe-
riod of active duty under section 3011 or 3012 of title
38, United States Code, as the case may be, begins on
or after such date.

(b) TERMINATION OF REDUCTIONS IN PROGRESS.—
Any reduction in the basic pay of an individual referred
to in section 3011(b) of title 38, United States Code, by
reason of such section 3011(b), or of any individual re-
ferred to in section 3012(¢) of such title by reason of such
section 3012(¢), as of the date of the enactment of this
Act shall cease commencing with the first month begin-
ning after such date, and any obligation of such individual

under such section 3011(b) or 3012(¢), as the case may

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N NN DN NDNDN P PP PP PP PP
aa A W N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

16

be, as of the day before such date shall be deemed to be
fully satisfied as of such date.

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 3034(e)(1)
of title 38, United States Code, is amended in the second
sentence by striking “‘as soon as practicable” and all that
follows through “‘such additional times” and inserting “at
such times”.

SEC. 403. ACCELERATED PAYMENTS OF EDUCATIONAL AS-
SISTANCE.

Section 3014 of title 38, United States Code, is
amended—

(1) by inserting “(a)” before “The Secretary
shall pay”’; and
(2) by adding at the end the following new sub-

section (b):

“(b)(1) When the Secretary determines that it is ap-
propriate to accelerate payments under the regulations
prescribed pursuant to paragraph (6), the Secretary may
make payments of basic educational assistance allowance
under this subchapter on an accelerated basis.

“(2) The Secretary may pay a basic educational as-
sistance allowance on an accelerated basis only to an indi-
vidual entitled to payment of the allowance under this sub-
chapter who has made a request for payment of the allow-

ance on an accelerated basis.

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N DN NN DN NN DN P PP PP PP PP
a o W N P O © 00 N O O b W N B O

17

“(3) In the event an adjustment under section
3015(g) of this title in the monthly rate of basic edu-
cational assistance will occur during a period for which
a payment of an allowance is made on an accelerated basis
under this subsection, the Secretary shall—

“(A) pay on an accelerated basis the amount
the allowance otherwise payable under this sub-
chapter for the period without regard to the adjust-
ment under that section; and

“(B) pay on the date of the adjustment any ad-
ditional amount of the allowance that is payable for
the period as a result of the adjustment.

“(4) The entitlement to a basic educational assistance
allowance under this subchapter of an individual who is
paid an allowance on an accelerated basis under this sub-
section shall be charged at a rate equal to one month for
each month of the period covered by the accelerated pay-
ment of the allowance.

“(5) A basic educational assistance allowance shall be
paid on an accelerated basis under this subsection as fol-
lows:

“(A) In the case of an allowance for a course
leading to a standard college degree, at the begin-
ning of the quarter, semester, or term of the course

iIn a lump-sum amount equivalent to the aggregate

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN NN DN P PP PP PP PP
o A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

18

amount of monthly allowance otherwise payable

under this subchapter for the quarter, semester, or

term, as the case may be, of the course.

“(B) In the case of an allowance for a course
other than a course referred to in subparagraph
(A)—

“(1) at the later of (I) the beginning of the
course, or (II) a reasonable time after the re-
quest for payment by the individual concerned;
and

“(11) In any amount requested by the indi-
vidual concerned up to the ageregate amount of
monthly allowance otherwise payable under this
subchapter for the period of the course.

“(6) The Secretary shall prescribe regulations for
purposes of making payments of basic educational allow-
ance on an accelerated basis under this subsection. Such
regulations shall specify the circumstances under which
accelerated payments should be made and include require-
ments relating to the request for, making and delivery of,
and receipt and use of such payments.”.

SEC. 404. TRANSFER OF ENTITLEMENT TO EDUCATIONAL
ASSISTANCE.
(a) AUTHORITY TO TRANSFER TO FamiLy MEeM-

BER.—Subchapter II of chapter 30 of title 38, United

*S 169 IS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

I~ e L N <
© O N O U M W N L O

20
21
22
23
24

19

States Code, is amended by adding at the end the follow-

ing new section:

“§3020. Transfer of entitlement to basic educational
assistance

“(a) The Secretary may, for the purpose of enhancing
recruiting and retention, and at the Secretary’s sole dis-
cretion, permit an individual entitled to educational assist-
ance under this subchapter to elect to transfer such indi-
vidual’s entitlement to such assistance, in whole or in part,
to the individuals specified in subsection (b).

“(b) An individual’s entitlement to educational assist-
ance may be transferred when authorized under subsection
(a) as follows:

“(1) To the individual’s spouse.

“(2) To one or more of the individual’s chil-
dren.

“(3) To a combination of the individuals re-

ferred to in paragraphs (1) and (2).

“(¢)(1) An individual electing to transfer an entitle-
ment to educational assistance under this section shall—

“(A) designate the individual or individuals to
whom such entitlement is being transferred and the
percentage of such entitlement to be transferred to

each such individual; and

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R
5E W N B O © 0 N O U0 A W N LB O

20
“(B) specify the period for which the transfer
shall be effective for each individual designated

under subparagraph (A).

“(2) The aggregate amount of the entitlement trans-
ferable by an individual under this section may not exceed
the aggregate amount of the entitlement of such individual
to educational assistance under this subchapter.

“(3) An individual electing to transfer an entitlement
under this section may elect to modify or revoke the trans-
fer at any time before the use of the transferred entitle-
ment. An individual shall make the election by submitting
written notice of such election to the Secretary.

“(d)(1) The use of any entitlement transferred under
this section shall be charged against the entitlement of the
individual making the transfer at the rate of one month
for each month of transferred entitlement that is used.

“(2) Except as provided in paragraph (3), an individ-
ual using entitlement transferred under this section shall
be subject to the provisions of this chapter in such use
as 1f such individual were entitled to the educational as-
sistance covered by the transferred entitlement in the indi-
vidual’s own right.

“(3) Notwithstanding section 3031 of this title, a

child shall complete the use of any entitlement transferred

*S 169 IS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e L O i O =
N~ O O~ W N B O

18
19
20
21
22
23
24

21
to the child under this section before the child attains the
age of 26 years.

“(e) In the event of an overpayment of educational
assistance with respect to an individual to whom entitle-
ment is transferred under this section, such individual and
the individual making the transfer under this section shall
be jointly and severally liable to the United States for the
amount of the overpayment for purposes of section 3685
of this title.

“(f) The Secretary shall preseribe regulations for
purposes of this section. Such regulations shall specify the
manner and effect of an election to modify or revoke a
transfer of entitlement under subsection (¢)(3).”

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections
at the beginning of such chapter is amended by inserting
after the item relating to section 3019 the following new

item:

“3020. Transfer of entitlement to basic educational assistance.”.
TITLE V—REPORT
SEC. 501. ANNUAL REPORT ON EFFECTS OF INITIATIVES ON
RECRUITMENT AND RETENTION.
(a) REQUIREMENT FOR REPORT.—On December 1 of
each year, the Secretary of Defense shall submit to Con-
eress a report that sets forth the Secretary’s assessment

of the effects that the provisions of this Act and the

*S 169 IS



22

1 amendments made by the Act are having on recruitment
2 and retention of personnel for the Armed Forces.
3 (b) FIRST REPORT.—The first report under this sec-

4 tion shall be submitted not later than December 1, 2000.
O

*S 169 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-17T04:53:59-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




