AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

106TH CONGRESS
LU H, R. 802

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase the annual limita-

My,

To

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

tion on deductible contributions to individual retirement accounts to
$5,000.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

FEBRUARY 23, 1999
Moore (for himself, Mr. FrosT, Mr. HINCHEY, Mr. BARTLETT of Mary-
land, and Mr. PAuL) introduced the following bill; which was referred to
the Committee on Ways and Means

A BILL

amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase
the annual hmitation on deductible contributions to indi-

vidual retirement accounts to $5,000.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twves of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. INCREASE IN AMOUNT OF DEDUCTIBLE IRA

CONTRIBUTIONS.

(a) INCREASE IN MAXiMUM AMOUNT OF DEDUC-
TION.—Subparagraph (A) of section 219(b)(1) of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 (relating to maximum
amount of deduction) is amended by striking “$2,000”

and inserting “$5,000”.



N~ oo o b~ o WwON P

(b) CONFORMING  AMENDMENTS.—Subsections

(a)(1), (b)(2), (§), and (p)(8) of section 408 of such Code

are each amended by striking “$2,000” each place it ap-
pears and inserting “$5,000”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

December 31, 1998.

*HR 802 TH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-17T03:22:47-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




