AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

106TH CONGRESS
nR HLR. 3104

To provide needed flexibility to the United States Department of Agriculture

To

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

to help developing countries and move surplus commodities from the

United States.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
OCTOBER 19, 1999

Ms. KAPTUR introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Agriculture

A BILL

provide needed flexibility to the United States Depart-
ment of Agriculture to help developing countries and

move surplus commodities from the United States.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. FOOD FOR PROGRESS AND SECTION 416.

(a) TRANSPORTATION OF FooOD AIb.—Section
1010(f)(3) of the Food Security Act of 1985 (7 U.S.C.
17360(f)(3)) is amended by striking “$30,000,000” and
inserting “$100,000,000”.

(b) MaxiMmUM COMMODITIES TO BE FURNISHED.—

Section 1010(g) of the Food Security Act of 1985 (7



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e A < e
o M W N B O

2
U.S.C. 17360(g)) is amended by striking 500,000 and

inserting ““1,000,000"".

(¢) DEVELOPMENT OF PRIVATE SECTOR AGRI-
CULTURE.—Section 1010(1)(1) of the Food Security Act
of 1985 (7 U.S.C. 17360(1)(1)) is amended by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$30,000,000".

(d) SECTION 416.—Section 416(b)(5) of the Agricul-
tural Act of 1949 (7 U.S.C. 1431(b)(5)) is amended by
adding at the end the following:

“(C) The Commodity Credit Corporation may pay
costs mmcurred in the development of program proposals
and costs associated with the administration, sale, imple-
mentation, and monitoring of programs implemented by
private voluntary organizations, nonprofit agricultural or-
canizations, cooperatives, Intergovernmental organiza-
tions, or other private entities.”.

O

*HR 3104 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-16T17:13:36-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




