AUTHENTICATED
GOVERNMENT

us.
INFORMATION

GPO

Calendar No. 122

106TH CONGRESS
L9 HLR. 1761

[Report No. 106-216]

A BILL

To amend provisions of title 17, United States
Code.

Juny 1, 1999

Reported with an amendment, committed to the Com-
mittee of the Whole House on the State of the Union,
and ordered to be printed



1B

Union Calendar No. 122
s H.R. 1761

[Report No. 106-216]

To amend provisions of title 17, United States Code.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
May 11, 1999

Mr. RoGAN (for himself and Mr. COBLE) introduced the following bill; which
was referred to the Committee on the Judiciary
JuLy 1, 1999

Reported with an amendment, committed to the Committee of the Whole
House on the State of the Union, and ordered to be printed

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

A BILL

To amend provisions of title 17, United States Code.
1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 tiwves of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
S5 hmprovement et of $999=



%
3
i

Seetion 504} of tithe 17, United States Code; is
aetded—

X3 = 2
) Y

“B) I a ease where the eopyrieht owner dem
onstrates that the mfrimeement was part of a re-

© 00O N O 0o B~ W DN

N N N DN B B R R R R R R R
W N B O © 0 N o 0 W N B O

24 Seettonr d0Her of Hitle 1 Hited States Code; s

*HR 1761 RH



1

© 00 N O O b~ w DN

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

Q
(3}

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Copyright Damages Im-
provement Act of 1999
SEC. 2. STATUTORY DAMAGES ENHANCEMENT.

Section 504(c) of title 17, Unated States Code, 1is
amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A4) by striking “$500” and inserting

“$7507; and

(B) by striking “$20,000” and inserting

“$30,000”; and

(2) in paragraph (2)—

(A) by wnserting “(A)” after “(2)”;
(B) by striking “$100,000” and inserting

“$300,000”;

(C) by inserting after the second sentence
the following:

“(B) In a case where the copyright owner dem-
onstrates that the infringement was part of a repeated
pattern or practice of infringement, the court may in-
crease the award of statutory damages to a sum of not

more than $250,000 per work.”; and

*HR 1761 RH



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R e
E WO N B O © 0 N O U A W N R O

4
(D) by striking “The court shall remit stat-

utory damages” and inserting the following:
“(C) The court shall remat statutory damages’.
SEC. 3. SENTENCING COMMISSION GUIDELINES.

Section 2(g) of the No Electronic Theft (NET) Act (28
U.S.C. 994 note) is amended by striking paragraph (2) and
inserting the following:

“(2) In implementing paragraph (1), the Sentencing
Commassion shall amend the guideline applicable to crimi-
nal infringement of a copyright or trademark to provide
an enhancement based upon the retail price of the legiti-
mate items that are infringed upon and the quantity of the
mfringing items. To the extent the conduct involves a viola-
tion of section 2319A of title 18, United States Code, the
enhancement shall be based upon the retail price of the in-
fringing items and the quantity of the infringing items.

“(3) Paragraph (1) shall be implemented not later
than 3 months after the later of—

“(A) the first day occurring after May 20, 1999,
or
“(B) the first day after the date of the enactment
of this paragraph,
on which sufficient members of the Sentencing Commission

have been confirmed to constitute a quorum.

*HR 1761 RH



5}
1 “(4) The Commassion shall promulgate the guidelines
2 or amendments provided for under this section in accord-
3 ance with the procedures set forth in section 21(a) of the
4 Sentencing Act of 1987, as though the authority under that
S Act had not expired.”.

*HR 1761 RH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-16T20:30:23-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




