AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

106TH CONGRESS
LS HLR. 1357

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase the maximum
amount which may be contributed annually to an individual retirement
plan to $5,000 and to increase the maximum amount which may be

contributed annually to an education individual retirement account to
$2,000.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Marcm 25, 1999
Mr. SOUDER (for himself, Mr. FrosT, Mr. FOssELLA, Mrs. EMERSON, Mr.
Soows, Mr. ForBes, Mr. Pavr, Mr. WynN, Mr. HOSTETTLER, Mr.
NETHERCUTT, Mr. BURR of North Carolina, and Mr. GARY MILLER of
California) introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Com-
mittee on Ways and Means

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to increase
the maximum amount which may be contributed annually
to an individual retirement plan to $5,000 and to in-
crease the maximum amount which may be contributed

annually to an education individual retirement account
to $2,000.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,



© 00 N O U b~ W DN PP

N DN N N NN DN B PP PP,k PPk
o A W N P O © 0 N O O b WO N B O

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Retirement and Edu-
cation Assets Power Act”.
SEC. 2. INCREASE IN MAXIMUM ANNUAL CONTRIBUTION TO

INDIVIDUAL RETIREMENT PLAN.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subparagraph (A) of section
219(b)(1) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 (relating
to maximum amount of deduction) is amended by striking

“$2,000” and inserting “$5,000”.

Subsections

(b) CONFORMING ~ AMENDMENTS.
(a)(1), (b), (3), and (p)(8) of section 408 of such Code
are each amended by striking “$2,000” each place it ap-
pears and inserting “$5,000”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 1999.

SEC. 3. INCREASE IN MAXIMUM ANNUAL CONTRIBUTION TO
EDUCATION INDIVIDUAL RETIREMENT AC-
COUNT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 530(b)(1)(A)(11) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking
“$500” and inserting “$2,000".

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
4973(e)(1)(A) of such Code is amended by striking
“$500” and inserting “$2,000".

*HR 1357 IH



3

1 (¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
2 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

3 December 31, 1999.

*HR 1357 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-17T01:49:00-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




