AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

105TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 9 9 7

To amend chapter 44 of title 28, United States Code, to authorize the
use of certain arbitration procedures in all district courts, to modify
the damage limitation applicable to cases referred to arbitration, and
for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES
JuLy 8, 1997

Mr. GRASSLEY introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To amend chapter 44 of title 28, United States Code, to
authorize the use of certain arbitration procedures in
all district courts, to modify the damage limitation appli-
cable to cases referred to arbitration, and for other pur-
poses.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. ARBITRATION IN DISTRICT COURTS.

(a) AUTHORIZATION OF ARBITRATION.—Section

651(a) of title 28, United States Code, is amended to read

o o A~ W N P

as follows:



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N N P B RP R R R R R R
N B O © 0 N O U M W N L O

H(a)

2

AvuTHorIity.—Each United States district court

shall authorize by local rule the use of arbitration in any

civil action, including adversary proceedings in bank-

ruptey, in accordance with this chapter.”.

(b) ACTIONS REFERRED TO ARBITRATION.—Section

652(a) of title 28, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) in the matter preceding subparagraph
(A) by striking “and section 901(¢)” and all
that follows through “651”7 and inserting ‘“‘a
district court”; and

(B) in subparagraph (B) by striking
“$100,000” and inserting “$150,000”; and
(2) in paragraph (2) by striking “$100,000”

and inserting “$150,000".

(¢)

CERTIFICATION OF ARBITRATORS.—Section

656(a) of title 28, United States Code, is amended by

striking “listed in section 658,

(d) REMOVAL OF LIMITATION.—Section 658 of title

28, United States Code, and the item relating to such sec-

tion in the table of sections at the beginning of chapter

44 of title 28, United States Code, are repealed.

*S 997 IS

O



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-17T16:39:21-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




