>
GPO,

Federal Register/Vol. 84, No. 169/Friday, August 30, 2019/ Notices

45823

As noted above, the May 17, 2019
notice invited public comments on
duties of up to 25 percent on the
products covered by the proposed $300
billion action. The current modification
in the rate of additional duty takes into
account the public comments and
testimony, as well as advice from
advisory committees and the
interagency Section 301 committee,
concerning the action proposed in the
May 17 notice.

The Annex to this notice amends the
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the
United States to provide that the rate of
additional duties for the products
covered in Annex A and Annex C of the
August 20 notice will be 15 percent.
This increase in the rate of duty does
not change the effective date of Annex
A (September 1, 2019) or of Annex C
(December 15, 2019).

Annex

Effective with respect to goods
entered for consumption, or withdrawn
from warehouse for consumption, on or
after 12:01 a.m. eastern daylight time on
September 1, 2019, subchapter III of
chapter 99 of the Harmonized Tariff
Schedule of the United States (HTSUS)
is modified:

1. By amending U.S. Note 20(r) to
subchapter III of chapter 99, as
established by the U.S. Trade
Representative in a determination
contained in 84 Federal Register 43304
(August 20, 2019), by deleting “10
percent” each place that it appears, and
inserting ““15 percent” in lieu thereof;
and

2. by amending the Rates of Duty 1-
General column of heading 9903.88.15,
as established by the U.S. Trade
Representative in a determination
contained in 84 Federal Register 43304
(August 20, 2019), by deleting “10%”’,
and inserting “15%” in lieu thereof.

Effective with respect to goods
entered for consumption, or withdrawn
from warehouse for consumption, on or
after 12:01 a.m. eastern daylight time on
December 15, 2019, subchapter III of
chapter 99 of the Harmonized Tariff
Schedule of the United States is
modified:

1. By amending U.S. Note 20(t) to
subchapter III of chapter 99, as
established by the U.S. Trade
Representative in a determination
contained in 84 Federal Register 43304
(August 20, 2019), by deleting “10
percent” each place that it appears, and
inserting ““15 percent” in lieu thereof;
and

2. by amending the Rates of Duty 1-
General column of heading 9903.88.16,
as established by the U.S. Trade
Representative in a determination

contained in 84 Federal Register 43304
(August 20, 2019), by deleting “10%"”,
and inserting “15%” in lieu thereof.

Joseph Barloon,

General Counsel, Office of the U.S. Trade
Representative.

[FR Doc. 2019-18838 Filed 8—-27-19; 4:15 pm]
BILLING CODE 3290-F9-P

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
Federal Highway Administration

Notice of Final Federal Agency Action
on the I-10 Mobile River Bridge and
Bayway Project in Alabama

AGENCY: Federal Highway
Administration (FHWA), Department of
Transportation (DOT).

ACTION: Notice of Limitation on Claims

for Judicial Review of Actions by
FHWA.

SUMMARY: This notice announces actions
taken by the FHWA that are final. The
action relates to the proposed project to
increase the capacity of Interstate Route
10 (I-10) by constructing a new six-lane
bridge across the Mobile River and
replacing the existing four-lane I-10
bridges across Mobile Bay with eight
lanes above the 100-year storm
elevation. The proposed project is
located in Mobile and Baldwin
Counties, Alabama. Those actions grant
approvals for the project.

DATES: By this notice, the FHWA is
advising the public of final agency
actions subject to 23 U.S.C. 139()(1). A
claim seeking judicial review of the
Federal agency actions on the project
will be barred unless the claim is filed
on or before January 27, 2020. If the
Federal law that authorizes judicial
review of a claim provides a time period
of less than 150 days for filing such
claim, then that shorter time period still
applies.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Mark D. Bartlett, Division
Administrator, FHWA Alabama
Division, 9500 Wynlakes Place,
Montgomery, Alabama 36117-8515,
Telephone: (334) 274-6350,
Email:Mark.Bartlett@dot.gov. The
FHWA Alabama Division Office’s
normal business hours are 8:00 a.m. to
4:30 p.m. (Central Standard Time). You
may also contact Matt J. Ericksen,
Southwest Region Engineer, Alabama
Department of Transportation, 1701 I-
65 West Service Road North, Mobile,
Alabama 36618, Telephone: (251) 470—
8200, Email: ericksenm@dot.state.al.us.
The Alabama Department of

Transportation’s normal business hours
are 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Notice is
hereby given that FHWA has taken final
agency actions subject to 23 U.S.C.
139(])(1) by issuing a Record of Decision
(ROD) for the following highway project
in the State of Alabama: I-10 Mobile
River Bridge and Bayway Project in
Mobile and Baldwin Counties. The
proposed project to increase the
capacity of Interstate Route 10 (I-10) by
constructing a new six-lane bridge
across the Mobile River and replacing
the existing four-lane I-10 bridges
across Mobile Bay with eight lanes
above the 100-year storm elevation. The
actions taken by FHWA, and the laws
under which such actions were taken,
are described in the Combined Final
Environmental Impact Statement (FEILS)
and ROD approved on August 15, 2019,
and in other documents in the project
records. The Combined FEIS and ROD
and other project records can be viewed
on the project’s website at:
www.mobileriverbridge.com. These
documents and other project records are
also available by contacting FHWA or
the Alabama Department of
Transportation at the phone numbers
and addresses listed above.

This notice applies to all Federal
agency decisions as of the issuance date
of this notice and all laws under which
such actions were taken, including but
not limited to:

1. General: National Environmental
Policy Act (NEPA) [42 U.S.C. 4321—
4351]; Federal-Aid Highway Act
(FAHA) [23 U.S.C. 109 and 23 U.S.C.
128].

2. Air: Clean Air Act [42 U.S.C. 7401—
7671(q)].

3. Land: Section 4(f) of the
Department of Transportation Act of
1966 [49 U.S.C. 303 and 23 U.S.C. 138].

4. Wildlife: Endangered Species Act
[16 U.S.C. 15311544 and Section
1536]; Marine Mammal Protection Act
[16 U.S.C. 1361-1423h]; Fish and
Wildlife Coordination Act [16 U.S.C.
661-667(d)]; Migratory Bird Treaty Act
[16 U.S.C. 703-712]; Magnuson-Stevens
Fishery Conservation and Management
Act of 1976, as amended [16 U.S.C. 1801
et seq.].

5. Historic and Cultural Resources:
Section 106 of the National Historic
Preservation Act of 1966, as amended
[16 U.S.C. 470(f) et seq.]; Archeological
Resources Protection Act of 1977 [16
U.S.C. 470aa—470mm]; Archeological
and Historic Preservation Act [16 U.S.C.
469-469c]; Native American Grave
Protection and Repatriation Act
(NAGPRA) [25 U.S.C. 3001-3013].

6. Social and Economic: Civil Rights
Act of 1964 [42 U.S.C. 2000(d)-


mailto:ericksenm@dot.state.al.us
http://www.mobileriverbridge.com
mailto:Mark.Bartlett@dot.gov

45824

Federal Register/Vol. 84, No. 169/Friday, August 30, 2019/ Notices

2000(d)(1)]; Farmland Protection Policy
Act (FPPA) [7 U.S.C. 4201-4209];
Uniform Relocation Assistance and Real
Property Acquisition Act [42 U.S.C.
4601 et seq.].

7. Noise: 23 U.S.C. 109(i).

8. Hazardous Materials:
Comprehensive Environmental
Response, Compensation, and Liability
Act (CERCLA) [42 U.S.C. 9601 et seq.].

9. Executive Orders: E.O. 11990
Protection of Wetlands; E.O. 11988
Floodplain Management; E.O. 12898,
Federal Actions to Address
Environmental Justice in Minority
Populations and Low-Income
Populations; E.O. 11593 Protection and
Enhancement of Cultural Resources;
E.O. 13287 Preserve America; E.O.
13175 Consultation and Coordination
with Indian Tribal Governments; E.O.
13112 Invasive Species; E.O. 13186
Responsibilities of Federal Agencies to
Protect Migratory Birds.

(Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance
Program Number 20.205, Highway Planning
and Construction. The regulations
implementing Executive Order 12372
regarding intergovernmental consultation on
Federal programs and activities apply to this
program.)

Authority: 23 U.S.C. 139()(1).

Issued on: August 21, 2019
Mark D. Bartlett,
Division Administrator, Montgomery, AL.
[FR Doc. 2019-18699 Filed 8—29-19; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 4910-RY-P

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

Federal Railroad Administration

[Docket No. FRA-2019-0004—-N-15]

Proposed Agency Information
Collection Activities; Comment
Request

AGENCY: Federal Railroad
Administration (FRA), U.S. Department
of Transportation (DOT).

ACTION: Notice of information collection;
request for comment.

SUMMARY: Under the Paperwork
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) and its
implementing regulations, FRA seeks
approval of the Information Collection
Request (ICR) abstracted below. Before
submitting this ICR to the Office of
Management and Budget (OMB) for
approval, FRA is soliciting public
comment on specific aspects of the
activities identified in the ICR.

1 Throughout the tables in this document, the
dollar equivalent cost is derived from the Surface

DATES: Interested persons are invited to
submit comments on or before October
29, 2019.

ADDRESSES: Submit written comments
on the ICR activities by mail to either:
Ms. Hodan Wells, Information
Collection Clearance Officer, Office of
Railroad Safety, Regulatory Analysis
Division, Federal Railroad
Administration, 1200 New Jersey
Avenue SE, Washington, DC 20590; or
Ms. Kim Toone, Information Collection
Clearance Officer, Office of Information
Technology, Federal Railroad
Administration, 1200 New Jersey
Avenue SE, Washington, DC 20590.
Commenters requesting FRA to
acknowledge receipt of their respective
comments must include a self-addressed
stamped postcard stating, “Comments
on OMB Control Number 2130-0526,”
(the relevant OMB control number for
each ICR is listed below) and should
also include the title of the ICR.
Alternatively, comments may be faxed
to 202—493-6216 or 202—493-6497, or
emailed to Ms. Wells at hodan.wells@
dot.gov, or Ms. Toone at kim.toone@
dot.gov. Please refer to the assigned
OMB control number in any
correspondence submitted. FRA will
summarize comments received in
response to this notice in a subsequent
notice and include them in its
information collection submission to
OMB for approval.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms.
Hodan Wells, Information Collection
Clearance Officer, Office of Railroad
Safety, Regulatory Analysis Division,
Federal Railroad Administration, 1200
New Jersey Avenue SE, Washington, DC
20590 (telephone: (202) 493-0440) or
Ms. Kim Toone, Information Collection
Clearance Officer, Office of Information
Technology, Federal Railroad
Administration, 1200 New Jersey
Avenue SE, Washington, DC 20590
(telephone: 202—493-6132).
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The PRA,
44 U.S.C. 3501-3520, and its
implementing regulations, 5 CFR part
1320, require Federal agencies to
provide 60-days’ notice to the public to
allow comment on information
collection activities before seeking OMB
approval of the activities. See 44 U.S.C.
3506, 3507; 5 CFR 1320.8 through
1320.12. Specifically, FRA invites
interested parties to comment on the
following ICR regarding: (1) Whether the
information collection activities are
necessary for FRA to properly execute
its functions, including whether the
activities will have practical utility; (2)

Transportation Board’s Full Year Wage A&B data

series using the appropriate employee group hourly

the accuracy of FRA’s estimates of the
burden of the information collection
activities, including the validity of the
methodology and assumptions used to
determine the estimates; (3) ways for
FRA to enhance the quality, utility, and
clarity of the information being
collected; and (4) ways for FRA to
minimize the burden of information
collection activities on the public,
including the use of automated
collection techniques or other forms of
information technology. See 44 U.S.C.
3506(c)(2)(A); 5 CFR 1320.8(d)(1).

FRA believes that soliciting public
comment may reduce the administrative
and paperwork burdens associated with
the collection of information that
Federal regulations mandate. In
summary, FRA reasons that comments
received will advance three objectives:
(1) Reduce reporting burdens; (2)
organize information collection
requirements in a “user-friendly” format
to improve the use of such information;
and (3) accurately assess the resources
expended to retrieve and produce
information requested. See 44 U.S.C.
3501.

The summary below describes the ICR
that FRA will submit for OMB clearance
as the PRA requires:

Title: Control of Alcohol and Drug
Use in Railroad Operations.

OMB Control Number: 2130-0526.

Abstract: The Federal Railroad
Administration (FRA) and the railroad
industry will use the information
collected to determine the extent of
alcohol and drug abuse on railroad
property, curtail alcohol and drug use,
and ensure compliance with all 49 CFR
part 219 requirements covering
regulated employees. For example, FRA
will use the information collected to
ensure that regulated employees are
subject to random alcohol and drug
testing. This information collection also
covers foreign-railroads’ foreign-based
employees who perform train or
dispatching service in the United States.

Type of Request: Extension with
change (revised estimates) of a currently
approved collection.

Affected Public: Businesses.

Form(s): FRA F 6180.73, 6180.74,
6180.75.

Respondent Universe: 713 railroads
(includes 2 foreign-based railroads),
44,797 MOW employees, and 146,000
employees.

Frequency of Submission: On
occasion.

ReportingBurden:

wage rate that includes 75-percent overhead
charges.


mailto:hodan.wells@dot.gov
mailto:hodan.wells@dot.gov
mailto:kim.toone@dot.gov
mailto:kim.toone@dot.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-06-24T19:45:46-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




