>
GPO,

Federal Register/Vol. 84, No. 90/ Thursday, May 9, 2019/ Notices

20459

pending reconsideration. Petitions to
stay that do not involve environmental
issues must be filed by May 17, 2019,
and formal expressions of intent to file
an OFA to subsidize continued rail
service under 49 CFR 1152.27(c)(2) 4
must be filed by May 20, 2019.5
Petitions to reopen must be filed by May
29, 2019, with the Surface
Transportation Board, 395 E Street SW,
Washington, DC 20423-0001.

A copy of any petition filed with the
Board should be sent to TTI's
representative, Louis E. Gitomer, Law
Offices of Louis E. Gitomer, LLC, 600
Baltimore Ave., Suite 301, Towson, MD
21204.

If the verified notice contains false or
misleading information, the exemption
is void ab initio.

Board decisions and notices are
available at www.stb.gov.

Decided: May 3, 2019.

By the Board, Allison C. Davis, Acting
Director, Office of Proceedings.

Jeffrey Herzig,

Clearance Clerk.

[FR Doc. 2019-09537 Filed 5—8—19; 8:45 am|]
BILLING CODE 4915-01-P

OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES
TRADE REPRESENTATIVE

Notice of Modification of Section 301
Action: China’s Acts, Policies, and
Practices Related to Technology
Transfer, Intellectual Property, and
Innovation

AGENCY: Office of the United States
Trade Representative.
ACTION: Notice of modification of action.

SUMMARY: In accordance with the
direction of the President, the U.S.
Trade Representative (Trade
Representative) has determined to
modify the action being taken in this
Section 301 investigation by increasing
the rate of additional duty from 10
percent to 25 percent for the products of
China covered by the September 2018
action in this investigation. The Trade
Representative has further determined
to establish a process by which
interested persons may request that
particular products classified within a
tariff subheading covered by the
September 2018 action be excluded
from the additional duties.

4The filing fee for OFAs can be found at 49 CFR
1002.2(f)(25).

5Because this is a discontinue proceeding and
not an abandonment, interim trail use/rail banking
and public use conditions are not appropriate.
Because there will be an environmental review
during abandonment, this discontinuance does not
require an environmental review.

DATES: The rate of additional duty will
increase to 25 percent with respect to
products covered by the September
2018 action on May 10, 2019.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For
questions about this notice, contact
Associate General Counsel Arthur Tsao,
Assistant General Counsel Philip Butler,
or Director of Industrial Goods Justin
Hoffmann at (202) 395-5725. For
questions on customs classification or
implementation of additional duties on
products covered by the September
2018 action, contact traderemedy@
cbp.dhs.gov.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

A. September 2018 Action

For background on the proceedings in
this investigation, please see the prior
notices issued in the investigation,
including 82 FR 40213 (August 23,
2017), 83 FR 14906 (April 6, 2018), 83
FR 28710 (June 20, 2018), 83 FR 33608
(July 17, 2018), 83 FR 38760 (August 7,
2018), and 83 FR 40823 (August 16,
2018).

In a notice published on September
21, 2018 (83 FR 47974), the Trade
Representative, at the direction of the
President, announced a determination
to modify the action being taken in the
investigation by imposing additional
duties on products of China with an
annual trade value of approximately
$200 billion. The rate of additional duty
initially was 10 percent. Those
additional duties were effective starting
on September 24, 2018, and currently
are in effect. Under Annex B of the
September 21 notice, the rate of
additional duty was set to increase to 25
percent on January 1, 2019. In the
September 21 notice, the Trade
Representative stated that he would
continue to consider the actions taken
in this investigation, and if further
modifications were appropriate, he
would take into account the extensive
public comments and testimony
previously provided in response to the
notices published on July 17, 2018 (83
FR 33608) and August 7, 2018 (83 FR
38760).

On September 28, 2018 (83 FR 49153),
the Trade Representative issued a
conforming amendment and
modification of the September 21
notice. The current notice refers to the
September 21 notice, as modified by the
September 28 notice, as the ‘September
2018 action.’

On December 19, 2018 (83 FR 65198),
in accordance with the direction of the
President, the Trade Representative
determined to modify the September
2018 action by postponing until March
2, 2019, the increase in the rate of

additional duty to 25 percent. The
Annex to the December 19 notice,
which superseded Annex B to the
September 21 notice, amended the
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the
United States (HTSUS) to reflect this
postponement of the increase in the rate
of duty applicable to the September
2018 action.

On March 5, 2019 (84 FR 7699), in
accordance with the direction of the
President, the Trade Representative
determined to modify the September
2018 action by postponing until further
notice the increase in the rate of
additional duty to 25 percent. Annex B
of the September 21 notice (83 FR
47974) and the Annex to the December
19 notice (83 FR 65198) were rescinded.
In accordance with Annex A of the
September 21 notice, the rate of
additional duty under the September
2018 action remained at 10 percent until
further notice.

B. Determination to Further Modify
September 2018 Action

The United States is engaging with
China with the goal of obtaining the
elimination of the acts, policies, and
practices covered in the investigation.
The leaders of the United States and
China met on December 1, 2018, and
agreed to hold negotiations on a range
of issues, including those covered in
this Section 301 investigation. See
https://www.whitehouse.gov/briefings-
statements/statement-press-secretary-
regarding-presidents-working-dinner-
china/. Since the meeting on December
1, the United States and China have
engaged in additional rounds of
negotiation on these issues, including
meetings in March, April, and May of
2019. In the most recent negotiations,
China has chosen to retreat from
specific commitments agreed to in
earlier rounds. In light of the lack of
progress in discussions with China, the
President has directed the Trade
Representative to increase the rate of
additional duty to 25 percent.

Section 301(b) of the Trade Act of
1974, as amended (Trade Act), provides
that the Trade Representative ‘“‘shall
take all appropriate and feasible action
authorized under [Section 301(c)] to
obtain the elimination of [the] act,
policy, or practice [under
investigation].” Section 307(a)(1) of the
Trade Act authorizes the Trade
Representative to modify or terminate
any action being taken under Section
301, subject to the specific direction, if
any, of the President if “‘the burden or
restriction on United States commerce

. . of the acts, policies, and practices,
that are the subject of such action has
increased or decreased, or such action is


mailto:traderemedy@cbp.dhs.gov
mailto:traderemedy@cbp.dhs.gov
http://www.stb.gov
https://www.whitehouse.gov/briefings-statements/statement-press-secretary-regarding-presidents-working-dinner-china/
https://www.whitehouse.gov/briefings-statements/statement-press-secretary-regarding-presidents-working-dinner-china/
https://www.whitehouse.gov/briefings-statements/statement-press-secretary-regarding-presidents-working-dinner-china/
https://www.whitehouse.gov/briefings-statements/statement-press-secretary-regarding-presidents-working-dinner-china/

20460

Federal Register/Vol. 84, No. 90/ Thursday, May 9, 2019/ Notices

being taken under Section [301(b)] of
this title and is no longer appropriate.”
In light of the lack of progress in the
additional rounds of negotiations since
March 2019, and at the direction of the
President, the Trade Representative has
determined that it is appropriate for the
rate of additional duty under the
September 2018 action to increase to 25
percent on May 10, 2019.

The Trade Representative’s decision
to modify the September 2018 action
takes into account the extensive public
comments and testimony, as well as
advice from advisory committees,
concerning the actions proposed in the
notices issued in advance of the
September 2018 action (83 FR 33608
and 83 FR 38760). Those notices, among
other things, requested comments on
whether the rate of additional duties
should be 10 percent or 25 percent. The
Trade Representative’s decision also
reflects the advice of the interagency
Section 301 Committee.

The Annex to this notice amends the
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the
United States to provide that the rate of
additional duties for the September
2018 action will increase to 25 percent
on May 10, 2019.

Pursuant to Sections 301(b), 301(c),
304(a), and 307(a) of the Trade Act, the
Trade Representative has determined
that the Office of the United States
Trade Representative (USTR) will
establish a process by which interested
persons may request that particular
products classified within an HTSUS
subheading covered by the September
2018 action be excluded from the
additional duties. USTR will publish a
separate notice describing the product
exclusion process, including the
procedures for submitting exclusion
requests, and an opportunity for
interested persons to submit oppositions
to a request.

Annex

Effective with respect to goods (i)
entered for consumption, or withdrawn
from warehouse for consumption, on or
after 12:01 a.m. eastern daylight time on
May 10, 2019, and (ii) exported to the
United States on or after May 10, 2019,
subchapter III of chapter 99 of the
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the
United States is modified:

1. By amending U.S. Note 20(e) to
subchapter III of chapter 99 by deleting
10 percent” each place that it appears,
and inserting ‘25 percent” in lieu
thereof;

2. by amending U.S. Note 20(g) to
subchapter III of chapter 99 by deleting
“10 percent” each place that it appears,
and inserting ‘25 percent” in lieu
thereof;

3. by amending the Rates of Duty 1-
General column of heading 9903.88.03
by deleting “10%”, and inserting
“25%"’ in lieu thereof; and

4. by amending the Rates of Duty 1-
General column of heading 9903.88.04
by deleting “10%”, and inserting
“25%” in lieu thereof.

Joseph Barloon,

General Counsel, Office of the U.S. Trade
Representative.

[FR Doc. 2019-09681 Filed 5-8-19; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 3290-F9-P

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

Federal Aviation Administration
[Docket No. FAA—2019-0333]

Agency Information Collection
Activities: Requests for Comments;
Clearance of Renewed Approval of
Information Collection: Small
Unmanned Aircraft Registration
System (sUAS)

AGENCY: Federal Aviation

Administration (FAA), DOT.

ACTION: Notice and request for
comments.

SUMMARY: In accordance with the
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, FAA
invites public comments about our
intention to request Office of
Management and Budget (OMB) renewal
approval for information collection
2120-0765. Aircraft registration is
necessary to ensure personal
accountability among all users of the
national airspace system. Aircraft
registration also allows the FAA and
law enforcement agencies to address
non-compliance by providing the means
for identifying an aircraft’s owner and
operator. This collection also permits
individuals to de-register or update their
record in the registration database.
DATES: Written comments should be
submitted by July 8, 2019.

ADDRESSES: Please send written
comments:

By Electronic Docket:
www.regulations.gov (Enter docket
number into search field).

By mail: Ken Thompson, Manager,
Aircraft Registration Branch, AFB-710,
P.O. Box 25504, Oklahoma City, OK
73125.

By fax: 405—-954—8068.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Bonnie Lefko at: bonnie.lefko@faa.gov;
or by phone: 405-954-7461.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

Public Comments Invited: You are
asked to comment on any aspect of this

information collection, including (a)
Whether the proposed collection of
information is necessary for FAA’s
performance; (b) the accuracy of the
estimated burden; (c) ways for FAA to
enhance the quality, utility and clarity
of the information collection; and (d)
ways that the burden could be
minimized without reducing the quality
of the collected information. The agency
will summarize and/or include your
comments in the request for OMB’s
clearance of this information collection.

OMB Control Number: 2120-0765.

Title: Small Unmanned Aircraft
Registration System (sUAS).

Form Numbers: None.

Type of Review: Renewal of existing
collection.

Background: The Secretary of the
Department of Transportation (DOT)
and the Administrator of the Federal
Aviation Administration (FAA) affirmed
that all unmanned aircraft, including
model aircraft, are aircraft. As such, in
accordance with 49 U.S.C. 44101(a) and
as further prescribed in 14 CFR part 48,
registration is required prior to
operation. See 80 FR 63912, 63913
(October 22, 2015). Aircraft registration
is necessary to ensure personal
accountability among all users of the
national airspace system. Aircraft
registration also allows the FAA and
law enforcement agencies to address
non-compliance by providing the means
for identifying an aircraft’s owner and
operator.

Subject to certain exceptions
discussed below, aircraft must be
registered prior to operation. See 49
U.S.C. 44101-44103. Upon registration,
the Administrator must issue a
certificate of registration to the aircraft
owner. See 49 U.S5.C. 44103.

Registration, however, does not
provide the authority to operate.
Persons intending to operate a small
unmanned aircraft must operate in
accordance with section 336 of Public
Law 112-95, part 107 or part 91, in
accordance with a waiver issued under
part 107, in accordance with an
exemption issued under 14 CFR part 11
(including those persons operating
under an exemption issued pursuant to
section 333 of Public Law 112-95), or in
conjunction with the issuance of a
special airworthiness certificate, and are
required to register.

Respondents: Approximately 300,000
affected sUAS registrations and 14,000
de-registrations annually.

Frequency: Information is collected
on occasion.

Estimated Average Burden per
Response: 10 minutes per response to
register and 3 minutes per response to
de-register.


mailto:bonnie.lefko@faa.gov
http://www.regulations.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-05-31T16:01:16-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




