AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

115TH CONGRESS REPORT
2d Session HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 115-582

PROVIDING FOR CONSIDERATION OF THE BILL (H.R. 4296) TO PLACE RE-
QUIREMENTS ON OPERATIONAL RISK CAPITAL REQUIREMENTS FOR
BANKING ORGANIZATIONS ESTABLISHED BY AN APPROPRIATE FED-
ERAL BANKING AGENCY, AND PROVIDING FOR CONSIDERATION OF THE
BILL (H.R. 4607) TO AMEND THE ECONOMIC GROWTH AND REGULATORY
PAPERWORK REDUCTION ACT OF 1996 TO ENSURE THAT FEDERAL FI-
NANCIAL REGULATORS PERFORM A COMPREHENSIVE REVIEW OF REG-
ULATIONS TO IDENTIFY OUTDATED OR OTHERWISE UNNECESSARY
REGULATORY REQUIREMENTS IMPOSED ON COVERED PERSONS, AND
FOR OTHER PURPOSES

FEBRUARY 26, 2018.—Referred to the House Calendar and ordered to be printed

Mr. BUCK, from the Committee on Rules,
submitted the following

REPORT

[To accompany H. Res. 747]

The Committee on Rules, having had under consideration House
Resolution 747, by a record vote of 8 to 3, report the same to the
House with the recommendation that the resolution be adopted.

SUMMARY OF PROVISIONS OF THE RESOLUTION

The resolution provides for consideration of H.R. 4296, to place
requirements on operational risk capital requirements for banking
organizations established by an appropriate Federal banking agen-
cy, under a closed rule. The resolution provides one hour of debate
equally divided and controlled by the chair and ranking minority
member of the Committee on Financial Services. The resolution
waives all points of order against consideration of the bill. The res-
olution provides that an amendment in the nature of a substitute
consisting of the text of Rules Committee Print 115-60, modified
by the amendment printed in part A of this report, shall be consid-
ered as adopted and the bill, as amended, shall be considered as
read. The resolution waives all points of order against provisions
in the bill, as amended. The resolution provides one motion to re-
commit with or without instructions.

Section 2 of the resolution provides for consideration of H.R.
4607, the Comprehensive Regulatory Review Act, under a closed
rule. The resolution provides one hour of debate equally divided
and controlled by the chair and ranking minority member of the

79-008



2

Committee on Financial Services. The resolution waives all points
of order against consideration of the bill. The resolution provides
that an amendment in the nature of a substitute consisting of the
text of Rules Committee Print 115-61, modified by the amendment
printed in part B of this report, shall be considered as adopted and
the bill, as amended, shall be considered as read. The resolution
waives all points of order against provisions in the bill, as amend-
ed. The resolution provides one motion to recommit with or without
instructions.

EXPLANATION OF WAIVERS

The waiver of all points of order against consideration of H.R.
4296 includes a waiver of the following:

e Section 302(f) of the Congressional Budget Act, which pro-
hibits consideration of legislation providing new budget author-
ity in excess of a 302(a) allocation of such authority;

e Section 303 of the Congressional Budget Act, which pro-
hibits consideration of legislation, providing a change in budget
authority for a fiscal year until the budget resolution for that
year has been agreed to; and

e Clause 10 of rule XXI, which prohibits the consideration of
a bill if it has the net effect of increasing mandatory spending
over the five-year or ten-year period.

Although the resolution waives all points of order against provi-
sions in H.R. 4296 as amended, the Committee is not aware of any
points of order. The waiver is prophylactic in nature.

The waiver of all points of order against consideration of H.R.
4607 includes a waiver of the following:

e Section 302(f) of the Congressional Budget Act, which pro-
hibits consideration of legislation providing new budget author-
ity in excess of a 302(a) allocation of such authority;

e Section 303 of the Congressional Budget Act, which pro-
hibits consideration of legislation, providing a change in
change in budget authority for a fiscal year until the budget
resolution for that year has been agreed to; and

e Clause 10 of rule XXI, which prohibits the consideration of
a bill if it has the net effect of increasing mandatory spending
over the five-year or ten-year period.

Although the resolution waives all points of order against provi-
sions in H.R. 4607 as amended, the Committee is not aware of any
points of order. The waiver is prophylactic in nature.

COMMITTEE VOTES

The results of each record vote on an amendment or motion to
report, together with the names of those voting for and against, are
printed below:

Rules Committee record vote No. 193
Motion by Mr. Burgess to report the rule. Adopted: 8-3

Majority Members Vote Minority Members Vote

Mr. Cole Ms. Slaughter Nay
Mr. Woodall Yea Mr. McGovern
Mr. Burgess Yea Mr. Hastings of Florida .......cccccoovvevververnnnnne Nay

Mr. Collins Yea Mr. Polis Nay




Majority Members Vote Minority Members Vote

Mr. Byrne Yea
Mr. Newhouse Yea
Mr. Buck Yea
Ms. Cheney Yea
Mr. Sessions, Chairman ..........ccccccooeveeeveiennane Yea

PART A—TEXT OF AMENDMENT TO H.R. 4296 CONSIDERED AS ADOPTED

SUMMARY OF THE AMENDMENT TO H.R. 4296 IN PART A CONSIDERED
AS ADOPTED

1. Luetkemeyer (MO): Removes a total of $31,428,572.00 from
the Federal Reserve’s surplus fund to cover the perceived costs as-
sociated with this legislation.

Add at the end the following:

SEC. 2. RE]I)SUCTISON OF SURPLUS FUNDS OF FEDERAL RESERVE

(a) IN GENERAL..—Section 7(a)(3)(A) of the Federal Reserve Act
(12 U.S.C. 289(a)(3)(A)) is amended by striking “$7,500,000,000”
and inserting “$7,468,571,428”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—Subsection (a) shall take effect on May 1,
2018.

PART B—TEXT OF AMENDMENT TO H.R. 4607 CONSIDERED AS ADOPTED

SUMMARY OF THE AMENDMENT TO H.R. 4607 IN PART B CONSIDERED
AS ADOPTED

1. Loudermilk (GA): Reduces the cap on surplus funds of the Fed-
eral Reserve Banks from $7,500,000,000 to $7,495,714,285.

Add at the end the following:
SEC. 6. RE]I)SUCTISON OF SURPLUS FUNDS OF FEDERAL RESERVE

(a) IN GENERAL..—Section 7(a)(3)(A) of the Federal Reserve Act
(12 U.S.C. 289(a)(3)(A)) is amended by striking “$7,500,000,000”
and inserting “$7,495,714,285”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—Subsection (a) shall take effect on May 1,
2018.

O




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2018-02-27T05:52:12-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




