AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

REPORT

114TH CONGRESS
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 114-203

1st Session

IMPROVING ACCESS TO CAPITAL FOR EMERGING
GROWTH COMPANIES ACT

JuLy 14, 2015.—Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the State of
the Union and ordered to be printed

Mr. HENSARLING, from the Committee on Financial Services,
submitted the following

REPORT

[To accompany H.R. 2064]

[Including cost estimate of the Congressional Budget Office]

The Committee on Financial Services, to whom was referred the
bill (H.R. 2064) to amend certain provisions of the securities laws
relating to the treatment of emerging growth companies, having
considered the same, report favorably thereon with an amendment
and recommend that the bill as amended do pass.

The amendment is as follows:

Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the following:

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Improving Access to Capital for Emerging Growth
Companies Act”.

SEC. 2. FILING REQUIREMENT FOR PUBLIC FILING PRIOR TO PUBLIC OFFERING.

Section 6(e)(1) of the Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77f(e)(1)) is amended by
striking “21 days” and inserting “15 days”.

SEC. 3. GRACE PERIOD FOR CHANGE OF STATUS OF EMERGING GROWTH COMPANIES.

Section 6(e)(1) of the Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77f(e)(1)) is further amend-
ed by adding at the end the following: “An issuer that was an emerging growth com-
pany at the time it submitted a confidential registration statement or, in lieu there-
of, a publicly filed registration statement for review under this subsection but ceases
to be an emerging growth company thereafter shall continue to be treated as an
emerging market growth company for the purposes of this subsection through the
earlier of the date on which the issuer consummates its initial public offering pursu-
ant to such registrations statement or the end of the 1-year period beginning on the
date the company ceases to be an emerging growth company.”.

SEC. 4. SIMPLIFIED DISCLOSURE REQUIREMENTS FOR EMERGING GROWTH COMPANIES.

Section 102 of the Jumpstart Our Business Startups Act (Public Law 112-106)
is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(d) SIMPLIFIED DISCLOSURE REQUIREMENTS.—With respect to an emerging growth
company (as such term is defined under section 2 of the Securities Act of 1933):

49-006



2

“(1) REQUIREMENT TO INCLUDE NOTICE ON FORMS S—1 AND F-1.—Not later than
30 days after the date of enactment of this subsection, the Securities and Ex-
change Commission shall revise its general instructions on Forms S-1 and F-
1 to indicate that a registration statement filed (or submitted for confidential
review) by an issuer prior to an initial public offering may omit financial infor-
mation for historical periods otherwise required by regulation S-X (17 C.F.R.
210.1-01 et seq.) as of the time of filing (or confidential submission) of such reg-
istration statement, provided that—

“(A) the omitted financial information relates to a historical period that
the issuer reasonably believes will not be required to be included in the
Form S-1 or F-1 at the time of the contemplated offering; and

“(B) prior to the issuer distributing a preliminary prospectus to investors,
such registration statement is amended to include all financial information
required by such regulation S—X at the date of such amendment.

“(2) RELIANCE BY ISSUERS.—Effective 30 days after the date of enactment of
this subsection, an issuer filing a registration statement (or submitting the
statement for confidential review) on Form S-1 or Form F-1 may omit financial
information for historical periods otherwise required by regulation S-X (17
C.F.R. 210.1-01 et seq.) as of the time of filing (or confidential submission) of
such registration statement, provided that—

“(A) the omitted financial information relates to a historical period that
the issuer reasonably believes will not be required to be included in the
Form S-1 or Form F-1 at the time of the contemplated offering; and

“(B) prior to the issuer distributing a preliminary prospectus to investors,
such registration statement is amended to include all financial information
required by such regulation S—-X at the date of such amendment.”.

PURPOSE AND SUMMARY

H.R. 2064, the “Improving Access to Capital for Emerging
Growth Companies Act,” makes changes related to the treatment
of Emerging Growth Companies (EGCs), as defined by the
Jumpstart Our Business Startups Act. H.R. 2064 would reduce the
number of days an EGC must have a confidential registration
statement on file with the Securities and Exchange Commission be-
fore it may conduct a “road show” to provide financial and other
information from 21 days to 15. H.R. 2064 also clarifies that an
issuer that was an EGC at the time it filed a confidential registra-
tion statement but is no longer an EGC will continue to be treated
as an EGC through the date of its IPO and requires the SEC to
revise its general instructions on Form S-1 regarding the financial
information an issuer must disclose prior to its IPO.

BACKGROUND AND NEED FOR LEGISLATION

H.R. 2064 makes changes related to the treatment of Emerging
Growth Companies (EGCs), which are a new category of issuers es-
tablished in Title I of the JOBS Act.?

H.R. 2064 would reduce the number of days an EGC must have
a confidential registration statement on file with the SEC before it
may conduct a road show to provide financial and other informa-
tion from 21 days to 15. A “road show” is one of the most important
steps by a company planning to issue securities through an initial
public offering (IPO). The company puts together a team of execu-
tives to provide financial information, such as a business outlook
for the firm; explain why it is doing an IPO; identify a possible

1EGCs are issuers with annual gross revenues of less than $1 billion during its most recent
fiscal year. A company retains emerging growth company status until the earliest of: 1) the end
of the fiscal year in which its annual revenues exceed $1 billion, 2) the end of the fiscal year
in which the fifth anniversary of its IPO occurred, 3) the date on which the company has, during
the previous three-year period, issued more than $1 billion in non-convertible debt, or 4) the
date on which the company has a public float of $700 million or more.



3

sales price for the stock; and answer questions from analysts and
investors in order to spur positive interest. Road shows can lit-
erally be that—the company’s team travels across the globe to
make the presentation. Road shows, however, can also be done by
phone or by a webcast.

H.R. 2064 also clarifies that an issuer that was an EGC at the
time it filed a confidential registration statement but is no longer
an emerging growth company will continue to be treated as an
EGC through the date of its IPO. Gary K. Wunderlich, Jr., Chief
Executive Officer of Wunderlich Securities, testified on the impor-
tance of this clarification at an October 2013 Capital Markets Sub-
committee hearing:

The cost and effort to create audited financial state-
ments (and related narrative disclosures) for IPO issuers
are significant, and is an entirely unnecessary burden for
them where those financial statements will not be required
to be included in a preliminary prospectus or final pro-
spectus distributed to investors. It is our understanding
that other securities regulators (for example, the UK FSA)
currently permit the suggested approach.

H.R. 2064 also requires the SEC to revise its general instructions
on Form S-1 regarding the financial information an issuer must
disclose prior to its IPO. Section 4 is designed to simplify the finan-
cial statement disclosure requirements for EGCs. Currently, an
EGC must include the previous two years of audited financials
when it files its registration statement for review. The time re-
quired for SEC review could cause the EGC to roll into a new fiscal
year before it launches its IPO, and as such the relevant two-year
period may change. Identical legislation passed the Committee on
Financial Services in the 113th Congress on a 56-0 vote.

H.R. 2064 is a reaction to the success of Title I of the JOBS Act
and makes targeted changes to the federal securities laws to make
IPOs even more appealing to small issuers. David Weild previously
commented, “We support this bill as it creates generally greater
optionality for issuers without altering the ultimate level of re-
quired disclosure to investors. This bill is in keeping with the phi-
losophy that underlies Title I of the JOBS Act and the creation of
safe harbors such as ‘Testing the waters’ and ‘Confidential filings.’
We believe, for example, that providing issuers with the ability to
file without full financial statements will cut issuer time-to-market
which is beneficial in mitigating market risk and speeding access
to capital.”

At a hearing on the 113th Congress version of H.R. 2064, Mr.
Wunderlich supported the legislation’s reduction of the 21-day
quiet period: “In our experience however, this 21-day period is ex-
cessively long given the ready online access the public now pos-
sesses to such filings. The volatility in our markets can narrow the
window of opportunity for an IPO to launch and price successfully
and a 21-day quiet period inordinately and unnecessarily restricts
an EGC’s ability to come to market in a timely manner. We sup-
p}(l)rtbausigniﬁcant reduction in the quiet period as contemplated in
the bill.”

Finally, Tom Quaadman from the U.S. Chamber of Commerce
testified in support of this legislation from the 113th Congress,



4

stating, “One of the most important contributions of the JOBS Act
was that it removed many of the practical obstacles to an TPO for
EGCs. Importantly, it would promote EGC access to the capital
markets without denying investors with important real time infor-
mation on which to base their investment decision.”

HEARINGS

The Committee on Financial Services held a hearing on April 29,
2015, titled “Legislative Proposals to Enhance Capital Formation
and Reduce Regulatory Burdens,” at which this matter was exam-
ined.

COMMITTEE CONSIDERATION

The Committee on Financial Services met in open session on
May 20, 2015, and ordered H.R. 2064 to be reported favorably to
the House with an amendment by a recorded vote of 57 yeas to 0
nays (Record vote no. FC-38), a quorum being present.

COMMITTEE VOTES

By voice vote, the Committee agreed to an amendment offered by
Representatives Fincher of Tennessee and Delaney of Maryland.
Clause 3(b) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House of Representa-
tives requires the Committee to list the record votes on the motion
to report legislation and amendments thereto. The sole record vote
in committee was a motion by Chairman Hensarling to report the
bill favorably to the House with an amendment. The motion was
agreed to by a recorded vote of 57 yeas to 0 nays (Record vote no.
FC-38), a quorum being present.



5

Record vote no. FC-38

Representative Yea  Nay Present Representative Yea Nay Present
Mr. Hensarling . ... X Ms. Waters(CA} ___ . . X
M King (INY) i . Mrs. Maloney (NY) . X o
Mr.Royce . ... X o Ms.Veldzquez ... X ... ...
Mr.lucas . X Mr.Sherman ... X ... ..
Mr. Garrett . . S MroMeeks . X% . ..
Mr. Neugebauer ____ X Mr.Capuano . K . ...
Mr.MeHenry . X Mr.Hingjesa ___ .. X ... ...
Mr.Pearce .. ... __ X Mr.Clay . ...
Mr.Posey . B X Mr. Lynch X
Mr. Fitzpatrick X Mr. David Scott (GA) ... X
Mr. Westmoreland ___ X Mr. AlGreen (TX) _____________ ) S
Mr. Luetkemeyer . X MeCleaver e .
Mr. Huizenga (MD) . X Ms.Moore .. X
MrDuffy X . Mr Ellison X
Mr. Hurt (VA) X Mr. Perlmutter X
Mr. Stivers ___ X Mr. Himes X
Mr Fincher . X Mr.Camey .. X
Mr.Stutzman .. X Ms. Sewell (AL . . ) S
Mr. Mulvaney ___ X . Mr. Foster X
Mr. Hultgren X Mr. Kildee X
Mr.Ross . X Mr. Murphy (FL) _____ . X
Mr. Pittenger _____ ... X o ot el Mr. Delaney ... X
Mrs. Wagner . X Ms, Sinema
Mr.Barr X Mrs. Beatty
Mr. Rothfus ____ X o Mr.Heck WAy .. ...
Mr. Messer X . Mr.Vargas ...
Mr. Schweikert X s
Mr.Guinta ... ), S
Mr. Tipton ____ R S
Mr, Williams ... X
Mr. Poliquin ... X o
Mrs. tove X o
MrHill X
Mr. Emmer X




6

COMMITTEE OVERSIGHT FINDINGS

Pursuant to clause 3(c)(1) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the findings and recommendations of the Com-
mittee, based on oversight activities under clause 2(b)(1) of rule X
of the Rules of the House of Representatives, are incorporated in
the descriptive portions of this report.

PERFORMANCE GOALS AND OBJECTIVES

Pursuant to clause 3(c)(4) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the Committee states that H.R. 2064 will en-
hance access to capital by emerging growth companies by enhanc-
ing their ability to conduct a “road show” to provide financial and
other information to potential investors and by streamlining cer-
tain other regulatory requirements.

NEW BUDGET AUTHORITY, ENTITLEMENT AUTHORITY, AND TAX
EXPENDITURES

In compliance with clause 3(c)(2) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee adopts as its own the es-
timate of new budget authority, entitlement authority, or tax ex-
penditures or revenues contained in the cost estimate prepared by
the Director of the Congressional Budget Office pursuant to section
402 of the Congressional Budget Act of 1974.

COMMITTEE COST ESTIMATE

The Committee adopts as its own the cost estimate prepared by
the Director of the Congressional Budget Office pursuant to section
402 of the Congressional Budget Act of 1974.

CONGRESSIONAL BUDGET OFFICE ESTIMATES

Pursuant to clause 3(c)(3) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the following is the cost estimate provided by
the Congressional Budget Office pursuant to section 402 of the
Congressional Budget Act of 1974:

U.S. CONGRESS,
CONGRESSIONAL BUDGET OFFICE,
Washington, DC, June 17, 2015.
Hon. JEB HENSARLING,
Chairman, Committee on Financial Services,
House of Representatives, Washington, DC.

DEAR MR. CHAIRMAN: The Congressional Budget Office has pre-
pared the enclosed cost estimate for H.R. 2064, the Improving Ac-
cess to Capital for Emerging Growth Companies Act.

If you wish further details on this estimate, we will be pleased
to provide them. The CBO staff contacts are Susan Willie and Ben
Christopher.

Sincerely,
KEITH HALL.

Enclosure.



7

H.R. 2064—Improving Access to Capital for Emerging Growth Com-
panies Act

H.R. 2064 would broaden some of the federal reporting exemp-
tions available to emerging growth companies (EGCs) and allow a
grace period to continue operations as an EGC if the company’s
status changes. (An EGC is a company that has issued or proposes
to issue stock and had gross revenues of less than $1 billion during
its most recently completed fiscal year; companies can retain that
designation from the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC)
for up to five years.) The bill also would require the SEC to revise
Eoglce of its forms to allow for a simplified registration process for

S.

Based on information from the SEC, CBO expects that the agen-
cy would spend $1 million under H.R. 2064 to revise instructions
and other documents to reflect the new treatment of EGCs. In ad-
dition, limiting the information EGCs would need to report could
increase the SEC’s workload to review registration statements. Be-
cause the SEC is authorized to collect fees sufficient to offset its
annual appropriation, CBO estimates that the net budgetary effect
of H.R. 2064 would be negligible, assuming appropriation actions
consistent with the agency’s authority.

Enacting H.R. 2064 would not affect direct spending or revenues;
therefore, pay-as-you-go procedures do not apply.

H.R. 2064 contains no intergovernmental or private-sector man-
dates as defined in the Unfunded Mandates Reform Act and would
not affect the budgets of state, local, or tribal governments.

The CBO staff contacts for this estimate are Susan Willie and
Ben Christopher. The estimate was approved by H. Samuel
Papenfuss, Deputy Assistant Director for Budget Analysis.

FEDERAL MANDATES STATEMENT

The Committee adopts as its own the estimate of Federal man-
dates prepared by the Director of the Congressional Budget Office
pursuant to section 423 of the Unfunded Mandates Reform Act.

ADVISORY COMMITTEE STATEMENT

No advisory committees within the meaning of section 5(b) of the
Federal Advisory Committee Act were created by this legislation.

APPLICABILITY TO LEGISLATIVE BRANCH

The Committee finds that the legislation does not relate to the
terms and conditions of employment or access to public services or
accommodations within the meaning of the section 102(b)(3) of the
Congressional Accountability Act.

EARMARK IDENTIFICATION

H.R. 2064 does not contain any congressional earmarks, limited
tax benefits, or limited tariff benefits as defined in clause 9 of rule
XXI.

DuPLICATION OF FEDERAL PROGRAMS

Pursuant to section 3(g) of H. Res. 5, 114th Cong. (2015), the
Committee states that no provision of H.R. 2064 establishes or re-



8

authorizes a program of the Federal Government known to be du-
plicative of another Federal program, a program that was included
in any report from the Government Accountability Office to Con-
gress pursuant to section 21 of Public Law 111-139, or a program
related to a program identified in the most recent Catalog of Fed-
eral Domestic Assistance.

DISCLOSURE OF DIRECTED RULEMAKING

Pursuant to section 3(i) of H. Res. 5, 114th Cong. (2015), the
Committee states that H.R. 2064 does not require any directed
rulemakings.

SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS OF THE LEGISLATION

Section 1. Short title

This section cites H.R. 2064 as the “Improving Access to Capital
for Emerging Growth Companies Act.”

Section 2. Filing requirement for public filing prior to public offer-
ing

This section amends Section 6(e)(1) of the Securities Act of 1933

(15 U.S.C. 77f(e)(1) by striking “21 days” and inserting “15 days.”

Section 3. Grace period for change of status of emerging growth
companies

This section amends Section 6(e)(1) of the Securities Act of 1933
(15 U.S.C. 77f(e)(1)) by providing that an issuer that was an EGC
when it submitted a confidential registration statement or a pub-
licly filed registration statement, but ceases to be an EGC there-
after, shall continue to be treated as an EGC through the earlier
of the date on which the issuer consummates its IPO pursuant to
such registration statement or the end of the 1l-year period begin-
ning on the date the company ceases to be an EGC.

Section 4. Simplified disclosure requirements for emerging growth
companies

The section amends Section 102 of the Jumpstart Our Business
Startups Act (P.L. 112-106) to simplify the types of financial data
that an EGC must disclose in connection with certain SEC filings.

CHANGES IN EXISTING LAW MADE BY THE BILL, AS REPORTED

In compliance with clause 3(e) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, changes in existing law made by the bill,
as reported, are shown as follows (existing law proposed to be omit-
ted is enclosed in black brackets, new matter is printed in italic,
and existing law in which no change is proposed is shown in
roman):

SECURITIES ACT OF 1933

* * * & * * *

TITLE I—SHORT TITLE

* * *k & * * *k



9

REGISTRATION OF SECURITIES AND SIGNING OF REGISTRATION
STATEMENT

SEC. 6. (a) Any security may be registered with the Commission
under the terms and conditions hereinafter provided, by filing a
registration statement in triplicate, at least one of which shall be
signed by each issuer, its principal executive officer or officers, its
principal financial officer, its comptroller or principal accounting of-
ficer, and the majority of its board of directors or persons per-
forming similar functions (or, if there is no board of directors or
persons performing similar functions, by the majority of the per-
sons or board having the power of management of the issuer), and
in case the issuer is a foreign or Territorial person by its duly au-
thorized representative in the United States; except that when
such registration statement relates to a security issued by a foreign
government, or political subdivision thereof, it need be signed only
by the underwriter of such security. Signatures of all such persons
when written on the said registration statements shall be pre-
sumed to have been so written by authority of the person whose
signature is so affixed and the burden of proof, in the event such
authority shall be denied, shall be upon the party denying the
same. The affixing of any signature without the authority of the
purported signer shall constitute a violation of this title. A registra-
tion statement shall be deemed effective only as to the securities
specified therein as proposed to be offered.

(b) REGISTRATION FEE.—

(1) FEE PAYMENT REQUIRED.—At the time of filing a registra-
tion statement, the applicant shall pay to the Commission a fee
at a rate that shall be equal to $92 per $1,000,000 of the max-
imum aggregate price at which such securities are proposed to
be offered, except that during fiscal year 2003 and any suc-
ceeding fiscal year such fee shall be adjusted pursuant to para-
graph (2).

(2) ANNUAL ADJUSTMENT.—For each fiscal year, the Commis-
sion shall by order adjust the rate required by paragraph (1)
for such fiscal year to a rate that, when applied to the baseline
estimate of the aggregate maximum offering prices for such fis-
cal year, is reasonably likely to produce aggregate fee collec-
tions under this subsection that are equal to the target fee col-
lection amount for such fiscal year.

(3) PRO RATA APPLICATION.—The rates per $1,000,000 re-
quired by this subsection shall be applied pro rata to amounts
and balances of less than $1,000,000.

(4) REVIEW AND EFFECTIVE DATE.—In exercising its authority
under this subsection, the Commission shall not be required to
comply with the provisions of section 553 of title 5, United
States Code. An adjusted rate prescribed under paragraph (2)
and published under paragraph (5) shall not be subject to judi-
cial review. An adjusted rate prescribed under paragraph (2)
shall take effect on the first day of the fiscal year to which
such rate applies.

(5) PUBLICATION.—The Commission shall publish in the Fed-
eral Register notices of the rate applicable under this sub-
section and under sections 13(e) and 14(g) for each fiscal year
not later than August 31 of the fiscal year preceding the fiscal



10

year to which such rate applies, together with any estimates
or projections on which such rate is based.
(6) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this subsection:
(A) TARGET OFFSETTING COLLECTION AMOUNT.—The tar-
get fee collection amount for each fiscal year is determined
according to the following table:

Target fee

Fiscal year: collection amount
2002 $377,000,000
2003 $435,000,000
2004 $467,000,000
2005 $570,000,000
2006 . $689,000,000
2007 $214,000,000
2008 $234,000,000
2009 $284,000,000
2010 $334,000,000
2011 $394,000,000
2012 $425,000,000
2013 $455,000,000
2014 $485,000,000
2015 $515,000,000
2016 $550,000,000
2017 $585,000,000
2018 $620,000,000
2019 $660,000,000
2020 $705,000,000
2021 and each fiscal year thereafter .. An amount that is equal to the target

fee collection amount for the prior
fiscal year, adjusted by the rate of
inflation.

(B) BASELINE ESTIMATE OF THE AGGREGATE MAXIMUM OF-
FERING PRICES.—The baseline estimate of the aggregate
maximum offering prices for any fiscal year is the baseline
estimate of the aggregate maximum offering price at which
securities are proposed to be offered pursuant to registra-
tion statements filed with the Commission during such fis-
cal year as determined by the Commission, after consulta-
tion with the Congressional Budget Office and the Office
of Management and Budget, using the methodology re-
quired for projections pursuant to section 257 of the Bal-
anced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

(c) The filing with the Commission of a registration statement,
or of an amendment to a registration statement, shall be deemed
to have taken place upon the receipt thereof, but the filing of a reg-
istration statement shall not be deemed to have taken place unless
it is accompanied by a United States postal money order or a cer-
tified bank check or cash for the amount of the fee required under
subsection (b).

(d) The information contained in or filed with any registration
statement shall be made available to the public under such regula-
tions as the Commission may prescribe, and copies thereof, photo-
static or otherwise, shall be furnished to every applicant at such
reasonable charge as the Commission may prescribe.

(e) EMERGING GROWTH COMPANIES.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Any emerging growth company, prior to its
initial public offering date, may confidentially submit to the
Commission a draft registration statement, for confidential
nonpublic review by the staff of the Commission prior to public



11

filing, provided that the initial confidential submission and all
amendments thereto shall be publicly filed with the Commis-
sion not later than [21 days] 15 days before the date on which
the issuer conducts a road show, as such term is defined in sec-
tion 230.433(h)(4) of title 17, Code of Federal Regulations, or
any successor thereto. An issuer that was an emerging growth
company at the time it submitted a confidential registration
statement or, in lieu thereof, a publicly filed registration state-
ment for review under this subsection but ceases to be an emerg-
ing growth company thereafter shall continue to be treated as
an emerging market growth company for the purposes of this
subsection through the earlier of the date on which the issuer
consummates its initial public offering pursuant to such reg-
istrations statement or the end of the 1-year period beginning
on the date the company ceases to be an emerging growth com-
pany.

(2) CONFIDENTIALITY.—Notwithstanding any other provision
of this title, the Commission shall not be compelled to disclose
any information provided to or obtained by the Commission
pursuant to this subsection. For purposes of section 552 of title
5, United States Code, this subsection shall be considered a
statute described in subsection (b)(3)(B) of such section 552. In-
formation described in or obtained pursuant to this subsection
shall be deemed to constitute confidential information for pur-
poses of section 24(b)(2) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934.

* * * * * * *

JUMPSTART OUR BUSINESS STARTUPS ACT

* * * & * * *

TITLE I—REOPENING AMERICAN CAP-
ITAL. MARKETS TO EMERGING
GROWTH COMPANIES

* * *k & * * *k

SEC. 102. DISCLOSURE OBLIGATIONS.
(a) EXECUTIVE COMPENSATION.—
(1) EXEMPTION.—Section 14A(e) of the Securities Exchange
Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78n-1(e)) is amended—
(A) by striking “The Commission may” and inserting the
following:
“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Commission may”;
(B) by striking “an issuer” and inserting “any other
issuer”; and
(C) by adding at the end the following:
“(2) TREATMENT OF EMERGING GROWTH COMPANIES.—
“(A) IN GENERAL.—An emerging growth company shall
?be exempt from the requirements of subsections (a) and
).
“(B) COMPLIANCE AFTER TERMINATION OF EMERGING
GROWTH COMPANY TREATMENT.—An issuer that was an



12

emerging growth company but is no longer an emerging
growth company shall include the first separate resolution
dfgscribed under subsection (a)(1) not later than the end
0 —

“(1) in the case of an issuer that was an emerging
growth company for less than 2 years after the date of
first sale of common equity securities of the issuer
pursuant to an effective registration statement under
the Securities Act of 1933, the 3-year period beginning
on such date; and

“(ii) in the case of any other issuer, the 1-year period
beginning on the date the issuer is no longer an
emerging growth company.”.

(2) PROXIES.—Section 14(i) of the Securities Exchange Act of
1934 (15 U.S.C. 78n(i)) is amended by inserting “, for any
issuer other than an emerging growth company,” after “includ-
ing”.

(3) COMPENSATION DISCLOSURES.—Section 953(b)(1) of the In-
vestor Protection and Securities Reform Act of 2010 (Public
Law 111-203; 124 Stat. 1904) is amended by inserting “, other
than an emerging growth company, as that term is defined in
section 3(a) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934,” after “re-
quire each issuer”.

(b) FINANCIAL DISCLOSURES AND ACCOUNTING PRONOUNCE-
MENTS.—

(1) SECURITIES ACT OF 1933.—Section 7(a) of the Securities
Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77g(a)) is amended—

(A) by striking “(a) The registration” and inserting the
following:

“(a) INFORMATION REQUIRED IN REGISTRATION STATEMENT.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The registration”; and

(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) TREATMENT OF EMERGING GROWTH COMPANIES.—An
emerging growth company—

“(A) need not present more than 2 years of audited fi-
nancial statements in order for the registration statement
of such emerging growth company with respect to an ini-
tial public offering of its common equity securities to be ef-
fective, and in any other registration statement to be filed
with the Commission, an emerging growth company need
not present selected financial data in accordance with sec-
tion 229.301 of title 17, Code of Federal Regulations, for
any period prior to the earliest audited period presented in
connection with its initial public offering; and

“(B) may not be required to comply with any new or re-
vised financial accounting standard until such date that a
company that is not an issuer (as defined under section
2(a) of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002 (15 U.S.C. 7201(a)))
is required to comply with such new or revised accounting
standard, if such standard applies to companies that are
not issuers.”.

(2) SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF 1934.—Section 13(a) of the
Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78m(a)) is amended
by adding at the end the following: “In any registration state-
ment, periodic report, or other reports to be filed with the



13

Commission, an emerging growth company need not present
selected financial data in accordance with section 229.301 of
title 17, Code of Federal Regulations, for any period prior to
the earliest audited period presented in connection with its
first registration statement that became effective under this
Act or the Securities Act of 1933 and, with respect to any such
statement or reports, an emerging growth company may not be
required to comply with any new or revised financial account-
ing standard until such date that a company that is not an
issuer (as defined under section 2(a) of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act
of 2002 (15 U.S.C. 7201(a))) is required to comply with such
new or revised accounting standard, if such standard applies
to companies that are not issuers.”.

(c) OTHER DISCLOSURES.—An emerging growth company may
comply with section 229.303(a) of title 17, Code of Federal Regula-
tions, or any successor thereto, by providing information required
by such section with respect to the financial statements of the
emerging growth company for each period presented pursuant to
section 7(a) of the Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77g(a)). An
emerging growth company may comply with section 229.402 of title
17, Code of Federal Regulations, or any successor thereto, by dis-
closing the same information as any issuer with a market value of
outstanding voting and nonvoting common equity held by non-af-
filiates of less than $75,000,000.

(d) SIMPLIFIED DISCLOSURE REQUIREMENTS.—With respect to an
emerging growth company (as such term is defined under section 2
of the Securities Act of 1933):

(1) REQUIREMENT TO INCLUDE NOTICE ON FORMS S—1 AND F-
1.—Not later than 30 days after the date of enactment of this
subsection, the Securities and Exchange Commission shall re-
vise its general instructions on Forms S—1 and F-1 to indicate
that a registration statement filed (or submitted for confidential
review) by an issuer prior to an initial public offering may omit
financial information for historical periods otherwise required
by regulation S-X (17 C.F.R. 210.1-01 et seq.) as of the time of
filing (or confidential submission) of such registration state-
ment, provided that—

(A) the omitted financial information relates to a histor-
ical period that the issuer reasonably believes will not be
required to be included in the Form S—1 or F-1 at the time
of the contemplated offering; and

(B) prior to the issuer distributing a preliminary pro-
spectus to investors, such registration statement is amended
to include all financial information required by such regu-
lation S-X at the date of such amendment.

(2) RELIANCE BY ISSUERS.—Effective 30 days after the date of
enactment of this subsection, an issuer filing a registration
statement (or submitting the statement for confidential review)
on Form S-1 or Form F-1 may omit financial information for
historical periods otherwise required by regulation S-X (17
C.F.R. 210.1-01 et seq.) as of the time of filing (or confidential
submission) of such registration statement, provided that—

(A) the omitted financial information relates to a histor-
ical period that the issuer reasonably believes will not be



14

required to be included in the Form S—1 or Form F-1 at the
time of the contemplated offering; and

(B) prior to the issuer distributing a preliminary pro-
spectus to investors, such registration statement is amended
to include all financial information required by such regu-
lation S-X at the date of such amendment.

* *k & * * *k

O




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-11-09T00:01:46-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




