G:\COMP\114-1\NEW MEXICO NAVAJO WATER SETTLEMENT TECHNICAL ...XML

September 11, 2019

AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

New Mexico Navajo Water Settlement Technical Corrections
Act

[Public Law 114-57]

[This law has not been amended]

[Currency: This publication is a compilation of the text of Public Law 114-57. It was
last amended by the public law listed in the As Amended Through note above and
below at the bottom of each page of the pdf version and reflects current law
through the date of the enactment of the public law listed at https:/
www.govinfo.gov/app/collection/comps/]

[Note: While this publication does not represent an official version of any Federal
statute, substantial efforts have been made to ensure the accuracy of its contents.
The official version of Federal law is found in the United States Statutes at Large
and in the United States Code. The legal effect to be given to the Statutes at
Large and the United States Code is established by statute (1 U.S.C. 112, 204).1

AN ACT To make technical corrections to the Navajo water rights settlement in the
State of New Mexico, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the
United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. [43 U.S.C. 371 note] SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “New Mexico Navajo Water Set-
tlement Technical Corrections Act”.

SEC. 2. NAVAJO WATER SETTLEMENT.

(a) DEFINITIONS.—Section 10302 of the Omnibus Public Land
Management Act of 2009 (43 U.S.C. 407 note; Public Law 111-11)
is amended—

(1) in paragraph (2), by striking “Arrellano” and inserting

“Arellano”; and

(2) in paragraph (27), by striking “75-185” and inserting

“75-184”.

(b) DELIVERY AND USE OF NAVAJO-GALLUP WATER SUPPLY
ProOJECT WATER.—Section 10603(c)(2)(A) of the Omnibus Public
Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111-11; 123 Stat. 1385)
is amended—

(1) in clause (i), by striking “Article III(c)” and inserting

“Articles III(c)”; and

(2) in clause (ii)(II), by striking “Article III(c)” and insert-

ing “Articles III(c)”.

(¢) PROJECT CONTRACTS.—Section 10604(f)(1) of the Omnibus
Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111-11; 123
Stat. 1391) is amended by inserting “Project” before “water”.

(d) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section 10609 of the
Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111-
11; 123 Stat. 1395) is amended—

1
This law has not been amended



G:\COMP\114-1\NEW MEXICO NAVAJO WATER SETTLEMENT TECHNICAL ...XML

Sec. 2 New Mexico Navajo Water Settlement Technical Corr... 2

(1) in paragraphs (1) and (2) of subsection (b), by striking
“construction or rehabilitation” each place it appears and in-
serting “planning, design, construction, rehabilitation,”;

(2) in subsection (e)(1), by striking “2 percent” and insert-
ing “4 percent”; and

(3) in subsection (f)(1), by striking “4 percent” and insert-
ing “2 percent”.

(e) [43 U.S.C. 620 note]l AGREEMENT.—Section 10701(e) of the
Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111-
11; 123 Stat. 1400) is amended in paragraphs (2)(A), (2)(B), and
(3)(A) by striking “and Contract” each place it appears.

September 11, 2019 This law has not been amended



		Superintendent of Documents
	2021-10-14T23:44:20-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




