
138 

6 CFR Ch. I (1–1–23 Edition) Pt. 9 

number of pages where declassification 
was denied. 

(j) The DHS Disclosure Officer shall 
maintain a record of all mandatory re-
view actions for reporting in accord-
ance with applicable Federal require-
ments. 

(k) The mandatory declassification 
review system shall provide for admin-
istrative appeal in cases where the re-
view results in the information remain-
ing classified. The requester shall be 
notified of the results of the review and 
of the right to appeal the denial of de-
classification. To address such appeals, 
the DHS Disclosure Office shall con-
vene a DHS Classification Appeals 
Panel (DHS/CAP). The DHS/CAP shall, 
at a minimum, consist of representa-
tives from the Disclosure Office, the 
Office of the Chief Security Officer, the 
Office of General Counsel, and a rep-
resentative from the component having 
jurisdiction over the information. Ad-
ditional members may be added as de-
termined by the DHS Disclosure Offi-
cer. The DHS/CAP shall be chaired by 
the DHS Disclosure Officer. 

(l) If the requester files an appeal 
through the DHS/CAP, and the appeal 
is denied, the requester shall be noti-
fied of the right to appeal the denial to 
the ISCAP pursuant to section 5.3 of 
Executive Order 13526, and the rules 
issued by the ISCAP pursuant to sec-
tion 5.3 of Executive Order 13526. 
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Subpart A—General 

§ 9.1 Conditions on use of funds. 

(a) No appropriated funds may be ex-
pended by the recipient of a Federal 
contract, grant, loan, or cooperative 
agreement to pay any person for influ-
encing or attempting to influence an 
officer or employee of any agency, a 
Member of Congress, an officer or em-
ployee of Congress, or an employee of a 
Member of Congress in connection with 
any of the following covered Federal 
actions: the awarding of any Federal 
contract, the making of any Federal 
grant, the making of any Federal loan, 
the entering into of any cooperative 
agreement, and the extension, continu-
ation, renewal, amendment, or modi-
fication of any Federal contract, grant, 
loan, or cooperative agreement. 

(b) Each person who requests or re-
ceives from an agency a Federal con-
tract, grant, loan, or cooperative 
agreement shall file with that agency a 
certification, set forth in appendix A to 
this part, that the person has not 
made, and will not make, any payment 
prohibited by paragraph (a) of this sec-
tion. 

(c) Each person who requests or re-
ceives from an agency a Federal con-
tract, grant, loan, or a cooperative 
agreement shall file with that agency a 
disclosure form, set forth in appendix B 
to this part, if such person has made or 
has agreed to make any payment using 
non appropriated funds (to include 
profits from any covered Federal ac-
tion), which would be prohibited under 
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paragraph (a) of this section if paid for 
with appropriated funds. 

(d) Each person who requests or re-
ceives from an agency a commitment 
providing for the United States to in-
sure or guarantee a loan shall file with 
that agency a statement, set forth in 
appendix A to this part, whether that 
person has made or has agreed to make 
any payment to influence or attempt 
to influence an officer or employee of 
any agency, a Member of Congress, an 
officer or employee of Congress, or an 
employee of a Member of Congress in 
connection with that loan insurance or 
guarantee. 

(e) Each person who requests or re-
ceives from an agency a commitment 
providing for the United States to in-
sure or guarantee a loan shall file with 
that agency a disclosure form, set forth 
in appendix B to this part, if that per-
son has made or has agreed to make 
any payment to influence or attempt 
to influence an officer or employee of 
any agency, a Member of Congress, an 
officer or employee of Congress, or an 
employee of a Member of Congress in 
connection with that loan insurance or 
guarantee. 

§ 9.2 Definitions. 

For purposes of this part: 
(a) Agency has the same meaning as 

provided in 5 U.S.C. 552(f), and includes 
Federal executive departments and 
agencies as well as independent regu-
latory commissions and Government 
corporations, as defined in 31 U.S.C. 
9101(1). 

(b) The term covered Federal action: 
(1) Means any of the following Fed-

eral actions: 
(i) The awarding of any Federal con-

tract; 
(ii) The making of any Federal grant; 
(iii) The making of any Federal loan; 
(iv) The entering into of any coopera-

tive agreement; and 
(v) The extension, continuation, re-

newal, amendment, or modification of 
any Federal contract, grant, loan, or 
cooperative agreement. 

(2) Does not include receiving from 
an agency a commitment providing for 
the United States to insure or guar-
antee a loan. Loan guarantees and loan 
insurance are addressed independently 
within this part. 

(c) Federal contract means an acquisi-
tion contract awarded by an agency, 
including those subject to the Federal 
Acquisition Regulation (FAR) (48 CFR 
Chapter 1) and any other acquisition 
contract for real or personal property 
or services not subject to the FAR. 

(d) Federal cooperative agreement 
means a cooperative agreement en-
tered into by an agency. 

(e) Federal grant means an award of 
financial assistance in the form of 
money, or property in lieu of money, 
by the Federal Government or a direct 
appropriation made by law to any per-
son. The term does not include tech-
nical assistance that provides services 
instead of money, or other assistance 
in the form of revenue sharing, loans, 
loan guarantees, loan insurance, inter-
est subsidies, insurance, or direct 
United States cash assistance to an in-
dividual. 

(f) Federal loan means a loan made by 
an agency. The term does not include 
loan guarantee or loan insurance. 

(g) Indian tribe and tribal organization 
have the meaning provided in section 4 
of the Indian Self-Determination and 
Education Assistance Act (25 U.S.C. 
450B). Alaskan Natives are included 
under the definition of Indian tribe in 
that Act. 

(h) Influencing or attempting to influ-
ence means making, with the intent to 
influence, any communication to or ap-
pearance before an officer or employee 
or any agency, a Member of Congress, 
an officer or employee of Congress, or 
an employee of a Member of Congress 
in connection with any covered Federal 
action. 

(i) Loan guarantee or loan insurance 
means an agency’s guarantee or insur-
ance of a loan made by a person. 

(j) Local government means a unit of 
government in a State and, if char-
tered, established, or otherwise recog-
nized by a State for the performance of 
a governmental duty, including a local 
public authority, a special district, an 
intrastate district, a council of govern-
ments, a sponsor group representative 
organization, and any other instrumen-
tality of a local government. 

(k) Officer or employee of an agency in-
cludes the following individuals who 
are employed by an agency: 


		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-05-23T05:26:09-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




