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nor reissue a duplicate Assignment 
Guarantee Agreement unless: 

(i) The original was lost, stolen, de-
stroyed, mutilated, or defaced; and 

(ii) The reissue is in accordance with 
§ 4279.226. 

(5) The Assignment Guarantee Agree-
ment clearly states the percentage and 
corresponding amount of the guaran-
teed portion it represents and the 
Lender’s servicing fee. A servicing fee 
may be charged by the Lender to a 
Holder and is calculated as a percent-
age per annum of the unpaid balance of 
the guaranteed portion of the loan as-
signed by the Assignment Guarantee 
Agreement. The Agency is not and will 
not be a party to any contract between 
the Lender and another party where 
the Lender sells its servicing fee in an 
Arm’s Length Transaction. The Agency 
will not acknowledge, approve, or have 
any liability to any of the parties of 
such contract. 

(b) Multi-note system. Under this op-
tion, the Lender may provide multiple 
Promissory Notes for the unguaranteed 
and the guaranteed portions of the 
loan. All Promissory Notes must re-
flect the same payment terms. When 
the Lender selects this option, the 
Holder will receive one of the Bor-
rower’s executed notes and a Loan 
Note Guarantee. The Agency will issue 
a Loan Note Guarantee for each Prom-
issory Note, including the 
unguaranteed Promissory Note(s), to 
be attached to the Promissory Note(s). 
An Assignment Guarantee Agreement 
will not be used when the multi-note 
option is utilized. 

§ 4279.224 Minimum retention. 
The Lender is required to hold a min-

imum of 7.5 percent of the total loan 
amount. The amount required to be 
held must be of the unguaranteed por-
tion of the loan and cannot be Partici-
pated to another Person. The Agency 
may reduce the minimum retention 
below 7.5 percent on a case by case 
basis when the Lender establishes to 
the Secretary’s satisfaction that reduc-
tion of the minimum retention per-
centage is to meet compliance with the 
Lender’s regulatory authority. The 
Lender must retain interest in the Col-
lateral, and retain the servicing re-
sponsibilities for the guaranteed loan. 

§ 4279.225 Repurchase from Holder. 
(a) Repurchase by Lender. A Lender 

has the option to repurchase the un-
paid guaranteed portion of the loan 
from a Holder within 30 days of written 
demand by the Holder when the Bor-
rower is in Default not less than 60 
days on principal or Interest due on the 
loan; or when the Lender has failed to 
remit to the Holder its Pro Rata share 
of any payment within 30 days of the 
Lender’s receipt thereof from the Bor-
rower. The repurchase by the Lender 
will be for an amount equal to the un-
paid guaranteed portion of principal 
and accrued Interest less the Lender’s 
servicing fee. The Holder must concur-
rently send a copy of the demand letter 
to the Agency. The Lender must accept 
an assignment without recourse from 
the Holder upon repurchase. The Lend-
er is encouraged to repurchase the 
loan, upon written demand from the 
Holder, to facilitate the accounting of 
funds, resolve any loan problem, and 
resolve the Default, where and when 
reasonable. The benefit to the Lender 
is that it may re-sell the guaranteed 
portion of the loan in order to continue 
collection of its servicing fee if the De-
fault is cured. The Lender must notify, 
in writing, the Holder and the Agency 
of its decision. 

(b) Agency repurchase. (1) The Lend-
er’s servicing fee will stop on the date 
that Interest was last paid by the Bor-
rower when the Agency purchases the 
guaranteed portion of the loan from a 
Holder. The Lender cannot charge such 
servicing fee to the Agency and must 
apply all loan payments and Collateral 
proceeds received to the guaranteed 
and unguaranteed portions of the loan 
on a Pro Rata basis. 

(2) If the Agency repurchases 100 per-
cent of the guaranteed portion of the 
loan, the Agency will not continue col-
lection of the Annual Renewal Fee 
from the Lender. 

(3) If the Lender does not repurchase 
the unpaid guaranteed portion of the 
loan as provided in paragraph (a) of 
this section, the Agency will purchase 
from the Holder the unpaid principal 
balance of the guaranteed portion to-
gether with accrued Interest to date of 
repurchase or the Interest Termination 
Date, whichever is sooner, less the 
Lender’s servicing fee, within 30 days 
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