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Subpart H—Business Conduct 
Standards for Swap Dealers 
and Major Swap Participants 
Dealing With Counterparties, 
Including Special Entities 

SOURCE: 77 FR 9822, Feb. 17, 2012, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 23.400 Scope. 
The sections of this subpart shall 

apply to swap dealers and, unless oth-
erwise indicated, major swap partici-
pants. These rules are not intended to 
limit or restrict the applicability of 
other provisions of the Act and rules 
and regulations thereunder, or other 
applicable laws, rules and regulations. 
The provisions of this subpart shall 
apply in connection with transactions 
in swaps as well as in connection with 
swaps that are offered but not entered 
into. 

§ 23.401 Definitions. 
(a) Counterparty. The term 

‘‘counterparty,’’ as appropriate in this 
subpart, includes any person who is a 
prospective counterparty to a swap. 

(b) Major swap participant. The term 
‘‘major swap participant’’ means any 
person defined in Section 1a(33) of the 
Act and § 1.3 of this chapter and, as ap-
propriate in this subpart, any person 
acting for or on behalf of a major swap 
participant, including an associated 
person defined in Section 1a(4) of the 
Act. 

(c) Special Entity. The term ‘‘Special 
Entity’’ means: 

(1) A Federal agency; 
(2) A State, State agency, city, coun-

ty, municipality, other political sub-
division of a State, or any instrumen-
tality, department, or a corporation of 
or established by a State or political 
subdivision of a State; 

(3) Any employee benefit plan subject 
to Title I of the Employee Retirement 
Income Security Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C. 
1002); 

(4) Any governmental plan, as defined 
in Section 3 of the Employee Retire-
ment Income Security Act of 1974 (29 
U.S.C. 1002); 

(5) Any endowment, including an en-
dowment that is an organization de-
scribed in Section 501(c)(3) of the Inter-

nal Revenue Code of 1986 (26 U.S.C. 
501(c)(3)); or 

(6) Any employee benefit plan defined 
in Section 3 of the Employee Retire-
ment Income Security Act of 1974 (29 
U.S.C. 1002), not otherwise defined as a 
Special Entity, that elects to be a Spe-
cial Entity by notifying a swap dealer 
or major swap participant of its elec-
tion prior to entering into a swap with 
the particular swap dealer or major 
swap participant. 

(d) Swap dealer. The term ‘‘swap deal-
er’’ means any person defined in Sec-
tion 1a(49) of the Act and § 1.3 of this 
chapter and, as appropriate in this sub-
part, any person acting for or on behalf 
of a swap dealer, including an associ-
ated person defined in Section 1a(4) of 
the Act. 

§ 23.402 General provisions. 
(a) Policies and procedures to ensure 

compliance and prevent evasion. (1) Swap 
dealers and major swap participants 
shall have written policies and proce-
dures reasonably designed to: 

(i) Ensure compliance with the re-
quirements of this subpart; and 

(ii) Prevent a swap dealer or major 
swap participant from evading or par-
ticipating in or facilitating an evasion 
of any provision of the Act or any regu-
lation promulgated thereunder. 

(2) Swap dealers and major swap par-
ticipants shall implement and monitor 
compliance with such policies and pro-
cedures as part of their supervision and 
risk management requirements speci-
fied in subpart J of this part. 

(b) Know your counterparty. Each 
swap dealer shall implement policies 
and procedures reasonably designed to 
obtain and retain a record of the essen-
tial facts concerning each counterparty 
whose identity is known to the swap 
dealer prior to the execution of the 
transaction that are necessary for con-
ducting business with such 
counterparty. For purposes of this sec-
tion, the essential facts concerning a 
counterparty are: 

(1) Facts required to comply with ap-
plicable laws, regulations and rules; 

(2) Facts required to implement the 
swap dealer’s credit and operational 
risk management policies in connec-
tion with transactions entered into 
with such counterparty; and 
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(3) Information regarding the author-
ity of any person acting for such 
counterparty. 

(c) True name and owner. Each swap 
dealer or major swap participant shall 
obtain and retain a record which shall 
show the true name and address of each 
counterparty whose identity is known 
to the swap dealer or major swap par-
ticipant prior to the execution of the 
transaction, the principal occupation 
or business of such counterparty as 
well as the name and address of any 
other person guaranteeing the perform-
ance of such counterparty and any per-
son exercising any control with respect 
to the positions of such counterparty. 

(d) Reasonable reliance on representa-
tions. A swap dealer or major swap par-
ticipant may rely on the written rep-
resentations of a counterparty to sat-
isfy its due diligence requirements 
under this subpart, unless it has infor-
mation that would cause a reasonable 
person to question the accuracy of the 
representation. If agreed to by the 
counterparties, such representations 
may be contained in counterparty rela-
tionship documentation and may sat-
isfy the relevant requirements of this 
subpart for subsequent swaps offered to 
or entered into with a counterparty, 
provided however, that such 
counterparty undertakes to timely up-
date any material changes to the rep-
resentations. 

(e) Manner of disclosure. A swap deal-
er or major swap participant may pro-
vide the information required by this 
subpart by any reliable means agreed 
to in writing by the counterparty; pro-
vided however, for transactions initi-
ated on a designated contract market 
or swap execution facility, written 
agreement by the counterparty regard-
ing the reliable means of disclosure is 
not required. 

(f) Disclosures in a standard format. If 
agreed to by a counterparty, the disclo-
sure of material information that is ap-
plicable to multiple swaps between a 
swap dealer or major swap participant 
and a counterparty may be made in 
counterparty relationship documenta-
tion or other written agreement be-
tween the counterparties. 

(g) Record retention. Swap dealers and 
major swap participants shall create a 
record of their compliance with the re-

quirements of this subpart and shall re-
tain records in accordance with sub-
part F of this part and § 1.31 of this 
chapter and make them available to 
applicable prudential regulators upon 
request. 

§§ 23.403–23.409 [Reserved] 

§ 23.410 Prohibition on fraud, manipu-
lation, and other abusive practices. 

(a) It shall be unlawful for a swap 
dealer or major swap participant— 

(1) To employ any device, scheme, or 
artifice to defraud any Special Entity 
or prospective customer who is a Spe-
cial Entity; 

(2) To engage in any transaction, 
practice, or course of business that op-
erates as a fraud or deceit on any Spe-
cial Entity or prospective customer 
who is a Special Entity; or 

(3) To engage in any act, practice, or 
course of business that is fraudulent, 
deceptive, or manipulative. 

(b) Affirmative defense. It shall be an 
affirmative defense to an alleged viola-
tion of paragraph (a)(2) or (3) of this 
section for failure to comply with any 
requirement in this subpart if a swap 
dealer or major swap participant estab-
lishes that the swap dealer or major 
swap participant: 

(1) Did not act intentionally or reck-
lessly in connection with such alleged 
violation; and 

(2) Complied in good faith with writ-
ten policies and procedures reasonably 
designed to meet the particular re-
quirement that is the basis for the al-
leged violation. 

(c) Confidential treatment of 
counterparty information. (1) It shall be 
unlawful for any swap dealer or major 
swap participant to: 

(i) Disclose to any other person any 
material confidential information pro-
vided by or on behalf of a counterparty 
to the swap dealer or major swap par-
ticipant; or 

(ii) Use for its own purposes in any 
way that would tend to be materially 
adverse to the interests of a 
counterparty, any material confiden-
tial information provided by or on be-
half of a counterparty to the swap deal-
er or major swap participant. 

(2) Notwithstanding paragraph (c)(1) 
of this section, a swap dealer or major 
swap participant may disclose or use 
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material confidential information pro-
vided by or on behalf of a counterparty 
to the swap dealer or major swap par-
ticipant if such disclosure or use is au-
thorized in writing by the 
counterparty, or is necessary: 

(i) For the effective execution of any 
swap for or with the counterparty; 

(ii) To hedge or mitigate any expo-
sure created by such swap; or 

(iii) To comply with a request of the 
Commission, Department of Justice, 
any self-regulatory organization des-
ignated by the Commission, or an ap-
plicable prudential regulator, or is oth-
erwise required by law. 

(3) Each swap dealer or major swap 
participant shall implement written 
policies and procedures reasonably de-
signed to protect material confidential 
information provided by or on behalf of 
a counterparty from disclosure and use 
in violation of this section by any per-
son acting for or on behalf of the swap 
dealer or major swap participant. 

§§ 23.411–23.429 [Reserved] 

§ 23.430 Verification of counterparty 
eligibility. 

(a) Eligibility. A swap dealer or major 
swap participant shall verify that a 
counterparty meets the eligibility 
standards for an eligible contract par-
ticipant, as defined in Section 1a(18) of 
the Act and § 1.3 of this chapter, before 
offering to enter into or entering into a 
swap with that counterparty. 

(b) Special Entity. In verifying the eli-
gibility of a counterparty pursuant to 
paragraph (a) of this section, a swap 
dealer or major swap participant shall 
also verify whether the counterparty is 
a Special Entity. 

(c) Special Entity election. In verifying 
the eligibility of a counterparty pursu-
ant to paragraph (a) of this section, a 
swap dealer or major swap participant 
shall verify whether a counterparty is 
eligible to elect to be a Special Entity 
under § 23.401(c)(6) and, if so, notify 
such counterparty of its right to make 
such an election. 

(d) Safe harbor. A swap dealer or 
major swap participant may rely on 
written representations of a 
counterparty to satisfy the require-
ments of this section as provided in 
§ 23.402(d). A swap dealer or major swap 

participant will have a reasonable basis 
to rely on such written representations 
for purposes of the requirements in 
paragraphs (a) and (b) of this section if 
the counterparty specifies in such rep-
resentations the provision(s) of Section 
1a(18) of the Act or paragraph(s) of § 1.3 
of this chapter that describe its status 
as an eligible contract participant and, 
in the case of a Special Entity, the 
paragraph(s) of the Special Entity defi-
nition in § 23.401(c) that define its sta-
tus as a Special Entity. 

(e) This section shall not apply with 
respect to: 

(1) A transaction that is initiated on 
a designated contract market; or 

(2) A transaction initiated on a swap 
execution facility, if the swap dealer or 
major swap participant does not know 
the identity of the counterparty to the 
transaction prior to execution. 

§ 23.431 Disclosures of material infor-
mation. 

(a) At a reasonably sufficient time 
prior to entering into a swap, a swap 
dealer or major swap participant shall 
disclose to any counterparty to the 
swap (other than a swap dealer, major 
swap participant, security-based swap 
dealer, or major security-based swap 
participant) material information con-
cerning the swap in a manner reason-
ably designed to allow the 
counterparty to assess: 

(1) The material risks of the par-
ticular swap, which may include mar-
ket, credit, liquidity, foreign currency, 
legal, operational, and any other appli-
cable risks; 

(2) The material characteristics of 
the particular swap, which shall in-
clude the material economic terms of 
the swap, the terms relating to the op-
eration of the swap, and the rights and 
obligations of the parties during the 
term of the swap; and 

(3) The material incentives and con-
flicts of interest that the swap dealer 
or major swap participant may have in 
connection with a particular swap, 
which shall include: 

(i) With respect to disclosure of the 
price of the swap, the price of the swap 
and the mid-market mark of the swap 
as set forth in paragraph (d)(2) of this 
section; and 
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(ii) Any compensation or other incen-
tive from any source other than the 
counterparty that the swap dealer or 
major swap participant may receive in 
connection with the swap. 

(b) Scenario Analysis. Prior to enter-
ing into a swap with a counterparty 
(other than a swap dealer, major swap 
participant, security-based swap deal-
er, or major security-based swap par-
ticipant) that is not made available for 
trading, as provided in Section 2(h)(8) 
of the Act, on a designated contract 
market or swap execution facility, a 
swap dealer shall: 

(1) Notify the counterparty that it 
can request and consult on the design 
of a scenario analysis to allow the 
counterparty to assess its potential ex-
posure in connection with the swap; 

(2) Upon request of the counterparty, 
provide a scenario analysis, which is 
designed in consultation with the 
counterparty and done over a range of 
assumptions, including severe downside 
stress scenarios that would result in a 
significant loss; 

(3) Disclose all material assumptions 
and explain the calculation methodolo-
gies used to perform any requested sce-
nario analysis; provided however, that 
the swap dealer is not required to dis-
close confidential, proprietary infor-
mation about any model it may use to 
prepare the scenario analysis; and 

(4) In designing any requested sce-
nario analysis, consider any relevant 
analyses that the swap dealer under-
takes for its own risk management 
purposes, including analyses performed 
as part of its ‘‘New Product Policy’’ 
specified in § 23.600(c)(3). 

(c) Paragraphs (a) and (b) of this sec-
tion shall not apply with respect to a 
transaction that is: 

(1) Initiated on a designated contract 
market or a swap execution facility; 
and 

(2) One in which the swap dealer or 
major swap participant does not know 
the identity of the counterparty to the 
transaction prior to execution. 

(d) Daily mark. A swap dealer or 
major swap participant shall: 

(1) For cleared swaps, notify a 
counterparty (other than a swap deal-
er, major swap participant, security- 
based swap dealer, or major security- 
based swap participant) of the counter-

party’s right to receive, upon request, 
the daily mark from the appropriate 
derivatives clearing organization. 

(2) For uncleared swaps, provide the 
counterparty (other than a swap deal-
er, major swap participant, security- 
based swap dealer, or major security- 
based swap participant) with a daily 
mark, which shall be the mid-market 
mark of the swap. The mid-market 
mark of the swap shall not include 
amounts for profit, credit reserve, 
hedging, funding, liquidity, or any 
other costs or adjustments. The daily 
mark shall be provided to the 
counterparty during the term of the 
swap as of the close of business or such 
other time as the parties agree in writ-
ing. 

(3) For uncleared swaps, disclose to 
the counterparty: 

(i) The methodology and assumptions 
used to prepare the daily mark and any 
material changes during the term of 
the swap; provided however, that the 
swap dealer or major swap participant 
is not required to disclose to the 
counterparty confidential, proprietary 
information about any model it may 
use to prepare the daily mark; and 

(ii) Additional information con-
cerning the daily mark to ensure a fair 
and balanced communication, includ-
ing, as appropriate, that: 

(A) The daily mark may not nec-
essarily be a price at which either the 
counterparty or the swap dealer or 
major swap participant would agree to 
replace or terminate the swap; 

(B) Depending upon the agreement of 
the parties, calls for margin may be 
based on considerations other than the 
daily mark provided to the 
counterparty; and 

(C) The daily mark may not nec-
essarily be the value of the swap that 
is marked on the books of the swap 
dealer or major swap participant. 

§ 23.432 Clearing disclosures. 
(a) For swaps required to be cleared— 

right to select derivatives clearing organi-
zation. A swap dealer or major swap 
participant shall notify any 
counterparty (other than a swap deal-
er, major swap participant, securities- 
based swap dealer, or major securities- 
based swap participant) with which it 
entered into a swap that is subject to 
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mandatory clearing under Section 2(h) 
of the Act, that the counterparty has 
the sole right to select the derivatives 
clearing organization at which the 
swap will be cleared. 

(b) For swaps not required to be 
cleared—right to clearing. A swap dealer 
or major swap participant shall notify 
any counterparty (other than a swap 
dealer, major swap participant, securi-
ties-based swap dealer, or major securi-
ties-based swap participant) with 
which it entered into a swap that is not 
subject to the mandatory clearing re-
quirements under Section 2(h) of the 
Act that the counterparty: 

(1) May elect to require clearing of 
the swap; and 

(2) Shall have the sole right to select 
the derivatives clearing organization 
at which the swap will be cleared. 

§ 23.433 Communications—fair dealing. 

With respect to any communication 
between a swap dealer or major swap 
participant and any counterparty, the 
swap dealer or major swap participant 
shall communicate in a fair and bal-
anced manner based on principles of 
fair dealing and good faith. 

§ 23.434 Recommendations to counter-
parties—institutional suitability. 

(a) A swap dealer that recommends a 
swap or trading strategy involving a 
swap to a counterparty, other than a 
swap dealer, major swap participant, 
security-based swap dealer, or major 
security-based swap participant, must: 

(1) Undertake reasonable diligence to 
understand the potential risks and re-
wards associated with the rec-
ommended swap or trading strategy in-
volving a swap; and 

(2) Have a reasonable basis to believe 
that the recommended swap or trading 
strategy involving a swap is suitable 
for the counterparty. To establish a 
reasonable basis for a recommendation, 
a swap dealer must have or obtain in-
formation about the counterparty, in-
cluding the counterparty’s investment 
profile, trading objectives, and ability 
to absorb potential losses associated 
with the recommended swap or trading 
strategy involving a swap. 

(b) Safe harbor. A swap dealer may 
fulfill its obligations under paragraph 

(a)(2) of this section with respect to a 
particular counterparty if: 

(1) The swap dealer reasonably deter-
mines that the counterparty, or an 
agent to which the counterparty has 
delegated decision-making authority, 
is capable of independently evaluating 
investment risks with regard to the 
relevant swap or trading strategy in-
volving a swap; 

(2) The counterparty or its agent rep-
resents in writing that it is exercising 
independent judgment in evaluating 
the recommendations of the swap deal-
er with regard to the relevant swap or 
trading strategy involving a swap; 

(3) The swap dealer discloses in writ-
ing that it is acting in its capacity as 
a counterparty and is not undertaking 
to assess the suitability of the swap or 
trading strategy involving a swap for 
the counterparty; and 

(4) In the case of a counterparty that 
is a Special Entity, the swap dealer 
complies with § 23.440 where the rec-
ommendation would cause the swap 
dealer to act as an advisor to a Special 
Entity within the meaning of 
§ 23.440(a). 

(c) A swap dealer will satisfy the re-
quirements of paragraph (b)(1) of this 
section if it receives written represen-
tations, as provided in § 23.402(d), that: 

(1) In the case of a counterparty that 
is not a Special Entity, the 
counterparty has complied in good 
faith with written policies and proce-
dures that are reasonably designed to 
ensure that the persons responsible for 
evaluating the recommendation and 
making trading decisions on behalf of 
the counterparty are capable of doing 
so; or 

(2) In the case of a counterparty that 
is a Special Entity, satisfy the terms of 
the safe harbor in § 23.450(d). 

§§ 23.435–23.439 [Reserved] 

§ 23.440 Requirements for swap deal-
ers acting as advisors to Special En-
tities. 

(a) Acts as an advisor to a Special Enti-
ty. For purposes of this section, a swap 
dealer ‘‘acts as an advisor to a Special 
Entity’’ when the swap dealer rec-
ommends a swap or trading strategy 
involving a swap that is tailored to the 
particular needs or characteristics of 
the Special Entity. 
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(b) Safe harbors. A swap dealer will 
not ‘‘act as an advisor to a Special En-
tity’’ within the meaning of paragraph 
(a) of this section if: 

(1) With respect to a Special Entity 
that is an employee benefit plan as de-
fined in § 23.401(c)(3): 

(i) The Special Entity represents in 
writing that it has a fiduciary as de-
fined in Section 3 of the Employee Re-
tirement Income Security Act of 1974 
(29 U.S.C. 1002) that is responsible for 
representing the Special Entity in con-
nection with the swap transaction; 

(ii) The fiduciary represents in writ-
ing that it will not rely on rec-
ommendations provided by the swap 
dealer; and 

(iii) The Special Entity represents in 
writing: 

(A) That it will comply in good faith 
with written policies and procedures 
reasonably designed to ensure that any 
recommendation the Special Entity re-
ceives from the swap dealer materially 
affecting a swap transaction is evalu-
ated by a fiduciary before the trans-
action occurs; or 

(B) That any recommendation the 
Special Entity receives from the swap 
dealer materially affecting a swap 
transaction will be evaluated by a fidu-
ciary before that transaction occurs; or 

(2) With respect to any Special Enti-
ty: 

(i) The swap dealer does not express 
an opinion as to whether the Special 
Entity should enter into a rec-
ommended swap or trading strategy in-
volving a swap that is tailored to the 
particular needs or characteristics of 
the Special Entity; 

(ii) The Special Entity represents in 
writing that: 

(A) The Special Entity will not rely 
on recommendations provided by the 
swap dealer; and 

(B) The Special Entity will rely on 
advice from a qualified independent 
representative within the meaning of 
§ 23.450; and 

(iii) The swap dealer discloses to the 
Special Entity that it is not under-
taking to act in the best interests of 
the Special Entity as otherwise re-
quired by this section. 

(c) A swap dealer that acts as an ad-
visor to a Special Entity shall comply 
with the following requirements: 

(1) Duty. Any swap dealer that acts as 
an advisor to a Special Entity shall 
have a duty to make a reasonable de-
termination that any swap or trading 
strategy involving a swap rec-
ommended by the swap dealer is in the 
best interests of the Special Entity. 

(2) Reasonable efforts. Any swap dealer 
that acts as an advisor to a Special En-
tity shall make reasonable efforts to 
obtain such information as is necessary 
to make a reasonable determination 
that any swap or trading strategy in-
volving a swap recommended by the 
swap dealer is in the best interests of 
the Special Entity, including informa-
tion relating to: 

(i) The financial status of the Special 
Entity, as well as the Special Entity’s 
future funding needs; 

(ii) The tax status of the Special En-
tity; 

(iii) The hedging, investment, financ-
ing, or other objectives of the Special 
Entity; 

(iv) The experience of the Special En-
tity with respect to entering into 
swaps, generally, and swaps of the type 
and complexity being recommended; 

(v) Whether the Special Entity has 
the financial capability to withstand 
changes in market conditions during 
the term of the swap; and 

(vi) Such other information as is rel-
evant to the particular facts and cir-
cumstances of the Special Entity, mar-
ket conditions, and the type of swap or 
trading strategy involving a swap 
being recommended. 

(d) Reasonable reliance on representa-
tions of the Special Entity. As provided 
in § 23.402(d), the swap dealer may rely 
on written representations of the Spe-
cial Entity to satisfy its requirement 
in paragraph (c)(2) of this section to 
make ‘‘reasonable efforts’’ to obtain 
necessary information. 

§§ 23.441–23.449 [Reserved] 

§ 23.450 Requirements for swap deal-
ers and major swap participants 
acting as counterparties to Special 
Entities. 

(a) Definitions. For purposes of this 
section: 

(1) The term ‘‘principal relationship’’ 
means where a swap dealer or major 
swap participant is a principal of the 
representative of a Special Entity or 
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the representative of a Special Entity 
is a principal of the swap dealer or 
major swap participant. The term 
‘‘principal’’ means any person listed in 
§ 3.1(a)(1) through(3) of this chapter. 

(2) The term ‘‘statutory disqualifica-
tion’’ means grounds for refusal to reg-
ister or to revoke, condition, or re-
strict the registration of any reg-
istrant or applicant for registration as 
set forth in Sections 8a(2) and 8a(3) of 
the Act. 

(b)(1) Any swap dealer or major swap 
participant that offers to enter or en-
ters into a swap with a Special Entity, 
other than a Special Entity defined in 
§ 23.401(c)(3), shall have a reasonable 
basis to believe that the Special Entity 
has a representative that: 

(i) Has sufficient knowledge to evalu-
ate the transaction and risks; 

(ii) Is not subject to a statutory dis-
qualification; 

(iii) Is independent of the swap dealer 
or major swap participant; 

(iv) Undertakes a duty to act in the 
best interests of the Special Entity it 
represents; 

(v) Makes appropriate and timely dis-
closures to the Special Entity; 

(vi) Evaluates, consistent with any 
guidelines provided by the Special En-
tity, fair pricing and the appropriate-
ness of the swap; and 

(vii) In the case of a Special Entity 
as defined in § 23.401(c)(2) or (4), is sub-
ject to restrictions on certain political 
contributions imposed by the Commis-
sion, the Securities and Exchange Com-
mission, or a self-regulatory organiza-
tion subject to the jurisdiction of the 
Commission or the Securities and Ex-
change Commission; provided however, 
that this paragraph (b)(1)(vii) of this 
section shall not apply if the represent-
ative is an employee of the Special En-
tity. 

(2) Any swap dealer or major swap 
participant that offers to enter or en-
ters into a swap with a Special Entity 
as defined in § 23.401(c)(3) shall have a 
reasonable basis to believe that the 
Special Entity has a representative 
that is a fiduciary as defined in Section 
3 of the Employee Retirement Income 
Security Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C. 1002). 

(c) Independent. For purposes of para-
graph (b)(1)(iii) of this section, a rep-
resentative of a Special Entity will be 

deemed to be independent of the swap 
dealer or major swap participant if: 

(1) The representative is not and, 
within one year of representing the 
Special Entity in connection with the 
swap, was not an associated person of 
the swap dealer or major swap partici-
pant within the meaning of Section 
1a(4) of the Act; 

(2) There is no principal relationship 
between the representative of the Spe-
cial Entity and the swap dealer or 
major swap participant; 

(3) The representative: 
(i) Provides timely and effective dis-

closures to the Special Entity of all 
material conflicts of interest that 
could reasonably affect the judgment 
or decision making of the representa-
tive with respect to its obligations to 
the Special Entity; and 

(ii) Complies with policies and proce-
dures reasonably designed to manage 
and mitigate such material conflicts of 
interest; 

(4) The representative is not directly 
or indirectly, through one or more per-
sons, controlled by, in control of, or 
under common control with the swap 
dealer or major swap participant; and 

(5) The swap dealer or major swap 
participant did not refer, recommend, 
or introduce the representative to the 
Special Entity within one year of the 
representative’s representation of the 
Special Entity in connection with the 
swap. 

(d) Safe harbor. (1) A swap dealer or 
major swap participant shall be 
deemed to have a reasonable basis to 
believe that the Special Entity, other 
than a Special Entity defined in 
§ 23.401(c)(3), has a representative that 
satisfies the applicable requirements of 
paragraph (b)(1) of this section, pro-
vided that: 

(i) The Special Entity represents in 
writing to the swap dealer or major 
swap participant that it has complied 
in good faith with written policies and 
procedures reasonably designed to en-
sure that it has selected a representa-
tive that satisfies the applicable re-
quirements of paragraph (b) of this sec-
tion, and that such policies and proce-
dures provide for ongoing monitoring 
of the performance of such representa-
tive consistent with the requirements 
of paragraph (b) of this section; and 
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(ii) The representative represents in 
writing to the Special Entity and swap 
dealer or major swap participant that 
the representative: 

(A) Has policies and procedures rea-
sonably designed to ensure that it sat-
isfies the applicable requirements of 
paragraph (b) of this section; 

(B) Meets the independence test in 
paragraph (c) of this section; and 

(C) Is legally obligated to comply 
with the applicable requirements of 
paragraph (b) of this section by agree-
ment, condition of employment, law, 
rule, regulation, or other enforceable 
duty. 

(2) A swap dealer or major swap par-
ticipant shall be deemed to have a rea-
sonable basis to believe that a Special 
Entity defined in § 23.401(c)(3) has a rep-
resentative that satisfies the applica-
ble requirements in paragraph (b)(2) of 
this section, provided that the Special 
Entity provides in writing to the swap 
dealer or major swap participant the 
representative’s name and contact in-
formation, and represents in writing 
that the representative is a fiduciary 
as defined in Section 3 of the Employee 
Retirement Income Security Act of 
1974 (29 U.S.C. 1002). 

(e) Reasonable reliance on representa-
tions of the Special Entity. A swap dealer 
or major swap participant may rely on 
written representations of a Special 
Entity and, as applicable under this 
section, the Special Entity’s represent-
ative to satisfy any requirement of this 
section as provided in § 23.402(d). 

(f) Chief compliance officer review. If a 
swap dealer or major swap participant 
initially determines that it does not 
have a reasonable basis to believe that 
the representative of a Special Entity 
meets the criteria established in this 
section, the swap dealer or major swap 
participant shall make a written 
record of the basis for such determina-
tion and submit such determination to 
its chief compliance officer for review 
to ensure that the swap dealer or major 
swap participant has a substantial, un-
biased basis for the determination. 

(g) Before the initiation of a swap, a 
swap dealer or major swap participant 
shall disclose to the Special Entity in 
writing: 

(1) The capacity in which it is acting 
in connection with the swap; and 

(2) If the swap dealer or major swap 
participant engages in business with 
the Special Entity in more than one 
capacity, the swap dealer or major 
swap participant shall disclose the ma-
terial differences between such capac-
ities. 

(h) This section shall not apply with 
respect to a transaction that is: 

(1) Initiated on a designated contract 
market or swap execution facility; and 

(2) One in which the swap dealer or 
major swap participant does not know 
the identity of the counterparty to the 
transaction prior to execution. 

§ 23.451 Political contributions by cer-
tain swap dealers. 

(a) Definitions. For the purposes of 
this section: 

(1) The term ‘‘contribution’’ means 
any gift, subscription, loan, advance, 
or deposit of money or anything of 
value made: 

(i) For the purpose of influencing any 
election for federal, state, or local of-
fice; 

(ii) For payment of debt incurred in 
connection with any such election; or 

(iii) For transition or inaugural ex-
penses incurred by the successful can-
didate for federal, state, or local office. 

(2) The term ‘‘covered associate’’ 
means: 

(i) Any general partner, managing 
member, or executive officer, or other 
person with a similar status or func-
tion; 

(ii) Any employee who solicits a gov-
ernmental Special Entity for the swap 
dealer and any person who supervises, 
directly or indirectly, such employee; 
and 

(iii) Any political action committee 
controlled by the swap dealer or by any 
person described in paragraphs (a)(2)(i) 
and (a)(2)(ii) of this section. 

(3) The term ‘‘governmental Special 
Entity’’ means any Special Entity de-
fined in § 23.401(c)(2) or (4). 

(4) The term ‘‘official’’ of a govern-
mental Special Entity means any per-
son (including any election committee 
for such person) who was, at the time 
of the contribution, an incumbent, can-
didate, or successful candidate for elec-
tive office of a governmental Special 
Entity, if the office: 
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(i) Is directly or indirectly respon-
sible for, or can influence the outcome 
of, the selection of a swap dealer by a 
governmental Special Entity; or 

(ii) Has authority to appoint any per-
son who is directly or indirectly re-
sponsible for, or can influence the out-
come of, the selection of a swap dealer 
by a governmental Special Entity. 

(5) The term ‘‘payment’’ means any 
gift, subscription, loan, advance, or de-
posit of money or anything of value. 

(6) The term ‘‘regulated person’’ 
means: 

(i) A person that is subject to restric-
tions on certain political contributions 
imposed by the Commission, the Secu-
rities and Exchange Commission, or a 
self-regulatory agency subject to the 
jurisdiction of the Commission or the 
Securities and Exchange Commission; 

(ii) A general partner, managing 
member, or executive officer of such 
person, or other individual with a simi-
lar status or function; or 

(iii) An employee of such person who 
solicits a governmental Special Entity 
for the swap dealer and any person who 
supervises, directly or indirectly, such 
employee. 

(7) The term ‘‘solicit’’ means a direct 
or indirect communication by any per-
son with a governmental Special Enti-
ty for the purpose of obtaining or re-
taining an engagement related to a 
swap. 

(b) Prohibitions and exceptions. (1) As a 
means reasonably designed to prevent 
fraud, no swap dealer shall offer to 
enter into or enter into a swap or a 
trading strategy involving a swap with 
a governmental Special Entity within 
two years after any contribution to an 
official of such governmental Special 
Entity was made by the swap dealer or 
by any covered associate of the swap 
dealer; provided however, that: 

(2) This prohibition does not apply: 
(i) If the only contributions made by 

the swap dealer to an official of such 
governmental Special Entity were 
made by a covered associate: 

(A) To officials for whom the covered 
associate was entitled to vote at the 
time of the contributions, provided 
that the contributions in the aggregate 
do not exceed $350 to any one official 
per election; or 

(B) To officials for whom the covered 
associate was not entitled to vote at 
the time of the contributions, provided 
that the contributions in the aggregate 
do not exceed $150 to any one official 
per election; 

(ii) To a swap dealer as a result of a 
contribution made by a natural person 
more than six months prior to becom-
ing a covered associate of the swap 
dealer, provided that this exclusion 
shall not apply if the natural person, 
after becoming a covered associate, so-
licits the governmental Special Entity 
on behalf of the swap dealer to offer to 
enter into or to enter into a swap or 
trading strategy involving a swap; or 

(iii) To a swap that is: 
(A) Initiated on a designated con-

tract market or swap execution facil-
ity; and 

(B) One in which the swap dealer does 
not know the identity of the 
counterparty to the transaction prior 
to execution. 

(3) No swap dealer or any covered as-
sociate of the swap dealer shall: 

(i) Provide or agree to provide, di-
rectly or indirectly, payment to any 
person to solicit a governmental Spe-
cial Entity to offer to enter into, or to 
enter into, a swap with that swap deal-
er unless such person is a regulated 
person; or 

(ii) Coordinate, or solicit any person 
or political action committee to make, 
any: 

(A) Contribution to an official of a 
governmental Special Entity with 
which the swap dealer is offering to 
enter into, or has entered into, a swap; 
or 

(B) Payment to a political party of a 
state or locality with which the swap 
dealer is offering to enter into or has 
entered into a swap or a trading strat-
egy involving a swap. 

(c) Circumvention of rule. No swap 
dealer shall, directly or indirectly, 
through or by any other person or 
means, do any act that would result in 
a violation of paragraph (b) of this sec-
tion. 

(d) Requests for exemption. The Com-
mission, upon application, may condi-
tionally or unconditionally exempt a 
swap dealer from the prohibition under 
paragraph (b) of this section. In deter-
mining whether to grant an exemption, 
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the Commission will consider, among 
other factors: 

(1) Whether the exemption is nec-
essary or appropriate in the public in-
terest and consistent with the protec-
tion of investors and the purposes of 
the Act; 

(2) Whether the swap dealer: 
(i) Before the contribution resulting 

in the prohibition was made, imple-
mented policies and procedures reason-
ably designed to prevent violations of 
this section; 

(ii) Prior to or at the time the con-
tribution which resulted in such prohi-
bition was made, had no actual knowl-
edge of the contribution; and 

(iii) After learning of the contribu-
tion: 

(A) Has taken all available steps to 
cause the contributor involved in mak-
ing the contribution which resulted in 
such prohibition to obtain a return of 
the contribution; and 

(B) Has taken such other remedial or 
preventive measures as may be appro-
priate under the circumstances; 

(3) Whether, at the time of the con-
tribution, the contributor was a cov-
ered associate or otherwise an em-
ployee of the swap dealer, or was seek-
ing such employment; 

(4) The timing and amount of the 
contribution which resulted in the pro-
hibition; 

(5) The nature of the election (e.g., 
federal, state or local); and 

(6) The contributor’s apparent intent 
or motive in making the contribution 
that resulted in the prohibition, as evi-
denced by the facts and circumstances 
surrounding the contribution. 

(e) Prohibitions inapplicable. (1) The 
prohibitions under paragraph (b) of this 
section shall not apply to a contribu-
tion made by a covered associate of the 
swap dealer if: 

(i) The swap dealer discovered the 
contribution within 120 calendar days 
of the date of such contribution; 

(ii) The contribution did not exceed 
the amounts permitted by paragraphs 
(b)(2)(i)(A) or (B) of this section; and 

(iii) The covered associate obtained a 
return of the contribution within 60 
calendar days of the date of discovery 
of the contribution by the swap dealer. 

(2) A swap dealer may not rely on 
paragraph (e)(1) of this section more 
than twice in any 12-month period. 

(3) A swap dealer may not rely on 
paragraph (e)(1) of this section more 
than once for any covered associate, re-
gardless of the time between contribu-
tions. 

APPENDIX A TO SUBPART H OF PART 23— 
GUIDANCE ON THE APPLICATION OF 
§§ 23.434 AND 23.440 FOR SWAP DEAL-
ERS THAT MAKE RECOMMENDATIONS 
TO COUNTERPARTIES OR SPECIAL EN-
TITIES 

The following provides guidance on the ap-
plication of §§ 23.434 and 23.440 to swap deal-
ers that make recommendations to counter-
parties or Special Entities. 

Section 23.434—Recommendations to 
Counterparties—Institutional Suitability 

A swap dealer that recommends a swap or 
trading strategy involving a swap to a 
counterparty, other than a swap dealer, 
major swap participant, security-based swap 
dealer or major security-based swap partici-
pant, must undertake reasonable diligence to 
understand the potential risks and rewards 
associated with the recommended swap or 
trading strategy involving a swap—general 
suitability (§ 23.434(a)(1))—and have a reason-
able basis to believe that the recommended 
swap or trading strategy involving a swap is 
suitable for the counterparty—specific suit-
ability (§ 23.434(a)(2)). To satisfy the general 
suitability obligation, a swap dealer must 
undertake reasonable diligence that will 
vary depending on, among other things, the 
complexity of and risks associated with the 
swap or swap trading strategy and the swap 
dealer’s familiarity with the swap or swap 
trading strategy. At a minimum, a swap 
dealer’s reasonable diligence must provide it 
with an understanding of the potential risks 
and rewards associated with the rec-
ommended swap or swap trading strategy. 

Recommendation. Whether a communica-
tion between a swap dealer and a 
counterparty is a recommendation will turn 
on the facts and circumstances of the par-
ticular situation. There are, however, cer-
tain factors the Commission will consider in 
reaching such a determination. The facts and 
circumstances determination of whether a 
communication is a ‘‘recommendation’’ re-
quires an analysis of the content, context, 
and presentation of the particular commu-
nication or set of communications. The de-
termination of whether a ‘‘recommendation’’ 
has been made, moreover, is an objective 
rather than a subjective inquiry. An impor-
tant factor in this regard is whether, given 
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its content, context, and manner of presen-
tation, a particular communication from a 
swap dealer to a counterparty reasonably 
would be viewed as a ‘‘call to action,’’ or sug-
gestion that the counterparty enter into a 
swap. An analysis of the content, context, 
and manner of presentation of a communica-
tion requires examination of the underlying 
substantive information transmitted to the 
counterparty and consideration of any other 
facts and circumstances, such as any accom-
panying explanatory message from the swap 
dealer. Additionally, the more individually 
tailored the communication to a specific 
counterparty or a targeted group of counter-
parties about a swap, group of swaps or trad-
ing strategy involving the use of a swap, the 
greater the likelihood that the communica-
tion may be viewed as a ‘‘recommendation.’’ 

Safe harbor. A swap dealer may satisfy the 
safe harbor requirements of § 23.434(b) to ful-
fill its counterparty-specific suitability duty 
under § 23.434(a)(2) if: (1) The swap dealer rea-
sonably determines that the counterparty, 
or an agent to which the counterparty has 
delegated decision-making authority, is ca-
pable of independently evaluating invest-
ment risks with regard to the relevant swap 
or trading strategy involving a swap; (2) the 
counterparty or its agent represents in writ-
ing that it is exercising independent judg-
ment in evaluating the recommendations of 
the swap dealer; (3) the swap dealer discloses 
in writing that it is acting in its capacity as 
a counterparty and is not undertaking to as-
sess the suitability of the recommendation; 
and (4) in the case of a counterparty that is 
a Special Entity, the swap dealer complies 
with § 23.440 where the recommendation 
would cause the swap dealer to act as an ad-
visor to a Special Entity within the meaning 
of § 23.440(a). 

To reasonably determine that the 
counterparty, or an agent to which the 
counterparty has delegated decision-making 
authority, is capable of independently evalu-
ating investment risks of a recommendation, 
the swap dealer can rely on the written rep-
resentations of the counterparty, as provided 
in § 23.434(c). Section 23.434(c)(1) provides 
that a swap dealer will satisfy § 23.434(b)(1)’s 
requirement with respect to a counterparty 
other than a Special Entity if it receives rep-
resentations that the counterparty has com-
plied in good faith with the counterparty’s 
policies and procedures that are reasonably 
designed to ensure that the persons respon-
sible for evaluating the recommendation and 
making trading decisions on behalf of the 
counterparty are capable of doing so. Section 
§ 23.434(c)(2) provides that a swap dealer will 
satisfy § 23.434(b)(1)’s requirement with re-
spect to a Special Entity if it receives rep-
resentations that satisfy the terms of 
§ 23.450(d) regarding a Special Entity’s quali-
fied independent representative. 

Prong (4) of the safe harbor clarifies that 
§ 23.434’s application is broader than § 23.440— 
Requirements for Swap Dealers Acting as 
Advisors to Special Entities. Section 23.434 is 
triggered when a swap dealer recommends 
any swap or trading strategy that involves a 
swap to any counterparty. However, § 23.440 
is limited to a swap dealer’s recommenda-
tions (1) to a Special Entity (2) of swaps that 
are tailored to the particular needs or char-
acteristics of the Special Entity. Thus, a 
swap dealer that recommends a swap to a 
Special Entity that is tailored to the par-
ticular needs or characteristics of the Spe-
cial Entity may comply with its suitability 
obligation by satisfying the safe harbor in 
§ 23.434(b); however, the swap dealer must 
also comply with § 23.440 in such cir-
cumstances. 

Section 23.440—Requirements for Swap Dealers 
Acting as Advisors to Special Entities 

A swap dealer ‘‘acts as an advisor to a Spe-
cial Entity’’ under § 23.440 when the swap 
dealer recommends a swap or trading strat-
egy involving a swap that is tailored to the 
particular needs or characteristics of the 
Special Entity. A swap dealer that ‘‘acts as 
an advisor to a Special Entity’’ has a duty to 
make a reasonable determination that a rec-
ommendation is in the ‘‘best interests’’ of 
the Special Entities and must undertake 
‘‘reasonable efforts’’ to obtain information 
necessary to make such a determination. 

Whether a swap dealer ‘‘acts as an advisor 
to a Special Entity’’ will depend on: (1) 
Whether the swap dealer has made a rec-
ommendation to a Special Entity; and (2) 
whether the recommendation concerns a 
swap or trading strategy involving a swap 
that is tailored to the particular needs or 
characteristics of the Special Entity. To de-
termine whether a communication between a 
swap dealer and counterparty is a rec-
ommendation, the Commission will apply 
the same factors as under § 23.434, the suit-
ability rule. However, unlike the suitability 
rule, which covers recommendations regard-
ing any type of swap or trading strategy in-
volving a swap, the ‘‘acts as an advisor rule’’ 
and ‘‘best interests’’ duty will be triggered 
only if the recommendation is of a swap or 
trading strategy involving a swap that is 
‘‘tailored to the particular needs or charac-
teristics of the Special Entity.’’ 

Whether a swap is tailored to the par-
ticular needs or characteristics of the Spe-
cial Entity will depend on the facts and cir-
cumstances. Swaps with terms that are tai-
lored or customized to a specific Special En-
tity’s needs or objectives, or swaps with 
terms that are designed for a targeted group 
of Special Entities that share common char-
acteristics, e.g., school districts, are likely 
to be viewed as tailored to the particular 
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1 The guidance in this appendix regarding 
the safe harbor to § 23.440 is limited to the 
safe harbor for any Special Entity under 
§ 23.440(b)(2). A swap dealer may separately 
comply with the safe harbor under 
§ 23.440(b)(1) for its communications to a Spe-
cial Entity that is an employee benefit plan 
as defined in § 23.401(c)(3). 

2 Communications on the list that are not 
within the meaning of the term ‘‘acts as an 
advisor to a Special Entity’’ are outside the 
requirements of § 23.440. By including such 
communications on the list, the Commission 

does not intend to suggest that they are 
‘‘recommendations.’’ Thus, a swap dealer 
that does not ‘‘act as an advisor to a Special 
Entity’’ within the meaning of § 23.440(a) is 
not required to comply with the safe harbor 
to avoid the ‘‘best interests’’ duty with re-
spect to its communications. 

needs or characteristics of the Special Enti-
ty. Generally, however, the Commission 
would not view a swap that is ‘‘made avail-
able for trading’’ on a designated contract 
market or swap execution facility, as pro-
vided in Section 2(h)(8) of the Act, as tai-
lored to the particular needs or characteris-
tics of the Special Entity. 

Safe harbor. Under § 23.440(b)(2), when deal-
ing with a Special Entity (including a Spe-
cial Entity that is an employee benefit plan 
as defined in § 23.401(c)(3)), 1 a swap dealer 
will not ‘‘act as an advisor to a Special Enti-
ty’’ if: (1) The swap dealer does not express 
an opinion as to whether the Special Entity 
should enter into a recommended swap or 
swap trading strategy that is tailored to the 
particular needs or characteristics of the 
Special Entity; (2) the Special Entity rep-
resents in writing, in accordance with 
§ 23.402(d), that it will not rely on the swap 
dealer’s recommendations and will rely on 
advice from a qualified independent rep-
resentative within the meaning of § 23.450; 
and (3) the swap dealer discloses that it is 
not undertaking to act in the best interests 
of the Special Entity. 

A swap dealer that elects to communicate 
within the safe harbor to avoid triggering 
the ‘‘best interests’’ duty must appropriately 
manage its communications. To clarify the 
type of communications that they will make 
under the safe harbor, the Commission ex-
pects that swap dealers may specifically rep-
resent that they will not express an opinion 
as to whether the Special Entity should 
enter into a recommended swap or trading 
strategy, and that for such advice the Spe-
cial Entity should consult its own advisor. 
Nothing in the final rule would preclude such 
a representation from being included in 
counterparty relationship documentation. 
However, such a representation would not 
act as a safe harbor under the rule where, 
contrary to the representation, the swap 
dealer does express an opinion to the Special 
Entity as to whether it should enter into a 
recommended swap or trading strategy. 

If a swap dealer complies with the terms of 
the safe harbor, the following types of com-
munications would not be subject to the 
‘‘best interests’’ duty: 2 (1) Providing infor-

mation that is general transaction, finan-
cial, educational, or market information; (2) 
offering a swap or trading strategy involving 
a swap, including swaps that are tailored to 
the needs or characteristics of a Special En-
tity; (3) providing a term sheet, including 
terms for swaps that are tailored to the 
needs or characteristics of a Special Entity; 
(4) responding to a request for a quote from 
a Special Entity; (5) providing trading ideas 
for swaps or swap trading strategies, includ-
ing swaps that are tailored to the needs or 
characteristics of a Special Entity; and (6) 
providing marketing materials upon request 
or on an unsolicited basis about swaps or 
swap trading strategies, including swaps 
that are tailored to the needs or characteris-
tics of a Special Entity. This list of commu-
nications is not exclusive and should not cre-
ate a negative implication that other types 
of communications are subject to a ‘‘best in-
terests’’ duty. 

The safe harbor in § 23.440(b)(2) allows a 
wide range of communications and inter-
actions between swap dealers and Special 
Entities without invoking the ‘‘best inter-
ests’’ duty, including discussions of the ad-
vantages or disadvantages of different swaps 
or trading strategies. The Commission notes, 
however, that depending on the facts and cir-
cumstances, some of the examples on the list 
could be ‘‘recommendations’’ that would 
trigger a suitability obligation under § 23.434. 
However, the Commission has determined 
that such activities would not, by them-
selves, prompt the ‘‘best interests’’ duty in 
§ 23.440, provided that the parties comply 
with the other requirements of § 23.440(b)(2). 
All of the swap dealer’s communications, 
however, must be made in a fair and bal-
anced manner based on principles of fair 
dealing and good faith in compliance with 
§ 23.433. 

Swap dealers engage in a wide variety of 
communications with counterparties in the 
normal course of business, including but not 
limited to the six types of communications 
listed above. Whether any particular com-
munication will be deemed to be a ‘‘rec-
ommendation’’ within the meaning of 
§§ 23.434 or 23.440 will depend on the facts and 
circumstances of the particular communica-
tion considered in light of the guidance in 
this appendix with respect to the meaning of 
the term ‘‘recommendation.’’ Swap dealers 
that choose to manage their communica-
tions to comply with the safe harbors pro-
vided in §§ 23.434 and 23.440 will be able to 
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limit the duty they owe to counterparties, 
including Special Entities, provided that the 
parties exchange the appropriate representa-
tions. 

Subpart I—Swap Documentation 

SOURCE: 77 FR 21307, Apr. 9, 2012, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 23.500 Definitions. 
For purposes of this subpart I, the 

following terms shall be defined as pro-
vided. 

(a) Acknowledgment means a written 
or electronic record of all of the terms 
of a swap signed and sent by one 
counterparty to the other. 

(b) Bilateral portfolio compression exer-
cise means an exercise in which two 
swap counterparties wholly terminate 
or change the notional value of some or 
all of the swaps submitted by the 
counterparties for inclusion in the 
portfolio compression exercise and, de-
pending on the methodology employed, 
replace the terminated swaps with 
other swaps whose combined notional 
value (or some other measure of risk) 
is less than the combined notional 
value (or some other measure of risk) 
of the terminated swaps in the exer-
cise. 

(c) Confirmation means the con-
summation (electronically or other-
wise) of legally binding documentation 
(electronic or otherwise) that memori-
alizes the agreement of the counterpar-
ties to all of the terms of a swap trans-
action. A confirmation must be in writ-
ing (whether electronic or otherwise) 
and must legally supersede any pre-
vious agreement (electronically or oth-
erwise). A confirmation is created 
when an acknowledgment is manually, 
electronically, or by some other legally 
equivalent means, signed by the receiv-
ing counterparty. 

(d) Execution means, with respect to a 
swap transaction, an agreement by the 
counterparties (whether orally, in writ-
ing, electronically, or otherwise) to the 
terms of the swap transaction that le-
gally binds the counterparties to such 
terms under applicable law. 

(e) Financial entity means a 
counterparty that is not a swap dealer 
or a major swap participant and that is 
one of the following: 

(1) A commodity pool as defined in 
Section 1a(5) of the Act; 

(2) A private fund as defined in Sec-
tion 202(a) of the Investment Advisors 
Act of 1940; 

(3) An employee benefit plan as de-
fined in paragraphs (3) and (32) of sec-
tion 3 of the Employee Retirement In-
come and Security Act of 1974; 

(4) A person predominantly engaged 
in activities that are in the business of 
banking, or in activities that are finan-
cial in nature as defined in Section 4(k) 
of the Bank Holding Company Act of 
1956; and 

(5) A security-based swap dealer or a 
major security-based swap participant. 

(f) Fully offsetting swaps means swaps 
of equivalent terms where no net cash 
flow would be owed to either 
counterparty after the offset of pay-
ment obligations thereunder. 

(g) Material terms means the min-
imum primary economic terms (as de-
fined in appendix 1 of part 45 of this 
chapter) of a swap other than the fol-
lowing: 

(1) An indication of whether the re-
porting counterparty is a swap dealer 
with respect to the swap; 

(2) An indication of whether the re-
porting party is a major swap partici-
pant with respect to the swap; 

(3) If the reporting counterparty is 
not a swap dealer or a major swap par-
ticipant with respect to the swap, an 
indication of whether the reporting 
counterparty is a financial entity as 
defined in section 2(h)(7)(c) of the Act; 

(4) An indication of whether the re-
porting counterparty is a U.S. person; 

(5) An indication that the swap will 
be allocated; 

(6) If the swap will be allocated, or is 
a post-allocation swap, the legal entity 
identifier of the agent; 

(7) An indication of whether the swap 
is a post-allocation swap; 

(8) If the swap is a post-allocation 
swap, the unique swap identifier of the 
original transaction between the re-
porting counterparty and the agent; 

(9) An indication of whether the non- 
reporting counterparty is a swap dealer 
with respect to the swap; 

(10) An indication of whether the 
non-reporting counterparty is a major 
swap participant with respect to the 
swap; 
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