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SUBCHAPTER A—GENERAL 

PART 2800 [RESERVED] 

PART 2801—DEPARTMENT OF JUS-
TICE ACQUISITION REGULATIONS 
SYSTEM 

Subpart 2801.1—Purpose, Authority, 
Issuance 

Sec. 
2801.101 Purpose. 
2801.106 OMB approval under the Paperwork 

Reduction Act. 

Subpart 2801.2—Administration 

2801.270–1 Revisions. 

Subpart 2801.3—Agency Acquisition 
Regulations 

2801.304 Agency control and compliance pro-
cedures. 

Subpart 2801.4—Deviations From the FAR 
and JAR 

2801.403 Individual deviations. 
2801.404 Class deviations. 
2801.470 Requests for class deviations. 

Subpart 2801.6—Career Development, 
Contracting Authority, and Responsibilities 

2801.601 General. 
2801.602 Contracting officers. 
2801.602–3 Ratification of unauthorized com-

mitments. 
2801.603 Selection, appointment and termi-

nation of appointment. 
2801.603–1 Department of Justice Acquisi-

tion Career Management Program. 
2801.603–3 Appointment. 

Subpart 2801.70—Contracting Officer’s 
Technical Representative 

2801.7001–701 General. 
2801.7001–702 Selection, appointment, and 

limitation of authority. 

AUTHORITY: 28 U.S.C. 510; 40 U.S.C. 486(c); 28 
CFR 0.75(j) and 28 CFR 0.76(j). 

SOURCE: 63 FR 16118, Apr. 2, 1998, unless 
otherwise noted. 

Subpart 2801.1—Purpose, 
Authority, Issuance 

2801.101 Purpose. 

(a) The Justice Acquisition Regula-
tions (JAR) in this chapter are estab-
lished to provide procurement regula-
tions that supplement the Federal Ac-
quisition Regulation (FAR), 48 CFR 
chapter 1. As such, the regulations con-
tained in the JAR will include coverage 
of only those areas where agency im-
plementation is required by the FAR, 
or where Department of Justice (DOJ) 
policies and procedures exist that sup-
plement FAR coverage and directly af-
fect the contractual relationship be-
tween the Department and potential or 
existing contractors. The JAR will not 
repeat FAR coverage. 

(b) The FAR contains many ref-
erences to agency procedures. If the 
JAR does not include supplemental 
guidance under the corresponding part 
or subpart, it is because the FAR lan-
guage is considered to be sufficient. In 
those instances where the JAR states 
‘‘in accordance with bureau proce-
dures,’’ it does not mean that the bu-
reau must have a procedure. It is in-
tended that the bureau procedures are 
to be followed if they exist, however, it 
does not mean that the bureau must 
have a formal written procedure. 
Where both the JAR and bureau proce-
dures do not address a FAR subject, the 
FAR guidance is to be followed. 

(c) The JAR is not a complete system 
of regulations and must be used in con-
junction with the FAR. 

2801.106 OMB approval under the Pa-
perwork Reduction Act. 

The Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(44 U.S.C. chapter 35) and the Office of 
Management and Budget’s (OMB) im-
plementing regulations at 5 CFR part 
1320, require that reporting and record 
keeping requirements affecting 10 or 
more members of the public be cleared 
by that office. The OMB control num-
ber for the collection of information 
under 48 CFR chapter 28 is 1103–0018. 
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Subpart 2801.2—Administration 
2801.270–1 Revisions. 

In addition to changes published in 
the FEDERAL REGISTER, the JAR will be 
amended by issuance of Justice Acqui-
sition Circulars (JACs) containing 
loose-leaf replacement pages which re-
vise parts, subparts, sections, sub-
sections, paragraphs or subparagraphs. 
A vertical bar (edit bar) at the begin-
ning or end of a line indicates that a 
change has been made within that line. 

Subpart 2801.3—Agency 
Acquisition Regulations 

2801.304 Agency control and compli-
ance procedures. 

Pursuant to FAR 1.304, the Procure-
ment Executive (PE) is responsible for 
ensuring that bureau acquisition regu-
lations and directives do not restrain 
the flexibilities found in the FAR. For 
this reason, bureau acquisition regula-
tions shall be forwarded to the PE upon 
issuance. The PE reserves the right to 
revoke the regulations and directives 
in this chapter if they are determined 
to be restrictive. 

Subpart 2801.4—Deviations From 
the FAR and JAR 

2801.403 Individual deviations. 
Individual deviations from the FAR 

or the JAR shall be approved by the 
head of the contracting activity (HCA). 
A copy of the deviation shall be in-
cluded in the contract file. Copies of all 
deviations will be provided to the PE. 

2801.404 Class deviations. 
Requests for class deviations from 

the FAR or the JAR shall be submitted 
to the PE. The PE will consult with 
the chairperson of the Civilian Agency 
Acquisition Council, as appropriate, 
and send his/her recommendations to 
the Assistant Attorney General for Ad-
ministration (AAG/A). The AAG/A will 
grant or deny requests for such devi-
ations. For the purposes of this chap-
ter, requests for deviations involving 
basic ordering agreements, master type 
contracts, or situations where multiple 
awards are made from one solicitation, 
are considered to involve more than 

one contract and therefore considered 
to be class deviation requests. 

2801.470 Requests for class deviations. 
Requests for approval of class devi-

ations from the FAR or the JAR shall 
be forwarded to the PE. Such requests 
will be signed by the Bureau Procure-
ment Chief (BPC). Requests for class 
deviations shall be submitted as far in 
advance as the exigencies of the situa-
tion permit and shall contain sufficient 
written justification to evaluate the 
request. 

Subpart 2801.6—Career Develop-
ment, Contracting Authority, 
and Responsibilities 

2801.601 General. 
(a) In accordance with Attorney Gen-

eral Order 1687–93, the authority vested 
in the Attorney General with respect 
to contractual actions, for goods and 
services, is delegated to the following 
officials: 

(1) AAG/A (for the offices, boards, and 
divisions (OBDs); 

(2) Director, Federal Bureau of Inves-
tigation; 

(3) Director, Federal Bureau of Pris-
ons; 

(4) Commissioner, Federal Prison In-
dustries; 

(5) Commissioner, Immigration and 
Naturalization Service; 

(6) Administrator, Drug Enforcement 
Administration; 

(7) Assistant Attorney General, Of-
fice of Justice Programs; 

(8) Director, U.S. Marshals Service; 
(9) Inspector General, Office of the 

Inspector General. 
(b) The acquisition authority dele-

gated to the officials in 2801.601(a) may 
be redelegated to subordinate officials 
as necessary for the efficient and prop-
er administration of the Department’s 
acquisition operations. Such redele-
gated authority shall expressly state 
whether it carries the power of redele-
gation of authority. 

(c) The redelegation of contracting 
authority directly to specific persons 
without regard for intermediate orga-
nizational levels only establishes au-
thority to represent the Government in 
its commercial business dealings. It is 
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not intended to affect the organiza-
tional relationship between the con-
tracting officers and higher adminis-
trative and supervisory levels in the 
performance of their duties. 

2801.602 Contracting officers. 

2801.602–3 Ratification of unauthor-
ized commitments. 

The HCA may delegate the authority 
to ratify unauthorized commitments to 
the chief of the contracting office, ex-
cept for those actions effected by his or 
her office. Dollar thresholds for delega-
tions made under this section will be 
determined by the HCA. Copies of all 
ratifications are to be provided to the 
PE. 

2801.603 Selection, appointment and 
termination of appointment. 

2801.603–1 Department of Justice Ac-
quisition Career Management Pro-
gram. 

(a) Each Bureau Procurement Chief 
shall develop and manage an acquisi-
tion career management program for 
contracting personnel in his or her 
component, consistent and uniform 
with this section and the Department 
of Justice Acquisition Procurement Ca-
reer Management Program. 

(b) The program shall cover all con-
tracting personnel in the following cat-
egories: 

(1) General Schedule (GS–1102) Con-
tracting Series; 

(2) Contracting officers, regardless of 
General Schedule Series, with con-
tracting authority above the simplified 
acquisition threshold; 

(3) Purchasing Series (GS–1105), other 
individuals performing purchasing du-
ties and individuals with contracting 
authority between the micro purchase 
and simplified acquisition thresholds. 

(4) All Contracting Officer Represent-
atives/Contracting Officer Technical 
Representatives, or equivalent posi-
tions. 

(c) The program shall include: 
(1) Management information system. 

Standardized information on the acqui-
sition workforce will be collected and 
maintained. To the maximum extent 
practicable, such data requirements 
shall conform to the standards estab-
lished by the Office of Personnel Man-

agement for the Central Personnel 
Data File and shall be compatible with 
the Department of Justice acquisition 
workforce management information 
system. 

(2) Individual assessments and develop-
ment plans for personnel in the GS–1102 
contracting series. (i) An individual as-
sessment by a supervisor of each cov-
ered employee’s state of competence to 
perform the full range of potential du-
ties of his or her job; and 

(ii) An individual development plan 
to schedule classroom, on-the-job 
training, or other training to develop 
the employee’s skill level to an appro-
priate level in each area of competence 
necessary to perform his or her job. 

(iii) Individual assessments and de-
velopment plans should be designed to 
fit the needs of the component, but 
they should be built upon the units of 
competence and instruction prepared 
by the Federal Acquisition Institute 
whenever feasible. Individual develop-
ment plans should attempt to bring the 
employee to an appropriate level of 
skill in all necessary competencies in 
the field of procurement. In general, a 
proficiency skill level of 3, as defined 
in Attachment 1 to Office of Federal 
Procurement Policy (OFPP) Policy 
Letter 92–3, shall be obtained for any 
contracting duty that is actually re-
quired to be performed on the job. Indi-
vidual assessments and development 
plans should be reviewed annually and 
revised as appropriate, until the em-
ployee reaches the full competency 
level of his or her job. 

(iv) Employees who perform only pur-
chasing duties, regardless of occupa-
tional series, shall be required to ob-
tain the requisite level of skill only in 
competencies involving simplified ac-
quisitions. If the employee’s duties are 
expanded to include contracting duties, 
then skill in procurement com-
petencies must be assessed and devel-
oped. 

(v) Individual assessments of covered 
employee skills shall be completed 
within 90 days of the employee’s entry 
on duty. 

(3) Mandatory training. Training shall 
be provided for the identified cat-
egories of contracting personnel to 
meet the minimum standards identi-
fied in OFPP Policy Letter 97–01. 
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(4) Skills currency. Contract Special-
ists (GS–1102) and contracting officers 
with authority to obligate funds above 
the micro-purchase threshold that have 
satisfied the mandatory training re-
quirements, shall be provided the 
equivalent of at least 40 hours of con-
tinuing procurement and acquisition 
related education and training every 
two years for the purpose of maintain-
ing the currency of acquisition knowl-
edge and skills. 

(5) Program funding. Bureau Procure-
ment Chiefs are responsible for assess-
ing the funding needs to provide for the 
education and training of their acquisi-
tion workforce and requesting such 
funding in the annual budget process. 

2801.603–3 Appointment. 
Contracting officers whose authority 

will be limited to micro-purchases 
shall be appointed in writing and in-
clude any limitations to that author-
ity. 

Subpart 2801.70—Contracting 
Officer’s Technical Representative 
2801.7001–701 General. 

Contracting officers may appoint in-
dividuals selected by program offices 
to act as authorized representatives in 
the monitoring and administration of a 
contract. Such officials shall be des-
ignated as Contracting Officers’ Tech-
nical Representatives (COTR’s). 

2801.7001–702 Selection, appointment, 
and limitation of authority. 

(a) COTR standards program. This sub-
part sets forth policies and procedures 
for establishing standards for COTR’s 
in DOJ. The program sets forth min-
imum standards for individuals to be 
eligible for an appointment as a COTR. 

(b) Applicability. The eligibility re-
quirements of this subpart apply to all 
individuals who are designated by the 
contracting officer as COTR’s. 

(c) Eligibility standards. To be deter-
mined eligible for an appointment as a 
DOJ COTR, the following standards 
must be met: 

(1) The candidate must attend and 
successfully complete a minimum of a 
16-hour basic COTR course; and 

(2) The candidate must attend a min-
imum of 1 hour training specifically in 

procurement ethics, either through 
courses offered periodically by the De-
partment, the bureaus, or a Govern-
ment or commercial vendor. 

(d) Limitations. Each COTR appoint-
ment made by the contracting officer 
shall clearly state that the representa-
tive is not an authorized contracting 
officer and does not have the authority 
under any circumstances to: 

(1) Award, agree to award, or execute 
any contract, contract modification, 
notice of intent, or other form of bind-
ing agreement; 

(2) Obligate, in any manner, the pay-
ment of money by the Government; 

(3) Make a final decision on any con-
tract matter which is subject to the 
clause at FAR 52.233–1, Disputes; or 

(4) Terminate, suspend, or otherwise 
interfere with the contractor’s right to 
proceed, or direct any changes in the 
contractor’s performance that are in-
consistent with or materially change 
the contract specifications. 

(e) Termination. Termination of the 
COTR’s appointment shall be made in 
writing by the contracting officer and 
shall give the effective date of the ter-
mination. The contracting officer shall 
promptly modify the contract once a 
COTR termination notice has been 
issued. A termination notice is not re-
quired when the COTR’s appointment 
terminates upon expiration of the con-
tract. 

(f) Waivers. No individual may serve 
as a COTR on any contract without the 
requisite training and signed COTR 
certificate for the file. In the rare 
event that there is an urgent require-
ment for a specific individual to serve 
as a COTR and the individual has not 
successfully completed the required 
training, the BPC may waive the train-
ing requirements and authorize the in-
dividual to perform the COTR duties, 
for a period of time not to exceed 120 
days. The waiver will be granted in ac-
cordance with bureau procedures. 

(g) COTR clause. The clause at 
2852.201–70 is required in all contracts 
where a COTR is designated. 
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PART 2802—DEFINITIONS OF 
WORDS AND TERMS 

Subpart 2802.1—Definitions 

Sec. 
2802.101 Definitions. 

AUTHORITY: 28 U.S.C. 510; 40 U.S.C. 486(c); 28 
CFR 0.75(j) and 28 CFR 0.76(j). 

Subpart 2802.1—Definitions 

2802.101 Definitions. 
Throughout this chapter, the fol-

lowing words and terms are used as de-
fined in this subpart unless the context 
in which they appear clearly requires a 
different meaning, or a different defini-
tion is prescribed for a particular part 
or portion of a part. 

(a) Bureaus means contracting activi-
ties. (See contracting activity in this 
subpart.) 

(b) Bureau procurement chief means 
that supervisory official who is di-
rectly responsible for supervising, man-
aging and directing all contracting of-
fices of the bureau. 

(c) Chief of the contracting office 
means that supervisory official who is 
directly responsible for supervising, 
managing and directing a contracting 
office. 

(d) Contracting activity means a com-
ponent within the Department which 
has been delegated procurement au-
thority to manage contracting func-
tions associated with its mission. See 
2801.601(a). 

(e) DOJ means the Department of 
Justice. 

(f) HCA means head of the con-
tracting activity i.e. those officials 
identified in 2801.601(a) having respon-
sibility for supervising, managing, and 
directing the operations of the con-
tracting activities. 

(g) JAR means the Department of 
Justice Acquisition Regulations in 48 
CFR chapter 28. 

(h) JMD means the Justice Manage-
ment Division. 

(i) OBDs means the offices, boards, 
and divisions within the Justice De-
partment. 

(j) PE means the Procurement Execu-
tive for the Department of Justice. 

[63 FR 16121, Apr. 2, 1998] 

PART 2803—IMPROPER BUSINESS 
PRACTICES AND PERSONAL 
CONFLICTS OF INTEREST 

Subpart 2803.1—Safeguards 

Sec. 
2803.101–3 Agency regulations. 
2803.104 Procurement integrity. 
2803.104–10 Violations or possible violations. 
2803.104–70 Ethics program training require-

ments. 

Subpart 2803.2—Contractor Gratuities to 
Government Personnel 

2803.203 Reporting suspected violations of 
the gratuities clause. 

2803.204 Treatment of violations. 

Subpart 2803.3—Reports of Suspected 
Antitrust Violations 

2803.301 General. 

Subpart 2803.9—Whistleblower Protections 
for Contractor Employees 

2803.905 Procedures for investigating com-
plaints. 

2803.906 Remedies. 

AUTHORITY: 28 U.S.C. 510; 40 U.S.C. 486(c); 28 
CFR 0.75(j) and 28 CFR 0.76(j). 

SOURCE: 63 FR 16121, Apr. 2, 1998, unless 
otherwise noted. 

Subpart 2803.1—Safeguards 

2803.101–3 Agency regulations. 
The DOJ regulations governing 

Standards of Conduct are contained in 
5 CFR part 2635. 

2803.104 Procurement integrity. 

2803.104–10 Violations or possible vio-
lations. 

(a) Upon receipt of information of a 
violation or possible violation of sec-
tion 27 of the Act, the contracting offi-
cer must do the following: 

(1) Refer the matter to the Office of 
the Inspector General or other office 
designated in Attorney General Order 
1931–94; and 

(2) Make the determination required 
by FAR 3.104–10(a) and follow the pro-
cedures prescribed therein. 

(b) The individual referenced in FAR 
3.104–10(a)(1) is the Bureau Procure-
ment Chief. 
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(c) The HCA must follow the criteria 
contained in FAR 3.104–10(g) when des-
ignating authority under this subpart. 

(d) The HCA, or designee, shall refer 
information regarding actual or pos-
sible violations of section 27 of the Act 
to the Office of the Inspector General 
or other office designated in Attorney 
General Order 1931–94 for guidance be-
fore taking action. 

(e) If the HCA, or designee, receiving 
the information of a violation, or pos-
sible violation, determines that award 
is justified by urgent and compelling 
circumstances, or is otherwise in the 
interest of the Government, then the 
contracting officer may be authorized 
to award the contract after notifica-
tion to the Office of the Inspector Gen-
eral or other office designated in Attor-
ney General Order 1931–94. 

(f) The contracting officer will be ad-
vised, or directed by the HCA, or des-
ignee, as to the action to be taken. The 
types of actions that would normally 
be taken when a violation has occurred 
that affected the outcome of a procure-
ment are listed in FAR 3.104–11(d). 

(g) The PE shall be advised of all in-
stances where violations have been de-
termined to have occurred. Informa-
tion must describe the violation as well 
as actions taken. 

2803.104–70 Ethics program training 
requirements. 

It is the responsibility of the bureaus 
to provide training for ‘‘procurement 
officials’’ concerning the requirements 
of FAR 3.104. The bureau procurement 
training efforts should be coordinated 
with the Department’s Ethics Official, 
who is responsible for developing agen-
cy ethics training plans, to include 
briefings on ethics and standards of 
conduct for employees who are con-
tracting officers and procurement offi-
cials. The Ethics Official should be 
contacted directly to schedule train-
ing. 

Subpart 2803.2—Contractor Gratu-
ities to Government Per-
sonnel 

2803.203 Reporting suspected viola-
tions of the gratuities clause. 

DOJ personnel shall report suspected 
violations of the gratuities clause to 

the contracting officer or chief of the 
contracting office in writing. The re-
port shall clearly state the cir-
cumstances surrounding the incident, 
including the nature of the gratuity, 
the behavior or action the gratuity was 
to influence, and the persons involved. 
The contracting officer, after review, 
shall forward the report along with his 
or her recommendations regarding the 
treatment of the violation in accord-
ance with FAR 3.204(c) to the HCA or 
designee. 

2803.204 Treatment of violations. 

(a) The HCA or designee shall deter-
mine whether adverse action against 
the contractor in accordance with FAR 
3.204(c) should be taken. In reaching a 
decision, the HCA or designee shall 
consult with the contracting activity’s 
legal advisor and the Office of the In-
spector General or other office des-
ignated in Attorney General Order 
1931–94. 

(b) Prior to taking any action 
against the contractor the HCA or des-
ignee shall allow the contractor the op-
portunity to present opposing argu-
ments in accordance with FAR 3.204(b). 

(c) The PE shall be advised of all in-
stances where violations have been de-
termined to have occurred. Informa-
tion must describe the violation as well 
as actions taken. 

Subpart 2803.3—Reports of 
Suspected Antitrust Violations 

2803.301 General. 

Reports of suspected antitrust viola-
tions shall be referred to the AG and 
PE in accordance with bureau proce-
dures. 

Subpart 2803.9—Whistleblower 
Protections for Contractor Em-
ployees 

2803.905 Procedures for investigating 
complaints. 

(a) The Inspector General shall con-
duct an investigation and provide a 
written report of findings to the HCA. 

(b) The HCA will ensure that the In-
spector General provides the report of 
finding as specified in FAR 3.905(c). 
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(c) The complainant and contractor 
shall be afforded the opportunity to 
submit a written response to the report 
of findings within 30 days to the HCA. 
Extensions of time to file a written re-
sponse may be granted by the HCA. 

(d) The HCA may at any time request 
additional investigative work be done 
on the complaint. 

2803.906 Remedies. 
(a) Upon determination that a con-

tractor has subjected one of its em-
ployees to a reprisal for providing in-
formation, the HCA may take one or 
more actions specified in FAR 3.906(a). 

(b) Whenever a contractor fails to 
comply with an order, the HCA shall 
request an action be filed for enforce-
ment of such order in the United 
States district court. 

PART 2804—ADMINISTRATIVE 
MATTERS 

Subpart 2804.4—Safeguarding Classified 
Information Within Industry 

Sec. 
2804.402 General. 
2804.403 Responsibilities of contracting offi-

cers. 
2804.470 Contractor Personnel Security Pro-

gram. 
2804.470–1 Policy. 
2804.470–2 Responsibilities. 

Subpart 2804.5—Electronic Commerce in 
Contracting 

2804.506 Exemptions. 

Subpart 2804.6—Contract Reporting 

2804.602 Federal Procurement Data System. 

Subpart 2804.8—Government Contract 
Files 

2804.805 Storage, handling, and disposal of 
contract files. 

Subpart 2804.9—Information Reporting to 
the Internal Revenue Service 

2804.901 Definitions. 
2804.902 Contract information. 
2804.970 Special reporting exceptions. 

AUTHORITY: 28 U.S.C. 510; 40 U.S.C. 486(c); 28 
CFR 0.75(j) and 28 CFR 0.76(j). 

SOURCE: 63 FR 16122, Apr. 2, 1998, unless 
otherwise noted. 

Subpart 2804.4—Safeguarding 
Classified Information Within 
Industry 

2804.402 General. 

Classified acquisitions or contracts 
which require access to classified ma-
terial, as defined in FAR 4.401, for their 
performance shall be subject to the 
policies, procedures, and instructions 
contained in departmental regulations 
and shall be processed in a manner con-
sistent with those regulations. 

2804.403 Responsibilities of con-
tracting officers. 

For proposed solicitations and con-
tracts which may require access to 
classified material or where guard 
services are assigned to safeguard de-
partmental activities in possession of 
classified information, the contracting 
officer shall consult with the COTR 
and the Director, Security and Emer-
gency Planning Staff, JMD, to deter-
mine the appropriate security meas-
ures to safeguard such material and in-
formation. 

2804.470 Contractor Personnel Secu-
rity Program. 

2804.470–1 Policy. 

It is the policy of the Department of 
Justice that all acquisitions which 
allow unescorted contractor access to 
Government facilities or sensitive in-
formation contain, as appropriate, re-
quirements for appropriate personnel 
security screening by the contractor. 
To the maximum extent practicable, 
contractors shall be made responsible 
for the performance of personnel secu-
rity screening. The personnel security 
screening may vary from one acquisi-
tion to another, depending upon the 
type, context, duration and location of 
the work to be performed. Classified 
contracts are exempted from the re-
quirements of this section because they 
are governed by the requirements of 
Executive Order 12829 (January 6, 1993). 

2804.470–2 Responsibilities. 

(a) The primary acquiring compo-
nent, together with its Security Pro-
gram Manager, is responsible for pro-
viding the contracting officer with the 
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appropriate contractor personnel secu-
rity screening requirements (including 
waiver requirements, if appropriate) to 
be included in the statement of work. 

(b) The contracting officer is respon-
sible for including in the contract file 
for all such acquisitions, a certifi-
cation made by the responsible Secu-
rity Program Manager that the per-
sonnel security requirements of the 
contract are adequate to ensure the se-
curity of Departmental operations, in-
formation and personnel. 

(c) The Security Program Manager 
for the acquiring component is respon-
sible for monitoring and ensuring that 
the contractor personnel security re-
quirements of the contract are accom-
plished. 

(d) For purposes of this section, the 
term Contracting Officer includes any-
one empowered to place orders under 
Blanket Purchase Agreements (BPA) 
or any other existing contract vehicle 
and/or through the use of the govern-
ment-wide commercial purchase card. 

Subpart 2804.5—Electronic 
Commerce in Contracting 

2804.506 Exemptions. 
Pursuant to FAR 4.506(b), all deter-

minations that FACNET processing is 
not cost-effective or practicable for the 
contracting officer, or portions thereof, 
shall be initiated by the HCA and sub-
mitted to the PE for processing to the 
Attorney General for signature. 

Subpart 2804.6—Contract 
Reporting 

2804.602 Federal Procurement Data 
System. 

(a) Federal Procurement Data Sys-
tem (FPDS) reports shall be submitted 
to the Procurement Policy and Review 
Group (PPRG) within 20 days of the 
close of each of the first three quarters 
of the fiscal year and within 30 days 
after the close of the fourth quarter. 
Specific preparation procedures are 
contained in the FPDS Reporting Man-
ual and the Product and Service Code 
Manual. 

(b) Bureaus shall submit periodic re-
ports of their subcontract activities, 
together with copies of their Standard 

Forms 295 and 294 to the Director, Of-
fice of Small and Disadvantaged Busi-
ness Utilization (OSDBU) as required 
by that office. 

(c) BPCs shall provide to the PE, the 
name, office, mailing address, and tele-
phone number of the individual who 
will provide day-to-day operational 
contact within the bureau for the im-
plementation of the FPDS. Changes 
and updates shall be forwarded to 
PPRG within 10 days after they occur. 
It is the responsibility of the bureau 
contacts to ensure that all actions are 
reported and submitted to PPRG in a 
timely manner and that all statistics 
and reports are accurate, current, and 
complete. BPCs shall be responsible for 
validating the data. 

Subpart 2804.8—Government 
Contract Files 

2804.805 Storage, handling, and dis-
posal of contract files. 

In accordance with FAR 4.805, each 
bureau shall prescribe procedures for 
the handling, storing, and disposing of 
contract files. 

Subpart 2804.9—Information Re-
porting to the Internal Rev-
enue Service 

2804.901 Definitions. 

Classified contract, as used in this sub-
part, means a contract such that the 
fact of its existence of its subject mat-
ter has been designated and clearly 
marked or clearly represented, pursu-
ant to the provisions of Federal law or 
an Executive Order, as requiring a spe-
cific degree of protection against unau-
thorized disclosure for reasons of na-
tional security. 

Confidential contract, as used in this 
subpart, means a contract, the report-
ing of which to the Internal Revenue 
Service (IRS) as required under 26 
U.S.C. 6050M, would interfere with the 
effective conduct of a confidential law 
enforcement activity, such as con-
tracts for sites for undercover oper-
ations or contracts with informants, or 
foreign counterintelligence activity. 
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2804.902 Contract information. 
(a) Pursuant to FAR 4.902, the HCA, 

or delegate, shall certify to the PE, in 
the format specified in this section, 
under penalty of perjury, that such of-
ficial has examined the information 
submitted by that bureau as its FPDS 
data, that the data has been prepared 
pursuant to the requirement of 26 
U.S.C. 6050M, and that, to the best of 
such official’s knowledge and belief it 
is compiled from bureau records main-
tained in the normal course of business 
for the purpose of making a true, cor-
rect and complete return as required 
by 26 U.S.C. 6050M. 

(b) The following certification will be 
signed and dated by the HCA, or dele-
gate, and submitted with each bureau 
quarterly FPDS report (as specified by 
2804.602). 

CERTIFICATION 

I, llllllllllll(Name), 
llllllllllllll (Title) under the 
penalties of perjury have examined the infor-
mation to be submitted by 
llllllllllll (Bureau) to the Pro-
curement Executive, for making information 
returns on behalf of the Department of Jus-
tice to the Internal Revenue Service, and 
certify that this information has been pre-
pared pursuant to the requirements of 26 
U.S.C. 6050M and that it is to the best of my 
knowledge and belief, a compilation of bu-

reau records maintained in the normal 
course of business for the purpose of pro-
viding true, correct and complete returns as 
required by 26 U.S.C. 6050M. 

Signature llllllllllllllllll

Date lllllllllllllllllllll

(c) The PE will certify the consoli-
dated FPDS data for the Department, 
transmit the data to the Federal Pro-
curement Data Center (FPDC) and au-
thorize the FPDC to make returns to 
the IRS on behalf of the agency. 

2804.970 Special reporting exceptions. 

(a) The Technical and Miscellaneous 
Revenue Act of 1988 (Pub. L. 100–647) 
amended 26 U.S.C. 6050M to allow ex-
ceptions to the reporting requirements 
for certain classified or confidential 
contracts. 

(b) The head of the agency has deter-
mined that the filing of information re-
turns, as required by 26 U.S.C. 6050M, 
on confidential contracts, which in-
volve law enforcement or foreign coun-
terintelligence activities, would inter-
fere with the effective conduct of those 
confidential law enforcement or for-
eign counterintelligence activities, and 
that the special reporting exceptions 
added to 26 U.S.C. 6050M by The Tech-
nical and Miscellaneous Revenue Act 
of 1988 to these types of contracts. 
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