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(c) The cooperative agreement will 
include an attachment listing the par-
cels accepted by the State Conserva-
tionist. This list will include land-
owners’ names and addresses, acreage, 
the estimated fair market value, the 
estimated Federal contribution, and 
other relevant information. The coop-
erative agreement template will be 
made available by the State Conserva-
tionist. 

(d) The cooperative agreement will 
incorporate the provisions necessary 
for the eligible entity to comply with 
applicable registration and reporting 
requirements of the Federal Funding 
Accountability and Transparency Act 
of 2006 (Pub. L. 109–282, as amended) 
and 2 CFR parts 25 and 170. 

§ 1491.21 Funding. 
(a) Subject to the statutory limits, 

the State Conservationist, in coordina-
tion with the eligible entity, will de-
termine the NRCS share of the cost of 
purchasing a conservation easement or 
other interest in the land. 

(b) NRCS may provide up to 50 per-
cent of the appraised fair market value 
of the conservation easement con-
sistent with § 1491.4(g). An eligible enti-
ty will share in the cost of purchasing 
a conservation easement in accordance 
with the limitations of this part. 

(c) A landowner may make donations 
toward the acquisition of the conserva-
tion easement. 

(d) The eligible entity must provide a 
minimum of 25 percent of the purchase 
price of the conservation easement. 

(e) FRPP funds may not be used for 
expenditures such as appraisals, sur-
veys, title insurance, legal fees, costs 
of easement monitoring, and other re-
lated administrative and transaction 
costs incurred by the eligible entity. 

(f) NRCS will conduct its technical 
and administrative review of appraisals 
and its hazardous materials reviews 
with FRPP funds. 

(g) If the State Conservationist de-
termines that the purchase of two or 
more conservation easements are com-
parable in achieving FRPP goals, the 
State Conservationist will not assign a 
higher priority to any one of these con-
servation easements solely on the basis 
of lesser cost to FRPP. 

(h) Environmental Services Credits: 

(1) NRCS asserts no direct or indirect 
interest in environmental credits that 
may result from or be associated with 
an FRPP easement; 

(2) NRCS retains the authority to en-
sure that the requirements for FRPP- 
funded easements are met and main-
tained consistent with this part; and 

(3) If activities required under an en-
vironmental credit agreement may af-
fect land covered under a FRPP ease-
ment, landowners are encouraged to re-
quest a compatibility assessment from 
the eligible entity prior to entering 
into such agreements. 

§ 1491.22 Conservation easement 
deeds. 

(a) Under FRPP, a landowner grants 
an easement to an eligible entity with 
which NRCS has entered into an FRPP 
cooperative agreement. The easement 
will require that the easement area be 
maintained in accordance with FRPP 
goals and objectives for the term of the 
easement. 

(b) Pending offers by an eligible enti-
ty must be for acquiring an easement 
in perpetuity, except where State law 
prohibits a permanent easement. In 
such cases where State law limits the 
term of a conservation easement, the 
easement term will be for the max-
imum allowed under State law. 

(c) The eligible entity may use its 
own terms and conditions in the con-
servation easement deed, but the con-
servation easement deed must be re-
viewed and approved by National Head-
quarters in advance of use. Individual 
conservation easement deeds used by 
the eligible entity will be submitted to 
National Headquarters at least 90 days 
before the planned closing date. Eligi-
ble entities with multiple parcels in a 
cooperative agreement may submit a 
conservation easement deed template 
for review and approval. The deed tem-
plates must be reviewed and approved 
by National Headquarters in advance of 
use. For eligible entities that have not 
been certified, the NRCS State offices 
will review prior to closing the con-
servation easement deeds for indi-
vidual parcels to ensure that they con-
tain the same language as approved by 
the national office and that the appro-
priate site-specific information has 
been included. NRCS reserves the right 
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