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as an insurance company other than 
life. 

(c) Noncancellable life, health, or acci-
dent insurance policy. The term 
noncancellable life, health, or accident in-
surance policy means a health and acci-
dent contract, or a health and accident 
contract combined with a life insur-
ance or annuity contract, which the in-
surance company is under an obliga-
tion to renew or continue at a specified 
premium and with respect to which a 
reserve in addition to the unearned 
premiums (as defined in paragraph (e) 
of this section) must be carried to 
cover that obligation. Such a health 
and accident contract shall be consid-
ered noncancellable even though it 
states a termination date at a stipu-
lated age, if, with respect to the health 
and accident contract, such age termi-
nation date is 60 or over. Such a con-
tract, however, shall not be considered 
to be noncancellable after the age ter-
mination date stipulated in the con-
tract has passed. However, if the age 
termination date stipulated in the con-
tract occurs during the period covered 
by a premium received by the life in-
surance company prior to such date, 
and the company cannot cancel or 
modify the contract during such pe-
riod, the age termination date shall be 
deemed to occur at the expiration of 
the period for which the premium has 
been received. 

(d) Guaranteed renewable life, health, 
and accident insurance policy. The term 
guaranteed renewable life, health, and 
accident insurance policy means a health 
and accident contract, or a health and 
accident contract combined with a life 
insurance or annuity contract, which is 
not cancellable by the company but 
under which the company reserves the 
right to adjust premium rates by class-
es in accordance with its experience 
under the type of policy involved, and 
with respect to which a reserve in addi-
tion to the unearned premiums (as de-
fined in paragraph (e) of this section) 
must be carried to cover that obliga-
tion. Section 801(e) provides that such 
policies shall be treated in the same 
manner as noncancellable life, health, 
and accident insurance policies. For 
example, the age termination date re-
quirements applicable to 
noncancellable health and accident in-

surance policies shall also apply to 
guaranteed renewable life, health, and 
accident insurance policies. See para-
graph (c) of this section. 

(e) Unearned premiums. The term un-
earned premiums means those amounts 
which shall cover the cost of carrying 
the insurance risk for the period for 
which the premiums have been paid in 
advance. Such term includes all un-
earned premiums, whether or not re-
quired by law. 

(f) Life insurance reserves. For the def-
inition of the term ‘‘life insurance re-
serves’’, see section 801(b) and § 1.801–4. 

(g) Unpaid losses (whether or not 
ascertained). The term unpaid losses 
(whether or not ascertained) means a 
reasonable estimate of the amount of 
the losses (based upon the facts in each 
case and the company’s experience 
with similar cases): 

(1) Reported and ascertained by the 
end of the taxable year but where the 
amount of the loss has not been paid by 
the end of the taxable year, 

(2) Reported by the end of the taxable 
year but where the amount thereof has 
not been either ascertained or paid by 
the end of the taxable year, or 

(3) Which have occurred by the end of 
the taxable year but which have not 
been reported or paid by the end of the 
taxable year. 

(h) Total reserves. For the definition 
of the term total reserves, see section 
801(c) and § 1.801–5. 

(i) Amount of reserves. For purposes of 
subsections (a), (b), and (c) of section 
801 and this section, section 801(b)(5) 
provides that the amount of any re-
serve (or portion thereof) for any tax-
able year shall be the mean of such re-
serve (or portion thereof) at the begin-
ning and end of the taxable year. 

[T.D. 6513, 25 FR 12655, Dec. 10, 1960, as 
amended by T.D. 7172, 37 FR 5619, Mar. 17, 
1972] 

§ 1.801–4 Life insurance reserves. 
(a) Life insurance reserves defined. For 

purposes of part I, subchapter L, chap-
ter 1 of the Code, the term life insur-
ance reserves (as defined in section 
801(b)) means those amounts: 

(1) Which are computed or estimated 
on the basis of recognized mortality or 
morbidity tables and assumed rates of 
interest; 
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(2) Which are set aside to mature or 
liquidate, either by payment or rein-
surance, future unaccrued claims aris-
ing from life insurance, annuity, and 
noncancellable health and accident in-
surance contracts (including life insur-
ance or annuity contracts combined 
with noncancellable health and acci-
dent insurance) involving, at the time 
with respect to which the reserve is 
computed, life, health, or accident con-
tingencies; and 

(3) Which, except as otherwise pro-
vided by section 801(b)(2) and para-
graphs (b) and (c) of this section, are 
required by law. For the meaning of 
the term ‘‘reserves required by law’’, 
see paragraph (b) of § 1.801–5. 
For purposes of determining life insur-
ance reserves, only those amounts 
shall be taken into account which must 
be reserved either by express statutory 
provisions or by rules and regulations 
of the insurance department of a State, 
Territory, or the District of Columbia 
when promulgated in the exercise of a 
power conferred by statute. Moreover, 
such amounts must actually be held by 
the company during the taxable year 
for which the reserve is claimed. How-
ever, reserves held by the company 
with respect to the net value of risks 
reinsured in other solvent companies 
(whether or not authorized) shall be de-
ducted from the company’s life insur-
ance reserves. For example, if an ordi-
nary life policy with a reserve of $100 is 
reinsured in another solvent company 
on a yearly renewable term basis, and 
the reserve on such yearly renewable 
term policy is $10, the reinsured com-
pany shall include $90 ($100 minus $10) 
in determining its life insurance re-
serves. Generally, life insurance re-
serves, as in the case of level premium 
life insurance, are held to supplement 
the future premium receipts when the 
latter, alone, are insufficient to cover 
the increased risk in the later years. 
For examples of reserves which qualify 
as life insurance reserves, see para-
graph (d) of this section. For examples 
of reserves which do not qualify as life 
insurance reserves, see paragraph (e) of 
this section. 

(b) Certain reserves which need not be 
required by law. Section 801(b)(2) sets 
forth certain reserves which, though 
not required by law, may still qualify 

as life insurance reserves, provided, 
however, that they first satisfy the re-
quirements of section 801(b)(1) (A) and 
(B) and paragraph (a) (1) and (2) of this 
section. Thus, reserves need not be re-
quired by law: 

(1) In the case of policies covering 
life, health, and accident insurance 
combined in one policy issued on the 
weekly premium payment plan, con-
tinuing for life and not subject to can-
cellation, and 

(2) For taxable years beginning be-
fore January 1, 1970, in the case of poli-
cies issued by an organization which 
met the requirements of section 
501(c)(9) (as it existed prior to amend-
ment by the Tax Reform Act of 1969) 
other than the requirement of subpara-
graph (B) thereof. 

(c) Assessment companies. Section 
801(b)(3) provides that in the case of an 
assessment life insurance company or 
association, the term life insurance re-
serves includes: 

(1) Sums actually deposited by such 
company or association with officers of 
a State or Territory pursuant to law as 
guaranty or reserve funds, and 

(2) Any funds maintained, under the 
charter or articles of incorporation or 
association of such company or asso-
ciation (or bylaws approved by the 
State insurance commissioner) of such 
company or association, exclusively for 
the payment of claims arising under 
certificates of membership or policies 
issued upon the assessment plan and 
not subject to any other use. 

For purposes of part I, subchapter L, 
chapter 1 of the Code, the reserves de-
scribed in this paragraph shall be in-
cluded as life insurance reserves even 
though such reserves do not meet the 
requirements of section 801(b) and 
paragraph (a) of this section. However, 
for such reserves to be included as life 
insurance reserves, they must be depos-
ited or maintained to liquidate future 
unaccrued claims arising from life in-
surance, annuity, or noncancellable 
health and accident insurance con-
tracts (including life insurance or an-
nuity contracts combined with 
noncancellable health and accident in-
surance) involving, at the time with re-
spect to which the reserve is deposited 
or maintained, life, health, or accident 
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contingencies. The rate of interest as-
sumed in calculating the reserves de-
scribed in this paragraph shall be 3 per-
cent, regardless of the rate of interest 
(if any) specified in the contract in re-
spect of such reserves. 

(d) Reserves which qualify as life insur-
ance reserves. The following reserves, 
provided they meet the requirements of 
section 801(b) and paragraph (a) of this 
section, are illustrative of reserves 
which shall be included as life insur-
ance reserves: 

(1) Reserves held under life insurance 
contracts. 

(2) Reserves held under annuity con-
tracts (including reserves held under 
variable annuity contracts as described 
in section 801(g)(1)). 

(3) Reserves held under 
noncancellable health and accident in-
surance contracts (as defined in para-
graph (c) of § 1.801–3) and reserves held 
under guaranteed renewable health and 
accident insurance contracts (as de-
fined in paragraph (d) of § 1.801–3). 

(4) Reserves held either separately or 
combined under contracts described in 
subparagraphs (1), (2), or (3) of this 
paragraph. 

(5) Reserves held under deposit ad-
ministration contracts. Generally, the 
reserves held by a life insurance com-
pany on both the active and retired 
lives under deposit administration con-
tracts will meet the requirements of 
section 801(b) and paragraph (a) of this 
section. 

However, reserves held by the company 
with respect to the net value of risks 
reinsured in other solvent companies 
(whether or not authorized) shall be de-
ducted from the company’s life insur-
ance reserves. See paragraph (a) of this 
section. 

(e) Reserves and liabilities which do not 
qualify as life insurance reserves. The fol-
lowing are illustrative of reserves and 
liabilities which do not meet the re-
quirements of section 801(b) and para-
graph (a) of this section and, accord-
ingly, shall not be included as life in-
surance reserves: 

(1) Liability for supplementary con-
tracts not involving at the time with 
respect to which the liability is com-
puted, life, health, or accident contin-
gencies. 

(2) In the case of cancellable health 
and accident policies and similar 
cancellable contracts, the unearned 
premiums and unpaid losses (whether 
or not ascertained). 

(3) The unearned premiums, and un-
paid losses (whether or not 
ascertained), on noncancellable life, 
health, or accident policies (and guar-
anteed renewable life, health, and acci-
dent policies) not included in life insur-
ance reserves. (However, such amounts 
shall be taken into account under sec-
tion 801(a)(2) for purposes of deter-
mining whether an insurance company 
is a life insurance company.) 

(4) The deficiency reserve (as defined 
in section 801(b)(4)) for each individual 
contract, that is, that portion of the 
reserve for such contract equal to the 
amount (if any) by which: 

(i) The present value of the future 
net premiums required for such con-
tract, exceeds 

(ii) The present value of the future 
actual premiums and consideration 
charged for such contract. 

(5) Reserves required to be main-
tained to provide for the ordinary oper-
ating expenses of a business which 
must be currently paid by every com-
pany from its income if its business is 
to continue, such as taxes, salaries, 
and unpaid brokerage. 

(6) Liability for premiums received in 
advance. 

(7) Liability for premium deposit 
funds. 

(8) Liability for annual and deferred 
dividends declared or apportioned. 

(9) Liability for dividends left on de-
posit at interest. 

(10) Liability for accrued but unset-
tled policy claims whether known or 
unreported. 

(11) A mandatory securities valuation 
reserve. 

(f) Adjustments to life insurance re-
serves. In the event it is determined on 
the basis of the facts of a particular 
case that premiums deferred and uncol-
lected and premiums due and unpaid 
are not properly accruable for the tax-
able year under section 809 and, accord-
ingly, are not properly includible under 
assets (as defined in section 805(b)(4)) 
for the taxable year, appropriate reduc-
tion shall be made in the life insurance 
reserves. This reduction shall be made 
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when the insurance company has cal-
culated life insurance reserves on the 
assumption that the premiums on all 
policies are paid annually or that all 
premiums due on or prior to the date of 
the annual statement have been paid. 

[T.D. 6513, 25 FR 12656, Dec. 10, 1960, as 
amended by T.D. 7172, 37 FR 5619, Mar. 17, 
1972] 

§ 1.801–5 Total reserves. 
(a) Total reserves defined. For purposes 

of section 801(a) and § 1.801–3, the term 
‘‘total reserves’’ is defined in section 
801(c) as the sum of: 

(1) Life insurance reserves (as defined 
in section 801(b) and § 1.801–4), 

(2) Unearned premiums (as defined in 
paragraph (e) of § 1.801–3), and unpaid 
losses (whether or not ascertained) (as 
defined in paragraph (g) of § 1.801–3), 
not included in life insurance reserves, 
and 

(3) All other insurance reserves re-
quired by law. 
The term ‘‘total reserves’’ does not, 
however, include deficiency reserves 
(within the meaning of section 
801(b)(4), and paragraph (e)(4) of § 1.801– 
4), even though such deficiency re-
serves are required by State law. In de-
termining total reserves, a company is 
permitted to make use of the highest 
aggregate reserve required by any 
State or Territory or the District of 
Columbia in which it transacts busi-
ness, but the reserve must have been 
actually held during the taxable year 
for which the reserve is claimed. For 
example, during the taxable year 1958 a 
life insurance company sells life insur-
ance and annuity contracts in States A 
and B. State A requires reserves of 10 
against the life and 5 against the annu-
ity business. State B requires reserves 
of 9 against the life and 7 against the 
annuity business. Assuming the com-
pany actually holds these reserves dur-
ing the taxable year 1958, its highest 
aggregate reserve for such taxable year 
is the 16 required by State B. Thus, the 
company is not permitted to compute 
its highest aggregate reserve by taking 
State A’s requirement of 10 against its 
life insurance business and adding it to 
State B’s requirement of 7 against its 
annuity business. 

(b) Reserves required by law defined. 
For purposes of part I, subchapter L, 

chapter 1 of the Code, the term reserves 
required by law means reserves which 
are required either by express statu-
tory provisions or by rules and regula-
tions of the insurance department of a 
State, Territory, or the District of Co-
lumbia when promulgated in the exer-
cise of a power conferred by statute, 
and which are reported in the annual 
statement of the company and accept-
ed by state regulatory authorities as 
held for the fulfillment of the claims of 
policyholders or beneficiaries. 

(c) Information to be filed. In any case 
where reserves are claimed, sufficient 
information must be filed with the re-
turn to enable the district director to 
determine the validity of the claim. 
See section 6012 and paragraph (c) of 
§ 1.6012–2. If the basis (for Federal in-
come tax purposes) for determining the 
amount of any of the life insurance re-
serves as of the close of the taxable 
year differs from the basis for such de-
termination as of the beginning of the 
taxable year then the following infor-
mation must be filed with respect to 
all such changes in basis: 

(1) The nature of the life insurance 
reserve (i.e., life, annuity, etc.); 

(2) The mortality or morbidity table, 
assumed rate of interest, method used 
in computing or estimating such re-
serve on the old basis, and the amount 
of such reserve at the beginning and 
close of the taxable year computed on 
the old basis; 

(3) The mortality or morbidity table, 
assumed rate of interest, method used 
in computing or estimating such re-
serve on the new basis, and the amount 
of such reserve at the close of the tax-
able year computed on the new basis; 

(4) The deviation, if any, from recog-
nized mortality or morbidity tables, or 
recognized methods of computation; 

(5) The reasons for the change in 
basis of such reserve; and 

(6) Whether such change in the re-
serve has been approved or accepted by 
the regulatory authorities of the State 
of domicile, and if so, a copy of the let-
ter, certificate, or other evidence of 
such approval or acceptance. 

(d) Illustration of principles. The provi-
sions of section 801 relating to the per-
centage requirements for qualification 
as a life insurance company may be il-
lustrated by the following example: 
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