AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1191H CONGRESS
L HLR. 754

AN ACT

To amend the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 to
increase the amount that may be invested in small busi-
ness investment companies.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,



[E—

NolENe B e N, .~ L OV R \O)

10
11

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Investing in Main
Street Act of 20257,
SEC. 2. INVESTMENT IN SMALL BUSINESS INVESTMENT
COMPANIES.
Section 302(b) of the Small Business Investment Act
of 1958 (15 U.S.C. 682(b)) is amended—
(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “5 percent”
and inserting “15 percent’”’; and
(2) In paragraph (2), by striking “5 percent”
and inserting “15 percent”.

Passed the House of Representatives February 24,
2025.
Attest:

Olerk.

*HR 754 EH






11910 CONGRESS
HOSE HL R, 754

AN ACT

To amend the Small Business Investment Act of
1958 to increase the amount that may be in-
vested in small business investment companies.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-02-25T23:56:32-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




