AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1181TH CONGRESS
5925 HL R, 8036

Making emergency supplemental appropriations for assistance for the Indo-
Pacific region and for related expenses for the fiscal year ending Sep-
tember 30, 2024, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

APrIL 17, 2024
Mr. CoLE (for himself, Mr. CALVERT, and Mr. D1AZ-BALART) introduced the
following bill; which was referred to the Committee on Appropriations,
and in addition to the Committee on the Budget, for a period to be subse-
quently determined by the Speaker, in each case for consideration of such
provisions as fall within the jurisdiction of the committee concerned

A BILL

Making emergency supplemental appropriations for assist-
ance for the Indo-Pacific region and for related expenses
for the fiscal year ending September 30, 2024, and for

other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
That the following sums are appropriated, out of any
money in the Treasury not otherwise appropriated, for the

fiscal year ending September 30, 2024, and for other pur-

AN N B~ W

poses, namely:



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NS I NS I NS R T e e T e e T e T e T T
[ B NG O N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O IR NO R e

2
TITLE I

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE
OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE
OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Operation and Main-
tenance, Navy”’, $557,758,000, to remain available until
September 30, 2024, to support improvements to the sub-
marine industrial base and for related expenses: Provided,
That such amount is designated by the Congress as being
for an emergency requirement pursuant to section
251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and Emergency
Deficit Control Act of 1985.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, DEFENSE-WIDE

(INCLUDING TRANSFERS OF FUNDRS)

For an additional amount for “Operation and Main-
tenance, Defense-Wide”, $1,900,000,000, to remain avail-
able until September 30, 2025, to respond to the situation
in Taiwan and for related expenses: Provided, That such
funds may be transferred to accounts under the headings
“Operation and Maintenance”, “‘Procurement’”, and ‘“‘Re-
volving and Management Funds” for replacement,
through new procurement or repair of existing unservice-
able equipment, of defense articles from the stocks of the
Department of Defense, and for reimbursement for de-

fense services of the Department of Defense and military

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS B e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG O N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) TR “S O B NO S e

3

education and training, provided to Taiwan or identified
and notified to Congress for provision to Taiwan or to for-
eign countries that have provided support to Taiwan at
the request of the United States: Provided further, That
funds transferred pursuant to the preceding proviso shall
be merged with and available for the same purposes and
for the same time period as the appropriations to which
the funds are transferred: Provided further, That the Sec-
retary of Defense shall notify the congressional defense
committees of the details of such transfers not less than
15 days before any such transfer: Provided further, That
upon a determination that all or part of the funds trans-
ferred from this appropriation are not necessary for the
purposes provided herein, such amounts may be trans-
ferred back and merged with this appropriation: Provided
Sfurther, That any transfer authority provided herein is in
addition to any other transfer authority provided by law:
Provided further, That such amount is designated by the
Congress as being for an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and
Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.
PROCUREMENT
SHIPBUILDING AND CONVERSION, NAVY
For an additional amount for “Shipbuilding and Con-

version, Navy”’, $2,155,000,000, to remain available until

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O T NO S e

4
September 30, 2028, to support improvements to the sub-

marine industrial base and for related expenses: Provided,
That of the total amount provided under this heading in
this Act, funds shall be available as follows:
Columbia Class Submarine (AP),
$1,955,000,000; and
Virginia Class Submarine (AP), $200,000,000:
Provided further, That such amount is designated by the
Congress as being for an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the Balanced Budget and
Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.
OTHER PROCUREMENT, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Other Procurement,
Navy”’, $293,570,000, to remain available until September
30, 2026, to support improvements to the submarine in-
dustrial base and for related expenses: Provided, That
such amount is designated by the Congress as being for
an  emergency requirement pursuant to  section
251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the Balanced Budget and Emergency
Deficit Control Act of 1985.

DEFENSE PRODUCTION ACT PURCHASES

For an additional amount for “Defense Production
Act Purchases”, $132,600,000, to remain available until
expended, for activities by the Department of Defense pur-

suant to sections 108, 301, 302, and 303 of the Defense

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG TN N TR NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N R BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO I e

5}

Production Act of 1950 (50 U.S.C. 4518, 4531, 4532, and
4533): Provided, That such amounts shall be obligated
and expended by the Secretary of Defense as if delegated
the necessary authorities conferred by the Defense Pro-
duction Act of 1950: Provided further, That such amount
is designated by the Congress as being for an emergency
requirement pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the
Balanced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control Act of
1985.

RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST AND

EVALUATION
RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST AND EVALUATION,
Navy

For an additional amount for “Research, Develop-
ment, Test and Evaluation, Navy”, $7,000,000, to remain
available until September 30, 2025, to support improve-
ments to the submarine industrial base and for related ex-
penses: Provided, That such amount is designated by the
Congress as being for an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and
Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

GENERAL PROVISIONS—THIS TITLE

SEC. 101. For an additional amount for the Depart-

ment of Defense, $542,400,000, to remain available until

September 30, 2024, for transfer to operation and mainte-

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

6

nance accounts, procurement accounts, and research, de-
velopment, test and evaluation accounts, in addition to
amounts otherwise made available for such purpose, only
for unfunded priorities of the United States Indo-Pacific
Command for fiscal year 2024 (as submitted to Congress
pursuant to section 1105 of title 31, United States Code):
Provided, That none of the funds provided under this sec-
tion may be obligated or expended until 30 days after the
Secretary of Defense, through the Under Secretary of De-
fense (Comptroller), provides the Committees on Appro-
priations of the House of Representatives and the Senate
a detailed execution plan for such funds: Provided further,
That not less than 15 days prior to any transfer of funds,
the Secretary of Defense shall notify the congressional de-
fense committees of the details of any such transfer: Pro-
vided further, That upon transfer, the funds shall be
merged with and available for the same purposes, and for
the same time period, as the appropriation to which trans-
ferred: Provided further, That any transfer authority pro-
vided herein is in addition to any other transfer authority
provided by law: Provided further, That such amount is
designated by the Congress as being for an emergency re-
quirement pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the Bal-

anced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N W Bk W =

e T S N e T e T Y =G =)
O o0 N O »n B~ W NN = O

7
TITLE II

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE
MILITARY CONSTRUCTION, NAVY AND MARINE CORPS

For an additional amount for “Military Construction,
Navy and Marine Corps”, $281,914,000, to remain avail-
able until September 30, 2028, to support improvements
to the submarine industrial base and for related expenses:
Provided, That not later than 60 days after the date of
enactment of this Act, the Secretary of the Navy, or their
designee, shall submit to the Committees on Appropria-
tions of the House of Representatives and the Senate an
expenditure plan for funds provided under this heading
in this Act: Provided further, That such funds may be obli-
cated or expended for planning and design and military
construction projects not otherwise authorized by law:
Provided further, That such amount is designated by the
Congress as being for an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and

Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

*HR 8036 IH



8
TITLE III

DEPARTMENT OF STATE AND RELATED
AGENCY
INTERNATIONAL SECURITY ASSISTANCE
FUNDS APPROPRIATED TO THE PRESIDENT
FOREIGN MILITARY FINANCING PROGRAM

For an additional amount for “Foreign Military Fi-
nancing Program’, $2,000,000,000, to remain available
until September 30, 2025, for assistance for the Indo-Pa-
cific region and for related expenses: Provided, That
amounts made available under this heading in this Act and
unobligated balances of amounts made available under
this heading in Acts making appropriations for the De-
partment of State, foreien operations, and related pro-
orams for fiscal year 2024 and prior fiscal years shall be
available for the cost of loans and loan guarantees as au-
thorized by section 2606 of the Ukraine Supplemental Ap-
propriations Act, 2022 (division N of Public Law 117-
103), subject to the terms and conditions provided in such
section, or as otherwise authorized by law: Provided fur-
ther, That loan guarantees made using amounts described
in the preceding proviso for loans financed by the Federal
Financing Bank may be provided notwithstanding any
provision of law limiting the percentage of loan principal

that may be guaranteed: Provided further, That up to

*HR 8036 IH



O© o0 2 O WD B W N

[\ I \© R \O I O N N i e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N R, WD = O

9

$5,000,000 of funds made available under this heading in
this Aect, in addition to funds otherwise available for such
purposes, may be used by the Department of State for
necessary expenses for the general costs of administering
military assistance and sales, including management and
oversight of such programs and activities: Provided fur-
ther, That such amount is designated by the Congress as
being for an emergency requirement pursuant to section
251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and Emergency
Deficit Control Act of 1985.

INTERNATIONAL ASSISTANCE PROGRAMS
MULTILATERAL ASSISTANCE
CONTRIBUTION TO THE INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT
ASSOCIATION

For an additional amount for “Contribution to the
International Development Association”, $250,000,000, to
remain available until expended, which shall be made
available for a contribution to the International Develop-
ment Association Special Program to Enhance Crisis Re-
sponse Window: Provided, That such amount is designated
by the Congress as being for an emergency requirement
pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the Balanced Budg-

et and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NO T N T NG I NG R NG B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N U N N = =N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

10
GENERAL PROVISIONS—THIS TITLE
(INCLUDING TRANSFERS OF FUNDS)

SEC. 301. During fiscal year 2024, section 506(a)(1)
of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C.
2318(a)(1))  shall  be applied by  substituting
“$7,800,000,000” for “$100,000,000".

SEC. 302. During fiscal year 2024, section
506(a)(2)(B) of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 (22
U.S.C. 2318(a)(2)(B)) shall be applied by substituting
“$400,000,000” for “$200,000,000” in the matter pre-
ceding clause (i), and by substituting “$150,000,000 for
“$75,000,000” in clause (1).

SEC. 303. During fiscal year 2024, section 552(¢)(2)
of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C.
2348a(c)(2)) shall  be applied by substituting
“$50,000,000” for “$25,000,000".

SEC. 304. (a) Section 2606 of the Ukraine Supple-
mental Appropriations Act, 2022 (division N of Public
Law 117-103) 1s amended as follows:

(1) in subsection (a), by striking “and North Atlantic
Treaty Organization (NATO) allies” and inserting *,
North Atlantic Treaty Organization (NATO) allies, major
non-NATO allies, and the Indo-Pacific region”; by strik-
ing “$4,000,000,000” and inserting “$8,000,000,000";

4

and by striking *‘, except that such rate may not be less

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
L R W NN = DO 0O X NN R WD~ O

11

than the prevailing interest rate on marketable Treasury
securities of similar maturity”.

(2) in subsection (b), by striking “and NATO allies”
and inserting *“, NATO allies, major non-NATO allies, and
the Indo-Pacific region”; by striking “$4,000,000,000”
and inserting “$8,000,000,000”; and by inserting at the
end of the second proviso “except for guarantees of loans
by the Federal Financing Bank”.

(b) Funds made available for the costs of direct loans
and loan guarantees for major non-NATO allies and the
Indo-Pacific region pursuant to section 2606 of division
N of Public Law 117-103, as amended by subsection (a),
may only be made available from funds appropriated by
this Act under the heading “Foreign Military Financing
Program” and available balances from under such heading
in prior Acts making appropriations for the Department
of State, foreign operations, and related programs: Pro-
vided, That such funds may only be made available if the
Secretary of State certifies and reports to the appropriate
congressional committees, not less than 15 days prior to
the obligation of such funds, that such direct loan or loan
cuarantee is in the national security interest of the United
States, 1s being provided in response to exigent cir-
cumstances, 1s addressing a mutually agreed upon emer-

gency requirement of the recipient country, and the recipi-

*HR 8036 IH



O© o0 3 O WD B W N e

[\© TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
L R W NN = DO O XN N R WND = O

12
ent country has a plan to repay such loan: Provided fur-
ther, That not less than 60 days after the date of enact-
ment of this Act, the Secretary of State shall consult with
such committees on the implementation of this subsection.

(¢) Amounts repurposed pursuant to this section that
were previously designated by the Congress as an emer-
gency requirement pursuant to a concurrent resolution on
the Budget are designated as an emergency requirement
pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Bude-
et and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

SEC. 305. Prior to the initial obligation of funds
made available in this title in this Act, but not later than
15 days after the date of enactment of this Act, the Seec-
retary of State and the Secretary of the Treasury, as ap-
propriate, shall submit to the Committees on Appropria-
tions spend plans, as defined in section 7034(s)(4) of the
Department of State, Foreien Operations, and Related
Programs Appropriations Act, 2023 (division K of Public¢
Law 117-328), at the country, account, and program
level, for funds appropriated by this Act under the head-
ings “Foreign Military Financing Program” and “Con-
tribution to the International Development Association’:
Provided, That plans submitted pursuant to this para-
eraph shall include for each program notified—(A) total

funding made available for such program, by account and

*HR 8036 IH



9 B S S B O]

13
fiscal year; (B) funding that remains unobligated for such
program from prior year base or supplemental appropria-
tions; (C) funding that is obligated but unexpended for
such program; and (D) funding committed, but not yet

notified for such program.

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 9 AN U Bk~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

14
TITLE IV

GENERAL PROVISIONS—THIS ACT

SEC. 401. Each amount appropriated or made avail-
able by this Act is in addition to amounts otherwise appro-
priated for the fiscal year involved.

SEC. 402. No part of any appropriation contained in
this Act shall remain available for obligation beyond the
current fiscal year unless expressly so provided herein.

SEC. 403. Unless otherwise provided for by this Act,
the additional amounts appropriated by this Act to appro-
priations accounts shall be available under the authorities
and conditions applicable to such appropriations accounts
for fiscal year 2024.

SEC. 404. Funds appropriated by this Act for foreign
assistance (including foreign military sales), for the De-
partment of State, for broadcasting subject to supervision
of United States Agency for Global Media, and for intel-
ligence or intelligence related activities are deemed to be
specifically authorized by the Congress for the purposes
of section 10 of Public Law 91-672 (22 U.S.C. 2412),
section 15 of the State Department Basic Authorities Act
of 1956 (22 U.S.C. 2680), section 313 of the Foreign Re-
lations Authorization Act, Fiscal Years 1994 and 1995
(22 U.S.C. 6212), and section 504(a)(1) of the National
Security Act of 1947 (50 U.S.C. 3094(a)(1)).

*HR 8036 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

e T SO =
W NN = O

—
V) BN AN

—
o 3 O

15

SEC. 405. Each amount designated in this Act by the
Congress as being for an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and
Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985 shall be available
(or repurposed or rescinded, if applicable) only if the
President subsequently so designates all such amounts
and transmits such designations to the Congress.

SEC. 406. Any amount appropriated by this Act, des-
ignated by the Congress as an emergency requirement
pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(1) of the Balanced Budg-
et and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985, and subse-
quently so designated by the President, and transferred
pursuant to transfer authorities provided by this Act shall

retain such designation.

SPENDING REDUCTION ACCOUNT
SEC. 407. $0.
This Act may be cited as the “Indo-Pacific Security
Supplemental Appropriations Act, 2024,
O

*HR 8036 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-04-18T00:59:57-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




